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I, Rachele R. Byrd, hereby declare as follows: 

1. I am a partner at Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP (“Wolf 

Haldenstein”), one of the counsel for Plaintiffs and the Class in the above-captioned action.  

Pursuant to the requirements of sections H.4. and H.5. of the Class Action Case Management 

Order #1 entered in this matter on November 8, 2016 by the Honorable Craig G. Riemer, I 

respectfully submit this Declaration in support of my firm’s application for an award of 

attorneys’ fees in connection with services rendered in this case, as well as the reimbursement of 

expenses incurred by my firm in connection with this litigation.  Except as otherwise noted, the 

facts set forth in this declaration are based in part upon my personal knowledge, and I would 

competently testify to them if called upon to do so. 

2. I have significant and extensive litigation experience, having been involved in 

class action litigation since I joined Wolf Haldenstein in 2001.   

3. The work done by my firm in this case includes: initial factual investigation; 

conducting legal research regarding Plaintiffs’ potential claims; drafting pleadings; client 

communications for the purposes of, among other things, review of relevant facts, status of 

matter and strategy, and review of the Settlement Agreement; corresponding with counsel for 

Defendants; attending some key court hearings; assisting Plaintiffs in gathering evidentiary 

materials; attending the settlement mediation; and preparing the settlement-related briefs and 

supporting documents.  

4. My firm kept detailed records regarding the amount of time spent by my firm, and 

the lodestar calculation based on my firm’s current billing rates. The information was prepared 

from contemporaneous, daily time records regularly prepared and maintained by my firm, true 

and correct copies (redacted to remove privileged information) of which are attached hereto as 

Exhibit A.  

5. In summary, the total number of hours spent by my firm rendering services 

through the date of this declaration, 2362.95, multiplied by the current hourly rates of the 

attorneys and other professionals equals $1,505,149.50.  These hours are broken down as 
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follows: 

Attorneys (P=partner; A=associate) Hours Rate Lodestar 

Daniel W. Krasner (P) 41.40 $995.00 $41,193.00

Mark C. Rifkin (P) 58.50 $910.00 $53,235.00

Betsy C. Manifold (P) 11.90 $810.00 $9,639.00

Janine L. Pollack (P) 434.00 $795.00 $345,030.00

Rachele R. Byrd (P) 255.4  $680.00  $173,672.00

Randall S. Newman (P) 1,052.55  $680.00  $715,734.00

Kate M. McGuire (Of Counsel) 21.50  $575.00  $12,362.50

Brittany N. DeJong (A) 127.20  $455.00  $57,876.00

Total Attorneys 2002.45    $1,408,741.50

Paraprofessionals Hours Rate Lodestar 

J. Cirigliano 49.00  $330.00  $16,170.00

K. Cabrera 186.20  $280.00  $52,136.00

A. Loutsenhizer 54.00  $235.00  $12,690.00

W. Loritsch 57.60  $220.00  $12,672.00

K. Warren 13.70  $200.00  $2,740.00

Total Paraprofessionals 360.50    $96,408.00

  

GRAND TOTAL TIME 2,362.95 $1,505,149.50

6. In my judgment, and based on my years of experience in class action litigation 

and other litigation, the number of hours expended, and the services performed by my firm, were 

reasonable and necessary for my firm’s representation of Plaintiffs. 

7. I have general familiarity with the range of hourly rates typically charged by 

plaintiffs’ class action counsel in the geographical area where my firm practices and throughout 

the United States, both on a current basis and historically.  From that basis, I am able to conclude 

that the rates charged by my firm are within the range of market rates charged by attorneys and 

professional staff of equivalent experience, skill and expertise for legal services furnished in 

complex contingency class action litigation, such as this. 
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8. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is my firm’s resume including biographies of the 

attorneys in the firm who were principally involved in this litigation. I believe that the skill and 

experience described therein justify the rates charged.  The rates reflect the risk undertaken due 

to contingency representation of the Plaintiffs given that the firm bore the risk of no payment at 

all for its services during this litigation.  Our rates have been approved by other courts as 

reasonable for contingency representations similar to that here.   See, e.g., See, e.g., Ardon v. City 

of Los Angeles, No. BC363959, slip. op. at 20 (L.A. Cnty. Super Ct. Oct. 26, 2016) (order 

approving fees and costs); DeFrees v. Kirkland, No. CV 11-4272-JLS (SPx), slip op., ECF No. 

400 (C.D. Cal. Apr. 11, 2016); DeFrees v. Kirkland, No. CV 11-4272 GAF (SPx), 2014 U.S. 

Dist. LEXIS 157320, at *2 (C.D. Cal. Nov. 4, 2014) (“the Court finds the fees and costs appear 

to be reasonable”); DeFrees v. Kirkland, No. CV 11-4272 GAF (SPx), slip op., ECF No. 226 

(C.D. Cal. Sept. 5, 2012) (order granting plaintiffs’ application for fees and costs) (“The Court 

routinely approves billing rates in the range charged by [Wolf Haldenstein] for counsel of similar 

skill and experience”); Carter v. Hot Topic, Inc., No. 2:13-cv-04153-SJO (JCx), slip op., ECF 

No. 9 (C.D. Cal. Apr. 13, 2016) (awarding requested fees). 

9. The time described above does not include charges for expense items.  Expense 

items are billed separately, and such charges are not duplicated in my firm’s billing rates.  Based 

upon my firm records, my firm has incurred a total of $52,602.60 in unreimbursed expenses in 

connection with the prosecution of this litigation. The expenses are summarized as follows:   

Expense Category Total 

Document Reproduction  $2,740.05 

Telephone $191.93 

Research $15,382.62 

Attorney Services $14,925.85 

Filing/Court Fees $5,066.91 

Travel $9,830.18 

Postage $153.46 
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Non-Travel Meals $154.21 

Employee Overtime $107.39 

Mediation Fees $4,050.00 

Total Expenses $52,602.60 

10. The expenses incurred in this action are reflected on the books and records of my 

firm.  These books and records are prepared from expense vouchers, check records, and other 

source materials and are an accurate record of the expenses incurred.  It is anticipated that costs 

will continue to accrue, including but not limited to costs associated with traveling to the July 8, 

2020 Final Approval Hearing in this matter as appropriate. 

11. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a detailed itemization and explanation for all 

expenses stated above, describing the date, nature, and amount of each expense incurred.  In 

particular, for any travel expenses, Exhibit C states the mode of travel (e.g., by car, taxi, airplane, 

etc.), the starting point, the destination, and the number of persons making the trip.  For any 

expenses for overnight accommodations, Exhibit C states the necessity for staying overnight and 

the number of persons doing so. 

12. My firm takes seriously its duty to supervise the claims administration process, 

and therefore I anticipate my firm might continue to incur additional lodestar and/or expenses in 

connection with this litigation through the end of the claims administration process as necessary. 

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the 

foregoing is true and correct.  Executed this 26th day of May, 2020 at San Diego, California. 
 

              
RACHELE R. BYRD 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Hero: 26459 



 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT A 
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Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 1
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83093.001 Ramos/Richard
83093.001 08/16/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 1.50 1,402.50 6697HERO (Truth in Lending)- conferences

RN, MCR etc.; research 
.; emails.

83093.001 09/07/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 1.50 1,402.50 6698HERO (TRUTH IN LENDING)-
conferences JLP and RN re complaint;
venue, claims etc.

83093.001 10/27/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 1.20 1,122.00 6582Conference JLP, RSN, MCR re pleading
issues and strategy.

83093.001 10/28/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 0.50 467.50 6583Conference MCR, JLP, RN re pleadings
and strategy as 

Subtotal for Timekeeper DWK Billable 4.70 4,394.50 Daniel W. Krasner

83093.001 08/16/2016 MCR P 499 820.00 0.50 410.00 6539Confer w/RSN re theories; email from
RSN re claims; email from DWK.

83093.001 10/05/2016 MCR P 499 820.00 0.40 328.00 6624Email from RSN re  confer
w/RSN re claims and jurisdiction.

83093.001 10/07/2016 MCR P 499 820.00 0.80 656.00 6625Confer w/RSN re potential claims.
83093.001 10/10/2016 MCR P 499 820.00 0.80 656.00 6626Confer w/RSN re potential claims.
83093.001 10/14/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 1.40 1,162.00 6632confer w/RSN re issues and

strategies; confer w/JP re potential claims.
83093.001 10/18/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 1.80 1,494.00 6633Email from RSN; review and revise draft

complaint; confer w/RSN re claims and
edits to complaint.

83093.001 10/18/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.20 166.00 6634Email from JP re draft complaint.
83093.001 10/19/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.60 498.00 6635Confer w/RSN re edits to draft complaint.
83093.001 10/21/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 1.80 1,494.00 6636Review and revise complaint; confer

w/RSN and JP re edits to complaint; email
from JP re draft complaint

83093.001 10/24/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.10 83.00 6637Email from L. Shalov re draft complaint.
83093.001 10/25/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 1.40 1,162.00 6638Confer w/RSN; review and revise

complaint; email from JP and RSN.
83093.001 10/27/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 1.20 996.00 6639Email from J. Pollack re coordination;

review and revise complaint; confer
w/RSN.

83093.001 10/28/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 2.30 1,909.00 6640Email to and from RSN re final draft
complaint; confer w/RSN and J. Pollack;
review Riverside draft complaint; review
LA draft complaint.

83093.001 12/30/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.90 778.50 6641Edit adn review draft complaints; confer
w/RSN and JP.

83093.001 11/01/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.70 581.00 6642Email to an from JP and BCM re filing;
confer w/JP and RSN re filing and
strategies.

83093.001 11/02/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.50 415.00 6643Confer w/RSN and JP re strategies for
cases; email from K. Cabera re same.

83093.001 11/03/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.50 415.00 6644Email form co-counsel re status; confer
w/RSN and JP re strategies; email from
BCM re articles; email to P. Kang.

83093.001 11/04/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.40 332.00 6645Confer w/JP and RSN re strategies; email
from JP re pro hac vice.

83093.001 11/07/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 1.00 830.00 6646Confer w/RSN and JP re status and
strategies; email from BCM re articles.

83093.001 11/08/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.60 498.00 6647Email from JP re CA advocates; confer
w/JP and RSN re strategies.

83093.001 11/14/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.20 166.00 6648Email from JP re inquiry from additional
counsel.

83093.001 11/17/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.20 166.00 6649Email from RSN re  confer
w/RSN and JP.

83093.001 11/18/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.60 498.00 6650Email from RSN re article; confer w/RSN
and JP re strategies.

83093.001 12/02/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.40 346.00 6683Review ECF orders; email from JP; confer
w/JP and RSN re status.

83093.001 12/05/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 6684Review ECF notice; email form JP; confer
w/JP and RSN.

83093.001 12/06/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.10 86.50 6685Email from RR re Pro Hac Vice.
83093.001 11/21/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.20 166.00 6686Email from RSN re PACE guidelines.
83093.001 11/21/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.20 166.00 6687Email to and from JP and RSN re filings.
83093.001 01/19/2017 MCR P 10 865.00 0.50 432.50 6694Review MTD
83093.001 01/20/2017 MCR P 10 865.00 0.20 173.00 6695Email from J. Pollack re MTD issues
83093.001 12/12/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.70 605.50 6749Confer w/RSN re strategies for case.
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Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 2
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83093.001 Ramos/Richard
83093.001 12/14/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.50 432.50 6750Email from RSN re case assignment;

confer w/RSN re status and strategies.
83093.001 12/16/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.50 432.50 6756Email to and from K. Cabrera and RRR re

pro hac vice applications.
83093.001 12/22/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 6763Email from JP and J. Cirigliano re pro hac

vice and scheduling issues.
83093.001 12/22/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 6764Email from JP re scheduling issues.
83093.001 12/23/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.50 432.50 6765Confer w/RSN and JP re case strategies.
83093.001 12/26/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 2.10 1,816.50 6766Draft and revise consolidation motions;

confer w/RSN; email to and from B.
DeJong and RRR.

83093.001 12/27/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 6767Email to and from RRR re consolidation.
83093.001 01/03/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 1.70 1,470.50 6784Review and revise motion to consolidate

and appoint lead counsel; confer w/JP and
RSN re motion.

83093.001 01/05/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.60 519.00 6785Email from J. Pollack re meet and confer;
confer w/ J. Pollack and RSN re status
and strategies.

83093.001 01/06/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 6786Email from RRR,  RSN, J. Pollack;  confer
w/RSN and J. Pollack re status report and
strategies.

83093.001 01/06/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 6787Review ECF notices; email to and from K.
Cabrera re filings.

Subtotal for Timekeeper MCR Billable 28.50 23,983.50 Mark C.Rifkin

83093.001 06/01/2016 BCM P 499 770.00 1.60 1,232.00 6461Hero - review matters from Janine re;
Hero Program; research 

 detailed e-mail re:
HERO program and issues re: transfer

83093.001 06/03/2016 BCM P 499 770.00 1.80 1,386.00 6462e-mail RSN re:  and
 research re:

HERO program and 

83093.001 06/04/2016 BCM P 499 770.00 0.80 616.00 Hero - e-mail RSN re
 review

calculations
83093.001 06/13/2016 BCM P 499 770.00 0.40 308.00 6464Hero - review RAMOS numbers; f/u

RSN 
e-mail Janine

Subtotal for Timekeeper BCM Billable 4.60 3,542.00 Betsy C. Manifold

83093.001 06/06/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6438[HERO - possible new] Olc's and emails
re: possible new case.

83093.001 06/07/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6439[HERO - possible new] Olc's re: possible
new case.

83093.001 06/13/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6440[HERO - possible new] Olc's and emails
re: case.

83093.001 06/16/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6441[HERO - possible new] Teleconference's
re: possible claim; reviewed paperwork;
email.

83093.001 06/17/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6442[HERO - possible new] Olc's and reviewed
docs re: possible claims.

83093.001 06/22/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6443[Hero - possible new] Emails re:  claims /
complaint.

83093.001 06/29/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6444[HERO - possible new] Call with potential
client; olc's.

83093.001 06/30/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6445[HERO - possible new] Drafted retainer
agreement; olc's re: claims.

83093.001 07/06/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6494Emails and olc's re: claims/client docs.
83093.001 07/05/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.50 1,207.50 6437Olc's and emails re: possible claims.
83093.001 07/07/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 2.00 1,610.00 6465Reviewed memo re: claims; continued

discussions re: cmpt; retainer letter.
83093.001 07/20/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6466Olc's re: cpt; retainer; .
83093.001 07/29/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6467Reviewed draft cpt; emails.
83093.001 08/01/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 6468Emails re: cpt. draft.
83093.001 08/01/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.20 161.00 6469Emails re: cpt.
83093.001 08/03/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 2.50 2,012.50 6480Worked on research re: facts and law.
83093.001 08/04/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.50 1,207.50 6481Continued research on legal and factual

issues; teleconference Riverside plaintiff;
emails.

83093.001 08/05/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.50 1,207.50 6484Continued factual and legal
research/issues; emails and olc's re:
client.

83093.001 08/08/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.50 1,207.50 6485Retainer Agreement for 
continued olc's and work re: claims for cpt.

83093.001 08/09/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 2.00 1,610.00 6486Continued work on claims; teleconference
with possible client.
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Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 3
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83093.001 Ramos/Richard
83093.001 08/10/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 3.00 2,415.00 6487Research re: ; olc's re: factual issues

and legal issues re: cpt; email's re: clients.
83093.001 08/11/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6488Continued factual and legal investigation

for cpt.
83093.001 08/12/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 3.50 2,817.50 6489Meeting re: cmpt; olc's; worked on same.
83093.001 08/15/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.50 1,207.50 6490Teleconference with new possible client;

drafted retainer; reviewed client's docs.
83093.001 08/16/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6491Olc's re: case and emails re: same and re:

83093.001 08/17/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6492Worked on draft 
83093.001 08/18/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 2.00 1,610.00 6493Worked on draft of Complaint; olc's re:

same.
83093.001 09/07/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6511Olc's re: cpt draft/claims.
83093.001 09/12/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6512Olc's re: draft cpt/claims.
83093.001 09/14/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6513Continued Olc's re: cpt/claims/transfer.
83093.001 09/15/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6514Continued research for complaint and

olc's.
83093.001 09/16/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.50 1,207.50 6515Teleconference with Riverside client; olc's;

reviewed client's docs; emails.
83093.001 09/20/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.50 1,207.50 6516Continued emails and olc's re: draft cpt;

drafted retainer for Riverside.
83093.001 09/21/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6517Reviewed factual material and olc's re:

same.
83093.001 09/27/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6521Continued work on facts for cpt; olc's.
83093.001 10/11/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6540Olc's re: claims.
83093.001 10/13/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6541Olc's and teleconference's re: statutes for

cpt.
83093.001 10/20/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6543Emails re: am. cpt; teleconference re:

same.
83093.001 10/20/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6544Olc's re: draft cpt and emails re: same.
83093.001 10/21/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 3.00 2,415.00 6545Worked on draft complaint; olc's re: same.
83093.001 10/24/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 2.00 1,610.00 6546Continued work on draft cpt; olc's;

teleconferences; emails.
83093.001 10/25/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 4.00 3,220.00 6547Continued work on issues re: cpt. emails;

olc's; worked on draft.
83093.001 10/26/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 3.00 2,415.00 6548Continued work on draft cpt; olc's.
83093.001 10/27/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 2.00 1,610.00 6549Olc's and worked on cpt draft.
83093.001 10/28/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6550Continued work on finalizing cpt; olc's;

emails.
83093.001 10/31/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6551Finalized cpt.
83093.001 11/01/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 6552Emails and olc's re: filing of cpt.
83093.001 11/02/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 6553Reviewed Court documents/rules; emails;

olc's.
83093.001 11/04/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6574Olc's and emails re: hearings/service.
83093.001 11/07/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.60 483.00 6575Teleconference's with possible witnesses

and others re: case; olc's and emails.
83093.001 10/28/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 2.30 1,851.50 6576Finalize complaint.
83093.001 11/08/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6577Teleconference's and olc's and emails re:

witnesses.
83093.001 11/09/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6578Teleconference and olc's re: motion to

challenge; emails re: coordination motion;
teleconference office of Pro Tem;
reviewed motion to challenge.

83093.001 11/10/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.40 322.00 6579Teleconference with ; olc's.
83093.001 11/14/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6580Teleconference attorney re: other cases;

olc's; reviewed materials.
83093.001 11/15/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 6581Emails re: 
83093.001 11/16/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6584Teleconference potential client; reviewed

amicus by CFPB.
83093.001 11/17/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 6585Olc's and email to CFPB.
83093.001 11/18/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 6586Teleconference defense counsel; olc's.
83093.001 11/22/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.70 563.50 6587Reviewed updated Best Practice -

Guidelines; emails re; schedule with
defendant; olc's re: same.

83093.001 11/23/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.70 563.50 6588Worked on draft stipulation re: extension;
olc's.

83093.001 11/28/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 6589Worked on draft stip; emails re: same;
emails re: CFPB; olc's.

83093.001 11/30/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6590Teleconference realtors re: case;
teleconference CFPB; emails.

83093.001 12/01/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6591Emails re; motion to remove.
83093.001 12/02/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6596Teleconference's defense counsel and

co-counsel re: motion to remove and
stipulation; reviewed draft of stip.

83093.001 12/06/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6598Conference call with defendants re:
possible consolidation and other
procedural issues; pro hac vice issues;
reviewed Court Orders.

83093.001 12/08/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6618Reviewed notice of related cases; emails.
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83093.001 12/08/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6619Reviewed notice of related cases; emails.
83093.001 12/14/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6621Reviewed Court Order and emails re:

same; olc's.
83093.001 12/15/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6622Reviewed stip to coordinate briefing; olc's

re: same.
83093.001 12/16/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6623Reviewed stipulation; emails re: same;

olc's.
83093.001 12/20/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6627Reviewed revised stipulation re: briefing;

emails; olc's.
83093.001 12/21/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 6630Teleconference attorney in contractor suit

re; RA; olc's; emails.
83093.001 12/22/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 6631Worked on PHV.
83093.001 12/23/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6651Teleconferences and olc's re: PACE

program; pro hac app.; reviewed news
articles.

83093.001 01/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6652Worked on motion to consolidate; emails;
teleconferences; olc's re; M/D.

83093.001 01/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6654Teleconference realtor association; pro
hac.

83093.001 01/09/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 6667Worked on draft motion to consolidate and
ILC.

83093.001 01/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6688Worked on Stipulation to Adjorn class
motion; meet and confer consolidate and
for interim lead counsel.

83093.001 01/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 6689Worked on order re: consolidation and
lead and motion; worked on draft
stipulation to ajourn class motion.

83093.001 01/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6690Finalized draft of motion to consolidate
and lead.

83093.001 01/13/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 6692Worked on finalizing motion to consolidate
and lead; conference call defendants.

83093.001 01/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 6693Teleconference with defendant's counsel
Shelodon re: stipulation to adjourn and
olc's re: same; olc's re: am. cpt.

83093.001 01/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 6696Worked on finalizing stip. and proposal
order to adjourn class motion.

83093.001 01/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 6719Worked on discovery drafts; emails to
client and discussion among attorneys re:
same.

83093.001 01/31/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 6720Continued work on draft discovery.
83093.001 02/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6721Continued work on draft discovery; olc's.
83093.001 02/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6722Continued work on am. cpt.
83093.001 02/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6723Contined work on am. cpt. and olc's re:

claims and issues; emails re: extension for
am. cpt.

83093.001 02/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6724Emails re: stip for extension reviewed opp
consolidation and began draft of reply's
conference call with team re: am. cpt.

83093.001 02/07/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6725Worked on draft of reply on consolidation
motion.

83093.001 02/08/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 6726Continued drafting reply on motion to
consolidate and interim class counsel.

83093.001 02/09/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6727Contined work on draft of reply on
consolidation and interim lead; reviewed
cases regarding defendants' defenses.

83093.001 02/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6728Continued work on reply on motion to
consolidate and interim lead.

83093.001 02/17/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 6744Reviewed draft of Notice of Intent to file
am. cpt; olc's re: am. cpt.

83093.001 02/21/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 3.00 2,445.00 6745Worked on draft am. cpt and sent to client;
olc's re: same.

83093.001 02/22/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 6746Finalized am. cpt; olc's re: same;
teleconference's ;
hearing prep.; emails with defendants re:
m/d.

83093.001 02/23/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6747Hearing prep. and teleconference Sheldon
re: moving CMH.

83093.001 02/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 6748Emails re: Stipulation to Adjourn and
coordinate CMH; reviewed Court Order re:
canceled hearing.

83093.001 03/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6768Reviewed Court Order on Motion to
Consolidate and interim lead and olc's re:
same.

83093.001 03/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6788Worked on stip re: opp m/d.
83093.001 03/21/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6789Reviewed m/d and olc's re: same.
83093.001 03/22/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 6790Worked on opp. m/d; olc's re: same.
83093.001 03/23/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 6791Finalized for filing opp. m/d.
83093.001 03/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 6792Worked on opp m/amicus.
83093.001 03/28/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6793Olc's re: hearing and possible new cases.
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83093.001 04/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6794Reviewed county's reply.
83093.001 04/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 6798Prep. for m/d argument; reviewed Court

Order re: hearing change; emails re:
 and

reviewed same.
83093.001 04/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 6820Meet and confer with defendants and

worked on draft of joint report.
83093.001 04/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 6821Continued work on draft Joint Report; olc's

re: same.
83093.001 04/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 6822Reviewed draft discovery request to

defendants and edited; continued work on
Joint report draft.

83093.001 04/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6823Reviewed R. 26f draft from defendants.
83093.001 04/17/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 6824Finalized R. 26 Joint Report.
83093.001 04/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 6825Olc's and teleconference's re: supp.

authority / submission on m/d; hearing
prep on m/d.

83093.001 04/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6828Worked on notice of supp. authority and
prep for hearing.

83093.001 04/26/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 6829Prep. for oral argument.
83093.001 04/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6830Continued prep for hearing; olc's re: same.
83093.001 04/28/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6832Worked on draft initial disclosures;

hearing prep.; reviewed defendant's initial
disclosure.

83093.001 04/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 3.00 2,445.00 6833Travel to CA for hearing; hearing prep.
83093.001 05/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 6834Hearing, return to New York.
83093.001 05/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 6836Phone calls with class members.
83093.001 06/07/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6852Teleconference class member.
83093.001 06/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6853Teleconference possible experts.
83093.001 07/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6865Reviewed Court Order on m/d and gp call

and olc's re: same.
83093.001 07/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6866Olc's to discuss remand issues and

possible appeal.
83093.001 07/21/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6867Emails re: remand to state court and

possible consolidation of cases;
teleconference defendant's counsel re:
same.

83093.001 07/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6868Sent opinion to client.
83093.001 07/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6869Reviewed drafts of judgment / final order

from county; emails re: same.
83093.001 07/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6870Worked on draft of judgment and emails

re: same; olc's and emails re:
consolidation in state court;
teleconference  re similar
cases in state court.

83093.001 08/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6871Office conference and teleconference
regarding consolidation issues.

83093.001 08/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6873Teleconference Neudecker to discuss
judgment language and worked on same;
office conference; e-mails and
teleconferences Re: consolidation.

83093.001 08/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6874Teleconference counties Re: appeal;
office conference Re: same and
teleconferences.

83093.001 08/07/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.20 163.00 6875E-mails re consolidation and told defts of
plaintiffs' position.

83093.001 08/14/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.00 815.00 6880Worked on draft of joint petition to
coordinate.

83093.001 08/15/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 6881Worked on joint petition to coordinate;
office conferences and telephone
conferences with defendants' counsel re:
appeal issues; e-mails.

83093.001 08/16/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.50 407.50 6882Telephone call with defendants' counsel
re: coordination; conference call with team
re: same.

83093.001 08/17/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.70 570.50 6883Worked on petition for
coordination;e-mails.

83093.001 08/18/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.70 570.50 6884Worked on m/coordination and sent to
defendant's counsel.

83093.001 09/05/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.50 407.50 6889Meet and confer with defendants
regarding hearing and status report.

83093.001 09/11/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.50 407.50 6892E-mails re hearing.
83093.001 09/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6908Revised draft of judgement and stip re:

fees re: federal claims and emails re:
same.

83093.001 09/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 6909Finalized judgments and orders in federal
case for filing.

83093.001 09/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6910Reviewed articles regarding RA in
newspapers and office conferences
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regarding same; emails.

83093.001 10/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 6911Reviewed order regarding coordination;
teleconferences and emails regarding
same.

83093.001 10/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6926Emails regarding moving hearing date and
submitted request for same.

83093.001 10/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6927Worked on stipulation to change hearing
date for consolidation motion.

83093.001 10/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6932Emails regarding filing of stipulation with
Panel regarding coordination.

83093.001 11/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6936Worked on draft stipulation to adjourn
conference; emails.

83093.001 11/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 6937Emails regarding hearing on consolidation
and preparation for same.

83093.001 11/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6940Preparation for hearing on consolidation;
emails regarding hearing time.

83093.001 12/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6941Pro hac vice papers for coordination
hearing; hearing preparation.

83093.001 12/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.70 2,200.50 6942Travel to LA; preparation for hearing with
co-counsel.

83093.001 12/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.70 2,200.50 6943Attended hearing; return to NYC.
83093.001 12/08/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 6944Worked on settlement issues; office

conferences and teleconferences
regarding same; drafted settlement letter
to defendant.

83093.001 12/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6945Worked on settlement letter to defendant.
83093.001 12/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 6946Worked on letter to defendant regarding

settlement; reviewed court order on
coordination; emails regarding same.

83093.001 12/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 6947Emails regarding coordination and judge
assignment.

83093.001 02/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 6968Teleconferences regarding hearing and
schedule; emails regarding same.

83093.001 02/23/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 6969Teleconference with defendant's counsel
regarding settlement; office conferences
and emails regarding same.

83093.001 02/28/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 6970Call regarding research for complaints.
83093.001 03/06/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 6972Emails and office conferences regarding

research for amended complaint.
83093.001 03/15/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 6973Finalized complaint and sent to client.
83093.001 04/02/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 6974Reviewed court order regarding amended

complaints; emails with defendant
regarding same.

83093.001 04/05/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 6975Worked on stipulation regarding amended
complaint.

83093.001 04/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 6980Emails regarding finalizing stipulation
regarding amended complaint.

83093.001 04/10/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 6981Meet and confer on demurrer; emails
regarding stipulation filed with the court.

83093.001 04/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 6982Stipulation regarding page extension and
emails regarding hearing date.

83093.001 04/17/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 6983Office conferences and emails regarding
opposition to demurrer.

83093.001 05/04/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 7002Emails regarding demurrer opposition and
teleconferences and reviewed draft of
same; emails regarding CMC.

83093.001 05/07/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 7003Worked on demurrer opposition and
reviewed D. memorandum.

83093.001 05/08/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 7019Continued work on opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 05/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 7020Worked on opposition to demurrer and

office conference regarding draft.
83093.001 05/15/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 7021Emails regarding demurrer due date/filing

issues; office conferences regarding
opposition.

83093.001 05/30/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 7042Worked on opposition to demurer.
83093.001 06/05/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 7043Reviewed draft of CMS and emails

regarding same.
83093.001 06/07/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 7044Reviewed reply on demurrer; office

conferences regarding hearing.
83093.001 06/08/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 7045Worked on CMS draft; office conferences

and emails.
83093.001 06/12/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.70 577.50 7054Preparation for hearing/reviewed tentative.
83093.001 06/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 7055Teleconferences and emails regarding

court ruling and discovery.
83093.001 06/19/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 7056Office conferences regarding discovery

issues; call to defendant; emails.
83093.001 06/20/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 7057Conference call with defendant regarding

discovery and settlement issues; emails.
83093.001 07/02/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 7058Worked on CMS draft; office conferences
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regarding same.

83093.001 07/03/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 7060Teleconference with attorneys from other
RA case; office conferences and emails
regarding hearing and discovery plan;
conference call regarding late answer by
RA.

83093.001 07/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 7066Worked on draft CMS; sent to defendant.
83093.001 07/17/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 7067Teleconferences regarding status

conference and emails regarding same.
83093.001 07/19/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 7068Conference call with defendant's counsel

regarding informal discovery and
settlement; emails and teleconferences
regarding same.

83093.001 07/20/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 7069Reviewed defendant's answer.
83093.001 08/23/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 7076Emails with  regarding phone call.
83093.001 08/28/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 7077Teleconference with defendant's counsel

and emails regarding same; office
conferences.

83093.001 08/29/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 7078Teleconference with .

Subtotal for Timekeeper JLP Billable 166.30 134,922.50 Janine L.Pollack

83093.001 06/01/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 2.00 1,280.00 6457Hero - Review email from JP re potential
new litigation re HERO loans; review
articles hyperlinked therein; confer w/BCM
re same; review BCM's email re same.

83093.001 06/06/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 1.00 640.00 6458Hero - HERO/Renovate America:  Emails
to/from RSN re potential action against
Renovate; review SD City Attorney Memo
re same

83093.001 06/17/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 1.00 640.00 6459Hero - Conference call from JP and RN re
potential claims and terms of contract;
confer w/BND re researching issues and
her preliminary findings

83093.001 06/22/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 1.20 768.00 6460Hero- Review and edit BND's memo re
;

confer w/BND re same; emails to/from JP
and RN re same

83093.001 07/05/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 0.20 128.00 6474Emails to/from BND and JP 

83093.001 07/06/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 0.50 320.00 6475Emails to/from MB and JP re billing
number; review BND's memo re same;
emails to/from BND re same

83093.001 10/28/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 6563Review, analysis and edit complaint; email
edits to team; t/c from KC re same; emails
to/from KC re same.

83093.001 11/09/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 2.30 1,472.00 6597T/c from JP and RN re challenging judge,
coordination proceedings, and moving for
appointment as lead counsel; research
issues and draft email w/attachments re
each issue; draft motion and declaration re
peremptory challenge of the judge; review
evidence in support of peremptory
challenge.

83093.001 12/15/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 6655Review and comment on draft stipulation
re briefing schedule on MTD.

83093.001 12/16/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 6656Emails to/from MCR and JP re their pro
hac vice application(s); circulate a notice
of order to show cause re status of
removal that we received in the mail.

83093.001 01/10/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 6699Conference call from JP and RSN re
conference call w/Defense counsel;
participate in call w/defense counsel; send
sample stipulations and proposed orders
to JP and RSN; emails to/from RSN re
obtaining copies of pleadings in another
old case re merits of MTD; review and edit
stipulation to move out class cert.
deadline; review local rules.

83093.001 01/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6700Confer w/KC re consolidation and interim
class counsel papers to be filed tomorrow;
emails to/from JP re same; review emails
to/from defense counsel.

83093.001 01/13/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6701Review motion for consolidation and
appointment of interim class counsel and
RRR declaration in support; emails to/from
co-counsel re same.

83093.001 02/08/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6754Emails to/from JP re reply brief re
consolidation and lead counsel; confer
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w/BND re her research project for same.

83093.001 02/13/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6755Draft conclusion to reply brief re motion to
consolidate and appoint interim class
counsel; emails to/from JP and t/c from
same re reply brief; review and supervise
finalization and filing of same.

83093.001 02/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 6757Emails to/from JP what do to about MTD
opp. deadline on Friday; confer w/BND
and KC re same.

83093.001 02/17/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.60 390.00 6758Draft notice of intent to amend; email
same to JP; cause same to be filed.

83093.001 02/22/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6759Review complaint before filing; emails
to/from JP re same.

83093.001 03/03/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6799Review order consolidating and appointing
WHAFH lead counsel; emails to/from JP
and t/c from MCR re same.

83093.001 03/14/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6800Review and edit stipulation and order
drafted by KC for page limits.

83093.001 03/22/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 6801Review and analysis of statement
regarding differences between this
opposition brief and the one we filed
yesterday in HERO Riverside; emails
to/from co-counsel and KC re same.

83093.001 03/23/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 6802Review and comment on corrections to
RJN, review and edit Exhibit A to the brief;
review redline of Riverside brief; confer
w/KC re finalization of opp. to MTD;
supervise finalization and filing of same;
emails to/from JLP re opposition to amicus
briefs due date.

83093.001 03/24/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6803Review notice of errata.
83093.001 03/27/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 6804Review and edit opposition to amicus

briefs; emails to/from and t/cs to/from JLP
re same; supervise finalization and filing of
same.

83093.001 04/14/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6831Review discovery, execute and cause
same to be filed and served.

83093.001 07/19/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.70 455.00 6872Confer w/JLP and RSN re dismissal of
federal claims and remand to state court;
research whether judge in San Bernardino
case was stricken before removal; email
order assigning the case to a new judge to
JLP and RSN.

83093.001 08/04/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6893Forward order to co-counsel; emails
to/from same re trial setting conference;
sign notice of entry of order.

83093.001 08/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6894Review practice guide re time to file notice
of appeal; emails to/from co-counsel re
same.

83093.001 08/16/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.50 975.00 6895Draft Petition for coordination; review
rules; edit memorandum of points and
authorities; conference call w/co-counsel
re same; email drafts of documents to JP.

83093.001 08/17/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.10 715.00 6896Edit petition for coordination and
application for stay and supporting papers;
emails to/from JP and defense counsel re
same; circulate to plaintiffs' counsel.

83093.001 08/25/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 6897Review defendant's edits to
coordination/stay motion; add plaintiffs'
sections and circulate to co-counsel
w/email.

83093.001 08/29/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 6898Emails to/from JP and JC re motion to
coordinate and relative congestion of the
courts; edit motion papers and supporting
documents.

83093.001 08/30/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 6899Edit motion to coordinate and support
papers; email same to defense counsel for
review.

83093.001 08/31/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.20 780.00 6900Emails to/from co- and defense counsel re
corrections to motion to coordinate/stay;
supervise finalization and filing of same;
t/c from MCR re status of three state court
actions, coordination, stay request, etc.

83093.001 09/05/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 6903Conference call w/JP, RSN and defense
counsel re Monday's hearing and joint
statement; review draft joint statement and
comment on same; emails to/from
defense counsel and plaintiffs' counsel re
same; pull CRC and local rules and email
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to co-counsel; emails to/from WL and
RSN re his CourtCall appearance and
filing and serving a notice of telephonic
appearance; review form and call/email
RSN re signing it.

83093.001 09/08/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6904Emails to/from WL re checking calendar
for Monday's hearing.

83093.001 09/10/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 2.90 1,885.00 6905Drive to San Bernardino for trial setting
conference; review Order granting in part
MTD, petition for coordination and joint
statement.

83093.001 09/11/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 3.40 2,210.00 6906Appear at Trial Setting Conference; drive
back to office; look up local rules for next
trial setting conference and at issue
memorandum due date; email to WL to
calendar.

83093.001 09/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6907Review and comment on proposed
judgment and waiver agreement.

83093.001 10/05/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.60 390.00 6934Emails to/from Molly re requesting a
continuance of the hearing on the motion
for coordination; emails to/from WL re
figuring out how to request a continuance
of the hearing.

83093.001 10/06/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 6935Draft stipulation and proposed order
(JCCP) continuing hearing on motion for
coordination; send to JLP; incorporate her
edits and send to defense counsel.

83093.001 11/07/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6938Emails to/from Defense counsel and JP re
moving status conference via stipulation
and proposed order.

83093.001 12/04/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6950Emails to/from JP re judges assigned to
each of the three cases; look up same.

83093.001 12/06/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6951T/c w/JP re yesterday's hearing and
settlement discussions.

83093.001 12/07/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 6952T/c w/ JP re her discussions with defense
counsel re discussing settlement and the
JCCP hearing.

83093.001 12/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 6953Review order granting petition and emails
to/from KC re preparing notice of entry of
order.

83093.001 12/18/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 Emails to/from JP re 

 legal research re
same; email to JP re findings.

83093.001 03/15/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 6978Review and edit amended complaint;
supervise finalization and filing of same.

83093.001 04/04/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.90 594.00 6985Draft stipulation and proposed order
granting leave to file amended complaints
and vacating status conference; email
same to KC to fill in blanks.

83093.001 04/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 6986Edit stipulation re amending complaints;
emails to/from JP re same; email draft
stipulation to defense counsel; review
defendant's edits.

83093.001 04/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 6987Supervise finalization and filing and
service of stipulation re amending
complaints; emails to/from JP re same.

83093.001 04/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 6988V/m from Molly re extending page limits on
demurrer briefing; emails to/from JP re
same; emails to/from Molly re same.

83093.001 04/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 6989Emails to/from JP and Molly re stipulation
regarding page limits on demurrer briefing;
emails to/from KC and Molly re Tuesday's
hearing; confer w/BND re covering
hearing; confer w/KC re her call w/clerk re
stipulation and pro hac vice application

83093.001 04/16/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 6990Confer w/BND and KC re tomorrow's
hearing; emails to/from JP and Molly re
same and re demurrer hearing; t/c from
BND re hearing; multiple emails b/w BND
and JP and RSN re hearing.

83093.001 04/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 6991Confer w/BND re how hearing went and
demurrer briefing.

83093.001 04/19/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 6992Email from State Bar re Janine's pro hac
application; forward to MB to fax
application; emails to/from KC re same.

83093.001 04/25/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.50 330.00 6993Review and analysis of complaints in
related cases just filed.

83093.001 05/04/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 7023Message from class member; forward
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same to JP; emails to/from JP and confer
w/KC re status conference date and report
due date.

83093.001 06/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7059Review tentative ruling; review emails
to/from and between co-counsel and
defense counsel.

83093.001 07/03/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7070T/c from defense counsel re missing filing
deadline; emails to/from RSN and JP;
conference call w/RSN, JP and MCR;
emails to/from defense counsel re same.

83093.001 07/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7071Review and edit Joint Status Conference
Report; emails to/from KC re finalizing and
filing same.

83093.001 07/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 7072Emails to/from RSN re how the status
conference went; emails to/from JP re
conference call.

83093.001 07/31/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 7073Review and edit notice of appearance;
emails to/from JP re same.

83093.001 09/26/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 7081Emails to/from RSN, JP and KC re setting
up courtcall for tomorrow's SC.

83093.001 10/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7147Research JAMS website for mediator in
Riverside; emails to/from RSN and JP re
same.

83093.001 11/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 7154Emails to/from JP, KC, GMN, DWK and
MCR re their pro hac vice applications

83093.001 11/09/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 7155T/c from MCR re expenses in HERO
cases; email to KC re same.

83093.001 12/03/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7164Draft stipulation and proposed order
advancing pro hac vice hearings to CMC
date; emails to/from co-counsel re same.

83093.001 12/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 7165Emails to/from RSN & MCR re settlement
demand and stipulation; review and edit
joint CMC statement and email edits to
RSN

83093.001 12/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7166Emails to/from JP and KC re appearing at
the CMC next Tuesday and JP and RSN
appearing telephonically; emails to/from
MCR and JP re stipulation; forward same
to defense counsel; email from defense
counsel re same; cause same to be filed
and served; review draft CMC statement;
emails to/from JP re same.

83093.001 12/11/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7167Review CMC statement; emails to/from JP
and KC re same and re hearing time; edit
CMC statement; emails to/from defense
counsel re same; supervise finalization
and filing of same.

83093.001 12/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 7168Emails to/from MCR re BND appearing at
CMC; emails to/from BND re same; email
to RSN re CMC.

83093.001 12/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 7169Emails to/from RSN re BND appearing at
CMC; emails to/from MCR re GMN's pro
hac vice application

83093.001 12/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 7170Conference call w/BND, RSN and JP re
tomorrow's CMC.

83093.001 01/14/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.30 201.00 7180Review and edit First Set of RFP's; confer
w/KW re same.

83093.001 01/15/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.60 402.00 7181Review and edit and comment on
discovery requests; emails to/from RSN re
same.

83093.001 01/16/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 7182Supervise finalization and filing of 1st
RFP; emails to/from RSN re same.

83093.001 02/08/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 7185Review emails to/from defense counsel
and JP requesting extension of time on
responses to RFPs.

83093.001 03/21/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.60 402.00 7188Emails to/from co-counsel and KC re
calling the clerk in San Bernardino to see
what needs to be done to move it out;
emails to/from RSN re motion to compel
deadline and settlement negotiations;
calculate deadline.

83093.001 07/01/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 2.00 1,340.00 7191Review and edit settlement agreement;
emails to/from JP re same; review and edit
joint notice of settlement and stipulation
continuing CMC.

83093.001 07/11/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.30 871.00 7192Review and edit settlement agreement
83093.001 07/15/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.00 670.00 7193Continue to review and edit settlement

agreement; email same to RSN.
83093.001 08/01/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 7198Review defendant's edits to settlement
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agreement; email to RSN and JP re same.

83093.001 08/07/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.20 804.00 7199Review and analysis of Riverside complex
litigation rules; emails to/from RSN and JP
re same; locate and circulate sample
exclusion and objection forms; edit draft
objection form and circulate.

83093.001 08/08/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.50 335.00 7200Review objection form; review and
edit/comment on proposed final approval
order; emails to/from RSN and JP re
same; review emails between parties re
new hearing date and requirements for
preliminary approval.

83093.001 08/09/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 7201Review and edit preliminary approval
order, notice, settlement agreement, final
order and judgment; emails to/from JP and
RSN re same; draft timeline to keep the
due dates straight and circulate

83093.001 08/12/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 7202Emails to/from JP and RSN re 

 review complaint ;
review articles concerning 
review and edit stipulation to move status
conference and preliminary approval filing
date; emails to/from JP re 

; review and analysis 

emails to/from
RSN and JP re same.

83093.001 08/13/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.40 268.00 7203Emails to/from JP and RSN re settlement
timeline and stipulation setting/moving
deadline to file motion for preliminary
approval.

83093.001 08/21/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 7204Emails to/from RSN and KD re 
; internet research for

same; email from defense counsel re new
draft of settlement agreement.

83093.001 10/25/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 7209Emails to/from JP and RSN re status
conference report due today; review draft
report and sign same; email to KC re
arranging for RSN to appear telephonically
at the status conference.

83093.001 01/03/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 7221Emails to/from JP re status conference on
January 9th.

83093.001 01/06/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 7222Emails to/from JP and RSN re status
conference in SB case

Subtotal for Timekeeper RRB Billable 52.80 34,512.00 Rachele R. Byrd

83093.001 06/03/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 6446Review HERO Program Financing
documents for ; email
correspondence to B. Manifold and R.
Rickert regarding same.

83093.001 06/06/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.00 3,200.00 6447Research regarding residential HERO
program; review documents related to
HERO program; email correspondence
with B. Manifold. Research San
Bernardino County  land records.
Discussion with J. Pollack regarding
same; discussion with M. Rifkin regarding
same; research regarding

to HERO Program.
83093.001 06/13/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.40 896.00 6448Review Notice of Assessment and

Payment of Contractual Assessment
recorded in San Bernardino County;
calculate

; calculate 
ttempt to calculate

83093.001 06/16/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.10 704.00 6449Review additional documents provided by
 and other potential case in

Riverside County, California; discussion
with J. Pollak regarding same.

83093.001 06/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.90 1,216.00 6450Review HERO documents; telephone
conference with J. Pollack and R. Rickert
regarding possible causes of action;
meeting with J. Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 06/22/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.30 2,752.00 6451Research regarding 
; review memorandum prepared by B.
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DeJong; research  email
correspondence to R. Rickert, B. DeJong
and J. Pollack regarding potential claims.

83093.001 06/23/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.25 3,360.00 6452Research ; research regarding
SANBAG and HERO Programs; emails
regarding same.

83093.001 06/24/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.10 3,904.00 6453Research regarding San Bernardino
County and its HERO program from
County Minutes; research regarding 

 research  against
SANBAG; research regarding damages
available under class action.

83093.001 06/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 6454Research regarding state causes of action
against Renovate America; research 

; meeting with J. Pollak to discuss
status; prepare for telephone conference
with potential client.

83093.001 06/29/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 6455Telephone conference with J. Pollak and
client regarding HERO program; research
regarding same.

83093.001 06/30/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.30 2,752.00 6456Research regarding PACE and HERO
Programs; research 

; begin to draft class action complaint
against

83093.001 07/05/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 Email correspondence regarding 
; researc

83093.001 07/06/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.10 1,984.00 6471Email correspondence with B. DeJong
regarding 
review  calculations
regarding same; review research memo
prepared by B. DeJong regarding 

83093.001 07/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.30 1,472.00 6472Review memo regarding 
; meeting with J. Pollack to

discuss case; review 
 prepare calculation 

revise complaint.
83093.001 07/08/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.20 128.00 6473Review  retainer letter; discussion

with J. Pollack regarding same.
83093.001 07/14/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 6476Review and Revise Complaint.
83093.001 07/26/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 6477Research Truth in Lending Books received

from National Consumer Law Center.
83093.001 07/27/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.20 2,688.00 6478Review and Revise Class Action

Complaint.
83093.001 07/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.70 3,008.00 6479Review and Revise Complaint.
83093.001 07/01/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 6482Research regarding  class action

damages.
83093.001 08/01/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.20 3,328.00 6495Review and revise complaint to add

allegations regarding 

83093.001 08/03/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.40 4,096.00 6496Research regarding Renovate America,

discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.
83093.001 08/04/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.40 2,176.00 6497Research; call with Riverside Plaintiff;

research regarding 

83093.001 08/05/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.40 3,456.00 6498Research regarding Riverside HERO
program; research regarding LA HERO
program; review LA County Assessment
Contract; research .

83093.001 08/06/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.70 1,728.00 6499Research regarding 
 regarding

; review case law
interpreting ; research
regarding

  Research

83093.001 08/08/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.20 3,328.00 6500Research regarding Renovate America;

 telephone conference with B.
Altchiler regarding ;
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research legislative history of 
research regarding

83093.001 08/09/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.80 1,792.00 6501Email correspondence regarding possible
new case  research

83093.001 08/10/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.50 3,520.00 6502Research RICO claims; research

research
 review contract between Renovate

America and SANBAG, Los Angeles
County and Renovate America; email
correspondence regarding potential
plaintiff in Riverside County.

83093.001 08/11/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.50 4,160.00 6503Email correspondence with J. Pollack
regarding ; research

; review
prospectus and offering information 

; compute 
amounts; telephone conference

 review documents
provided by ; research

; prepare for meeting with R.
Altchiller to 

83093.001 08/12/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.70 4,288.00 6504Meeting with J. Pollack and R. Altchiller to
discuss  against SANBAG
and Renovate America; research
regarding

; email correspondence regarding
potential Riverside HERO plaintiff; email
correspondence from M. Richardson

 review ; prepare
calculations of 

83093.001 08/15/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.70 2,368.00 6505Telephone conference with Riverside
potential plaintiff; review Riverside HERO
documents; telephone call 

 regarding potential Los
Angeles HERO Plaintiff.  Review
documents from Los Angeles.

83093.001 08/16/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.60 4,224.00 6506Discussion with M. Rifkin regarding
viability of  claims; email
correspondence with J. Pollack and D.
Krasner regarding same; review and
revise Complaint to add information about
Fannie Mae and Freddie Mac positions on
PACE Loans; review decision
in 
email correspondence with M. Jaramillo
regarding documents needed from
Riverside plaintiff.

83093.001 08/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.60 2,944.00 6507Research regarding  on
PACE program; review and revise draft of
complaint.

83093.001 08/18/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.70 1,728.00 6508Review HERO  research
regarding complaints against Renovate
America; research  Renovate
America; research

Research

83093.001 08/24/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.90 1,856.00 6509Review SANBAG and San Bernardino
County's .

83093.001 08/29/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.20 2,048.00 6510Research regarding San
Bernardino Count

 review financial
statements to determine revenue

; review
TILA statute; revise complaint.

83093.001 09/02/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.30 1,472.00 6522Review and Revise Complaint; research
regarding LA County Program.

83093.001 09/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.40 2,816.00 6523Discussions with J. Pollack regarding case
status; meeting with D. Krasner and J.
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Pollack regarding case strategy and
venue; telephone conference with
co-counsel regarding case status;
research 

83093.001 09/08/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.50 960.00 6524Telephone conference with 
regarding 

83093.001 09/13/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.60 4,224.00 6525Research regarding San Bernardino

, research
; review and revise

complaint based upon facts discovered
during research.

83093.001 09/14/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.80 4,352.00 6526Discuss venue and possibility 
 against Renovate

America; review California Civil Procedure
regarding 

; research regarding 
; review and revise

complaint.
83093.001 09/15/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.30 2,752.00 6527Research regarding possibility of filing

 discussion with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 09/16/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.30 3,392.00 6528Review documents from Riverside
potential plaintiff
conference with J. Pollack regarding
same; research regarding Riverside
HERO program; telephone conference
with  potential Riverside plaintiff.

83093.001 09/19/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.30 3,392.00 6529Research definition of ;
review ;
research proposed amendments to 

 for PACE Loan
purposes; review various California county
meeting minutes regarding revisions to
HERO program to require Renovate
America to comply with Truth in Lending
Act.

83093.001 09/20/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 8.40 5,376.00 6530Revise complaint; research 

.
83093.001 09/21/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.40 4,096.00 6531Review contractor agreements with

Renovate America; review Renovate
America's various websites and marketing
materials; review and revise complaint.

83093.001 09/22/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.50 4,160.00 6532Review California consumer statutes for
applicability to HERO Loans; review and
revise complaint.

83093.001 09/23/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.40 3,456.00 6533Review and revise complaint; research
applicable  provisions.

83093.001 09/26/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 7.20 4,608.00 Calculations 
 prepare

complaint, research regarding 
 

83093.001 09/27/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.60 4,224.00 6535Research California  statute,
statute, 

 statute and state law 
statutes; computations 

 review and
revise complaint.

83093.001 09/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 7.60 4,864.00 6536Calculate 
, revise complaint, research re

 in California.
83093.001 09/29/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 5.60 3,584.00 6537Research regarding calculation ;

 disclosed; research regarding
violation ; review and
revise complaint.

83093.001 09/30/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 4.30 2,752.00 6538Research regarding 
 and other HERO borrowers;

review county recording fees; review and
revise complaint to add allegations
regarding Renovate America 

83093.001 10/04/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 6557Research potential claims against
Renovate America and county; review and
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revise complaint.

83093.001 10/05/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.80 1,792.00 6558Review and Revise complaint; add claims
for TILA sections 1639c, d, e,

83093.001 10/06/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.20 1,408.00 6559Review and revise complaint; TILA claims;
research.

83093.001 10/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 6560Research regarding California 
; Research regarding

California ;
discussions with J. Pollack regarding
same; review statutes; research case law;
research regarding Renovate America's

.
83093.001 10/11/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.40 896.00 6561Research regarding California 

; discussion with J.
Pollack and D. Krasner regarding

 in
California statute; review email regarding

83093.001 10/13/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.50 960.00 6562Research regarding 

and definition of ; review
and revise complaint.

83093.001 10/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 6564Review and revise complaint.
83093.001 10/18/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 6565Revise complaint and sent to M. Rifkin

and J. Pollack to review.
83093.001 10/19/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 6566Meeting with M. Rifkin to review and

revise complaint.
83093.001 10/20/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 6567Revise Complaint.
83093.001 10/21/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.20 1,408.00 6568Review edited version of class action

complaint; conference call with M. Rifkin,
J. Pollack and R. Richert to discuss

.
83093.001 10/24/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 6569Conference with J. Pollack to discuss

revisions to complaint; research 

cause of action against Renovate
America; revise complaint to incorporate
edits.

83093.001 10/25/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.20 2,048.00 6570Meeting with M. Rifkin and J. Pollack to
review and revise complaint; research
regarding

; research regarding

83093.001 10/26/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.90 1,856.00 6571Review and revise class action complaint.
83093.001 10/27/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.30 1,472.00 6572Review and revise complaint; research

; add claim for
; revise damages allegations.

83093.001 10/31/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.40 1,536.00 6573Edit complaint to incorporate comments
from San Diego office.

83093.001 11/01/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 6599Research Judge D. Cohn; research San
Bernardino County local rules.

83093.001 11/02/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 6600Review filings and court information;
correspondence with co-counsel regarding
judges; research rules regarding striking
of judge; respond to media inquiries.

83093.001 11/03/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 6601Email correspondence with co-counsel;
review Law360 article about cases;
respond to media inquiries.

83093.001 11/04/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.90 1,216.00 6602Research cases decided by Superior
Court Judge; telephone conference with

;
email correspondence from 
regarding PACE Loans.

83093.001 11/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.40 1,536.00 6603Telephone conferences with , 
,  

83093.001 11/08/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.20 768.00 6604Telephone conference with 
regarding PACE Loans; correspondence
with co-counsel regarding same;
discussion with J. Pollack.

83093.001 11/09/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 6605Telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding peremptory
challenges; research regarding same;
review motion.

83093.001 11/10/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 6606Telephone conference with 
Renovate America ; review
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complaints 

 research

review law review article about legality of
PACE programs; research r

review PACE
legislation in 

.
83093.001 11/11/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.10 704.00 6607Telephone conference with SD attorney;

research regarding state PACE laws;
conference with J. Pollack regarding
status.

83093.001 11/14/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 6608Research regarding case law on 
; conference call

with .
83093.001 11/15/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 6609Correspondence with ; email

correspondence with CA counsel
regarding peremptory challenges;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same;
research regarding legal brief filed by
CFPB regarding

research CFPB position.
83093.001 11/16/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.90 576.00 6610Telephone conference with potential class

member; review documents related to
PACE Loan; review 

 with Riverside; email
correspondence to CFPB regarding
amicus brief.

83093.001 11/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.80 512.00 6611Correspondence with ;
correspondence to , research
regarding  HERO program;
research 

83093.001 11/18/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.70 448.00 6612Research defense counsel experience
and prior cases; review article in San
Diego Union Tribune.

83093.001 11/21/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.80 512.00 6613Review revised 
.

83093.001 11/22/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.20 768.00 6614Email correspondence regarding briefing
on Motion to Dismiss; conference with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 11/23/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.50 320.00 6615Review email correspondence regarding
stipulations; conference with J. Pollack.

83093.001 11/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 6616Review stipulation; review emails
regarding ; review emails from
potential class members; discussion with
J. Pollack.

83093.001 11/30/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.70 448.00 6617Conference call with ; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; review
potential class member documents and
prepare calculations.

83093.001 12/05/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 6668Correspondence regarding pro hac vice
motions; conference with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83093.001 12/06/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 6669Review removal documents;
telephone conference with Shalov;
telephone conference with defendants
regarding consolidation; review Ramos
scheduling notice; review order striking
allegations in complaint; review 

g; conference with J. Pollack
regarding order.

83093.001 12/08/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 6670Email correspondence with San Diego
attorney, review notices of related cases;
review SD potential client documents;
conference with J. Pollack regarding
same.

83093.001 12/09/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6671Telephone conference with SD attorney
regarding potential clients; telephone
conference with potential Riverside client;
regarding pro hac vice motions.

83093.001 12/12/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 6672Email correspondence regarding potential
plaintiffs; meeting with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83093.001 12/13/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 6673Review  documents;
telephone conference with same; prepare
retainer letter; telephone conference with
potential Orange County plaintiff; research



KD Monday 05/18/2020  8:54 am

Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 17
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83093.001 Ramos/Richard
regarding consolidation; research
regarding  and 

; research regarding 
;

research regarding .
83093.001 12/14/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 6674Email correspondence with from

regarding status of lawsuits; review
order relating cases; discussion with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 12/16/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 6675Email correspondence regarding briefing
schedules; conference calls with potential
plaintiffs (Riverside, etc)

83093.001 12/19/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 6676Correspondence with S. Petetan regarding
; review client documents.

83093.001 12/20/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 6677Review ; correspondence
with ; call with
potential client.

83093.001 12/21/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 6678Review  Fourth Amended
Complaint; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same; telephone conference
with  CDCA case;
research regarding

;
research regarding L.R. 23-3 and
requirement for filing motion for class
certification.

83093.001 12/22/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 6679Call with possible client; review stipulation;
emails, conference with J. Pollack; review
order to show cause regarding status of
removal; review HERO loan documents
for potential new client.

83093.001 12/23/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6680Review documents for Renew Clients;
telephone conference with  from SD
regarding same.

83093.001 12/26/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 6681Conference call with M. Rifkin and J.
Pollack regarding motions for
consolidation and Interim Lead counsel;
email correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 12/30/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 6682Conference call with M. Rifkin and J.
Pollack regarding motions for
consolidation and Interim Lead counsel;
email correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 01/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 6715Discussion with J. Pollack regarding case
status and strategy; research regarding

83093.001 01/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 6716Conference calls with potential class
members, .

83093.001 01/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 6717Research regarding  cause of
action; review HERO documents for

review documents provided by

review motion to consolidate
and for interim lead.

83093.001 01/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 6718Emails regarding Stipulation on Motions to
Dismiss; research regarding 

, case law and legislative history of
statutory provision.

83093.001 01/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6729Conference with J. Pollack regarding
consolidation; review ECF Notice
regarding pro hac vice applications;
research TILA cases regarding

.
83093.001 01/10/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 Conference with M. Rifkin regarding 

; research case law regarding
same; research 9th Cir. authority
regarding same; research 9th Cir. rules
regarding citation to unpublished decisions
(1.1); conference with J. Pollack regarding
consolidation and interim lead counsel;
research rule 23(g) and related case law;
telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding strategy for
consolidation and interim lead; participate
in meet and confer with defendants
regarding Motion to Dismiss; motion to
consolidate; motion for interim lead;
adjournment of motion for class
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certification under local rule;
correspondence with 
regarding PACE article; telephone
conference with regarding same.

83093.001 01/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6731Review HERO Financing Documents for
 prepare computations of

same; review and revise motion to
consolidate and motion for interim lead
counsel.

83093.001 01/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 6732Review and revise Motion for Interim Lead
and Consolidation; research regarding

; discussions with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 01/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 6733Review motion for interim lead counsel
and to consolidate; prepare list of past
TILA cases; conference with Defendants'
counsel regarding return date of motion.

83093.001 01/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 6734Conference with J. Pollack regarding
potential new clients and motion to
dismiss; telephone conference with
potential HERO borrower; review
documents from HERO borrower and
prepare calculations regarding same.

83093.001 01/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 6735Research regarding issues raised in
motion to dismiss.

83093.001 01/19/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 6736Prepare amended complaint; research
regarding Renovate America 

; review 
; research definition of 

and issue of  in definition
of ; review motion to dismiss filed by
Renovate America and SANBAG.

83093.001 01/23/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6737Discussion with M. Rifkin regarding
strategy.

83093.001 01/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 6738Review SANBAG motion to dismiss;
review documents attached to request for
judicial notice; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding strategy.

83093.001 01/25/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 6739Research regarding .
83093.001 01/26/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 6740Research regarding  and

 and potential
claims.

83093.001 01/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 6741Research legislative history of 
legislation including  in
statute; research 

; research
legislative history of  and other
PACE related legislation; research CA

; research CA

rule.
83093.001 01/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 6742Review and revise document requests to

Defendants; research regarding
 to

TILA; discussions with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83093.001 01/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6743Review and revise discovery requests to
Defendants; review client documents;
discussions with J. Pollack regarding
discovery.

83093.001 02/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.40 1,560.00 6769Finalize Request for Production;
discussion with potential plaintiff;
discussions with J. Pollack; research
regarding municipal bonds; prepare
calculations for potential plaintiff; research

 paid by plaintiffs.
83093.001 02/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.70 1,755.00 6770Prepare calculations for plaintiff and other

potential plaintiffs regarding 
and

research 

research regarding
legislative history of , research
regarding 17200 allegations; review and
revise draft of Amended Complaint.

83093.001 02/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.30 1,495.00 6771Conference with M. Rifkin regarding
Amended Complaint; review and revise
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Amended Complaint; research regarding

; research
regarding  for clients.

83093.001 02/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 6772Prepare calculations for clients and
other borrowers; prepare  calculations
based on sample documents on Renovate
America's website; review and revise
stipulations regarding extensions of time
to file Amended Complaints; research

 PACE laws;
discussions with J. Pollack

83093.001 02/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 6773Review and Revise Amended Complaint
83093.001 02/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.00 1,300.00 6774Review and revise amended complaint.
83093.001 02/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6775Review and Revise Amended Complaint
83093.001 02/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 6776Review and revise Amended Complaint
83093.001 02/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.20 2,080.00 6777Review and revise Amended Complaint
83093.001 02/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.80 1,820.00 6778Review and revise Amended Complaint
83093.001 02/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 6779Review and revise Amended Complaint;

prepare San Bernardino specific Amended
Complaint

83093.001 02/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 4.70 3,055.00 6780Research 
review and revise Amended Complaint

83093.001 02/21/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.30 1,495.00 6781Review and revise Amended Complaint
for San Bernardino County

83093.001 02/22/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 6782Finalize Amended Complaint; Conference
call with ; discussions with J.
Pollack

83093.001 03/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 6805Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83093.001 03/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 6806Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83093.001 03/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.40 1,560.00 6807Review Motion to Dismiss Amended

Complaint filed by SANBAG and Renovate
America; compare to WRCOG motions;
review Request for Judicial Notice;
Discussion with 
regarding cases; Opposition to Motion to
Dismiss.

83093.001 03/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 6808Research regarding foreclosure
procedures in CA; research regarding

Mortgage; prepare
opposition to motion to dismiss.

83093.001 03/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 6809Prepare opposition to motion to dismiss;
telephone conference with counsel for
amicus; review amicus brief; research
regarding standing to file amicus; research
connection between amicus and
Defendants; discussion with J. Pollack.

83093.001 03/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 6810Review and revise Opposition to Motion to
Dismiss.

83093.001 03/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.50 975.00 6811Review portion of opposition brief
prepared by J. Pollack; review Amicus;
research regarding amicus;
correspondence with co-counsel regarding
amicus; prepare opposition to motion to
dismiss.

83093.001 03/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 6812Review amicus brief filed by Local
Government Commission; review sources
cited in brief; research regarding whether

.
83093.001 03/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 6813Review Local Gov Commission amicus

brief; research regarding 
and Renovate America HERO

; review and
revise opposition to motion to dismiss;
meet with M. Rifkin to discuss opposition
brief.

83093.001 03/20/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 6814Prepare Request for Judicial Notice and
exhibits.

83093.001 03/21/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 6815Prepare opposition to motion to dismiss;
finalize request for judicial notice.

83093.001 03/22/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 4.80 3,120.00 6816Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83093.001 03/23/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 6817Review and revise opposition to motion to

dismiss.
83093.001 03/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.90 1,885.00 6818Research regarding amicus; prepare

opposition to amicus; meeting with M.
Rifkin and J. Pollack.

83093.001 03/28/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 6819Telephone conference with potential
plaintiff; review ECF filings and organize
for hearing; discussion with J. Pollack.

83093.001 04/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 6837Review Reply Briefs; Request for Judicial
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Notice; Opposition to Plaintiffs' Request
for Judicial Notice; discussion with J.
Pollack regarding same.  Research

 introduced by 

83093.001 04/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 6838Prepare Reply in Support of Plaintiffs'
Request for Judicial Notice; research
regarding federal PACE legislation.

83093.001 04/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 6839Prepare Reply in Support of Plaintiffs'
Request for Judicial Notice; research
regarding federal PACE legislation.

83093.001 04/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 6840Telephone conference with  from
 regarding federal

PACE legislation; research bills, press
releases.  Correspondence with 

.
83093.001 04/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 6841Correspondence with  office;

prepare information to provide to ;
review draft of Joint 26 report.

83093.001 04/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 6842Review and revise joint report.
83093.001 04/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6843Discuss joint report with J. Pollack; review

discovery requests to defendants.
83093.001 04/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 6844Prepare Reply in Support of Request for

RJN; review and revise Joint Report;
research regarding  for
non-disclosures; discussions with J.
Pollack regarding Joint Report.

83093.001 04/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 6845Conference with J. Pollack regarding
motions to dismiss and joint report;
telephone conference with HERO
borrowers.

83093.001 04/20/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 6846Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 04/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 6847Correspondence with counsel for 
; prepare Notice of

Supplemental Authority; telephone
conferences with HERO borrowers;
telephone conference with J. Pollack and
B. Manifold.

83093.001 04/25/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 6848Correspondence with counsel for .
; review and revise notice of

supplemental authority; research
regarding same.

83093.001 04/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6849Telephone conferences with HERO
borrowers; prepare for hearing on Motion
to Dismiss.

83093.001 04/28/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 6850Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 04/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 6851Travel to Los Angeles and prepare for
hearing on Motion to Dismiss; meeting
with J. Pollack and L. Shalov regarding
same.

83093.001 05/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 4.60 2,990.00 6854Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
appear at hearing; travel from LA to NYC.

83093.001 05/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6855Correspondence with 
 regarding PACE Loans and

hearing on Motion to Dismiss; provide
documents regarding 

.
83093.001 05/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6856Telephone conference with 

 regarding 
.

83093.001 05/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 6857Correspondence with potential class
members; review documents.

83093.001 05/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6858Telephone conference with 
regarding HERO program;

research regarding status of county
programs.

83093.001 05/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6859Review documents for PACE program;
correspondence with 
regarding PACE legislation.

83093.001 05/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 6860Review new case filed in CA; research
regarding same.

83093.001 06/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 6861Correspondence with PACE borrower
regarding HERO loans and status of
cases.

83093.001 06/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6862Telephone conference with HERO
borrower; review documents.

83093.001 06/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 6863Review PACE loan documents provided
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by potential client.

83093.001 06/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6864Correspondence regarding Order to Show
Cause; review PACE loan documents.

83093.001 07/06/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.50 325.00 6876Review PACE loan documents from RA
competitor.

83093.001 07/18/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 6877Review decisions granting County's
motion to dismiss and remanding state
claims back to Superior Court; research
regarding when appeal must be filed and
whether decision on motion to dismiss and
remand is appealable; correspondence to

regarding decision; discussions with
J. Pollak and M. Rifkin regarding same.

83093.001 07/19/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.50 325.00 6878Meeting with J. Pollack and R. Rickert to
discuss decision in HERO cases.

83093.001 07/31/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 6879Review Superior Court dockets;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding
strategy.

83093.001 08/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.00 650.00 6915Review docket report; discuss status with
J. Pollack; research new judge assigned in
case.

83093.001 08/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 6916Research regarding "final judgment" for
purposes of appeal; telephone conference
with  discussions with J.
Pollack.

83093.001 08/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 6917Call with counsel for counties; discussion
regarding judgments; review Superior
Court rules and dockets.

83093.001 08/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 6918Telephone conference with counsel for
counties regarding judgment; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; research
re coordination; review notice of
conference.

83093.001 08/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6919Review court orders, discuss coordination.
83093.001 08/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6920Emails regarding appeal of District Court

decision and settlement with counties;
review Superior Court dockets for activity.

83093.001 08/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6921Discussion with J. Pollack regarding
status; research regarding time to appeal;
consolidation and strike judges.

83093.001 08/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6922Telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding status; email
correspondence with counsel; review
Superior Court dockets.

83093.001 08/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6923Review and revise coordination motion.
83093.001 08/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6924Review dockets and rules regarding status

reports; begin draft of report.
83093.001 08/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6925Review and revise case management

statement and rules; review coordination
motion; correspondence with co-counsel.

83093.001 09/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6928Telephone conference with 
; review court rules; review

documents from Defendants.
83093.001 09/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 6929Appearance via telephone in San

Bernardino Superior Court status
conference.

83093.001 09/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6930Review proposed Judgment and email
correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 09/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 6931Telephone conference with Judicial
Council regarding status of coordination
motion.

83093.001 10/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 6955Review status of coordination motion;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 10/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6956Correspondence with HERO borrower and
potential client regarding HERO loan;
research regarding same.

83093.001 10/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 6957Review coordination order, discussion with
J. Pollack regarding same; email
correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 10/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 6958Review 
; discussion with J. Pollack

regarding same.
83093.001 10/10/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 6959Review  review second

amended complaint; review motion to
dismiss second amended complaint;
research CA law for claims asserted
against .

83093.001 12/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.00 1,950.00 6960Travel to CA for coordination hearing;
prepare for same; meet with counsel to
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prepare.

83093.001 12/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.80 1,820.00 6961Prepare for hearing and attend hearing;
travel to NYC.

83093.001 12/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 6962Travel to NYC on red eye flight; call with J.
Pollack to discuss proposed settlement
terms.

83093.001 12/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 6963Settlement Calculations and conference
with J. Pollack.

83093.001 12/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 6964Review consolidation decision; discussion
with J. Pollack; research.

83093.001 01/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 7022Review notice from Court; discussion with
J. Pollack regarding same; research
coordination rules.

83093.001 02/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 7046Prepare draft of CMC Statement.
83093.001 02/05/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 7047Review revisions to CMC statement; email

correspondence regarding same.
83093.001 02/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 7048Email correspondence regarding CMC.
83093.001 02/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.70 462.00 7049Email correspondence regarding

appearance at CMC; research regarding
striking judge; email regarding 

claims; research regarding 
83093.001 02/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 7050Review transcript from CMC hearing;

discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.
83093.001 02/23/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7051Email correspondence regarding

; telephone conference
with plaintiffs.

83093.001 02/27/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 7052Review and revise Second Amended
Complaint.

83093.001 02/28/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 7053Research and discuss additional claims to
assert in SAC.

83093.001 03/01/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 7082Review and revise amended complaint;
research regarding causes of action.

83093.001 03/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 7083Review case management order; Review
and revise amended complaint; research
regarding causes of action.

83093.001 03/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.60 1,056.00 7084Review and revise amended complaint;
research updated factual allegations and
new disclosures; review memorandum
regarding cause of action for fraud and
tortious interference; review
complaints.

83093.001 03/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 7085Review and revise amended complaint;
research regarding factual allegations and
supporting documentation.

83093.001 03/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.80 1,188.00 7086Review and revise amended complaint;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same;
research 

83093.001 03/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 7087Review and revise amended complaint;
emails regarding same.

83093.001 03/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 7088Finalize amended complaint.
83093.001 04/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 7089Review court's order regarding filing of

amended complaints; email
correspondence with Defendant regarding
same.

83093.001 04/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 7090Meet and confer with Defendant regarding
demurrer to Amended Complaint; email
correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 04/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 7091Review demurrer to Amended Complaint;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83093.001 05/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7092Review draft of opposition to demurrer.
Email correspondence regarding CMC
joint statement.

83093.001 05/07/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 7093Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
research regarding same.

83093.001 05/08/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.10 1,386.00 7094Review demurrer and draft of opposition;
research  

; factual research regarding
.

83093.001 05/09/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 7095Prepare RJN; review and revise
opposition to demurrer.

83093.001 05/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 7096Review and revise RJN; review and revise
opposition to demurrer; research
regarding same.

83093.001 05/11/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 7097Research regarding claims and
; emails regarding

same.
83093.001 05/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.80 1,188.00 7098Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
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send to J. Pollack and M. Rifkin for review;
email correspondence regarding clerk's
rejection of Defendant's demurrer.

83093.001 05/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7099Email correspondence regarding rejection
of Defendant's demurrer; review docket;
email correspondence with Defendant
regarding same.

83093.001 05/22/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 7100Review amended demurrer; review and
revise brief.

83093.001 05/23/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 7101Research regarding Renovate America
; research

regarding ;
review and revise opposition to demurrer.

83093.001 05/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 7102Edit opposition to demurrer;
correspondence with M. Rifkin regarding
edits.

83093.001 05/25/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7103Email correspondence regarding service
of opposition to demurrer.

83093.001 05/29/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.60 1,056.00 7104Edit opposition to demurrer; prepare RJN;
prepare Declaration of Randall S.
Newman in opposition to demurrer.

83093.001 05/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.10 1,386.00 7105Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
RSN Declaration; RJN; research
regarding RA documents.

83093.001 05/31/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.20 792.00 7107Finalize opposition to demurrer; RSN
Declaration; RJN.

83093.001 06/01/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7108Review documents filed in opposition;
research regarding 

83093.001 06/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 7109Review and revise joint CMC statement.
83093.001 06/05/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7110Joint CMC statement; email

correspondence regarding same.
83093.001 06/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7111Review Defendant's reply brief in support

of demurrer.
83093.001 06/07/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7112Review Defendant's reply brief in support

of demurrer; meeting with J. Pollack
regarding hearing; review cases cited by
Defendant in Reply.

83093.001 06/08/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 7113Review and revise CMC statement;
correspondence with Defendant's counsel
regarding same; review Court's 11/8/16
CMO order; discussions with J. Pollack.

83093.001 06/11/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 7114Prepare documents for hearing in
Riverside County on demurrer.

83093.001 06/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.60 1,716.00 7115Travel to CA for hearing on demurrer;
review motion and opposition; review
tentative ruling; telephone conference with
J. Pollack and M. Rifkin.

83093.001 06/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 3.10 2,046.00 7116Prepare for hearing on demurrer; attend
hearing; discussions with Defendant's
counsel; telephone conference with J.
Pollack and M. Rifkin; travel to NY.

83093.001 06/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7117Informal discovery research; meeting with
J. Pollack and M. Rifkin regarding
discovery requests; call Defendant's
counsel.

83093.001 06/20/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7118Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery and
settlement; email correspondence
regarding same.

83093.001 07/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.80 528.00 7119Review cases filed by  against
Renovate America; research regarding
status of cases; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same; review and revise CMC
statement.

83093.001 07/03/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 7120Conference call with counsel for 
 regarding cases against Renovate

America; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding Defendant's answer and
discovery.

83093.001 07/09/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.70 462.00 7121Review and revise joint CMC statement;
meeting with J. Pollack and M. Rifkin to
review.

83093.001 07/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 7122Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding joint CMC; review and revise for
filing.

83093.001 07/16/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.40 1,584.00 7123Travel to CA for status conference.
83093.001 07/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.80 1,848.00 7124Attend status conference; discussion with



KD Monday 05/18/2020  8:54 am

Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 24
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83093.001 Ramos/Richard
M. Sheldon regarding settlement;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding
status; travel to NY.

83093.001 07/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7125Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery and
settlement; emails regarding same.

83093.001 08/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7126Correspondence with M. Sheldon
regarding production of documents
requested in informal discovery.

83093.001 08/28/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7127Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; emails.

83093.001 09/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7128Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding informal discovery.

83093.001 09/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7129Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery.

83093.001 09/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 7130Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding informal discovery; review letter
from Defendant regarding settlement;
review calculation of 
damages; review 

; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83093.001 09/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 7131Telephone conference with Defendant;
email correspondence regarding
settlement.

83093.001 09/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7132Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83093.001 09/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7133Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement; email
correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 09/25/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7134Email correspondence with co-counsel
regarding settlement.

83093.001 09/26/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7135Email correspondence with co-counsel
regarding settlement.

83093.001 09/27/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7136Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement; email
correspondence regarding same.

83093.001 09/27/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.70 462.00 7137Telephone appearance in San Bernardino
County regarding case status

83093.001 10/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7138Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83093.001 10/03/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7139Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83093.001 10/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.00 7140Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83093.001 10/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7141Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83093.001 10/22/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 7142Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement; review 

; email correspondence
regarding same.

83093.001 10/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7143Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

83093.001 10/29/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7144Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

83093.001 10/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7145Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

83093.001 10/31/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 7146Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

Subtotal for Timekeeper RSN Billable 499.95 322,703.00 Randall  S. Newman

83093.001 02/28/2018 KMM P 499 555.00 0.20 111.00 7018Comms. w/Pollack and Newman re
research for complaint.

Subtotal for Timekeeper KMM Billable 0.20 111.00 Kate M. McGuire

83093.001 12/26/2016 BD P 499 440.00 1.20 528.00 6666Review complaints, notice of related case,
notice of removal, prepare motion to
coordinate.

83093.001 12/29/2016 BD P 499 440.00 0.90 396.00 6691Prepare motion to consolidate and appoint
WHAFH as interim lead counsel.

83093.001 04/16/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.00 445.00 6994Prepare for hearing re amended
complaints by reviewing stipulation, MTDs,
order re MTD, complaints, amended
complaints, researching case law re

,
prepare and respond to emails with RN
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and JP re amended complaints.

83093.001 04/17/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.40 1,068.00 6995Prepare for and attend status conference
re amended complaints, confer with RRR,
RN and JP re same, prepare email with M.
Madden re same, review demurrer,
research case law re demurrer.

83093.001 04/19/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.30 133.50 6996Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 04/20/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 6997Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 04/24/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.50 1,112.50 6998Prepare opposition to demurrer while

researching case law.
83093.001 04/25/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.40 1,068.00 6999Prepare opposition to demurrer while

researching case law and legislative
history of ,
review new class action filed in LA County.

83093.001 04/27/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.60 712.00 7000Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 04/30/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.80 801.00 7001Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 05/01/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.30 1,023.50 7036Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 05/02/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.80 1,246.00 7037Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 05/03/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.90 1,290.50 7038Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83093.001 05/15/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 7039Review emails from RRR, JP, RN and KC

re demurrer being rejected by court, denial
of stip for additional pages and denial of
PHV application.

83093.001 05/29/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.30 578.50 7040Confer with RRR and JP re CMC
statement, review judge's case
management order, local rules and prior
case management statement, prepare
case management statement, review
emails from RN and RRR re opposition to
demurrer.

83093.001 05/30/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.80 801.00 7041Review emails from RRR, JP and RN re
opposition to demurrer, prepare CMC
statement.

83093.001 06/05/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.40 178.00 7064Review email from RN re CMC statement,
review edits to statement, edit statement,
research local rules re remand.

83093.001 06/08/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.10 44.50 7065Review numerous emails from defendant's
counsel, RRR and JP re CMC statement.

83093.001 12/14/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 7159Confer with RRB re CMC, review emails
from KC re pro hac vice applications,
confer with KC re register of actions.

83093.001 12/17/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.50 1,112.50 7160Review CMC statement, P/C with RRB, JP
and RN re same, review complaints,
review emails from RRB and RN re status
conference, review prior CMC statement
and related minute order, review tentative
rulings, confer with KC re pro hac vice
applications, travel to Riverside for
hearing.

83093.001 12/18/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.50 667.50 7161Travel to and attend CMC, travel back to
SD.

83093.001 07/09/2019 BD P 499 450.00 1.60 720.00 7190Review settlement agreement, prepare
motion for preliminary approval.

Subtotal for Timekeeper BD Billable 31.90 14,193.00 Brittany DeJong

83093.001 10/26/2016 JAC P 499 335.00 1.00 335.00 6620Review docket on Bloomberg; start
drafting PHV motion in state court

83093.001 11/04/2016 JAC P 499 335.00 3.30 1,105.50 6628Courtlink research re Judges; court with R.
Neuman; review PHV motions; review
Super. Ct. dockets; emails to JLP.

83093.001 11/16/2016 JAC P 499 335.00 2.70 904.50 6629Research
83093.001 12/02/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 6702review dockets; research
83093.001 12/07/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 1.50 472.50 6703Prepare docs for e-filing
83093.001 12/23/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 0.30 94.50 6712Emails to JLP; review PHV Apps
83093.001 01/04/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 1.30 409.50 6713PHV motion docs; editing forms; call Mario

Jaramilo; conf with JLP
83093.001 01/06/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 6714Review dockets; conf with JLP
83093.001 02/09/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.50 157.50 6783doc organization
83093.001 03/20/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.70 220.50 6826Research
83093.001 03/22/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 2.50 787.50 6827Review defs' briefs re. MTD; conf with JLP
83093.001 07/24/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.70 220.50 6885Research
83093.001 08/03/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 6901Review docket on courtlink; docs for RSN
83093.001 11/02/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 0.70 224.00 7156Plaintiffs' report; conf with DWK
83093.001 11/05/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 0.90 288.00 7157Plaintiff reports
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83093.001 11/06/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 1.00 320.00 7158Review and edit PHV Apps for MCR and

GMN; email and call KC in Cali office; get
signature pages - scan to KC; review court
twebsite re admissions

Subtotal for Timekeeper JAC Billable 18.30 5,917.50 James A.Cirigliano

83093.001 11/07/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.80 180.00 7148Compiled, filed and served 4 PHV
Applications (time divided three ways for
HERO)

83093.001 12/10/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.20 45.00 7162Prepared, gathered signatures, filed and
served Stip and PO for Advancing PHV
App Hearing

83093.001 12/14/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.80 180.00 7163Drafted Notice of Entry of Order, filed and
Served

Subtotal for Timekeeper AML Billable 1.80 405.00 Alexandra Loutsenhizer

83093.001 01/06/2020 KW P 499 200.00 0.70 140.00 7233Preparing POS for RN CourtCall
appearance and serving via email

Subtotal for Timekeeper KW Billable 0.70 140.00 Kerri Warren

83093.001 12/22/2016 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 6657Review multiple emails re PHV
applications for JLP, counsel with KC re
same

83093.001 12/27/2016 WL P 499 205.00 2.10 430.50 6658Fact-check Mtn for Lead Plaintiff (review
emails and counsel with BND re same)
(All HERO cases)

83093.001 12/30/2016 WL P 499 205.00 0.50 102.50 6659Calendar multiple deadlines
83093.001 12/29/2016 WL P 499 205.00 0.60 123.00 6665Draft MCR Decl ISO Mtn for lead counsel
83093.001 02/06/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 6760File joint stip and PO with CD Cal,

download and save filed version to N drive
83093.001 02/13/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.60 328.00 6761Paralegal reply brief, consult with RRR

and KC re same, prepare brief for filing
and file same, draft and send
correspondence to clerk and courtesy
copies to WOJ

83093.001 02/17/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 6762Fix formatting issues on Ntc of intent to
amend, file same

83093.001 03/23/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.10 430.50 6797Cite check AC references in Opp to MTD
83093.001 04/12/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 6835Speak to class member re case, send

information to Janine
83093.001 08/07/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.60 123.00 6886Prepare and file Ntc of Entry of Order with

WOJ, serve same on parties, save
conformed copy onto N drive

83093.001 08/14/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 6887Review emails from Janine and BCM re
issues surrounding coordination; forward
pleading requested by Janine

83093.001 08/31/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.10 225.50 6888Speak with clk and review dkt re hearing
deadlines, email to RRR, RSN and JP re
same; pull and organize all RRR decl
exhibits

83093.001 09/05/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.20 246.00 6912Schedule telephonic appearance for RSN
with CourtCall, emails with RRR re filing
and service of Ntc of Telephonic
appearance, create notice and forward to
WOJ for filing, emails and calls with WOJ
re filing issues

83093.001 09/08/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 6913Check Dkt re trial setting conference,
email RRR re same

83093.001 09/11/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 6914t/c with class member, email Janine re
same; calendar trial setting conference

83093.001 10/04/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.90 184.50 6933Draft Ntc of Entry of Order (JCCP), file
and serve same upon defendants
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Subtotal for Timekeeper WL Billable 12.40 2,542.00 Windy Loritsch

83093.001 10/25/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 1.00 250.00 6554Format complaint for CA Superior Ct.
83093.001 10/28/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 4.80 1,200.00 6555Format and paralegal complaint
83093.001 10/31/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 1.30 325.00 6556Finalize complaint; draft summons and

civil cover sheet; check local rules re local
forms and correct location for filing; corr.
re certificate of assignment; draft same

83093.001 11/01/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.30 75.00 6592Receipt of all file stamped face pages;
save same to sys. and forward to NY

83093.001 11/02/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.30 75.00 6593Research re correct addresses/entities for
service of process; phone calls re same;
arrange for service of process via WOJ
and First Legal

83093.001 11/10/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.20 50.00 6594Research re form of peremptory
challenges

83093.001 11/15/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.40 100.00 6595Finalize peremptory challenge docs; file
same via WOJ

83093.001 12/02/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 6660Check register of actions for removal from
federal court; corr. re same

83093.001 12/07/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.50 127.50 6661Create federal caption (.2); calendar
deadlines per Order Setting Status
Conference (.3)

83093.001 12/08/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 6662E-file POS summons re all defs
83093.001 12/16/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.40 102.00 6663Remove scheduling conference and

related deadlines from calendar per
transfer order; update caption w/ new
judge's info (.2); finalize PHV applications
with local counsel info (.2)

83093.001 12/22/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.40 102.00 6664Corr. re existence of PHV order; check
docket re same; corrections to PHV
application admission dates

83093.001 01/04/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 6704Corr. re status of PHV applications for JLP
and MCR

83093.001 01/06/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 6705corr. re fixing error in PHV apps
83093.001 01/10/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 6706Research re availability of docs from

83093.001 01/11/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 6707Reformat PO re motion for consolidation
and interim lead counsel (.2)

83093.001 01/12/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.20 306.00 6708Paralegal mtn for consolidation and for
interim class counsel

83093.001 01/13/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.80 459.00 6709Finalize edits to mtn for consolidation and
for interim class counsel; update RRR
Decl re same and PO; corr. w/ L.Shalov re
firm resume and cited cases; finalize decl
and PO; e-file all docs; submit Word
version of PO to chambers

83093.001 01/17/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 6710Save file stamped copies to sys.
83093.001 01/24/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.70 178.50 6711Draft stip and PO re deadline to file mtn

for class cert; e-file same; send Word
version of PO to chambers (.6); calendar
briefing deadlines and hearing for mtn to
consolidate and appoint interim class
counsel (.1)

83093.001 03/23/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 4.20 1,071.00 6795Paralegal and finalize Opp to MTD;
finalize corrected RJN; e-file same

83093.001 03/24/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.30 331.50 6796Save file stamped Opp to MTD and
corrected RJN to sys; arrange for
chambers copies re same via WOJ; draft
notice of errata; e-file same; arrange for
chambers copies via WOJ

83093.001 08/04/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.60 159.00 6890Draft Notice of Entry of Order and POS
83093.001 08/10/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.80 212.00 6891Draft Notice of Entry of Order re

Reassignment; file same via WOJ; send
service copies via U.S. Mail

83093.001 09/08/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.30 79.50 6902Corr. re Judicial Council docs due re
service and filing of petition

83093.001 11/30/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.10 26.50 6939Recalendar trial setting conference per
corr.
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83093.001 12/12/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.30 79.50 6948Draft notice of entry of order re

coordination; same for JCCP
83093.001 12/13/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.70 185.50 6949Finalize notice of entry of order re

coordination; file same via WOJ; file JCCP
notice of entry of order re coordination via
email; serve via U.S. Mail; email electronic
copy to counsel

83093.001 01/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 6965Draft notice of entry of order assigning
coordination trial judge

83093.001 01/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 6966Finalize Notice of Entry of Order Assigning
Coordination Judge; arrange for filing of
same via WOJ; serve same via U.S. Mail

83093.001 01/23/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 6967Remove Trial Setting Conference from
calendar per Def corr. w/ clerk

83093.001 03/15/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 6976Finalize amended complaint; file via WOJ;
serve via email

83093.001 03/27/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 6977Call clerk re whether file still located in SB
court; file notice of stay and serve counsel
via email and U.S. Mail

83093.001 04/02/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7004Corr. re consolidated caption
83093.001 04/03/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7005Further corr. re consolidated caption
83093.001 04/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7006Edits to stipulation (.1); review JLP PHV

app (.1)
83093.001 04/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7007Send PHV in Word form to JLP; finalize

PHV app and letter to state bar
83093.001 04/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7008Final review of docs for filing; arrange for

filing of stip re evidence for amended
complaints and JLP PHV application

83093.001 04/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7009Check on status of stip re hearing off
calendar re amended complaints; save file
stamped face pages to sys.

83093.001 04/12/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7010Check on status of stipulation
83093.001 04/13/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 7011Call clerk re status of stipulation to vacate

4/17 hearing, PHV application, issued w/
fees (.3); research re 
lawsuits filed (.1)

83093.001 04/16/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.90 243.00 7012Call clerk re status of stip and PO
removing hearing (.4); schedule CourtCall
for hearing a circulate notice of same (.2);
draft chart of complaint claims through all
amendments (.3)

83093.001 04/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7013Print chart for hearing; corr. re court
calendar

83093.001 04/19/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7014Pull minute order from 4/17 hearing; corr.
re court reporter

83093.001 04/24/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 7015Research re legislative history of 

83093.001 04/25/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7016Research re  complaints;
download and circulate same

83093.001 04/30/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.50 135.00 7017Lexis research re MTD cases in CA
federal courts involving 

83093.001 05/01/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7024Check register of actions for any order re
page limits on demurrer briefing

83093.001 05/02/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7025Check cites to RJN, def brief in opp to
demurrer

83093.001 05/03/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 7026Format opp to demurrer
83093.001 05/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7027Corr. re CMC date moved; remove

calendar entry re same
83093.001 05/07/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7028Corr. re deadline to file joint statement;

coordinate calendaring of same
83093.001 05/15/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.60 162.00 7029Corr. re rejected filings; whether or not

opp to demurrer due; call clerk re same;
recalendar demurrer briefing deadlines
per CCP

83093.001 05/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 7030Corr. w/ WOJ re fees returned by court;
corr. w/ George at State Bar re whether
additional fee needs to be sent, copy of
revised PHV application; attempt to call
clerk re fees

83093.001 05/18/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.60 162.00 7031Draft revised JLP PHV app; call w/ clerk re
fees and procedures for correctly filing;
draft notice of hearing

83093.001 05/21/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.80 216.00 7032Finalize JLP amended PHV app, notice of
hearing, PO; arrange for filing of same via
WOJ; serve same via email; email copy of
revised docs to G. Bursiago at State Bar

83093.001 05/22/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7033Corr. re method of service for opp to
demurrer
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83093.001 05/30/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 7034Paralegal opp to demurrer
83093.001 05/31/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.90 513.00 7035Paralegal remaining cites to opp to

demurrer; finalize all docs and prep for
filing; file all docs via WOJ; arrange for
personal service at Goodwin Procter LA
office via WOJ; serve all counsel via FTP
link

83093.001 06/06/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7061Check causes of action for all 3 filed
complaints in chart

83093.001 06/08/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 7062Finalize CMC statement; fax file; serve via
email

83093.001 06/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7063Send chart of COAs to Randy; corr. re
appearance at hearing

83093.001 07/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7074Save demurrer opp file stamped face
pages to sys.

83093.001 07/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7075Finalize Joint CMC Statement; file same
via WOJ; serve same via email

83093.001 09/26/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.70 189.00 7079Check register of actions for hearing re
status of stay; arrange for RSN CourtCall
appearance; circulate service copy of RSN
CourtCall appearance

83093.001 09/27/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7080Calendar hearing re status of stay
83093.001 10/09/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 7106Finalize JLP notice of attorney info

change; file same via WOJ; serve same
via email

83093.001 11/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.60 432.00 7149Pull Order granting JLP PHV; corr. re
status of L. Shalov, MCR, GMN PHV
applications; draft same; corr. w/ W.
Wilkinson re L. Shalov PHV app

83093.001 11/06/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 7150Draft L. Shalov, MCR, GMN notice of
hearing, PHV PO for MCR, GMN;
calendar hearing

83093.001 11/07/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.50 135.00 7151Call clerk Rachel to get hearing date for
W. Wilkinson PHV app (.2); finalize
Wilkinson and Shalov PHV apps (.2); send
all docs to WOJ for filings (.1);

83093.001 11/08/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 7152Corr. w/ W. Wilkinson re status of PHV
filings, docs to send to State Bar (.1); draft
RRB letter to State Bar encl. MCR, GMN
payment; send same to Y. Rodriguez with
accompanying docs to be sent to State
Bar (.2)

83093.001 11/26/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7153Calendar 12/18 CMC; corr. re deadlines;
check Courtlink for 7/17 CMC minutes

83093.001 12/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 7171Acquire copy of 7/17/18 minutes from
CMC

83093.001 12/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7172Paralegal stip re advancing PHV hearings;
update service list

83093.001 12/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7173Finalize joint CMC statement; file same
via WOJ; serve same via email

83093.001 12/13/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7174Check for court reporter availability for
CMC; check on status of stip to move
PHV hearings to 12/18; schedule RSN
CourtCall appearance; circulate service
copy re same

83093.001 12/14/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 7175Corr. re status of PHV hearings; pull order
moving PHV hearings to 12/18; recalendar
tentative ruling reminder

83093.001 12/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 7176Serve Pollack notice of CourtCall
appearance (.1); check for tentative ruling
re PHV hearings; call tentative clerk re
same; leave voicemail with Dept. 5 re
same (.3)

83093.001 01/16/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.50 137.50 7177Paralegal, finalize and serve RFPs1 to
Defendant; calendar deadline to respond
to same

83093.001 01/17/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7178Send Word version of RFPs1 to defense
counsel per request

83093.001 01/23/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7179Download PHV orders to sys.
83093.001 02/06/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.40 110.00 7183Draft notice of change of address and

letter to clerk; file same via U.S. Mail;
serve counsel via email

83093.001 02/08/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7184Recalendar deadline for Def to respond to
RFPs1 per email request for extension

83093.001 03/21/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.40 110.00 7186Call clerk re continuing hearing re status
of stay or need for attorney to appear;
corr. re same (.3); calculate deadline to
file MTC re RFPs (.1)

83093.001 03/22/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.80 220.00 7187Arrange for RSN CourtCall appearance;
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circulate service copy re same

83093.001 06/20/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7189Corr. re continued CMC; calendar
deadline to file CMC statement

83093.001 07/03/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7194Set up RSN CourtCall for 7/9 status
conference; serve notice of same

83093.001 07/08/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7195Corr. re status of stip to continue status
conference; cancel RSN CourtCall
appearance

83093.001 07/09/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7196Calendar rescheduled status conference
and deadline to file status conference
statement

83093.001 07/11/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7197Save M. Sheldon CourtCall service copy
to sys.

83093.001 08/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7205Pull 
complaint

83093.001 08/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7206Pull 
complaint

83093.001 09/17/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7208Pull local rule re deadline to file case
management statement; corr. re CourtCall
for RSN

83093.001 10/25/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7210Serve RSN CourtCall notice via email;
double check status conference still on
calendar

83093.001 10/29/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7211Continue RSN CourtCall appearance per
Court's continuance of CMC

83093.001 11/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.80 220.00 7212Finalize stip re page limits for mtn for
preliminary approval; file same via First
Legal; serve same via email; begin to
paralegal mtn for preliminary approval

83093.001 11/13/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 1.90 522.50 7213Continue to paralegal mtn for preliminary
approval; reserve hearing date; calendar
same

83093.001 11/14/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 1.60 440.00 7214Finalize edits to mtn for preliminary
approval; paralegal RSN Decl and finalize
all attachments; file mtn for preliminary
approval and all supporting docs via First
Legal; serve same via email

83093.001 12/03/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.20 55.00 7215Draft notice of additional signature page to
settlement agreement

83093.001 12/04/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.20 55.00 7216Finalize notice of additional signature
page; file same via First Legal; serve
same via email; make sure motion fees
were satisfied; calendar deadline to file
status conference statement

83093.001 12/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7217Corr. re coverage for hearing, no need for
CourtCall

83093.001 12/16/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7218Check for tentative ruling; review of same;
recalendar hearing re preliminary approval
per tentative ruling

83093.001 12/23/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.30 82.50 7219Corr. w/ Y. Rodriguez re cc charges for
mtn for preliminary approval; call court
clerk re process for refund; recalendar
status conference per ROA

83093.001 12/30/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 7220Corr. w/ Y. Rodriguez re credit received
for filing fee charges

83093.001 01/02/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.80 224.00 7223Corr. re location of operative Word
versions of settlement docs that need to
be revised per court's tentative order (.1);
pull complaint, docket, doe amendments,
and

 case; calendar hearing
and briefing schedule for Hill mtn to file
complaint in intervention per register of
actions (.7)

83093.001 01/03/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.60 168.00 7224Check docket re 1/9 status conference;
set up CourtCall for same

83093.001 01/07/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7225Pull order continuing hearing re
preliminary approval

83093.001 01/14/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.40 112.00 7226Paralegal stip re changes to settlement
agreement, supplemental submission

83093.001 01/15/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.90 252.00 7227Finish paralegaling supplemental
submission re preliminary approval;
finalize all exhibits and decs re same; file
same via First Legal; serve same via
email

83093.001 01/16/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7228Check docket for any withdrawal of mtn to
intervene

83093.001 01/21/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7229Corr. w/ RSN re coverage of preliminary
approval hearing and checking for
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tentative ruling; check docket for entry of
ntc of withdrawal of Hill mtn to intervene;
remove mtn to intervene deadlines from
calendar

83093.001 01/22/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7230Pull copy of tentative ruling
83093.001 01/28/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7231Check register of actions for any sign of

preliminary approval order entered
83093.001 01/31/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7232Check register of actions for any sign of

preliminary approval order entered;
calendar final approval hearing

83093.001 02/04/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.40 112.00 7234Accept all changes to First Amended
Settlement Agreement, finalize all exhibits
and circulate same for signature

83093.001 02/06/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.60 168.00 7235Finalize amended proposed order re
preliminary approval and all exhibits; file
same via First Legal; serve same via
email

83093.001 02/28/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7236Check on status of amended preliminary
approval order; try to pull via Courtlink

83093.001 03/03/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7237Calculate deadlines per preliminary
approval order

83093.001 03/04/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 7238Calendar deadlines per settlement
agreement

Subtotal for Timekeeper KMC Billable 56.00 14,855.50 Kathryn M.Cabrera
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 83117.001 Loya/George
83117.001 10/26/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 0.70 654.50 29Conferences JLP re strategy.
83117.001 10/28/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 0.50 467.50 30Conference MCR, JLP, RN re pleadings

and strategy as relates to Cal
consolidation.

Subtotal for Timekeeper DWK Billable 1.20 1,122.00 Daniel W. Krasner

83117.001 12/07/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 115Review PHV issues; email from L. Shalov
and JP re status report.

83117.001 11/29/2016 MCR P 499 830.00 0.50 415.00 116Email from RSN re ; confer w/RSN
and JP re strategies.

83117.001 01/18/2017 MCR P 10 865.00 0.20 173.00 126Review Pace Loan article
83117.001 12/15/2016 MCR P 499 865.00 1.10 951.50 183Confer w/RSN re case issues and claims.
83117.001 03/02/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.60 519.00 306Review MTD; confer w/RSN re strategies.
83117.001 03/03/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.50 432.50 307Revise consolidation order; confer w/RSN

and JP re order and strategies.
83117.001 03/06/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 2.50 2,162.50 308Review MTD issues; confer RSN re Mtd

strategies.
83117.001 03/15/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 2.80 2,422.00 313Review and revise MTD opposition.
83117.001 03/17/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 3.60 3,114.00 314Review and revise brief; confer w/RSN re

changes.
83117.001 03/27/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 1.00 865.00 355Draft and revise amicus opp; confer

w/RSN re opp. brief.
83117.001 03/27/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.40 346.00 356Review update on background from RSN

and JP.
83117.001 03/30/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 357Email from RSN re legislation; confer

w/RSN re status; review ECF filing; email
from JP.

83117.001 04/03/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.50 432.50 358Review MTD reply briefs.
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83117.001 04/04/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.50 432.50 359Review and revise amicus response.
83117.001 04/06/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.60 519.00 362Email to and from RSN and JP re

legislation; confer w/RSN re .
83117.001 05/08/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 364Review WSJ article for RSN.
83117.001 04/07/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.60 519.00 368Email from RSN re financials; email to and

from  review financials.
83117.001 04/11/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.70 605.50 369Confer w/RSN re legislation; email from

RSN re ; email from J. Pollack
re .

83117.001 04/11/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 370Email to and from J. Pollack and RSN re
SANBAG and Renovate Ameriica

83117.001 04/18/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.80 692.00 371Email from RSN re PACE ;
confer w/RSN re strategies.

83117.001 04/24/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 372Email fro RSN re Renovate  America
Article.

83117.001 04/24/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 373Email to and from RSN re  
.

83117.001 04/28/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 374T/c from homeowner; email to RSN and J.
Pollack.

83117.001 04/28/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 375Review initial disclosures for RA.
83117.001 01/10/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.80 692.00 379Email from RSN re issues; confer

w/RSN and J. Pollack re strategies; email
from L. Shalov re consolidation.

83117.001 01/11/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.50 432.50 385Confer w/RSN and JP re strategies; email
from JP re class briefing schedule.

83117.001 01/12/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.90 778.50 386Review and revise consolidation and lead
counsel motion; confer w/RSN and JP.

83117.001 08/02/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 426Confer w/RSN re status and strategies.
83117.001 08/04/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 427Email form RRR, RSN, JP re status;

confer w/RSN re strategies.
83117.001 08/22/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 428Confer w/RSN re status and strategies.
83117.001 08/25/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 429Review coordination memo; confer w/RSN

re strategies.
83117.001 09/05/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.40 346.00 450Email from J. Pollack re appeal and

dismissal; confer w/RSN and J. Pollack re
dismissal of 

83117.001 09/27/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 462Email from JP re  confer
w/RSN and JP re status and strategies;
review article

83117.001 01/23/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 476Email from co-counsel; confer w/RSN re
strategies.

83117.001 02/06/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.20 173.00 477Email from JP and RRR re status
83117.001 02/06/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.30 259.50 478Confer w/RSN re coordination and

scheduling issues.
83117.001 02/13/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.40 346.00 479Confer RSN and JP re status and

strategies on consolidation and
assignment of cases.

83117.001 12/07/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.20 176.00 516Confer w/RSN re status and strategies.
83117.001 12/11/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.20 176.00 517Review draft settlement letter and confer

w/RSN re strategies.
83117.001 12/12/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.10 88.00 518Email from RSN re status.
83117.001 10/04/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.20 176.00 553Email from RSN re  article; email

from JP re article.
83117.001 07/18/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.40 352.00 587Review MTD; confer w/RSN and JP re

strategies.
83117.001 07/19/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.30 264.00 588Email from RSN re appeal of dismissal

decision; confer w/RSN re strategies.
83117.001 07/31/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.20 176.00 589Confer w/RSN re strategies.
83117.001 12/12/2017 MCR P 499 880.00 0.10 88.00 694Email from RSN re status.

Subtotal for Timekeeper MCR Billable 25.70 22,238.50 Mark C.Rifkin

83117.001 03/08/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.70 546.00 277T/C  re: potential SD plaintiff
(0.30); quick review MTD (0.20); send
MTD briefing to  (0.20);

83117.001 04/03/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.40 312.00 309e-mail exchange re: potential client
from (6x)

83117.001 04/24/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.30 234.00 310e-mail re:
contacting Randy or Janine

83117.001 04/25/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 1.70 1,326.00 311T/C Janine re: strategy (0.20); research
submission issues (0.40); review filing
re: supplemental materials (0.60); final
and file under JP's e-file (0.40); f/u
service and circulate filed document
(0.20)

83117.001 04/28/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.70 546.00 312T/C Janine re: initial disclosures (0.20);
review (0.20);
final/serve (0.30)

83117.001 05/01/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.30 234.00 336e-mail re MTD hearing to Randy or
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Janine

83117.001 05/12/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.60 468.00 337T/C  (0.30); follow up e-mail
with SB complaint (0.30);

83117.001 05/19/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.20 156.00 338respond to e-mails re: Renovate
America 

Subtotal for Timekeeper BCM Billable 4.90 3,822.00 Betsy C. Manifold

83117.001 09/23/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 71[Riverside HERO]  Sent retainer letter to
new client; olc's.

83117.001 09/29/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 1Emails re: client docs and reviewed same.
83117.001 09/30/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 2Continued olc's and emails re: new client /

docs.
83117.001 10/31/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 3Finalized cpt.
83117.001 11/01/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 4Emails and olc's re; filing of cpt.
83117.001 11/02/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 5Reviewed Court documents/rules; emails;

olc's.
83117.001 11/04/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 24Olc's and emails re: hearings/service.
83117.001 11/07/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.60 483.00 25Teleconference's with possible witnesses

and others re: case; olc's and emails.
83117.001 11/08/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 26Teleconference's and olc's and emails re:

witnesses.
83117.001 11/09/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 27Emails re: coordination motion;

teleconference and olc's' teleconference
office of Pro Tem.

83117.001 11/10/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.40 322.00 28Teleconference with ; olc's.
83117.001 11/16/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 31Teleconference potential client; reviewed

amicus by CFPB.
83117.001 11/17/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 32Olc's and email to CFPB.
83117.001 11/18/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 33Teleconference defense counsel; emails

and reviewed documents from possible
client; olc's re: same.

83117.001 11/22/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.70 563.50 34Reviewed updated  -
; emails re; schedule with

defendant; olc's re: same.
83117.001 11/23/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.70 563.50 35Worked on draft stipulation re: extension;

olc's.
83117.001 11/28/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 36Worked on draft stip; emails re: same;

emails re: CFPB; olc's.
83117.001 11/30/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.20 966.00 37Teleconference possible class member;

teleconference realtors re: case;
teleconference CFPB; emails; reviewed
possible client's docs.

83117.001 12/01/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 38Emails re; motion to remove.
83117.001 12/02/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 41Teleconference's defense counsel and

co-counsel re:  motion to remove and
reviewed removal papers; emails re:
same.

83117.001 12/06/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 42Conference call with defendants re:
possible consolidation and other
procedural issues; pro hac vice issues.

83117.001 12/07/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 43Reviewed pro hac voice motion for
extension; emails.

83117.001 12/09/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 63Teleconference class members; emails.
83117.001 12/13/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 65Teleconference's with potential clients;

olc's re: same.
83117.001 12/15/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 66Reviewed stip to coordinate briefing and

olc's re: same.
83117.001 12/16/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 67Emails re: schedule; teleconference

possible class member's attorney.
83117.001 12/21/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 69Teleconference attorney in contractor suit

re; RA; olc's; emails.
83117.001 12/22/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.80 644.00 70Teleconference class member; worked on

PHV.
83117.001 12/23/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 72Teleconferences and olc's re: 

program; pro hac app.; reviewed news
articles.

83117.001 01/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 73Worked on motion to consolidate; emails;
teleconferences; olc's re; M/D.

83117.001 01/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 74Teleconference possible client;
teleconference realtor association re:
facts; pro hac.

83117.001 01/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 75Olc's re: possible new plaintiff and
reviewed her docs and sent her emails.

83117.001 01/09/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 99Worked on draft motion to consolidate and
ILC.

83117.001 01/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 117Worked on Stipulation to Adjorn class
motion; meet and confer consolidate and
for interim lead counsel.
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83117.001 01/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 118Reviewed docs from client and olc's re:

same; worked on order re: consolidation
and lead and motion; worked on draft
stipulation to ajourn class motion.

83117.001 01/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 119Finalized draft of motion to consolidate
and lead; reviewed case re: indispensable
party.

83117.001 01/13/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 121Worked on finalizing motion to consolidate
and lead; conference call defendants.

83117.001 01/17/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.30 1,059.50 122Teleconference client and draft retainer
letter to same; emails with co-counsel re:
same.

83117.001 01/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 123Reviewed Court's Order setting scheduling
conference; reviewed motions to dismiss
and conference call with RN and LS re:
research; emails re: serving discovery.

83117.001 01/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 124Teleconference with defendant's counsel
Shelodon re: stipulation to adjourn and
olc's re: same; olc's re: am. cpt.

83117.001 01/20/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 125Teleconference class member re:
case/claims.

83117.001 01/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 127Worked on finalizing stip. and proposal
order to adjourn class motion.

83117.001 01/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 128Teleconference class member.
83117.001 01/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 151Worked on discovery drafts.
83117.001 01/31/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 152Continued work on draft discovery;

communications with class member re:
her docs, reviewed same.

83117.001 02/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 153Teleconference plaintiff re: being class rep
and explained same and drafted/sent
retainer letter; continued work on draft
discovery; olc's.

83117.001 02/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 154Continued work on am. cpt.
83117.001 02/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 155Contined work on am. cpt. and olc's re:

claims and issues; reviewed docs from
client; emails re: extension for am. cpt and
reviewed draft of same.

83117.001 02/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.20 978.00 156Teleconference class member re: case
and emails re: stip for extension; reviewed
opp consolidation and began draft of reply;
conference call with team re: am. cpt.

83117.001 02/07/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 157Worked on draft of reply on consolidation
motion.

83117.001 02/08/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 158Continued drafting reply on motion to
consolidate and interim class counsel.

83117.001 02/09/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 159Contined work on draft of reply on
consolidation and interim lead; reviewed
cases regarding defendants' defenses.

83117.001 02/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 160Continued work on reply on motion to
consolidate and interim lead.

83117.001 02/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 176Teleconference  (class
member) re: telling her

and
she said ; emails to send draft
cpt to clients; olc's re: same.

83117.001 02/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 177Worked on draft of am cpt.; emails with
client  re: am. cpt; email to client

olc's re: am. cpt.
83117.001 02/16/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 178Finalized am. cpt; olc's and

teleconferences re: same.
83117.001 02/17/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 179Sent complaint as filed to plaintiffs;

reviewed Court Order; olc's
83117.001 02/22/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 180Teleconference's ;

hearing prep.; emails with defendants re:
m/d.

83117.001 02/23/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 181Hearing prep. and teleconference Sheldon
re: moving CMH.

83117.001 02/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 182Emails re: Stipulation to Adjourn and
coordinate CMH; reviewed Court Order re:
canceled hearing.

83117.001 03/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 207Reviewed WRCOG m/d; olc's re: same;
emails re: opp.

83117.001 03/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 208Reviewed Court Order on Motion to
Consolidate and interim lead and olc's re:
same.

83117.001 03/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 209Worked on portion of opp. m/d.
83117.001 03/07/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 6.00 4,890.00 210Continued work on opp. m/d drafting.
83117.001 03/08/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 5.00 4,075.00 225Continued drafting opp m/d; olc's re:

same.
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83117.001 03/09/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.50 3,667.50 226Continued drafting opp m/d.
83117.001 03/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 3.50 2,852.50 227Continued work drafting opp m/d.
83117.001 03/13/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 228Continued work on opp m/d;

teleconference's counsel re: amicus brief
motion and researched same; emails re:
consolidated opposition.

83117.001 03/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 3.00 2,445.00 229Continued work on draft of opp m/d;
worked on stip re: same.

83117.001 03/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 3.00 2,445.00 230Reviewed amicus and motion; continued
to work on draft opp. m/d.

83117.001 03/20/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 6.00 4,890.00 231Reviewed draft of opp m/d and worked on
same; reviewed amicus brief of local
government Comm'n.

83117.001 03/21/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 6.50 5,297.50 232Worked on finalizing the opp. m/d for
filing.

83117.001 03/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 233Worked on opp m/amicus.
83117.001 03/28/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 234Olc's re: hearing and possible new cases.
83117.001 04/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.80 652.00 236Reviewed county's reply; teleconference

class member.
83117.001 04/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 248Prep. for m/d argument; reviewed Court

Order re: hearing change; emails re: new
bills in Congress re:  law and
reviewed same.

83117.001 04/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 275Meet and confer with defendants and
worked on draft of joint report.

83117.001 04/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 276Continued work on draft Joint Report; olc's
re: same.

83117.001 04/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 278Reviewed draft discovery request to
defendants and edited; continued work on
Joint report draft.

83117.001 04/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 279Reviewed R. 26f draft from defendants.
83117.001 04/17/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 280Finalized R. 26 Joint Report.
83117.001 04/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 281Olc's and teleconference's re: supp.

authority / submission on m/d; hearing
prep on m/d.

83117.001 04/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 283Worked on notice of supp. authority and
prep for hearing.

83117.001 04/26/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 284Prep. for oral argument.
83117.001 04/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 285Continued prep for hearing; olc's re: same.
83117.001 04/28/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 290Worked on draft initial disclosures;

hearing prep.; reviewed defendant's initial
disclosure.

83117.001 04/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 3.00 2,445.00 291Travel to CA for hearing; hearing prep.
83117.001 05/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 292Hearing, return to New York.
83117.001 05/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 302Phone calls with class members.
83117.001 05/22/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.20 978.00 330Teleconference's with multiple class

members.
83117.001 05/23/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 331Teleconference's class members re:

status.
83117.001 05/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 332Teleconference's class members re:

status.
83117.001 05/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 333Teleconference's class members.
83117.001 05/31/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 334Reviewed cpt filed in CA state court;

emails.
83117.001 06/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 335Teleconference's class members.
83117.001 06/13/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 339Teleconference class members re: status.
83117.001 06/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 340Teleconference possible experts.
83117.001 07/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 341Teleconference class members re:

update.
83117.001 07/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 342Teleconference's class members.
83117.001 07/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.80 652.00 360Teleconference class members re: status.
83117.001 07/13/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 361Teleconference's class members / emails.
83117.001 07/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.80 652.00 363Teleconference class members.
83117.001 07/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 365Reviewed Court Order on m/d and gp call

and olc's re: same.
83117.001 07/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 366Olc's to discuss remand issues and

possible appeal.
83117.001 07/21/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 367Emails re: remand to state court and

possible consolidation of cases;
teleconference defendant's counsel re:
same.

83117.001 07/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 376Sent opinion to client.
83117.001 07/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 377Reviewed drafts of judgment / final order

from county; emails re: same.
83117.001 07/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 378Worked on draft of judgment and emails

re: same; olc's and emails re:
consolidation in state court;
teleconference  re similar
cases in state court.
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83117.001 08/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 380Office conference and teleconference

regarding consolidation issues.
83117.001 08/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 383Teleconference Neudecker to discuss

judgment language and worked on same;
office conference; e-mails and
teleconferences Re: consolidation.

83117.001 08/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 384Teleconference counties Re: appeal;
office conference Re: same and
teleconferences.

83117.001 08/07/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.20 163.00 388E-mails regarding consolidation and told
defts of plaintiffs' position.

83117.001 08/14/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.00 815.00 393Worked on draft of joint petition to
coordinate.

83117.001 08/15/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 394Worked on joint petition to coordinate;
office conferences and telephone
conferences with defendants' counsel re:
appeal issues; e-mails.

83117.001 08/16/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.00 815.00 395Reviewed draft of judge disqualification;
telephone call with defendants' counsel re:
coordination; conference call with team re:
same.

83117.001 08/17/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.70 570.50 396Worked on petition for
coordination;e-mails.

83117.001 08/18/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.70 570.50 397Worked on m/coordination and sent to
defendant's counsel.

83117.001 09/05/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.50 407.50 401Meet and confer with defendants
regarding hearing and status report.

83117.001 09/06/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.00 815.00 402Telephone call with  regarding
decision to appeal; e-mails regarding
same; telephone calls with class
members.

83117.001 09/07/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.00 815.00 403Reviewed draft of Joint Status Report and
e-mails regarding same; e-mails regarding
discussions with clients.

83117.001 09/08/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 408Telephone call with  on
behalf of

worked on joint status report.
83117.001 09/11/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.30 244.50 410E-mails re filing of Joint Report and

hearing.
83117.001 09/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 439Revised draft of judgement and stip re:

fees re: federal claims and emails re:
same.

83117.001 09/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 440Office conferences re: hearing, jury fee,
motion to consolidate.

83117.001 09/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 441Finalized judgments and orders in federal
case for filing.

83117.001 09/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 442Reviewed articles regarding RA in
newspapers and office conferences
regarding same; emails.

83117.001 10/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 443Reviewed order regarding coordination;
teleconferences and emails regarding
same.

83117.001 10/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 463Emails regarding moving hearing date and
submitted request for same.

83117.001 10/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 464Worked on stipulation to change hearing
date for consolidation motion.

83117.001 10/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 468Emails regarding filing of stipulation with
Panel regarding coordination.

83117.001 11/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 474Worked on draft stipulation to adjourn
conference; emails.

83117.001 11/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 475Emails regarding hearing on consolidation
and preparation for same.

83117.001 11/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 483Preparation for hearing on consolidation;
emails regarding hearing time.

83117.001 12/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 484Pro hac vice papers for coordination
hearing; hearing preparation.

83117.001 12/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.70 2,200.50 485Travel to LA; preparation for hearing with
co-counsel.

83117.001 12/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.70 2,200.50 486Attended hearing; return to NYC.
83117.001 12/08/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 487Worked on settlement issues; office

conferences and teleconferences
regarding same; drafted settlement letter
to defendant.

83117.001 12/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 488Worked on settlement letter to defendant.
83117.001 12/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 489Worked on letter to defendant regarding

settlement; reviewed court order on
coordination; emails regarding same.

83117.001 12/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 490Emails regarding coordination and judge
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assignment.

83117.001 02/02/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 519Worked on joint status report to court.
83117.001 02/05/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 520Finalized joint status report.
83117.001 02/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 521Teleconferences regarding hearing and

schedule; emails regarding same.
83117.001 02/23/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 522Teleconference with defendant's counsel

regarding settlement; office conferences
and emails regarding same.

83117.001 02/28/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 523Call regarding research for complaints.
83117.001 03/06/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 548Emails and office conferences regarding

research for amended complaint.
83117.001 03/14/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.70 1,402.50 549Reviewed draft complaint; emails with

plaintiff Simpson.
83117.001 03/15/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 550Finalized complaint and sent to client.
83117.001 03/21/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 551Teleconference with class member

attorney.
83117.001 04/02/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 552Reviewed court order regarding amended

complaints; emails with defendant
regarding same.

83117.001 04/05/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 554Worked on stipulation regarding amended
complaint.

83117.001 04/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 567Emails regarding finalizing stipulation
regarding amended complaint.

83117.001 04/10/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 568Meet and confer on demurrer; emails
regarding stipulation filed with the court.

83117.001 04/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 569Stipulation regarding page extension and
emails regarding hearing date.

83117.001 04/17/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 570Office conferences and emails regarding
opposition to demurrer.

83117.001 05/04/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 599Emails regarding demurrer opposition and
teleconferences and reviewed draft of
same; emails regarding CMC.

83117.001 05/07/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 600Worked on demurrer opposition and
reviewed D. memorandum.

83117.001 05/08/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 615Continued work on opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 05/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 616Worked on opposition to demurrer and

office conference regarding draft.
83117.001 05/15/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 617Emails regarding demurrer due date/filing

issues; office conferences regarding
opposition.

83117.001 05/30/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 649Worked on opposition to demurer.
83117.001 06/05/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 651Reviewed draft of CMS and emails

regarding same.
83117.001 06/07/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 652Reviewed reply on demurrer; office

conferences regarding hearing.
83117.001 06/08/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 653Worked on CMS draft; office conferences

and emails.
83117.001 06/12/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.70 577.50 662Preparation for hearing/reviewed tentative.
83117.001 06/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 663Teleconferences and emails regarding

court ruling and discovery.
83117.001 06/19/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 664Office conferences regarding discovery

issues; call to defendant; emails.
83117.001 06/20/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 665Conference call with defendant regarding

discovery and settlement issues; emails.
83117.001 07/02/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 666Worked on CMS draft; office conferences

regarding same.
83117.001 07/03/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 672Teleconference with attorneys from 

 office conferences and emails
regarding hearing and discovery plan;
conference call regarding late answer by
RA.

83117.001 07/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 682Worked on draft CMS; sent to defendant.
83117.001 07/17/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 683Teleconferences regarding status

conference and emails regarding same.
83117.001 07/19/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 684Conference call with defendant's counsel

regarding informal discovery and
settlement; emails and teleconferences
regarding same.

83117.001 07/20/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 685Reviewed defendant's answer.
83117.001 08/23/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 695Emails with  regarding phone call.
83117.001 08/28/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 696Teleconference with defendant's counsel

and emails regarding same; office
conferences.

83117.001 08/29/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 697Teleconference with .

Subtotal for Timekeeper JLP Billable 166.80 135,977.00 Janine L.Pollack

83117.001 12/03/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 76Emails to/from co- and opposing counsel
re filing stipulation in federal court and
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receiving notice of removal papers.

83117.001 12/05/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 77Emails to/from JP re orders to file pro hac
vice applications

83117.001 12/06/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 78Conference call w/JP, RSN re order we
never saw from court clerk and pro hac
vice applications.

83117.001 12/09/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 79T/c from MCR re 

; emails to/from MCR/KC re same.
83117.001 12/26/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 1.20 780.00 80Emails to/from MCR and BND re drafting

motion for consolidation and appointment
of interim class counsel; legal research re
coordination as opposed to consolidation

83117.001 12/27/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.50 325.00 81Emails to/from MCR and JP re setting up
a meet-and-confer w/defense counsel;
email to defense counsel re
meet-and-confer conference on Thursday.

83117.001 12/28/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 82Emails to/from JP and defense counsel re
meet-and-confer.

83117.001 12/29/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 83Emails to/from co-counsel and defense
counsel re meet-and-confer conference
call tomorrow.

83117.001 12/30/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 2.30 1,495.00 84T/c w/Janine to prepare for conference
call; meet-and-confer telephonically with
defense counsel re consolidation and
appointment of WHAFH as interim class
counsel; review and edit motion re same;
email to MCR, JP and RSN re same;
confer w/BND re motion.

83117.001 01/10/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 130Conference call from JP and RSN re
conference call w/Defense counsel;
participate in call w/defense counsel; send
sample stipulations and proposed orders
to JP and RSN; emails to/from RSN re
obtaining copies of pleadings in another
old case re merits of MTD; review and edit
stipulation to move out class cert.
deadline; review local rules.

83117.001 01/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 131Confer w/KC re consolidation and interim
class counsel papers to be filed tomorrow;
emails to/from JP re same; review emails
to/from defense counsel.

83117.001 01/13/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 132Review motion for consolidation and
appointment of interim class counsel and
RRR declaration in support; emails to/from
co-counsel re same.

83117.001 01/18/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 133Emails to/from JP re court's scheduling
order and when we can begin discovery;
review FRCP 26.,

83117.001 02/03/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 197Confer w/Windy re getting documents
from county recorder's office; circulate
proposed stipulation and order to
co-counsel extending time to amend
complaint.

83117.001 02/06/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.70 455.00 198Review emails to/from defense counsel
and review stipulation and proposed order
extending time to amend complaint; confer
w/KC re filing of same;

83117.001 02/08/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 199Emails to/from JP re reply brief re
consolidation and lead counsel; confer
w/BND re her research project for same.

83117.001 02/13/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 200Draft conclusion to reply brief re motion to
consolidate and appoint interim class
counsel; emails to/from JP and t/c from
same re reply brief; review and supervise
finalization and filing of same.

83117.001 02/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.60 390.00 201Emails to/from JP re complaint due
tomorrow; confer w/BND re her research
on  claim;
review

83117.001 02/16/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.60 390.00 202Review emails to/from JP and BND re
.

83117.001 03/03/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 249Review order consolidating and appointing
WHAFH lead counsel; emails to/from JP
and t/c from MCR re same.

83117.001 03/07/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 250Emails to/from JP re research project for
BND.

83117.001 03/13/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 2.90 1,885.00 251Review and analysis of Defendants'
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motions to dismiss; forward voicemail from
amici counsel to JP and RSN.

83117.001 03/14/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 4.60 2,990.00 252Review and edit JP's section of opposition
to MTD; email to same re same; some
legal research and review of MTD brief for
same; review and edit stipulation and
order drafted by KC for page limits.

83117.001 03/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 253Review amicus motion; review due dates;
review and respond to emails from JP re
same; cause MTD opp. brief to be
formatted and send back to JP.

83117.001 03/20/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.60 390.00 254Emails to/from Janine and KC re brief due
tomorrow; confer w/KC re finalizing and
filing of same.

83117.001 03/21/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 2.70 1,755.00 255Review opp. to MTD and RJN; edit same;
supervise finalization of same; cause
same to be filed.

83117.001 03/22/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 256Review order granting leave to file amicus
curaie brief; emails to/from JP re same.

83117.001 03/24/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 257T/c  potential class
member; email to RSN and JLP re same.

83117.001 03/27/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 258Review and edit opposition to amicus
briefs; emails to/from and t/cs to/from JLP
re same; supervise finalization and filing of
same.

83117.001 03/28/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 259T/c w/Randy and JLP and BCM re 
 and their SD client and 

.
83117.001 04/14/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 286Review discovery, execute and cause

same to be filed and served.
83117.001 04/17/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 287Email to BND re supervising WL in filing

reply ISO RJN.
83117.001 04/25/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 288Email from JP re filing; forward to BND.
83117.001 04/27/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 289T/c from potential class member's sister;

email to JP to please call her.
83117.001 07/26/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 381Internet research re  while

.
83117.001 07/27/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 382Emails to/from JP re Judgment.
83117.001 08/14/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.50 975.00 413Emails to/from BCM and JP re sample

motion to coordinate; emails to/from JP re
deadline to file notice of appeal; review
rules re same; find rule re challenging
judge; forward same to JP; research
whether

 email to JP re same.
83117.001 08/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.10 715.00 414Draft peremptory challenge and

declaration in support; circulate to
co-counsel; review practice guide re time
to file notice of appeal; emails to/from
co-counsel re same.

83117.001 08/16/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 415Emails to/from JP and KC re peremptory
challenge; review and sign same; draft
Petition for coordination; review rules; edit
memorandum of points and authorities;
conference call w/co-counsel re same;
email drafts of documents to JP.

83117.001 08/17/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.10 715.00 416Edit petition for coordination and
application for stay and supporting papers;
emails to/from JP and defense counsel re
same; circulate to plaintiffs' counsel.

83117.001 08/18/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 417Emails to/from JP re motion to coordinate.
83117.001 08/22/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 418Emails to/from RSN and JP re denial of

peremptory challenge of judge; t/c from
MCR re same; emails to/from KC re same
and finding out reason.

83117.001 08/25/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 419Review defendant's edits to
coordination/stay motion; add plaintiffs'
sections and circulate to co-counsel
w/email.

83117.001 08/28/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 420Emails to/from JP re coordination motion.
83117.001 08/29/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 421Emails to/from JP and JC re motion to

coordinate and relative congestion of the
courts; edit motion papers and supporting
documents.

83117.001 08/30/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 422Edit motion to coordinate and support
papers; email same to defense counsel for
review; emails to/from JP and RSN re
CMC statement and declaration due
Friday; email to WL re researching format



KD Monday 05/18/2020  8:54 am

Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 46
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
of CMC statement; draft RRR declaration
re material federal court pleadings per the
court's order and circulate same.

83117.001 08/31/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.50 975.00 423Emails to/from co- and defense counsel re
corrections to motion to coordinate/stay;
supervise finalization and filing of same;
t/c from MCR re status of three state court
actions, coordination, stay request, etc.;
emails to/from JP re meeting and
conferring and preparing CMC statement.

83117.001 09/01/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.20 780.00 432Supervise obtaining certified copies of
federal filings for declaration to be filed in
superior court; t/c w/JP; emails to/from WL
and JP re same; confer w/KC re same;
review and edit declaration and corrected
declaration; sign same.

83117.001 09/05/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.40 910.00 433Emails to/from WL re filing and serving
certified copies of federal court pleadings;
meet-and-confer conference call w/JP,
RSN, and defense counsel re joint status
report for CMC; pull CRC and local rules
and email to co-counsel.

83117.001 09/08/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 434Review and edit Joint CMC Statement;
email same to JP.

83117.001 09/11/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 435Emails to/from WL, JP and RSN re next
Monday's hearing.

83117.001 09/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 436Review and comment on proposed
judgment and waiver agreement.

83117.001 09/17/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 437Travel to Riverside for CMC.
83117.001 09/18/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 4.20 2,730.00 438Prepare for and attend CMC; emails

to/from and t/c w/ JLP and RSN re jury
fees; pay jury fees at clerk's office; travel
home; draft notice of deposit of jury fees
and cause to be filed and served; email to
WL re calendaring new CMC deadline and
CMC Statement deadline.

83117.001 10/05/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.60 390.00 472Emails to/from Molly re requesting a
continuance of the hearing on the motion
for coordination; emails to/from WL re
figuring out how to request a continuance
of the hearing.

83117.001 10/06/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 473Draft stipulation and proposed order
(JCCP) continuing hearing on motion for
coordination; send to JLP; incorporate her
edits and send to defense counsel.

83117.001 11/07/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 480Emails to/from Defense counsel and JP re
moving status conference via stipulation
and proposed order.

83117.001 12/04/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 493Emails to/from JP re judges assigned to
each of the three cases; look up same.

83117.001 12/06/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 494T/c w/JP re yesterday's hearing and
settlement discussions.

83117.001 12/07/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 495T/c w/ JP re her discussions with defense
counsel re discussing settlement and the
JCCP hearing.

83117.001 12/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 496Review order granting petition and emails
to/from KC re preparing notice of entry of
order.

83117.001 12/18/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 497Emails to/from JP re 

 legal research re
same; email to JP re findings.

83117.001 01/08/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 508Emails to/from defense counsel re status
conference/stay.

83117.001 01/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 509Review email from Molly re her call with
the clerk; review notice of entry of order
and forward to defense counsel; emails
to/from KC re same.

83117.001 01/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 510Emails to/from Molly re service of notices
of entry of order attaching copies of filings.

83117.001 01/22/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.80 528.00 511Emails to/from defense counsel,
co-counsel, KC and the clerk re tomorrow
morning's CMC, arranging for CourtCall,
cancelling CourtCall, etc.

83117.001 01/30/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 512Review Order; emails to/from RSN re
same; forward to Molly.

83117.001 02/02/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 540Review and edit joint status conference
report; emails to/from JP and RSN re
same;
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83117.001 02/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 541Review defendant's edits to CMC

statement; emails to/from JP re same;
emails to/from KC re not being able to find
court's order(s) on N drive; email to Molly
re signing off.

83117.001 02/11/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 542Emails to/from JP re Tuesday's status
conference.

83117.001 02/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.80 528.00 543Prepare for CMC; emails to/from JP, RSN
and KC re inability to appear telephonically
and CMC still being on calendar; look up
rule on peremptory challenges

83117.001 02/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 6.10 4,026.00 544Travel to Riverside for CMC; t/c w/JP re
CMC; appear at CMC; travel back to the
office; conference call w/JP and RSN re
the CMC; emails to KC re researching
Judge Riemer.

83117.001 02/14/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 545Review opinions .
83117.001 02/15/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 546Emails to/from Mario re status conference.
83117.001 02/21/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 547Emails to/from JP and RSN re whether to

.
83117.001 03/02/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.30 198.00 562Review court's order; emails to/from KC re

calendaring deadlines and complying with
contents.

83117.001 03/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 563Emails to/from KC and JP re pro hac vice
application.

83117.001 03/14/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 1.60 1,056.00 564Review and edit amended complaint;
emails to/from KC, RSN and JP re same.

83117.001 03/15/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 565Review and edit amended complaint;
supervise finalization and filing of same.

83117.001 04/01/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 575Forward court's order to JP and RSN.
83117.001 04/02/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 1.20 792.00 576Emails to/from JP and RSN re court's

order and what happened at the hearing;
review hearing transcript and send
excerpts to RSN and JP; emails to KC and
MB re creating caption for stipulation.

83117.001 04/03/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 577Emails to/from MB re creating a new
caption for the stipulation.

83117.001 04/04/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.90 594.00 578Draft stipulation and proposed order
granting leave to file amended complaints
and vacating status conference; email
same to KC to fill in blanks.

83117.001 04/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 579Edit stipulation re amending complaints;
emails to/from JP re same; email draft
stipulation to defense counsel; review
defendant's edits.

83117.001 04/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 580Supervise finalization and filing and
service of stipulation re amending
complaints; emails to/from JP re same.

83117.001 04/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 581V/m from Molly re extending page limits on
demurrer briefing; emails to/from JP re
same; emails to/from Molly re same.

83117.001 04/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 582Emails to/from JP and Molly re stipulation
regarding page limits on demurrer briefing;
emails to/from KC and Molly re Tuesday's
hearing; confer w/BND re covering
hearing; confer w/KC re her call w/clerk re
stipulation and pro hac vice application

83117.001 04/16/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 583Confer w/BND and KC re tomorrow's
hearing; emails to/from JP and Molly re
same and re demurrer hearing; t/c from
BND re hearing; multiple emails b/w BND
and JP and RSN re hearing.

83117.001 04/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 584Confer w/BND re how hearing went and
demurrer briefing.

83117.001 04/19/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 585Email from State Bar re Janine's pro hac
application; forward to MB to fax
application; emails to/from KC re same.

83117.001 04/25/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.50 330.00 586Review and analysis of complaints in
related cases just filed.

83117.001 05/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 619Emails to/from JP re demurrer opp.
briefing.

83117.001 05/11/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 1.80 1,188.00 620Review JCCP order and emails to/from
RSN re appellate districts and citing
unpublished cases; confer w/BND re
same.

83117.001 05/14/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 621V/m from defense counsel; emails to/from
JP and KC re same.

83117.001 05/15/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 1.40 924.00 622Emails to/from RSN, KC and JP re
demurrers and denial of JP pro hac vice
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application; forward docket to same;
voicemail from and emails to/from defense
counsel re demurrers and order denying
stipulation; forward order to co-counsel.

83117.001 05/21/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.60 396.00 623Review amended JP pro hac vice
application; review applicable rules; sign
and return signature page to KC for filing;
email to defense counsel re emailing
electronic copy of demurrer papers; skim
through demurrer papers and email briefs
to JP, RSN and BND.

83117.001 05/22/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.60 396.00 624Emails to/from KC, JP and RSN re service
by email or personal delivery of our
opposition and respective due dates;
emails to/from defense counsel re service
agreement; advise KC on filing demurrer
papers on N drive.

83117.001 05/25/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.30 198.00 625Emails to/from RSN and defense counsel
re service agreement;

83117.001 05/29/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.60 396.00 626Review draft opposition brief; emails
to/from RSN re same.

83117.001 05/30/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.80 528.00 627Review RSN declaration and RJN; t/c and
emails to/from MCR and RNS re RJN;
forward emails re briefing to KC.

83117.001 05/31/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 2.00 1,320.00 628Supervised filing and service of
oppositions to demurrers.

83117.001 06/01/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 667Review and edit CMC statement.
83117.001 06/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 668Emails to/from JP, RSN and BND re joint

status conference report; email same to
defense counsel.

83117.001 06/08/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 1.20 792.00 669Review CMC statement and defendant's
edits and plaintiffs' edits; emails to/from
RSN re same; emails to/from KC re fax
filing.

83117.001 06/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 670Review tentative ruling; review emails
to/from and between co-counsel and
defense counsel.

83117.001 06/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 671Emails to/from RSN re hearing on
demurrer.

83117.001 07/03/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 686T/c from defense counsel re missing filing
deadline; emails to/from RSN and JP;
conference call w/RSN, JP and MCR;
emails to/from defense counsel re same.

83117.001 07/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 687Review and edit Joint Status Conference
Report; emails to/from KC re finalizing and
filing same.

83117.001 07/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 688Emails to/from RSN re how the status
conference went; emails to/from JP re
conference call.

83117.001 07/18/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 689Emails to/from KW and JP re phone call
from .

83117.001 07/30/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 690Review notice of appearance; emails
to/from JP re same.

83117.001 07/31/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 691Review and edit notice of appearance;
emails to/from JP re same.

83117.001 09/07/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 699Emails to/from JP re notice of change of
address.

83117.001 09/25/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 700Email to RSN re status conference.
83117.001 09/27/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 701Emails to/from RSN and KC re status

conference and next one.
83117.001 10/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 766Research JAMS website for mediator in

Riverside; emails to/from RSN and JP re
same.

83117.001 10/08/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 767Emails to/from JP re notice of change of
attorney information.

83117.001 11/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 777Emails to/from JP, KC, GMN, DWK and
MCR re their pro hac vice applications

83117.001 11/09/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 778T/c from MCR re expenses in HERO
cases; email to KC re same.

83117.001 12/03/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 788Draft stipulation and proposed order
advancing pro hac vice hearings to CMC
date; emails to/from co-counsel re same.

83117.001 12/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 789Emails to/from RSN & MCR re settlement
demand and stipulation; review and edit
joint CMC statement and email edits to
RSN

83117.001 12/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 790Emails to/from JP and KC re appearing at
the CMC next Tuesday and JP and RSN
appearing telephonically; emails to/from
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MCR and JP re stipulation; forward same
to defense counsel; email from defense
counsel re same; cause same to be filed
and served; review draft CMC statement;
emails to/from JP re same.

83117.001 12/11/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 791Review CMC statement; emails to/from JP
and KC re same and re hearing time; edit
CMC statement; emails to/from defense
counsel re same; supervise finalization
and filing of same.

83117.001 12/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 792Emails to/from MCR re BND appearing at
CMC; emails to/from BND re same; email
to RSN re CMC.

83117.001 12/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 793Emails to/from RSN re BND appearing at
CMC; emails to/from MCR re GMN's pro
hac vice application

83117.001 12/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 794Conference call w/BND, RSN and JP re
tomorrow's CMC.

83117.001 01/14/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.30 201.00 806Review and edit First Set of RFP's; confer
w/KW re same.

83117.001 01/15/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.60 402.00 807Review and edit and comment on
discovery requests; emails to/from RSN re
same.

83117.001 01/16/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 808Supervise finalization and filing of 1st
RFP; emails to/from RSN re same.

83117.001 02/08/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 811Review emails to/from defense counsel
and JP requesting extension of time on
responses to RFPs.

83117.001 05/17/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.20 134.00 814Emails to/from JP re conversations with
class members.

83117.001 06/03/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.30 201.00 815Emails to/from JP and RSN re settlement
agreement.

83117.001 06/20/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 816Emails to/from RSN and JP re status of
settlement and upcoming status
conference.

83117.001 06/21/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.20 134.00 817Review and edit notice of settlement and
request to continue status conference;
email same to JP and RSN.

83117.001 07/01/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 2.00 1,340.00 822Review and edit settlement agreement;
emails to/from JP re same; review and edit
joint notice of settlement and stipulation
continuing CMC.

83117.001 07/02/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.20 134.00 823Sign and email signature page of
stipulation twice.

83117.001 07/03/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.20 134.00 824Confer w/KC and email to RSN re setting
up CourtCall appearance; email from
defense counsel re same.

83117.001 07/08/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.20 134.00 825Emails to/from Todd Boock and RSN re
tomorrow's CMC; email from clerk with
signed order; emails to/from KC re
cancelling CourtCall.

83117.001 07/09/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.30 201.00 826Emails to/from RSN re reviewing
settlement agreement and having BND
draft preliminary approval motion; emails
to/from BND re same.

83117.001 07/11/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.30 871.00 827Review and edit settlement agreement
83117.001 07/15/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.00 670.00 828Continue to review and edit settlement

agreement; email same to RSN.
83117.001 07/24/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 829Emails to/from RSN re BND already

starting to draft preliminary approval brief.
83117.001 08/01/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 834Review defendant's edits to settlement

agreement; email to RSN and JP re same.
83117.001 08/02/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.20 134.00 835Review and edit motion for preliminary

approval; emails to/from JP re same
83117.001 08/06/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 836Emails to/from BND and RNS re assigning

completion of motion for preliminary
approval.

83117.001 08/07/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.20 804.00 837Review and analysis of Riverside complex
litigation rules; emails to/from RSN and JP
re same; locate and circulate sample
exclusion and objection forms; edit draft
objection form and circulate.

83117.001 08/08/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.50 335.00 838Review objection form; review and
edit/comment on proposed final approval
order; emails to/from RSN and JP re
same; review emails between parties re
new hearing date and requirements for
preliminary approval.

83117.001 08/09/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 839Review and edit preliminary approval
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order, notice, settlement agreement, final
order and judgment; emails to/from JP and
RSN re same; draft timeline to keep the
due dates straight and circulate

83117.001 08/12/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 840Emails to/from JP and RSN re Renovate

 review complaint ;
review articles concerning ;
review and edit stipulation to move status
conference and preliminary approval filing
date; emails to/from JP re problem with
settlement; review and analysis of 

 case amended complaint and
decision on demurrers; emails to/from
RSN and JP re same.

83117.001 08/13/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.40 268.00 841Emails to/from JP and RSN re settlement
timeline and stipulation setting/moving
deadline to file motion for preliminary
approval.

83117.001 08/21/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 842Emails to/from RSN and KD 
; internet research for

same; email from defense counsel re new
draft of settlement agreement.

83117.001 09/11/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 850Email to RSN re .
83117.001 09/13/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 851Emails to/from JP re preliminary approval

brief and filing notice of change of address
for her.

83117.001 09/16/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 852Emails to/from RSN and JP re status
conference report due Wed.

83117.001 09/17/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.50 335.00 853Emails to/from JP and KC re status
conference report due tomorrow and JP's
notice of change of address; review and
edit status conference report and email
same to JP and RSN.

83117.001 09/20/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 854Review clerk's email; emails to RSN and
KC re continuing CourtCall for RSN.

83117.001 10/25/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 855Emails to/from JP and RSN re status
conference report due today; review draft
report and sign same; email to KC re
arranging for RSN to appear telephonically
at the status conference.

83117.001 10/30/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.80 536.00 856Emails to/from JP re Simpson individual
settlement agreement; review and
comment on same; emails to/from FTI and
JP re class member phone call.

83117.001 10/31/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 857Emails to/from JP re class member call.
83117.001 11/01/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 860Review JP's edits to Simpson settlement

agreement; emails to/from JP re same.
83117.001 11/11/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 861Emails to/from JP re Prelim. Appr. Brief

page limits & settlement agreement & stip
extending page limits; cause brief to be
formatted; draft stip re additional pages.

83117.001 11/12/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 2.00 1,340.00 862Sign stipulation for extra pages on prelim.
approval motion; review and edit brief in
support; email redlined brief to JP, RSN
and KC.

83117.001 11/13/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 3.00 2,010.00 863Numerous emails to/from co-counsel re
finalization of preliminary approval motion
papers; review and edit RSN and Azari
declarations; review edits to same and to
brief; edit caption of documents to make
consistent throughout;

83117.001 11/14/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 864Assist in finalizing and reviewing before
filing motion for preliminary approval and
all supporting documents; emails to/from
KC, JP, RSN and defense counsel re
same; emails to/from KC re stipulation
granted re page limits extension.

83117.001 11/15/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 865Confer w/KC and emails to/from JP re
filing final Renovate's) signature for
settlement agreement.

83117.001 11/22/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.50 335.00 866Review 
; emails to/from RSN re

whether 
.

83117.001 12/04/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 876Review notice of filing of signature page.
83117.001 12/13/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 877Emails to/from RSN re Tuesday's

preliminary approval hearing.
83117.001 12/16/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.50 335.00 878Emails to/from JP re watching for tentative
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ruling; emails to/from KC re location
online; check for tentative ruling on motion
for preliminary approval; review tentative
ruling; emails to/from JP re same.

83117.001 12/18/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 879Email to JP and RSN re drafting a
stipulation to continue the CMC.

83117.001 12/19/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.20 134.00 880Review stipulation and email to JP and
RSN re same.

83117.001 12/31/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 881Email from intervener's counsel; forward
papers to co-counsel.

83117.001 01/02/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 2.00 1,360.00 882Review intervention motion papers; emails
to/from and confer w/KC re intervener's
action in San Diego; review filings and
docket; participate in conference call w/JP,
RSN and defense counsel re same;
emails to/from JP re same and re making
edits to preliminary approval papers;
calculate due dates and emails to/from JP
re same.

83117.001 01/03/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.20 136.00 883Email to JP and RSN sample amendment
to settlement agreement; circulate dial-in
for call w/intervener's counsel on
Wednesday; emails to/from JP re same.

83117.001 01/07/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 884Emails to/from JP re proposed release
language.

83117.001 01/08/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.40 272.00 885Conference call w/J. Swiderski, JP, RSN
and M. Sheldon re breadth of release and
how to resolve intervener's concerns.

83117.001 01/09/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 2.50 1,700.00 886Edit Notice, Proposed Order and
Objection Form to comply with court's
order and email same to JP and RSN;
review and analysis of intervenor's
counsel's email re how to modify the
release so as not to release her claims.

83117.001 01/10/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.20 136.00 887Email Stipulation re amendments to
settlement agreement to M. Sheldon;
emails to/from JP re stipulation and
drafting supplemental submission; review
claims administrator's supplemental
declaration.

83117.001 01/13/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 3.80 2,584.00 888Emails to/from JP, M. Sheldon re
supplemental submission papers; draft
supplemental submission and circulate to
JP and RSN

83117.001 01/14/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.80 544.00 889Email Stipulation and Supplemental
Submission to M. Sheldon; emails to/from
KC re proof reading and cite checking
same; save redlined and non-redlined
exhibits to N drive.

83117.001 01/15/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 3.30 2,244.00 890Review and edit MS Decl. in support of
supplemental submission; emails to/from
MS and co-counsel; update draft
stipulation and class notice adding release
language and also to the supplemental
submission and circulate; finalize and
circulate stipulation and exhibits for
signature; finalize supplemental
submission and exhibits; review timeline
and JP's proposed final approval hearing
dates; emails to/from JP re same.

83117.001 01/21/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 891Review notice of telephonic appearance
by objectors; email to JP and RSN re
same; review M. Sheldon email re same.

83117.001 01/22/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.30 204.00 892Emails to/from JP re new objectors
withdrawing objections and new release
language; review tentative decision;
emails to/from JP re same; emails to/from
KC re whether to submit a new proposed
order with proposed dates.

83117.001 01/23/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 893Emails to/from T. Boock re updating the
settlement agreement and some of the
notices.

83117.001 01/28/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 894Emails to/from JP and KC re preliminary
approval order.

83117.001 01/31/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 895Emails to/from JP re editing settlement
agreement and exhibits.

83117.001 02/03/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 1.20 816.00 905Edit settlement and exhibits; emails
to/from JP re same.

83117.001 02/04/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.50 340.00 906Email amended docs. to defense counsel
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for review; edit settlement agreement and
send all docs to KC to convert and
assemble.

83117.001 02/06/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 2.90 1,972.00 907Emails to/from JP and MS; amend
preliminary approval order; review
amended settlement agreement and
emails to/from KC re same; emails to/from
JP re the time schedule.

83117.001 02/14/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 908Emails to/from Todd.
83117.001 02/18/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.20 136.00 909Emails to/from JP re timeline; calculate

deadlines if court signs order today.
83117.001 02/28/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.30 204.00 910Emails to/from JP re schedule; confer

w/KC re same.
83117.001 03/03/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 916Compare JP's schedule to KC's schedule;

email to KC and JP re same.
83117.001 03/06/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.20 136.00 917Emails to/from 

re settlement.
83117.001 03/23/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.20 136.00 918Emails to/from JP re settlement website

URL; emails to/from Epiq re language to
put on the web site.

83117.001 03/24/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 919Emails to/from JP re modifying settlement
agreement.

83117.001 03/25/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.20 136.00 920Review draft agreement modification;
emails to/from JP and defense counsel re
same.

83117.001 03/26/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 921Review and sign agreement modification.
83117.001 04/08/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.20 136.00 927Emails to/from JP re contents of notice

and web site; emails to/from KD
requesting expense totals; emails to/from
JP re expense cap.

83117.001 04/09/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 928Emails to/from JP and Epiq re notice.
83117.001 04/10/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.50 340.00 929Emails to/from JP and KW re class

member calls, developing a Q&A, blocking
caller ID on cell phones, directing them to
Epiq in the first instance.

83117.001 04/13/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.30 204.00 930Emails to/from JP, Epiq and KW re list of
people who have called requesting
information.

83117.001 04/17/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 0.10 68.00 931Emails to/from JP re contacting class
members.

83117.001 04/27/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 1.50 1,020.00 932Begin drafting final approval papers;

83117.001 04/29/2020 RRB P 499 680.00 1.50 933
emails to/from JP re same.

1,020.00 Review and forward email from Epiq re
contacting class members; review JP's
response to same; continue drafting final
approval brief.

Subtotal for Timekeeper RRB Billable 126.50 83,753.00 Rachele R. Byrd

83117.001 10/04/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 7Research potential claims against
Renovate America and county; review and
revise complaint.

83117.001 10/05/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.80 1,792.00 8Review and Revise complaint; add claims
for TILA sections 1639c, d, e.

83117.001 10/06/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.20 1,408.00 9Review and revise complaint; 
research.

83117.001 10/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 Research regarding 
 Act; Research regarding

 Act;
discussions with J. Pollack regarding
same; review statutes; research case law;
research regarding Renovate America's

 program.
83117.001 10/11/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.40 896.00 Research regarding 

 Act; discussion with J.
Pollack and D. Krasner regarding

 in
California statute; review email regarding

83117.001 10/13/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.50 960.00 12Research regarding 
 

and definition of ; review
and revise complaint.

83117.001 10/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 13Review and revise complaint.
83117.001 10/18/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 14Revise complaint and sent to M. Rifkin

and J. Pollack to review.
83117.001 10/19/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 15Meeting with M. Rifkin to review and
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revise complaint.

83117.001 10/20/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 16Revise Complaint.
83117.001 10/21/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 6.70 4,288.00 17Research  program and

 program administered by
WCROG.  Review WCROG monthly
minutes; review recorded Notice of
Assessments in various California
counties other than Riverside; review
program documents; review various
versions of Assessment Contracts and
program documents.

83117.001 10/24/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.00 640.00 18Research regarding 
 and Renovate America.

83117.001 10/25/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.20 2,048.00 19Meeting with M. Rifkin and J. Pollack to
review and revise complaint; research
regarding elements of

t;
Draft LA Complaint.

83117.001 10/26/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.90 1,856.00 20Review and revise class action complaint.
83117.001 10/27/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.50 2,240.00 21Review and revise complaint; research

 add claim for
; revise damages allegations.

83117.001 10/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 22Revise complaint to conform to template.
83117.001 10/31/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.80 1,792.00 23Edit complaint to incorporate comments

from San Diego office; revise complaint to
incorporate Riverside specific allegations.

83117.001 11/01/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 44Research Judge C. Riemer; research
Riverside County local rules.

83117.001 11/02/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 45Review filings and court information;
correspondence with co-counsel regarding
judges; research rules regarding striking
of judge; respond to media inquiries.

83117.001 11/03/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 46Email correspondence with co-counsel;
review Law360 article about cases;
respond to media inquiries.

83117.001 11/04/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.90 1,216.00 47Research cases decided by Superior
Court Judge; telephone conference with 

 
email correspondence from 
regarding PACE Loans.

83117.001 11/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.40 1,536.00 48Telephone conferences with , 
,  

.
83117.001 11/08/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.20 768.00 49Telephone conference with 

regarding PACE Loans; correspondence
with co-counsel regarding same;
discussion with J. Pollack.

83117.001 11/09/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 50Telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding peremptory
challenges; research regarding same;
review motion.

83117.001 11/10/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 51Telephone conference with f
; review

complaints 
research California

 regarding ;
review law review article 

; research regarding
; review PACE

legislation in 

83117.001 11/11/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.10 704.00 52Telephone conference with SD attorney;
research regarding state PACE laws;
conference with J. Pollack regarding
status.

83117.001 11/14/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 53Research regarding case law on 
; conference call

with .
83117.001 11/15/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 54Correspondence with ; email

correspondence with CA counsel
regarding peremptory challenges;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same;
research regarding legal brief filed by
CFPB regarding 

; research CFPB position.
83117.001 11/16/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.90 576.00 55Telephone conference with potential class

member; review documents related to
PACE Loan; review 



KD Monday 05/18/2020  8:54 am

Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 54
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
; email

correspondence to CFPB regarding
amicus brief.

83117.001 11/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.80 512.00 56Correspondence with ;
correspondence to , research
regarding  HERO program;
research regarding

83117.001 11/18/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.70 448.00 57Research defense counsel experience
and prior cases; review article in San
Diego Union Tribune.

83117.001 11/21/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.80 512.00 58Review revised 
.

83117.001 11/22/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.20 768.00 59Email correspondence regarding briefing
on Motion to Dismiss; conference with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83117.001 11/23/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.50 320.00 60Review email correspondence regarding
stipulations; conference with J. Pollack.

83117.001 11/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 61Review stipulation; review emails
regarding  review emails from
potential class members; discussion with
J. Pollack.

83117.001 11/30/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.70 448.00 62Conference call with ; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; review
potential class member documents and
prepare calculations.

83117.001 12/05/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 100Correspondence regarding pro hac vice
motions; conference with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83117.001 12/06/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 101Review Ramos removal documents;
telephone conference with Shalov;
telephone conference with defendants
regarding consolidation; review Ramos
scheduling notice; review order striking
allegations in complaint; review 

; conference with J. Pollack
regarding order.

83117.001 12/08/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 102Email correspondence with San Diego
attorney, review notices of related cases;
review SD potential client documents;
conference with J. Pollack regarding
same.

83117.001 12/09/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 103Telephone conference with SD attorney
regarding potential clients; telephone
conference with potential Riverside client;
review status report regarding pro hac vice
motions.

83117.001 12/12/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 104Email correspondence regarding potential
plaintiffs; meeting with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83117.001 12/13/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 105Review  documents;
telephone conference with same; prepare
retainer letter; telephone conference with
potential Orange County plaintiff; research
regarding consolidation; research
regarding  and 

; research regarding 
 on 

research 
83117.001 12/14/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 106Email correspondence with 

 regarding status of lawsuits.
83117.001 12/15/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 107Review ECF notice regarding order

vacating scheduling conference;
telephone conference with potential LA
plaintiff; review HERO Loan documents.

83117.001 12/16/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 108Email correspondence regarding briefing
schedules; conference calls with potential
plaintiffs (Riverside, etc).

83117.001 12/19/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 109Correspondence with S. Petetan regarding
; review client documents.

83117.001 12/20/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 110Review ; correspondence
with ; call with
potential client.

83117.001 12/21/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 111Review  Amended
Complaint; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same; telephone conference
with  regarding CDCA case;
research regarding 
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 for conflict of interest;

research regarding L.R. 23-3 and
requirement for filing motion for class
certification.

83117.001 12/22/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 112Call with possible client; review stipulation;
emails, conference with J. Pollack; review
order to show cause regarding status of
removal; review HERO loan documents
for potential new client.

83117.001 12/23/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 113Review documents for ;
telephone conference with  from SD
regarding same.

83117.001 12/26/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 114Conference call with M. Rifkin and J.
Pollack regarding motions for
consolidation and Interim Lead counsel;
email correspondence regarding same.

83117.001 01/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 147Discussion with J. Pollack regarding case
status and strategy; research 

83117.001 01/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 148Conference calls with potential class
members, 

83117.001 01/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 149Research regarding  cause of
action; review HERO documents for 

; review documents

review motion to consolidate
and for interim lead.

83117.001 01/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 150Emails regarding Stipulation on Motions to
Dismiss; research regarding 

, case law and legislative history of
statutory provision.

83117.001 01/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 161Conference with J. Pollack regarding
consolidation; review ECF Notice
regarding pro hac vice applications;
researc

.
83117.001 01/10/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 162Conference with M. Rifkin regarding 

; research case law regarding
same; research 9th Cir. authority
regarding same; research 9th Cir. rules
regarding citation to unpublished decisions
(1.1); conference with J. Pollack regarding
consolidation and interim lead counsel;
research rule 23(g) and related case law;
telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding strategy for
consolidation and interim lead; participate
in meet and confer with defendants
regarding Motion to Dismiss; motion to
consolidate; motion for interim lead;
adjournment of motion for class
certification under local rule;
correspondence with 
regarding PACE article; telephone
conference with  regarding same.

83117.001 01/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 163Review HERO  for
 prepare computations of

same; review and revise motion to
consolidate and motion for interim lead
counsel.

83117.001 01/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 164Review and revise Motion for Interim Lead
and Consolidation; research regarding
co-borrowers as necessary parties
pursuant to Rule 19; discussions with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83117.001 01/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 165Review motion for interim lead counsel
and to consolidate; prepare list of past

; conference with Defendants'
counsel regarding return date of motion.

83117.001 01/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 166Conference with J. Pollack regarding
potential new clients and motion to
dismiss; telephone conference with
potential HERO borrower; review
documents from HERO borrower and
prepare calculations regarding same.
Review motion to dismiss filed in
Riverside case.
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83117.001 01/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.20 2,080.00 167Review WRCOG motion to dismiss;

research regarding same; review
documents in request for judicial notice;
discussion with M. Rifkin and J. Pollack
regarding same.

83117.001 01/19/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 168Prepare amended complaint; research
regarding Renovate America 

; review 
; research

83117.001 01/23/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 169Discussion with M. Rifkin regarding
strategy.

83117.001 01/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 170Discussion with J. Pollack regarding
strategy.

83117.001 01/25/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 171Research regarding .
83117.001 01/26/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 172Research regarding  and

 Act and potential
claims.

83117.001 01/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 173Research legislative history of PACE
legislation including 

; research 
 PACE statutes; research

legislative history of
; research CA

; research CA

.
83117.001 01/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 174Review and revise document requests to

Defendants; research regarding

 discussions with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83117.001 01/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 175Review and revise discovery requests to
Defendants; review client documents;
discussions with J. Pollack regarding
discovery.

83117.001 02/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.70 1,755.00 211Prepare calculations for plaintiff and other
potential plaintiffs regarding 

research regardin

research regarding
legislative history of , research
regarding ; review and
revise draft of Amended Complaint.

83117.001 02/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.30 1,495.00 212Conference with M. Rifkin regarding
Amended Complaint; review and revise
Amended Complaint; research regarding

; research
regarding .

83117.001 02/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 213Prepare  calculations for clients and
other borrowers; prepare  calculations
based on sample documents 

 review and revise
stipulations regarding extensions of time
to file Amended Complaints; research
various amendments to PACE laws;
discussions with J. Pollack

83117.001 02/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 214Review and Revise Amended Complaint
83117.001 02/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.00 1,300.00 215Review and revise amended complaint.
83117.001 02/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 216Review and Revise Amended Complaint
83117.001 02/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 217Review and revise Amended Complaint
83117.001 02/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.20 2,080.00 218Review and revise Amended Complaint
83117.001 02/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.80 1,820.00 219Review and revise Amended Complaint
83117.001 02/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 5.10 3,315.00 220Review and revise Amended Complaint;

finalize Riverside Complaint and add
allegations regarding additional plaintiff

83117.001 02/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 221Review complaint filed on ECF
83117.001 02/22/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 222Conference call with ;

discussions with J. Pollack
83117.001 02/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.40 1,560.00 224Finalize Request for Production;

discussion with potential plaintiff;
discussions with J. Pollack; research
regarding ; prepare
calculations for potential plaintiff; research
property .

83117.001 03/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.40 1,560.00 260Review Motion to Dismiss Amended
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Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
Complaint filed by WRCOG and Renovate
America; outline Opposition brief.

83117.001 03/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 261Review Motion to Dismiss; research legal
issues raised in motion; discussion with J.
Pollack regarding opposition brief; review
Order granting Plaintiffs' Motion to
Consolidate.

83117.001 03/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 262Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83117.001 03/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 263Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83117.001 03/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 264Discussion with 

regarding cases; Opposition to Motion to
Dismiss.

83117.001 03/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 265Research regarding 
 in CA; research regarding

 prepare
opposition to motion to dismiss.

83117.001 03/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 266Prepare opposition to motion to dismiss;
telephone conference with counsel for
amicus; review amicus brief; research
regarding standing to file amicus; research
connection between amicus and
Defendants; discussion with J. Pollack.

83117.001 03/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 267Review and revise Opposition to Motion to
Dismiss.

83117.001 03/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.50 975.00 268Review portion of opposition brief
prepared by J. Pollack; review Amicus;
research regarding amicus;
correspondence with co-counsel regarding
amicus; prepare opposition to motion to
dismiss.

83117.001 03/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 269Review amicus brief filed by Local
Government Commission; review sources
cited in brief; research regarding whether

83117.001 03/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 270Review Local Gov Commission amicus
brief; research regarding CA subordination
agreements and Renovate America HERO
subordination agreement; review and
revise opposition to motion to dismiss;
meet with M. Rifkin to discuss opposition
brief.

83117.001 03/20/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 4.70 3,055.00 271Review and revise opposition to motion to
dismiss; prepare Request for Judicial
Notice and exhibits.

83117.001 03/21/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.40 2,210.00 272Finalize opposition brief and request for
judicial notice.

83117.001 03/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.90 1,885.00 273Research regarding amicus; prepare
opposition to amicus; meeting with M.
Rifkin and J. Pollack

83117.001 03/28/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 274Telephone conference with potential
plaintiff; review ECF filings and organize
for hearing; discussion with J. Pollack.

83117.001 04/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 315Review Reply Briefs; Request for Judicial
Notice; Opposition to Plaintiffs' Request
for Judicial Notice; discussion with J.
Pollack regarding same.  Research

.
83117.001 04/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 316Prepare Reply in Support of Plaintiffs'

Request for Judicial Notice; research
regarding federal .

83117.001 04/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 317Prepare Reply in Support of Plaintiffs'
Request for Judicial Notice; research
regarding federal .

83117.001 04/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 318Telephone conference with 

; research 
  Correspondence with 

83117.001 04/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 319Correspondence with ;
prepare information to provide ;
review draft of Joint 26 report.

83117.001 04/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 320Review and revise joint report.
83117.001 04/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 321Discuss joint report with J. Pollack; review

discovery requests to defendants.
83117.001 04/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 322Prepare Reply in Support of Request for

RJN; review and revise Joint Report;
research regarding 

; discussions with J.
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Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
Pollack regarding Joint Report.

83117.001 04/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 323Conference with J. Pollack regarding
motions to dismiss and joint report;
telephone conference with HERO
borrowers.

83117.001 04/20/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 324Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83117.001 04/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 325Correspondence with counsel for 
 prepare Notice of

Supplemental Authority; telephone
conferences with HERO borrowers;
telephone conference with J. Pollack and
B. Manifold.

83117.001 04/25/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 326Correspondence with counsel for 
; review and revise notice of

supplemental authority; research
regarding same.

83117.001 04/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 327Telephone conferences with HERO
borrowers; prepare for hearing on Motion
to Dismiss.

83117.001 04/28/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 328Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
correspondence regarding same; review
Initial Disclosures to Defendants; review
Defendants' Initial disclosures.

83117.001 04/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 329Travel to Los Angeles and prepare for
hearing on Motion to Dismiss; meeting
with J. Pollack and L. Shalov regarding
same.

83117.001 05/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 4.60 2,990.00 344Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
appear at hearing; travel from LA to NYC.

83117.001 05/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 345Correspondence with office of 
 regarding PACE Loans and

hearing on Motion to Dismiss; provide
documents regarding affected
homeowners.

83117.001 05/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 346Telephone conference with 
regarding meeting with 

.
83117.001 05/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 347Correspondence with potential class

members; review documents.
83117.001 05/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 348Telephone conference with 

 regarding HERO program;
research regarding status of county
programs.

83117.001 05/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 349Review documents for PACE program;
correspondence with 
regarding PACE

83117.001 05/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 350Review new case filed in CA; research
regarding same.

83117.001 06/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 351Correspondence with PACE borrower
regarding HERO loans and status of
cases.

83117.001 06/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 352Telephone conference with HERO
borrower; review documents.

83117.001 06/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 353Review PACE loan documents provided
by potential client.

83117.001 06/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 354Correspondence regarding Order to Show
Cause; review PACE loan documents.

83117.001 07/06/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.50 325.00 389Review PACE loan documents from 
.

83117.001 07/18/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 390Review decisions granting County's
motion to dismiss and remanding state
claims back to Superior Court; research
regarding

 correspondence to
 regarding decision; discussions with

J. Pollak and M. Rifkin regarding same.
83117.001 07/19/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.50 325.00 391Meeting with J. Pollack and R. Rickert to

discuss decision in HERO cases.
83117.001 07/31/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 392Review Superior Court dockets;

discussion with J. Pollack regarding
strategy.

83117.001 08/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.00 1,950.00 451Review docket report; discuss status with
J. Pollack.

83117.001 08/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 452Research regarding "final judgment" for
purposes of appeal; telephone conference
with counsel for CFPB; discussions with J.
Pollack.
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Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
83117.001 08/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 453Call with counsel for counties; discussion

regarding judgments; review Superior
Court rules and dockets

83117.001 08/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 454Telephone conference with counsel for
counties regarding judgment; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; research
re coordination; review notice of
conference.

83117.001 08/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 455Review court orders, discuss coordination.
83117.001 08/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 456Emails regarding appeal of District Court

decision and settlement with counties;
review Superior Court dockets for activity.

83117.001 08/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 457Discussion with J. Pollack regarding
status; research regarding time to appeal;
consolidation and strike judges.

83117.001 08/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 458Telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding status; email
correspondence with counsel; review
Superior Court dockets.

83117.001 08/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 459Review and revise coordination motion.
83117.001 08/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 460Review dockets and rules regarding status

reports; begin draft of report.
83117.001 08/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 461Review and revise case management

statement and rules; review coordination
motion; correspondence with co-counsel.

83117.001 09/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 465Status conference with Court; telephone
conference with  review
court rules; review documents from
Defendants.

83117.001 09/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 466Review proposed Judgment and email
correspondence regarding same.

83117.001 09/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 467Appearance by telephone in Riverside
Superior Court status conference;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same;
telephone conference with Judicial Council
regarding status of coordination motion.

83117.001 10/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 498Review status of coordination motion;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83117.001 10/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 499Correspondence with HERO borrower and
potential client regarding HERO loan;
research regarding same.

83117.001 10/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 500Review coordination order, discussion with
J. Pollack regarding same; email
correspondence regarding same.

83117.001 10/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 501Review  on
; discussion with J. Pollack

regarding same.
83117.001 10/10/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 502Review  decision; review second

amended complaint; review motion to
dismiss second amended complaint;
research CA law for claims asserted
against .

83117.001 12/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.00 1,950.00 503Travel to CA for coordination hearing;
prepare for same; meet with counsel to
prepare.

83117.001 12/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.80 1,820.00 504Prepare for hearing and attend hearing;
travel to NYC.

83117.001 12/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 505Travel to NYC on red eye flight; call with J.
Pollack to discuss proposed settlement
terms.

83117.001 12/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 506Settlement Calculations and conference
with J. Pollack.

83117.001 12/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 507Review consolidation decision; discussion
with J. Pollack; research.

83117.001 01/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 618Review notice from Court; discussion with
J. Pollack regarding same; research
coordination rules.

83117.001 02/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 654Prepare draft of CMC Statement.
83117.001 02/05/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 655Review revisions to CMC statement; email

correspondence regarding same.
83117.001 02/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 656Email correspondence regarding CMC.
83117.001 02/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.70 462.00 657Email correspondence regarding

appearance at CMC; research regarding
; email regarding 

claims; research regarding case.
83117.001 02/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 658Review transcript from CMC hearing;

discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.
83117.001 02/23/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 659Email correspondence regarding
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Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
; telephone conference

with plaintiffs.
83117.001 02/27/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 660Review and revise Second Amended

Complaint.
83117.001 02/28/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 661Research and discuss additional claims to

assert in SAC.
83117.001 03/01/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 703Review and revise amended complaint;

research regarding causes of action.
83117.001 03/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 704Review and revise amended complaint;

research regarding causes of action.
83117.001 03/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.60 1,056.00 705Review and revise amended complaint;

research updated factual allegations and
new disclosures; review memorandum
regarding cause of action 

 review 
complaints.

83117.001 03/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 706Review and revise amended complaint;
research regarding factual allegations and
supporting documentation.

83117.001 03/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.80 1,188.00 707Review and revise amended complaint;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same;
research 

83117.001 03/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 708Review and revise amended complaint;
emails regarding same.

83117.001 03/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 709Finalize amended complaint.
83117.001 04/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 710Review court's order regarding filing of

amended complaints; email
correspondence with Defendant regarding
same.

83117.001 04/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 711Meet and confer with Defendant regarding
demurrer to Amended Complaint; email
correspondence regarding same.

83117.001 04/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 712Review demurrer to Amended Complaint;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83117.001 05/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 713Review draft of opposition to demurrer.
Email correspondence regarding CMC
joint statement.

83117.001 05/07/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 714Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
research regarding same.

83117.001 05/08/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.10 1,386.00 715Review demurrer and draft of opposition;
research  

; factual research regarding

83117.001 05/09/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 716Prepare RJN; review and revise
opposition to demurrer.

83117.001 05/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 717Review and revise RJN; review and revise
opposition to demurrer; research
regarding same.

83117.001 05/11/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 718Research regarding  claims and
standard for ; emails regarding
same.

83117.001 05/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.80 1,188.00 719Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
send to J. Pollack and M. Rifkin for review;
email correspondence regarding clerk's
rejection of Defendant's demurrer.

83117.001 05/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 720Email correspondence regarding rejection
of Defendant's demurrer; review docket;
email correspondence with Defendant
regarding same.

83117.001 05/22/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 721Review amended demurrer; review and
revise brief.

83117.001 05/23/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 722Research regarding Renovate America
versions of documents; research
regarding RA contracts with counties;
review and revise opposition to demurrer.

83117.001 05/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 723Edit opposition to demurrer;
correspondence with M. Rifkin regarding
edits.

83117.001 05/25/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 724Email correspondence regarding service
of opposition to demurrer.

83117.001 05/29/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.60 1,056.00 725Edit opposition to demurrer; prepare RJN;
prepare Declaration of Randall S.
Newman in opposition to demurrer

83117.001 05/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.10 1,386.00 726Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
RSN Declaration; RJN; research
regarding RA documents.

83117.001 05/31/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.20 792.00 727Finalize opposition to demurrer; RSN
Declaration; RJN.
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Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
83117.001 06/01/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 728Review documents filed in opposition;

research regarding 
.

83117.001 06/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 729Review and revise joint CMC statement.
83117.001 06/05/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 730Joint CMC statement; email

correspondence regarding same.
83117.001 06/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 731Review Defendant's reply brief in support

of demurrer.
83117.001 06/07/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 732Review Defendant's reply brief in support

of demurrer; meeting with J. Pollack
regarding hearing; review cases cited by
Defendant in Reply.

83117.001 06/08/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 733Review and revise CMC statement;
correspondence with Defendant's counsel
regarding same; review Court's 11/8/16
CMO order; discussions with J. Pollack.

83117.001 06/11/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 734Prepare documents for hearing in
Riverside County on demurrer.

83117.001 06/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.60 1,716.00 735Travel to CA for hearing on demurrer;
review motion and opposition; review
tentative ruling; telephone conference with
J. Pollack and M. Rifkin.

83117.001 06/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 3.10 2,046.00 736Prepare for hearing on demurrer; attend
hearing; discussions with Defendant's
counsel; telephone conference with J.
Pollack and M. Rifkin; travel to NY.

83117.001 06/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 737Informal discovery research; meeting with
J. Pollack and M. Rifkin regarding
discovery requests; call Defendant's
counsel.

83117.001 06/20/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 738Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery and
settlement; email correspondence
regarding same.

83117.001 07/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.80 528.00 Review cases filed by 
; research regarding

status of cases; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same; review and revise CMC
statement.

83117.001 07/03/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 Conference call with 
regarding 
; discussion with J. Pollack

regarding same; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding Defendant's answer and
discovery.

83117.001 07/09/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.70 462.00 741Review and revise joint CMC statement;
meeting with J. Pollack and M. Rifkin to
review.

83117.001 07/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 742Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding joint CMC; review and revise for
filing.

83117.001 07/16/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.40 1,584.00 743Travel to CA for status conference.
83117.001 07/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.80 1,848.00 744Attend status conference; discussion with

M. Sheldon regarding settlement;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding
status; travel to NY.

83117.001 07/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 745Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery and
settlement; emails regarding same.

83117.001 08/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 746Correspondence with M. Sheldon
regarding production of documents
requested in informal discovery.

83117.001 08/28/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 747Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; emails.

83117.001 09/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 748Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding informal discovery.

83117.001 09/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 749Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery.

83117.001 09/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 750Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding informal discovery; review letter
from Defendant regarding settlement;
review  
damages; review 

; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83117.001 09/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 751Telephone conference with Defendant;
email correspondence regarding
settlement.
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83117.001 09/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 752Email correspondence with Defendant

regarding settlement.
83117.001 09/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 753Telephone conference with Defendant

regarding settlement; email
correspondence regarding same.

83117.001 09/25/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 754Email correspondence with co-counsel
regarding settlement.

83117.001 09/26/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 755Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83117.001 09/27/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 756Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement; email
correspondence regarding same.

83117.001 10/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 757Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83117.001 10/03/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 758Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83117.001 10/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 759Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83117.001 10/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 760Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83117.001 10/22/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 761Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement; review 

; email correspondence
regarding same.

83117.001 10/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 762Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

83117.001 10/29/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 763Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

83117.001 10/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 764Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

83117.001 10/31/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 765Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding mediation.

Subtotal for Timekeeper RSN Billable 279.60 181,637.00 Randall  S. Newman

83117.001 12/26/2016 BD P 499 440.00 1.20 528.00 98Review complaints, notice of related case,
notice of removal, prepare motion to
coordinate.

83117.001 12/29/2016 BD P 499 440.00 0.80 352.00 120Prepare motion to consolidate and appoint
WHAFH as interim lead counsel.

83117.001 02/08/2017 BD P 499 440.00 4.90 2,156.00 184Review defendants' opposition to motion
to consolidate and appoint interim lead
counsel, research case law, prepare

83117.001 02/09/2017 BD P 499 440.00 4.40 1,936.00 185Research and prepare reply brief to
motion to consolidate and for interim lead
counsel.

83117.001 02/13/2017 BD P 499 440.00 0.50 220.00 186Revise reply to motion to consolidate and
appoint interim lead counsel and review
emails re the same.

83117.001 02/15/2017 BD P 499 440.00 1.90 836.00 187Review email from JP re filing amended
complaint, research 

83117.001 02/16/2017 BD P 499 440.00 0.80 352.00 188Further research re  for
violations of 
and review and respond to emails re the
same.

83117.001 03/07/2017 BD P 499 440.00 5.60 2,464.00 244Review email from J. Pollack re research,
review complaint, review Renovate
America's motion to dismiss, research
case law.

83117.001 03/08/2017 BD P 499 440.00 6.70 2,948.00 245Research case law and legislative history
for opposition to motion to dismiss, review
draft opposition.

83117.001 03/09/2017 BD P 499 440.00 3.40 1,496.00 246Research case law for opposition to
motion to dismiss, revise draft opposition.

83117.001 03/10/2017 BD P 499 440.00 1.30 572.00 247Further research for opposition to motion
to dismiss.

83117.001 04/11/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.40 178.00 590Confer with RRR re status conference,
review court order and stipulation.

83117.001 04/16/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.90 400.50 591Prepare for hearing re amended
complaints by reviewing stipulation, MTDs,
order re MTD, complaints, amended
complaints, researching case law re

,
prepare and respond to emails with RN
and JP re amended complaints.

83117.001 04/17/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.40 1,068.00 592Prepare for and attend status conference
re amended complaints, confer with RRR,
RN and JP re same, prepare email with M.



KD Monday 05/18/2020  8:54 am

Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 63
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83117.001 Loya/George
Madden re same, review demurrer,
research case law re demurrer.

83117.001 04/19/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.30 133.50 593Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 04/20/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 594Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 04/24/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.50 1,112.50 595Prepare opposition to demurrer while

researching case law.
83117.001 04/25/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.40 1,068.00 596Prepare opposition to demurrer while

researching case law and legislative
history of 

83117.001 04/27/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.60 712.00 597Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 04/30/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.90 845.50 598Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 05/01/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.30 1,023.50 641Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 05/02/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.80 1,246.00 642Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 05/03/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.90 1,290.50 643Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 05/11/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.10 44.50 644Review and respond to emails from RN

and RRR re opposition to demurrer.
83117.001 05/15/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 645Review emails from RRR, JP, RN and KC

re demurrer being rejected by court, denial
of stip for additional pages and denial of
PHV application.

83117.001 05/18/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.10 44.50 646Confer with KC re pro hac vice renewed
application.

83117.001 05/29/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.30 578.50 647Confer with RRR and JP re CMC
statement, review judge's case
management order, local rules and prior
case management statement, prepare
case management statement, review
emails from RN and RRR re opposition to
demurrer.

83117.001 05/30/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.80 801.00 648Review emails from RRR, JP and RN re
opposition to demurrer, prepare CMC
statement.

83117.001 06/04/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.10 44.50 678Review RRR's edits to joint CMC
statement, review email from JP re same,

83117.001 06/05/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.40 178.00 679Review email from RN re CMC statement,
review edits to statement, edit statement,
research local rules re remand.

83117.001 06/08/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.10 44.50 680Review numerous emails from defendant's
counsel, RRR and JP re CMC statement.

83117.001 06/12/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 681Review tentative ruling and emails from JP
re same.

83117.001 12/14/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 782Confer with RRB re CMC, review emails
from KC re pro hac vice applications,
confer with KC re register of actions.

83117.001 12/17/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.60 1,157.00 783Review CMC statement, P/C with RRB, JP
and RN re same, review complaints,
review emails from RRB and RN re status
conference, review prior CMC statement
and related minute order, review tentative
rulings, confer with KC re pro hac vice
applications, travel to Riverside for
hearing.

83117.001 12/18/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.50 667.50 784Travel to and attend CMC, travel back to
SD.

83117.001 01/16/2019 BD P 499 450.00 0.20 90.00 801Review emails from RRB and RN re
discovery requests.

83117.001 06/11/2019 BD P 499 450.00 0.20 90.00 820Confer with KC re case management
conference notice and notice of
reassignment, review notice.

83117.001 07/09/2019 BD P 499 450.00 1.60 720.00 821Review settlement agreement, prepare
motion for preliminary approval.

83117.001 08/06/2019 BD P 499 450.00 0.20 90.00 843Review emails from RN and JP re law firm
inquiry re status of cases.

Subtotal for Timekeeper BD Billable 62.90 27,844.00 Brittany DeJong

83117.001 10/25/2016 JAC P 499 335.00 1.50 502.50 64Review emails; review PHV motions in CA
state court

83117.001 11/17/2016 JAC P 499 335.00 1.30 435.50 68Research
83117.001 12/02/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 134Review dockets; research
83117.001 12/07/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 1.50 472.50 135Prepare docs for efiling
83117.001 12/22/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 0.70 220.50 143Review emails to JLP et al.
83117.001 12/23/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 0.30 94.50 144Emails to JLP; review PHV applications
83117.001 01/04/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 1.30 409.50 145PHV motion docs; editing forms; call Mario

Jaramilo; conf with JLP
83117.001 01/06/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 146Review dockets; conf with JLP
83117.001 02/09/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.50 157.50 223doc organization
83117.001 03/20/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.70 220.50 282Research
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83117.001 04/04/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.50 157.50 301Lexis research for JLP
83117.001 04/07/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.30 94.50 303LEXIS research for JLP - cases.
83117.001 04/13/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.30 94.50 304LEXIS research
83117.001 04/17/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 5.00 1,575.00 305LEXIS research ; review 26f report; conf

with W Loritsch; Conf with JLP, RD;
review docket

83117.001 07/24/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.70 220.50 398research
83117.001 08/03/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 1.50 472.50 424Discussions with RSN re dockets and

mailing; courtlink; conf with RM, GC, JB re
receipt of mail.

83117.001 08/29/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 1.20 378.00 425Research; email RR and JLP
83117.001 08/21/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 0.20 64.00 698Courtlink searches for RSN
83117.001 11/02/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 0.70 224.00 779Plaintiffs' report ; conf with DWK
83117.001 11/05/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 0.70 224.00 780plaintiffs' reports
83117.001 11/06/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 1.00 320.00 781Review and edit PHV Apps for MCR and

GMN; email and call KC in Cali office; get
signature pages - scan to KC; review court
website re admissions

Subtotal for Timekeeper JAC Billable 20.70 6,589.50 James A.Cirigliano

83117.001 11/05/2018 AML P 499 225.00 1.00 768225.00 Reviewed past PHV applications 

83117.001 11/07/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.80 769180.00 Compiled, filed and served 4 PHV
Applications (time divided three ways for
HERO)

83117.001 11/13/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.40 90.00 770Save file stamped face page (PHV Apps)
and process WOJ invoice

83117.001 11/14/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.30 67.50 771Followed up with WOJ on missing face
page for PHV Application. Saved missing
stamped face page.

83117.001 12/10/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.20 45.00 785Prepared, gathered signatures, filed and
served Stip and PO for Advancing PHV
App Hearing

83117.001 12/14/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.80 180.00 786Drafted Notice of Entry of Order, filed and
Served

83117.001 12/17/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.20 45.00 787Cross checked mailed WOJ invoices and
face pages for CMC Statement, Stip and
PO re PHV apps.

83117.001 01/25/2019 AML P 499 230.00 0.20 46.00 805Scanned and saved face page of Ntc of
Entry of Order

83117.001 03/12/2019 AML P 499 230.00 0.20 46.00 813Saved doc production
83117.001 06/11/2019 AML P 499 230.00 0.20 46.00 819Researched when CMC statement is due

for BND

Subtotal for Timekeeper AML Billable 4.30 970.50 Alexandra Loutsenhizer

83117.001 04/10/2020 KW P 499 200.00 0.40 80.00 922Returning calls and creating spreadsheet
for calls re settlement

83117.001 04/13/2020 KW P 499 200.00 0.40 80.00 923Updating spreadsheet of calls re
settlement; returning calls from Fri 4/10

83117.001 04/22/2020 KW P 499 200.00 0.10 20.00 924Updating settlement call spreadsheet
83117.001 04/27/2020 KW P 499 200.00 0.10 20.00 925Updating spreadsheet of calls re

settlement
83117.001 04/29/2020 KW P 499 200.00 0.10 20.00 926Updating spreadsheet
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Subtotal for Timekeeper KW Billable 1.10 220.00 Kerri Warren

83117.001 12/20/2016 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 85Take call from class member, counsel with
BCM and forward information on to JLP.

83117.001 12/23/2016 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 86Check hearing dates for RRR
83117.001 12/29/2016 WL P 499 205.00 0.60 123.00 87Draft MCR Decl ISO Mtn for lead counsel

(All HERO cases)
83117.001 12/27/2016 WL P 499 205.00 2.10 430.50 97Fact-check Mtn for Lead Plaintiff (review

emails and counsel with BND re same)
83117.001 01/04/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.70 143.50 129Update Mtn to Consolidate Case and RRR

Decl with exhibit entries, etc.
83117.001 02/03/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.00 205.00 203Drive to County's Recorder's office and

pull document for RRR
83117.001 02/06/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.40 82.00 204File joint stip and PO with CD Cal,

download and save filed version to N drive
83117.001 02/13/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.00 410.00 205Paralegal reply brief, consult with RRR

and KC re same, prepare brief for filing
and file same, draft and send
correspondence to clerk and courtesy
copies to WOJ

83117.001 02/16/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 206File amended brief
83117.001 03/21/2017 WL P 499 205.00 6.20 1,271.00 243Extensive cite checking and paralegaling

of Opp to MTD, edit RJN and prep all
exhibits for filing, check table of authorities
for accuracy

83117.001 04/11/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 293Research issue for Janine
83117.001 04/14/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.20 451.00 294Proofread, edit, and serve discovery;

calendar deadlines
83117.001 04/17/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.10 430.50 295Edit and file reply brief, send same to

WOJ for courtesy copies; emails and t/c
with counsel re 26(f) report filing; make
edits to joint report and file same

83117.001 04/18/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 296Send joint report to WOJ for courtesy
copies

83117.001 04/25/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.10 430.50 297Review/edit supplemental authorities,
prepare brief, decl and exhibits for filing,
discuss filing with BCM, file same; send to
WOJ for courtesy copies

83117.001 04/26/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.50 102.50 298Review emails from JLP re exhibits
needed, identify same and send to JLP.

83117.001 04/27/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 299Pull RJN and Exhibits for JLP
83117.001 04/28/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.70 143.50 300Format and serve Initial Disclosures on all

parties
83117.001 06/23/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 343Take call from class member, forward

information on to Janine
83117.001 07/25/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 387T/C with class member, send email to

Janine re same
83117.001 08/22/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 399Review emails from counsel re court order

denying preemptory challenge
83117.001 08/30/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.60 328.00 400Research issues surrounding CMC and

CMC statement deadlines; review RRR
declaration and begin to pull exhibits;
address issues re calendaring (look up
court orders, dkt information, etc)

83117.001 09/01/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.90 594.50 444Prepare file and serve exhibits for RRR
decl, multiple emails between counsel and
WOJ re obtaining certified copies of
exhibits from court, trouble-shooting re
same; emails with MB re POS and service
issues

83117.001 09/05/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.00 410.00 445Continue to address multiple issues with
WOJ surrounding conformed copies of
exhibits to RRR decl, prepare new POS
and instruct WOJ on preparing/filing
exhibits.  Send same to KC MB for print
and service on defendants

83117.001 09/08/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 446Save conformed copies of filings to N
drive

83117.001 09/11/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.40 82.00 447Schedule telephonic appearance for RSN
with CourtCall, serve notice of same

83117.001 09/15/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 448Check status of CMC on ct dkt, email
RRR re same

83117.001 09/18/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.70 143.50 449Prepare and file notice of paid jury fees,
serve same on parties; calendar cmc and
statement deadlines

83117.001 10/04/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.20 246.00 469Calendaring; Draft Ntc of Entry of Order
(JCCP), file and serve same upon
defendants
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83117.001 10/06/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.60 123.00 470Make edits to POS (JCCP), compile all

POS (consolidated cases) and submit to
JCCP

83117.001 10/11/2017 WL P 499 205.00 2.00 410.00 471Call Clerk (superior court) re continuance
and requirements re same; circulate
stipulation to counsel for approval for
filing; draft POS(s), create ntc of filing and
file with LA, SB, Riverside and JCCP;
serve same upon defendants

Subtotal for Timekeeper WL Billable 34.00 6,970.00 Windy Loritsch

83117.001 10/31/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 1.30 325.00 6Finalize complaint; draft summons and
civil cover sheet; check local rules re local
forms and correct location for filing; send
same for filing via WOJ; corr. re certificate
of counsel; draft same

83117.001 11/01/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.40 100.00 39Check on status of complaint filing; receipt
of all file stamped face pages; save same
to sys. and forward to NY

83117.001 11/02/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.30 75.00 40Research re correct addresses/entities for
service of process; phone calls re same;
arrange for service of process via WOJ
and First Legal

83117.001 12/02/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 88Check register of actions for removal from
federal court, judge reassignment; corr. re
same

83117.001 12/06/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 2.10 535.50 89Pull OSC and notice re OSC hearing from
Riverside County Superior Court; forward
same to RRR (.3); corr. re status of PHV
applications and certificates of good
standing; draft status report re same;
circulate same for review; create federal
caption (1.8)

83117.001 12/07/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 2.20 561.00 90Draft PHV applications for JLP and MCR;
corr. w/ JC re same

83117.001 12/08/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 1.50 382.50 91Finalize and e-file status report re PHV
applications; e-file POS summons re all
defs; arrange for chambers copies re
same

83117.001 12/09/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 92Update JLP PVH application per example
from Blu case

83117.001 12/14/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.30 76.50 93Corr. re local counsel and contact info for
PHV applications

83117.001 12/16/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 94Finalize PHV applications with local
counsel info

83117.001 12/20/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 95Corr. re requested extended deadline to
file PHV apps

83117.001 12/22/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.30 76.50 96Corrections to PHV application admission
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83117.001 01/04/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 136Corr. re status of PHV applications for JLP
and MCR

83117.001 01/10/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.30 331.50 137Reformat stipulation re class certification;
incorporate RRR edits to same; draft
accompanying proposed order (1.2)
Research re availability of docs from

 case (.1)
83117.001 01/11/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 138Reformat PO re motion for consolidation

and interim lead counsel (.2)
83117.001 01/12/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.20 306.00 139Paralegal mtn for consolidation and for

interim class counsel
83117.001 01/13/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.80 459.00 140Finalize edits to mtn for consolidation and

for interim class counsel; update RRR
Decl re same and PO; corr. w/ L.Shalov re
firm resume and cited cases; finalize decl
and PO; e-file all docs; submit Word
version of PO to chambers

83117.001 01/17/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.50 127.50 141Save file stamped copies to sys.; draft ltr
to clerk encl. chambers copies; arrange
for chambers copies via WOJ

83117.001 01/24/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.50 127.50 142Finalize stip and PO re deadline to file mtn
for class cert; e-file same; send Word
version of PO to chambers (.4); calendar
briefing deadlines and hearing for mtn to
consolidate and appoint interim class
counsel (.1)

83117.001 03/09/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.80 204.00 237Research re S. Rep. 103-169; pull same
per BND

83117.001 03/14/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 2.80 714.00 238Draft stipulation and PO re briefing
deadlines and extending page limits re
opps to MTDS; circulate same to counsel
for approval; e-file same; email Word PO
to chambers

83117.001 03/20/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 2.40 612.00 239Format opp to MTD; insert RSN changes;
begin to paralegal brief

83117.001 03/21/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 7.60 1,938.00 240Continue to paralegal brief; corr. re RJN
exs.

83117.001 03/22/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.70 178.50 241Save file stamped Opp to MTD and RJN
to sys.; arrange for chambers copies of
same

83117.001 03/27/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 3.60 918.00 242Paralegal Opp to Mtn to File Amicus Briefs
83117.001 08/10/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.80 212.00 404Draft Notice of Entry of Order; file same

via WOJ; send service copies via U.S.
Mail

83117.001 08/14/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.30 79.50 405Corr. re examples of JCCP petitions
83117.001 08/16/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.60 159.00 406Finalize peremptory challenge; file same

via WOJ; mail service copies via U.S. Mail
83117.001 08/17/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.10 26.50 407Save file stamped face pages to sys. re

peremptory challenge
83117.001 08/22/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.50 132.50 409Pull order denying peremptory challenge;

corr. re same
83117.001 08/25/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.30 79.50 411Research re updating caption for added

plaintiffs
83117.001 08/29/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.10 26.50 412Corr. re citation to Court Statistics Report
83117.001 09/01/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.60 159.00 430Issues re certified copies of docs for

declaration of fed. ct. filings; corr. re same
83117.001 09/05/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 2.20 583.00 431Compile corrected RRR Declaration w/

certified fed ct filings; serve same via U.S.
Mail

83117.001 11/27/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.20 53.00 481Corr. re mtn for petition hearing date
83117.001 11/30/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.10 26.50 482Recalendar CMC per corr.
83117.001 12/12/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.10 26.50 491Draft notice of entry of order re

coordination
83117.001 12/13/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.50 132.50 492Finalize notice of entry of order re

coordination; file same via WOJ; serve via
U.S. Mail; email electronic copy to counsel

83117.001 01/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 513Draft notice of entry of order assigning
coordination trial judge

83117.001 01/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 514Finalize Notice of Entry of Order Assigning
Coordination Judge; arrange for filing of
same and delivery of chambers copy via
WOJ; serve same via U.S. Mail

83117.001 01/22/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.80 486.00 515Call clerk re whether status of CMC for
1/23/2018; schedule RRR for CourtCall;
cancel per clerk's notice of continuance

83117.001 02/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.80 216.00 524Corr. re edits to CMC statement; pull
missing orders from 11/2016 from
Courtlink; set up Courtlink notifications for
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case

83117.001 02/12/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 525Corr. re CourtCall availability re CMC (.3);
calendar deadline for peremptory
challenge (.1)

83117.001 02/13/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.10 297.00 526Calendar new deadlines per CMC (.2);
Lexis research re Judge Riemer (.9)

83117.001 02/14/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 527Continue Lexis research re 

83117.001 02/20/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 528Follow up email w/ Sheila Detwiler re
providing legible copy of transcript and
receipt for credit card charge

83117.001 02/22/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 529Save revised transcript of 2/13 CMC to
sys.

83117.001 02/23/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 530Save JCCP 12/5/17 Minutes to sys.
83117.001 03/02/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 555Corr. re status of JLP PHV filed with LA

Superior
83117.001 03/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 556Corr. re next steps for JLP PHV in

Riverside
83117.001 03/07/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 557Serve CMO on defense counsel; file POS

re same
83117.001 03/08/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 558Check LA docket for minute order re JLP

PHV application granted (.2); corr. re
serving notice of stay (.1)

83117.001 03/14/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 559Corr. re updated caption for amended
complaints

83117.001 03/15/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 560Finalize amended complaint; file via WOJ;
serve via email

83117.001 04/02/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 601Corr. re consolidated caption
83117.001 04/03/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 602Further corr. re consolidated caption
83117.001 04/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 603Edits to stipulation (.1); review JLP PHV

app (.1)
83117.001 04/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 604Send PHV in Word form to JLP; finalize

PHV app and letter to state bar
83117.001 04/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 605Final review of docs for filing; arrange for

filing of stip re evidence for amended
complaints and JLP PHV application

83117.001 04/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 606Check on status of stip re hearing off
calendar re amended complaints; save file
stamped face pages to sys.

83117.001 04/12/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 607Check on status of stipulation
83117.001 04/13/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 608Call clerk re status of stipulation to vacate

4/17 hearing, PHV application, issued w/
fees (.3); research re Renew Financial
lawsuits filed (.1)

83117.001 04/16/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.90 243.00 609Call clerk re status of stip and PO
removing hearing (.4); schedule CourtCall
for hearing a circulate notice of same (.2);
draft chart of complaint claims through all
amendments (.3)

83117.001 04/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 610Print chart for hearing; corr. re court
calendar

83117.001 04/19/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 611Pull minute order from 4/17 hearing; corr.
re court reporter

83117.001 04/24/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 612Research re legislative history of 

83117.001 04/25/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 613Research re  complaints;
download and circulate same

83117.001 04/30/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.50 135.00 614Lexis research re MTD cases in CA
federal courts involving 

83117.001 05/01/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 629Check register of actions for any order re
page limits on demurrer briefing

83117.001 05/02/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 630Check cites to RJN, def brief in opp to
demurrer

83117.001 05/03/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 631Format opp to demurrer
83117.001 05/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 632Corr. re CMC date moved; remove

calendar entry re same
83117.001 05/07/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 633Corr. re deadline to file joint statement;

coordinate calendaring of same
83117.001 05/15/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.60 162.00 634Corr. re rejected filings; whether or not

opp to demurrer due; call clerk re same;
recalendar demurrer briefing deadlines
per CCP

83117.001 05/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 635Corr. w/ WOJ re fees returned by court;
corr. w/ George at State Bar re whether
additional fee needs to be sent, copy of
revised PHV application; attempt to call
clerk re fees

83117.001 05/18/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.60 162.00 636Draft revised JLP PHV app; call w/ clerk re
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fees and procedures for correctly filing;
draft notice of hearing

83117.001 05/21/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.80 216.00 637Finalize JLP amended PHV app, notice of
hearing, PO; arrange for filing of same via
WOJ; serve same via email; email copy of
revised docs to G. Bursiago at State Bar

83117.001 05/22/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 638Corr. re method of service for opp to
demurrer

83117.001 05/30/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 639Paralegal opp to demurrer
83117.001 05/31/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.90 513.00 640Paralegal remaining cites to opp to

demurrer; finalize all docs and prep for
filing; file all docs via WOJ; arrange for
personal service at Goodwin Procter LA
office via WOJ; serve all counsel via FTP
link

83117.001 06/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 673Check causes of action for all 3 filed
complaints in chart

83117.001 06/06/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 674Research into when federal court
pleadings were provided to court; pull
register of actions and highlight same

83117.001 06/08/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 675Finalize CMC statement; fax file; serve via
email

83117.001 06/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 676Send chart of COAs to Randy; corr. re
appearance at hearing

83117.001 06/19/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 677Corr. re POS for CMO No. 1
83117.001 07/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 692Save demurrer opp file stamped face

pages to sys.
83117.001 07/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 693Finalize Joint CMC Statement; file same

via WOJ; serve same via email
83117.001 10/09/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 702Finalize JLP notice of attorney info

change; file same via WOJ; serve same
via email

83117.001 11/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.60 432.00 772Pull Order granting JLP PHV; corr. re
status of L. Shalov, MCR, GMN PHV
applications; draft same; corr. w/ W.
Wilkinson re L. Shalov PHV app

83117.001 11/06/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 773Draft L. Shalov, MCR, GMN notice of
hearing, PHV PO for MCR, GMN;
calendar hearing

83117.001 11/07/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.50 135.00 774Call clerk Rachel to get hearing date for
W. Wilkinson PHV app (.2); finalize
Wilkinson and Shalov PHV apps (.2); send
all docs to WOJ for filings (.1);

83117.001 11/08/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 775Corr. w/ W. Wilkinson re status of PHV
filings, docs to send to State Bar (.1); draft
RRB letter to State Bar encl. MCR, GMN
payment; send same to Y. Rodriguez with
accompanying docs to be sent to State
Bar (.2)

83117.001 11/26/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 776Calendar 12/18 CMC; corr. re deadlines;
check Courtlink for 7/17 CMC minutes

83117.001 12/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 795Acquire copy of 7/17/18 minutes from
CMC

83117.001 12/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 796Paralegal stip re advancing PHV hearings;
update service list

83117.001 12/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 797Finalize joint CMC statement; file same
via WOJ; serve same via email

83117.001 12/13/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 798Check for court reporter availability for
CMC; check on status of stip to move
PHV hearings to 12/18; schedule RSN
CourtCall appearance; circulate service
copy re same

83117.001 12/14/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 799Corr. re status of PHV hearings; pull order
moving PHV hearings to 12/18; recalendar
tentative ruling reminder

83117.001 12/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 800Serve Pollack notice of CourtCall
appearance (.1); check for tentative ruling
re PHV hearings; call tentative clerk re
same; leave voicemail with Dept. 5 re
same (.3)

83117.001 01/16/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.50 137.50 802Paralegal, finalize and serve RFPs1 to
Defendant; calendar deadline to respond
to same

83117.001 01/17/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 803Send Word version of RFPs1 to defense
counsel per request

83117.001 01/23/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 804Download PHV orders to sys.
83117.001 02/06/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.40 110.00 809Draft notice of change of address and

letter to clerk; file same via U.S. Mail;
serve counsel via email
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83117.001 02/08/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 810Recalendar deadline for Def to respond to

RFPs1 per email request for extension
83117.001 03/21/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 812Calculate deadline to file MTC re RFPs
83117.001 06/20/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 818Corr. re continued CMC; calendar

deadline to file CMC statement
83117.001 07/03/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 830Set up RSN CourtCall for 7/9 status

conference; serve notice of same
83117.001 07/08/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 831Corr. re status of stip to continue status

conference; cancel RSN CourtCall
appearance

83117.001 07/09/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 832Calendar rescheduled status conference
and deadline to file status conference
statement

83117.001 07/11/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 833Save M. Sheldon CourtCall service copy
to sys.

83117.001 08/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 844Pull 
complaint

83117.001 09/17/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 847Pull local rule re deadline to file case
management statement; corr. re CourtCall
for RSN

83117.001 10/25/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 858Serve RSN CourtCall notice via email;
double check status conference still on
calendar

83117.001 10/29/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 859Continue RSN CourtCall appearance per
Court's continuance of CMC

83117.001 11/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.80 220.00 867Finalize stip re page limits for mtn for
preliminary approval; file same via First
Legal; serve same via email; begin to
paralegal mtn for preliminary approval

83117.001 11/13/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 1.90 522.50 868Continue to paralegal mtn for preliminary
approval; reserve hearing date; calendar
same

83117.001 11/14/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 1.60 440.00 869Finalize edits to mtn for preliminary
approval; paralegal RSN Decl and finalize
all attachments; file mtn for preliminary
approval and all supporting docs via First
Legal; serve same via email

83117.001 12/03/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.20 55.00 870Draft notice of additional signature page to
settlement agreement

83117.001 12/04/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.20 55.00 871Finalize notice of additional signature
page; file same via First Legal; serve
same via email; make sure motion fees
were satisfied; calendar deadline to file
status conference statement

83117.001 12/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 872Corr. re coverage for hearing, no need for
CourtCall

83117.001 12/16/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 873Check for tentative ruling; review of same;
recalendar hearing re preliminary approval
per tentative ruling

83117.001 12/23/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.30 82.50 874Corr. w/ Y. Rodriguez re cc charges for
mtn for preliminary approval; call court
clerk re process for refund; recalendar
status conference per ROA

83117.001 12/30/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 875Corr. w/ Y. Rodriguez re credit received
for filing fee charges

83117.001 01/02/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.80 224.00 896Corr. re location of operative Word
versions of settlement docs that need to
be revised per court's tentative order (.1);
pull complaint, docket, doe amendments,
and Hill dismissal for 

 case; calendar hearing
and briefing schedule for Hill mtn to file
complaint in intervention per register of
actions (.7)

83117.001 01/07/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 897Pull order continuing hearing re
preliminary approval

83117.001 01/14/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.40 112.00 898Paralegal stip re changes to settlement
agreement, supplemental submission

83117.001 01/15/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.90 252.00 899Finish paralegaling supplemental
submission re preliminary approval;
finalize all exhibits and decs re same; file
same via First Legal; serve same via
email

83117.001 01/16/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 900Check docket for any withdrawal of mtn to
intervene

83117.001 01/21/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 901Corr. w/ RSN re coverage of preliminary
approval hearing and checking for
tentative ruling; check docket for entry of
ntc of withdrawal of Hill mtn to intervene;
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remove mtn to intervene deadlines from
calendar

83117.001 01/22/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 902Pull copy of tentative ruling
83117.001 01/28/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 903Check register of actions for any sign of

preliminary approval order entered
83117.001 01/31/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 904Check register of actions for any sign of

preliminary approval order entered;
calendar final approval hearing

83117.001 02/04/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.40 112.00 911Accept all changes to First Amended
Settlement Agreement, finalize all exhibits
and circulate same for signature

83117.001 02/06/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.60 168.00 912Finalize amended proposed order re
preliminary approval and all exhibits; file
same via First Legal; serve same via
email

83117.001 02/28/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 913Check on status of amended preliminary
approval order; try to pull via Courtlink

83117.001 03/03/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 914Calculate deadlines per preliminary
approval order

83117.001 03/04/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 915Calendar deadlines per settlement
agreement

Subtotal for Timekeeper KMC Billable 76.00 20,066.50 Kathryn M.Cabrera
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83122.001 10/11/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 1.00 935.00 30Conferences JLP and RSN re strategy on

complaints.
83122.001 10/28/2016 DWK P 499 935.00 0.50 467.50 31Conference MCR, JLP, RN re pleadings

and strategy as relates to Cal
consolidation.

83122.001 11/15/2016 DWK P 499 950.00 1.00 950.00 79Confs with RN and MCR re strategy and
news reports.

83122.001 01/11/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 1.20 1,140.00 117Reviewed WSJ article; confs MCR re lead
counsel motion; confs JLP re lead
counsel.

83122.001 02/22/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 0.50 475.00 228Conf JLP re status.
83122.001 05/04/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 1.10 1,045.00 256Conferences JLP re report on oral

argument and strategy going forward.
83122.001 07/18/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 1.50 1,425.00 277Read court opinion twice; conf RN and

JLP re strategy issue of appeal etc.
83122.001 07/19/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 2.50 2,375.00 279Read and reread district court opinion;

confs RN and JLP re appeal; conf MCR re
appeal; reviewed appellate opinions re
issues.

83122.001 09/27/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 1.70 1,615.00 320Reviewed WSJ article re FBI investigation
of Rebuild America; tel conf JLP etc.

83122.001 09/28/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 1.00 950.00 321Confs GMN et al re FBI investigation,
Grand Jury, etc.; conf MCR and RN.

83122.001 12/07/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 0.70 665.00 364Confs RN re strategy on settlement.
83122.001 12/08/2017 DWK P 499 950.00 0.70 665.00 368Confs RN re settlement strategy; conf

JLP.
83122.001 01/30/2018 DWK P 499 965.00 0.70 675.50 403Conf JLP re settlement strategy etc.
83122.001 02/23/2018 DWK P 499 965.00 1.50 1,447.50 404Conf RN re strategy and settlement

approach; conf JLP re same.
83122.001 11/01/2018 DWK P 499 965.00 1.20 1,158.00 609Confs MCR and RN re status and

mediation issues; tel confs JLP re
mediation issues.

83122.001 11/02/2018 DWK P 499 965.00 1.20 1,158.00 610Confs re settlement strategy and
mediation issues.

83122.001 11/05/2018 DWK P 499 965.00 1.20 1,158.00 611Tel conf JLP re mediation and time and
expense reports; confs MCR and RN.

83122.001 11/06/2018 DWK P 499 965.00 1.30 1,254.50 612Confs RN re lodestar issue; email JLP;
reviewed time reports.

83122.001 11/09/2018 DWK P 499 965.00 1.50 1,447.50 613Confs RN re damages calculations and
settlement issues; reviewed memos re
damages.

83122.001 11/13/2018 DWK P 499 980.00 1.20 1,176.00 620Conf RSN re defts response to settlement
demand and need to press for informal
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discovery.

83122.001 11/14/2018 DWK P 499 980.00 1.20 1,176.00 621Confs RSN re damages and defts ability to
pay.

83122.001 11/15/2018 DWK P 499 980.00 1.20 1,176.00 622Confs GMN, RSN, MCR re mediation
strategy and issues.

83122.001 11/19/2018 DWK P 499 980.00 1.20 1,176.00 623Confs and tel confs GMN re strategy for
mediation.

83122.001 11/20/2018 DWK P 499 980.00 0.70 686.00 624Tel confs GMN re settlement strategy at
mediation.

83122.001 11/21/2018 DWK P 499 980.00 0.50 490.00 625Tel conf GMN re mediation.
83122.001 08/13/2019 DWK P 499 980.00 2.50 2,450.00 656Confs RN re settlement issues; worked on

settlement agreement.
83122.001 08/14/2019 DWK P 499 980.00 3.00 2,940.00 657Reviewed and commented on draft

settlement agreement; tel conf JLP re
settlement agreement and issues raised.

83122.001 08/15/2019 DWK P 499 980.00 1.50 1,470.00 658Confs RN re issues on settlement stip.
83122.001 08/26/2019 DWK P 499 980.00 0.50 490.00 659Conf RN re issues on settlement papers.

Subtotal for Timekeeper DWK Billable 35.50 34,236.50 Daniel W. Krasner

83122.001 09/29/2016 MCR P 499 820.00 1.50 1,230.00 22Confer w/RSN re claims and issues.
83122.001 03/20/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 0.90 778.50 257Review MTD response draft; confer

w/RSN and JP re brief and strategies;
email from RSN re status.

83122.001 03/21/2017 MCR P 499 865.00 1.90 1,643.50 258Review and revise brief; confer w/RSN
and JP; t/cs ot and from BCM re brief;
email from JP re brief.

Subtotal for Timekeeper MCR Billable 4.30 3,652.00 Mark C.Rifkin

83122.001 10/12/2016 BCM P 499 770.00 0.40 308.00 23e-mails re: judges and premptory
challenges (0.40);

83122.001 01/02/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.50 390.00 167Listen/respond to VM (
) re: HERO program;

forward to RSN
83122.001 01/19/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.30 234.00 168e-mail ; re: HERO

program; forward to RSN
83122.001 03/28/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.50 390.00 224Forward message from (0.10);

T/C RSN and Janine re: discussions
with re: SD client; f/u 
(0.40)

83122.001 06/09/2017 BCM P 499 780.00 0.20 156.00 273F/u re;  contact re:
HERO issues (2x e-mails)

83122.001 11/19/2018 BCM P 499 790.00 0.30 237.00 589meet with RN, discuss mediation,
e-mail RRB re: detail

83122.001 11/20/2018 BCM P 499 790.00 0.40 316.00 590meet with GMN, RN and Janine re:
mediation

Subtotal for Timekeeper BCM Billable 2.60 2,031.00 Betsy C. Manifold

83122.001 10/31/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 1Finalized cpt.
83122.001 11/01/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 2Emails and olc's re; filing of cpt.
83122.001 11/02/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 3Reviewed Court documents/rules; emails;

olc's.
83122.001 11/04/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 20Olc's and emails re: hearings/service.
83122.001 11/07/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.60 483.00 21Teleconference's with possible witnesses

and others re: case; olc's and emails.
83122.001 11/08/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 24Teleconference's and olc's and emails re:

witnesses.
83122.001 11/09/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 25Emails re: coordination motion;

teleconference and olc's' teleconference
office of Pro Tem.

83122.001 11/10/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.40 322.00 26Teleconference with ; olc's.
83122.001 11/14/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 27Teleconference attorney re: other cases;

olc's; reviewed materials.
83122.001 11/14/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 28Teleconference attorney re: other cases;

olc's; reviewed materials.
83122.001 11/16/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 32Teleconference potential client; reviewed

amicus by CFPB.
83122.001 11/17/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 33Olc's and email to CFPB.
83122.001 11/18/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.30 241.50 34Teleconference defense counsel; olc's.
83122.001 11/21/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.70 563.50 35Reviewed Court Orders re: case

management / hearing; emails re: same.
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83122.001 11/22/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.70 563.50 36Reviewed updated Best Practice -

Guidelines; emails re; schedule with
defendant; olc's re: same.

83122.001 11/28/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 37Emails with CFPB; did proof of service for
Court Order; olc's.

83122.001 11/30/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 38Teleconference realtors re: case;
teleconference CFPB; emails.

83122.001 12/01/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 40Emails re; motion to remove.
83122.001 12/02/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 47Teleconference's defense counsel and

co-counsel re: motion to remove.
83122.001 12/05/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 48Reviewed transfer papers and orders; pro

hac vice issues; olc's re: same.
83122.001 12/06/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 52Conference call with defendants re:

possible consolidation and other
procedural issues; pro hac vice issues.

83122.001 12/08/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 72Reviewed draft stip; emails; reviewed
notice of related cases.

83122.001 12/15/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 73Reviewed stip to coordinate briefing and
olc's re: same.

83122.001 12/21/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 0.50 402.50 74Teleconference attorney in contractor suit
re; RA; olc's; emails.

83122.001 12/22/2016 JLP P 10 805.00 1.00 805.00 75Worked on draft stipulation; emails re:
same; worked on PHV.

83122.001 12/23/2016 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 77Teleconferences and olc's re: PACE
program; pro hac app.; reviewed news
articles.

83122.001 01/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 78Reviewed transfer order; worked on
motion to consolidate; emails;
teleconferences; olc's re; M/D.

83122.001 01/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 80Teleconference ; pro
hac.

83122.001 01/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 81Reviewed draft Notice of Intent to Defend
and emails re: same.

83122.001 01/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 82Emails re: Notice of Intent to Defend and
olc's re; same; reviewed Court Order.

83122.001 01/09/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 97Worked on draft motion to consolidate and
ILC.

83122.001 01/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 114Worked on Stipulation to Adjorn class
motion; meet and confer consolidate and
for interim lead counsel.

83122.001 01/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 115Worked on order re: consolidation and
lead and motion; worked on draft
stipulation to ajourn class motion.

83122.001 01/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 116Finalized draft of motion to consolidate
and lead.

83122.001 01/13/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 118Worked on finalizing motion to consolidate
and lead; conference call defendants.

83122.001 01/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 119Teleconference with defendant's counsel
Shelodon re: stipulation to adjourn and
olc's re: same; olc's re: am. cpt.

83122.001 01/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 120Worked on finalizing stip. and proposal
order to adjourn class motion.

83122.001 01/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 121Teleconference class member.
83122.001 01/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 142Worked on discovery drafts.
83122.001 01/31/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 143Continued work on draft discovery.
83122.001 02/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 144Continued work on draft discovery; olc's.
83122.001 02/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 145Continued work on am. cpt.
83122.001 02/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 146Contined work on am. cpt. and olc's re:

claims and issues; emails re: extension for
am. cpt.

83122.001 02/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 147Emails re: stip for extension reviewed opp
consolidation and began draft of reply's
conference call with team re: am. cpt.

83122.001 02/07/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 148Worked on draft of reply on consolidation
motion.

83122.001 02/08/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 149Continued drafting reply on motion to
consolidate and interim class counsel.

83122.001 02/09/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 150Contined work on draft of reply on
consolidation and interim lead; reviewed
cases regarding defendants' defenses.

83122.001 02/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 151Continued work on reply on motion to
consolidate and interim lead.

83122.001 02/22/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 169Teleconference's 
hearing prep.; emails with defendants re:
m/d.

83122.001 02/23/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.50 2,037.50 170Worked on am. cpt. draft; hearing prep. an
teleconference Sheldon re: moving CMH.

83122.001 02/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.80 652.00 171Finalized am. cpt. for filing; emails re:
Stipulation to Adjourn and coordinate
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CMH; reviewed Court Order re: canceled
hearing.

83122.001 03/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 179Reviewed Court Order on Motion to
Consolidate and interim lead and olc's re:
same.

83122.001 03/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 196Worked on stip re: opp m/d.
83122.001 03/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 6.00 4,890.00 197Worked on opp m/d draft and Exhibit A.
83122.001 03/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 198Finalized opp m/d for filing with Exhibit A;

worked on opp m/amicus.
83122.001 03/28/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 199Olc's re: hearing and possible new cases.
83122.001 04/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.80 652.00 200Reviewed county's reply; teleconference

class member.
83122.001 04/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 203Prep. for m/d argument; reviewed Court

Order re: hearing change; emails re: new
bills in Congress re: PACE law and
reviewed same.

83122.001 04/10/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 222Meet and confer with defendants and
worked on draft of joint report.

83122.001 04/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 223Continued work on draft Joint Report; olc's
re: same.

83122.001 04/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 225Reviewed draft discovery request to
defendants and edited; continued work on
Joint report draft.

83122.001 04/14/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 226Reviewed R. 26f draft from defendants.
83122.001 04/17/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.00 1,630.00 227Finalized R. 26 Joint Report.
83122.001 04/24/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.70 570.50 229Olc's and teleconference's re: supp.

authority / submission on m/d; hearing
prep on m/d.

83122.001 04/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 231Worked on notice of supp. authority and
prep for hearing.

83122.001 04/26/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 232Prep. for oral argument.
83122.001 04/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 233Continued prep for hearing; olc's re: same.
83122.001 04/28/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 237Worked on draft initial disclosures;

hearing prep.; reviewed defendant's initial
disclosure.

83122.001 04/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 3.00 2,445.00 238Travel to CA for hearing; hearing prep.
83122.001 05/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 4.00 3,260.00 239Hearing, return to New York.
83122.001 05/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 240Phone calls with class members.
83122.001 06/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 259Teleconference class members.
83122.001 06/07/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 260Teleconference class member and

reviewed documents.
83122.001 06/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 261Teleconference possible experts.
83122.001 07/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 274Reviewed Court Order on m/d and gp call

and olc's re: same.
83122.001 07/19/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 275Olc's to discuss remand issues and

possible appeal.
83122.001 07/21/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 276Emails re: remand to state court and

possible consolidation of cases;
teleconference defendant's counsel re:
same.

83122.001 07/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 278Reviewed drafts of judgment / final order
from county; emails re: same.

83122.001 07/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 280Worked on draft of judgment and emails
re: same; olc's and emails re:
consolidation in state court;
teleconference  re similar
cases in state court.

83122.001 08/02/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 281Office conference and teleconference
regarding consolidation issues.

83122.001 08/03/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 282Teleconference Neudecker to discuss
judgment language and worked on same;
office conference; e-mails and
teleconferences Re: consolidation.

83122.001 08/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 283Teleconference counties Re: appeal;
office conference Re: same and
teleconferences.

83122.001 08/07/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.20 163.00 284E-mails regarding consolidation and told
defts of plaintiffs' position.

83122.001 08/14/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.00 815.00 289Worked on draft of joint petition to
coordinate.

83122.001 08/15/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 1.50 1,222.50 290Worked on joint petition to coordinate;
office conferences and telephone
conferences with defendants' counsel re:
appeal issues; e-mails.

83122.001 08/16/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.50 407.50 291Telephone call with defendants' counsel
re: coordination; conference call with team
re: same.

83122.001 08/17/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.70 570.50 292Worked on petition for
coordination;e-mails.
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83122.001 08/18/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.70 570.50 293Worked on m/coordination and sent to

defendant's counsel.
83122.001 09/05/2017 JLP P 499 815.00 0.50 407.50 296Meet and confer with defendants

regarding hearing and status report.
83122.001 09/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 310Revised draft of judgement and stip re:

fees re: federal claims and emails re:
same.

83122.001 09/25/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 311Finalized judgments and orders in federal
case for filing.

83122.001 09/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.40 326.00 312Reviewed articles regarding RA in
newspapers and office conferences
regarding same; emails; reviewed
proposed stipulation to adjourn hearing.

83122.001 10/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.60 489.00 313Reviewed order regarding coordination;
teleconferences and emails regarding
same.

83122.001 10/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 328Emails regarding moving hearing date and
submitted request for same.

83122.001 10/06/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 329Worked on stipulation to change hearing
date for consolidation motion.

83122.001 10/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 333Emails regarding filing of stipulation with
Panel regarding coordination.

83122.001 11/15/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 352Worked on draft stipulation to adjourn
conference; emails.

83122.001 11/27/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.30 244.50 353Emails regarding hearing on consolidation
and preparation for same.

83122.001 11/30/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 360Preparation for hearing on consolidation;
emails regarding hearing time.

83122.001 12/01/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 361Pro hac vice papers for coordination
hearing; hearing preparation.

83122.001 12/04/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.70 2,200.50 362Travel to LA; preparation for hearing with
co-counsel.

83122.001 12/05/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 2.70 2,200.50 363Attended hearing; return to NYC.
83122.001 12/08/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 1.00 815.00 365Worked on settlement issues; office

conferences and teleconferences
regarding same; drafted settlement letter
to defendant.

83122.001 12/11/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 366Worked on settlement letter to defendant.
83122.001 12/12/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.50 407.50 367Worked on letter to defendant regarding

settlement; reviewed court order on
coordination; emails regarding same.

83122.001 12/18/2017 JLP P 10 815.00 0.20 163.00 369Emails regarding coordination and judge
assignment.

83122.001 02/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 395Teleconferences regarding hearing and
schedule; emails regarding same.

83122.001 02/23/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 396Teleconference with defendant's counsel
regarding settlement; office conferences
and emails regarding same.

83122.001 02/28/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 397Call regarding research for complaints.
83122.001 03/06/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 399Emails and office conferences regarding

research for amended complaint.
83122.001 03/15/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 400Finalized complaint and sent to client.
83122.001 03/21/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 401Teleconference with class member.
83122.001 04/02/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 402Reviewed court order regarding amended

complaints; emails with defendant
regarding same.

83122.001 04/05/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 405Worked on stipulation regarding amended
complaint.

83122.001 04/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 410Emails regarding finalizing stipulation
regarding amended complaint.

83122.001 04/10/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 411Meet and confer on demurrer; emails
regarding stipulation filed with the court.

83122.001 04/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 412Stipulation regarding page extension and
emails regarding hearing date.

83122.001 04/17/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 413Office conferences and emails regarding
opposition to demurrer.

83122.001 05/04/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 431Emails regarding demurrer opposition and
teleconferences and reviewed draft of
same; emails regarding CMC.

83122.001 05/07/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 432Worked on demurrer opposition and
reviewed D. memorandum.

83122.001 05/08/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 447Continued work on opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 05/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 448Worked on opposition to demurrer and

office conference regarding draft.
83122.001 05/15/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 449Emails regarding demurrer due date/filing

issues; office conferences regarding
opposition.

83122.001 05/30/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 1.00 825.00 469Worked on opposition to demurer.
83122.001 06/05/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 470Reviewed draft of CMS and emails
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regarding same.

83122.001 06/07/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 471Reviewed reply on demurrer; office
conferences regarding hearing.

83122.001 06/08/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 472Worked on CMS draft; office conferences
and emails.

83122.001 06/12/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.70 577.50 481Preparation for hearing/reviewed tentative.
83122.001 06/13/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 482Teleconferences and emails regarding

court ruling and discovery.
83122.001 06/19/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 483Office conferences regarding discovery

issues; call to defendant; emails.
83122.001 06/20/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 484Conference call with defendant regarding

discovery and settlement issues; emails.
83122.001 07/02/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.50 412.50 485Worked on CMS draft; office conferences

regarding same.
83122.001 07/03/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.40 330.00 487Teleconference with attorneys from other

RA case; office conferences and emails
regarding hearing and discovery plan;
conference call regarding late answer by
RA.

83122.001 07/09/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 494Worked on draft CMS; sent to defendant.
83122.001 07/17/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.30 247.50 495Teleconferences regarding status

conference and emails regarding same.
83122.001 07/19/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 496Conference call with defendant's counsel

regarding informal discovery and
settlement; emails and teleconferences
regarding same.

83122.001 07/20/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 497Reviewed defendant's answer.
83122.001 08/23/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 508Emails with FTC regarding phone call.
83122.001 08/28/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.20 165.00 509Teleconference with defendant's counsel

and emails regarding same; office
conferences.

83122.001 08/29/2018 JLP P 10 825.00 0.10 82.50 510Teleconference with FTC.

Subtotal for Timekeeper JLP Billable 100.90 82,258.50 Janine L.Pollack

83122.001 11/02/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 0.80 512.00 49Emails to/from KC re serving defendants;
t/c from other firm re their potential case
against same defendants; email re same
to team.

83122.001 11/07/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 0.30 192.00 50Review emails/voicemails from various
individuals interested in HERO
complaints; emails to/from JP re her
conversations with same.

83122.001 11/20/2016 RRB P 499 640.00 0.10 64.00 51Emails to/from the clerk; forward
documents to JP.

83122.001 12/08/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 83Review stipulation and emails to/from JP
and defense counsel re same.

83122.001 12/09/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 84Review status report for filing; emails
to/from KC re same.

83122.001 12/22/2016 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 85Review proposed stipulations; emails
to/from JP and defense counsel re same;
review court's closed hearing dates and
local rules regarding reply briefing.

83122.001 01/10/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 123Conference call from JP and RSN re
conference call w/Defense counsel;
participate in call w/defense counsel; send
sample stipulations and proposed orders
to JP and RSN; emails to/from RSN re
obtaining copies of pleadings in another
old case re merits of MTD; review and edit
stipulation to move out class cert.
deadline; review local rules.

83122.001 01/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 124Confer w/KC re consolidation and interim
class counsel papers to be filed tomorrow;
emails to/from JP re same; review emails
to/from defense counsel.

83122.001 02/13/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 175Draft conclusion to reply brief re motion to
consolidate and appoint interim class
counsel; emails to/from JP and t/c from
same re reply brief; review and supervise
finalization and filing of same.

83122.001 02/24/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 176Review and edit amended complaint;
email to/from JP to defense counsel re
discovery conference.

83122.001 03/03/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 204Review order consolidating and appointing
WHAFH lead counsel; emails to/from JP
and t/c from MCR re same.

83122.001 03/14/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 205Review and edit stipulation and order
drafted by KC for page limits.
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83122.001 03/22/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 206Emails to/from JLP re non-appearance

case review on our calendar.
83122.001 03/27/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 2.70 1,755.00 207Review and edit opposition to MTD and

Exhibit A thereto; supervise finalization
and filing of same; review and edit
opposition to amicus briefs; emails to/from
and t/cs to/from JLP re same; supervise
finalization and filing of same.

83122.001 01/13/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 234Review motion for consolidation and
appointment of interim class counsel and
RRR declaration in support; emails to/from
co-counsel re same.

83122.001 02/08/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 235Emails to/from JP re reply brief re
consolidation and lead counsel; confer
w/BND re her research project for same.

83122.001 04/14/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 236Review discovery, execute and cause
same to be filed and served.

83122.001 08/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 299Review practice guide re time to file notice
of appeal; emails to/from co-counsel re
same.

83122.001 08/16/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 300Draft Petition for coordination; review
rules; edit memorandum of points and
authorities; conference call w/co-counsel
re same; email drafts of documents to JP;
review order from court assigning new
judge; confer w/BCM re new judge; email
to co-counsel re info. on new judge.

83122.001 08/17/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.10 715.00 301Edit petition for coordination and
application for stay and supporting papers;
emails to/from JP and defense counsel re
same; circulate to plaintiffs' counsel.

83122.001 08/25/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 302Review defendant's edits to
coordination/stay motion; add plaintiffs'
sections and circulate to co-counsel
w/email.

83122.001 08/29/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 303Emails to/from JP and JC re motion to
coordinate and relative congestion of the
courts; edit motion papers and supporting
documents.

83122.001 08/30/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 304Edit motion to coordinate and support
papers; email same to defense counsel for
review.

83122.001 08/31/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.30 845.00 305Emails to/from WL re calendaring due
date for CMC statement; emails to/from
co- and defense counsel re corrections to
motion to coordinate/stay; supervise
finalization and filing of same; t/c from
MCR re status of three state court actions,
coordination, stay request, etc.

83122.001 09/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.40 260.00 307Review docket; ask WL to pull order;
email same to all parties; cause dates to
be calendared.

83122.001 09/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 308Review and comment on proposed
judgment and waiver agreement.

83122.001 09/27/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 309Review and comment on stipulation and
proposed order continuing CMC; emails
to/from Molly re same.

83122.001 10/04/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 345Emails to/from JLP re status conference
and due date for joint status conference
statement; review CRC and send to JLP
along with court's rules on contents of joint
statement; review JCCP order setting
hearing on petition for coordination; emails
to/from Molly re signed stipulation and
order continuing status conference;
forward to WL for calendaring; confer
w/WL re preparing notices of entry of
order re JCCP order; emails to/from JLP
and RSN re November 22nd date and
requesting a continuance to December
5th.

83122.001 10/05/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.60 390.00 346Emails to/from Molly re requesting a
continuance of the hearing on the motion
for coordination; emails to/from WL re
figuring out how to request a continuance
of the hearing.

83122.001 10/06/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 347Draft stipulation and proposed order
(JCCP) continuing hearing on motion for
coordination; send to JLP; incorporate her
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edits and send to defense counsel.

83122.001 10/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 348Texts and t/c from WL re stipulation that
got kicked back; review emails re same.

83122.001 10/20/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 349Confer w/WL re stipulation continuing
hearing on petition for coordination and
status of same.

83122.001 11/02/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 354Emails to/from defense counsel and WL
re stipulation.

83122.001 11/07/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 355Emails to/from Defense counsel and JP re
moving status conference via stipulation
and proposed order.

83122.001 11/15/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 356Emails to/from defense counsel re
stipulation moving out status conference.

83122.001 11/27/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 357Emails to/from JP re petition hearing and
her pro hac vice application; emails
to/from KC re pro hac vice application.

83122.001 11/30/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 358Emails to/from KC re JP's pro hac vice
application.

83122.001 12/01/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 1.20 780.00 374Emails to/from KC and JP re JP's pro hac
vice application; emails to/from JP and
RSN re whether I should go to the hearing
on Tuesday; review Petition and emails
to/from JP re same.

83122.001 12/04/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 375Emails to/from JP re judges assigned to
each of the three cases; look up same.

83122.001 12/06/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 376T/c w/JP re yesterday's hearing and
settlement discussions.

83122.001 12/07/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.20 130.00 377T/c w/ JP re her discussions with defense
counsel re discussing settlement and the
JCCP hearing.

83122.001 12/11/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 378Emails to/from State Bar and YR re extra
check sent by accident for JP's pro hac
vice application; emails to/from defense
counsel re stipulation; review and edit
letter to defendant re settlement.

83122.001 12/12/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.10 65.00 379Review order granting petition and emails
to/from KC re preparing notice of entry of
order.

83122.001 12/18/2017 RRB P 499 650.00 0.30 195.00 380Emails to/from JP re 

 legal research re
same; email to JP re findings.

83122.001 01/08/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 391Emails to/from defense counsel re status
conference/stay.

83122.001 01/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 392Review email from Molly re her call with
the clerk; review notice of entry of order
and forward to defense counsel; emails
to/from KC re same.

83122.001 03/15/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 408Review and edit amended complaint;
supervise finalization and filing of same.

83122.001 04/04/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.90 594.00 414Draft stipulation and proposed order
granting leave to file amended complaints
and vacating status conference; email
same to KC to fill in blanks.

83122.001 04/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 415Edit stipulation re amending complaints;
emails to/from JP re same; email draft
stipulation to defense counsel; review
defendant's edits.

83122.001 04/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 416Supervise finalization and filing and
service of stipulation re amending
complaints; emails to/from JP re same.

83122.001 04/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 417V/m from Molly re extending page limits on
demurrer briefing; emails to/from JP re
same; emails to/from Molly re same.

83122.001 04/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 418Emails to/from JP and Molly re stipulation
regarding page limits on demurrer briefing;
emails to/from KC and Molly re Tuesday's
hearing; confer w/BND re covering
hearing; confer w/KC re her call w/clerk re
stipulation and pro hac vice application

83122.001 04/16/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 419Confer w/BND and KC re tomorrow's
hearing; emails to/from JP and Molly re
same and re demurrer hearing; t/c from
BND re hearing; multiple emails b/w BND
and JP and RSN re hearing.

83122.001 04/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 420Confer w/BND re how hearing went and
demurrer briefing.

83122.001 04/19/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 421Email from State Bar re Janine's pro hac
application; forward to MB to fax



KD Monday 05/18/2020  8:54 am

Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 93
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83122.001 Richardson/Michael
application; emails to/from KC re same.

83122.001 04/25/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.50 330.00 422Review and analysis of complaints in
related cases just filed.

83122.001 06/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 486Review tentative ruling; review emails
to/from and between co-counsel and
defense counsel.

83122.001 07/03/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 498T/c from defense counsel re missing filing
deadline; emails to/from RSN and JP;
conference call w/RSN, JP and MCR;
emails to/from defense counsel re same.

83122.001 07/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 499Review and edit Joint Status Conference
Report; emails to/from KC re finalizing and
filing same.

83122.001 07/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 500Emails to/from RSN re how the status
conference went; emails to/from JP re
conference call.

83122.001 07/31/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 501Review and edit notice of appearance;
emails to/from JP re same.

83122.001 09/26/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 511Emails to/from RSN, JP and KC re setting
up courtcall for tomorrow's SC.

83122.001 10/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 576Research JAMS website for mediator in
Riverside; emails to/from RSN and JP re
same.

83122.001 11/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 584Emails to/from JP, KC, GMN, DWK and
MCR re their pro hac vice applications

83122.001 11/09/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 585T/c from MCR re expenses in HERO
cases; email to KC re same.

83122.001 12/03/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 596Draft stipulation and proposed order
advancing pro hac vice hearings to CMC
date; emails to/from co-counsel re same.

83122.001 12/05/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.40 264.00 597Emails to/from RSN & MCR re settlement
demand and stipulation; review and edit
joint CMC statement and email edits to
RSN

83122.001 12/10/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 598Emails to/from JP and KC re appearing at
the CMC next Tuesday and JP and RSN
appearing telephonically; emails to/from
MCR and JP re stipulation; forward same
to defense counsel; email from defense
counsel re same; cause same to be filed
and served; review draft CMC statement;
emails to/from JP re same.

83122.001 12/11/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 599Review CMC statement; emails to/from JP
and KC re same and re hearing time; edit
CMC statement; emails to/from defense
counsel re same; supervise finalization
and filing of same.

83122.001 12/12/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 600Emails to/from MCR re BND appearing at
CMC; emails to/from BND re same; email
to RSN re CMC.

83122.001 12/13/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.10 66.00 601Emails to/from RSN re BND appearing at
CMC; emails to/from MCR re GMN's pro
hac vice application

83122.001 12/17/2018 RRB P 499 660.00 0.20 132.00 602Conference call w/BND, RSN and JP re
tomorrow's CMC.

83122.001 01/14/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.30 201.00 617Review and edit First Set of RFP's; confer
w/KW re same.

83122.001 01/15/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.60 402.00 618Review and edit and comment on
discovery requests; emails to/from RSN re
same.

83122.001 01/16/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 619Supervise finalization and filing of 1st
RFP; emails to/from RSN re same.

83122.001 02/08/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 628Review emails to/from defense counsel
and JP requesting extension of time on
responses to RFPs.

83122.001 03/28/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 630V/m from class member; forward to JP.
83122.001 07/01/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 2.00 1,340.00 633Review and edit settlement agreement;

emails to/from JP re same; review and edit
joint notice of settlement and stipulation
continuing CMC.

83122.001 07/11/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.30 871.00 634Review and edit settlement agreement
83122.001 07/15/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.00 670.00 635Continue to review and edit settlement

agreement; email same to RSN.
83122.001 08/01/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 640Review defendant's edits to settlement

agreement; email to RSN and JP re same.
83122.001 08/07/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.20 804.00 641Review and analysis of Riverside complex

litigation rules; emails to/from RSN and JP
re same; locate and circulate sample
exclusion and objection forms; edit draft
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objection form and circulate.

83122.001 08/08/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.50 335.00 642Review objection form; review and
edit/comment on proposed final approval
order; emails to/from RSN and JP re
same; review emails between parties re
new hearing date and requirements for
preliminary approval.

83122.001 08/09/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 643Review and edit preliminary approval
order, notice, settlement agreement, final
order and judgment; emails to/from JP and
RSN re same; draft timeline to keep the
due dates straight and circulate

83122.001 08/12/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 1.50 1,005.00 644Emails to/from JP and RSN re Renovate

 review complaint 
review articles concerning ;
review and edit stipulation to move status
conference and preliminary approval filing
date; emails to/from JP re problem with
settlement; review and analysis of 

 case amended complaint and
decision on demurrers; emails to/from
RSN and JP re same.

83122.001 08/13/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.40 268.00 645Emails to/from JP and RSN re settlement
timeline and stipulation setting/moving
deadline to file motion for preliminary
approval.

83122.001 08/21/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 646Emails to/from RSN and KD 
; internet research for

same; email from defense counsel re new
draft of settlement agreement.

83122.001 10/25/2019 RRB P 499 670.00 0.10 67.00 650Emails to/from JP and RSN re status
conference report due today; review draft
report and sign same; email to KC re
arranging for RSN to appear telephonically
at the status conference.

Subtotal for Timekeeper RRB Billable 38.30 25,165.00 Rachele R. Byrd

83122.001 10/04/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 4Research potential claims against
Renovate America and county; review and
revise complaint.

83122.001 10/05/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.80 1,792.00 5Review and Revise complaint; add claims
for TILA sections 1639c, d, e.

83122.001 10/06/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.20 1,408.00 6Review and revise complaint; TILA claims;
research.

83122.001 10/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 7Research regarding 
; Research regarding

;
discussions with J. Pollack regarding
same; review statutes; research case law;
research regarding Renovate America's

83122.001 10/11/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.40 896.00 8Research regarding 
; discussion with J.

Pollack and D. Krasner regarding

 review email regarding

83122.001 10/13/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.50 960.00 9Research regarding 

and definition of ; review
and revise complaint.

83122.001 10/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 10Review and revise complaint.
83122.001 10/18/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 11Revise complaint and sent to M. Rifkin

and J. Pollack to review.
83122.001 10/19/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 12Meeting with M. Rifkin to review and

revise complaint.
83122.001 10/20/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 13Revise Complaint.
83122.001 10/24/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 14Email correspondence with client

regarding retainer agreement and class
action lawsuit in Los Angeles County;
research regarding Los Angeles County
HERO program.

83122.001 10/25/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.20 2,048.00 15Meeting with M. Rifkin and J. Pollack to
review and revise complaint; research
regarding elements of
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;

Draft LA Complaint.
83122.001 10/26/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.90 1,856.00 16Review and revise class action complaint.
83122.001 10/27/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 3.60 2,304.00 17Review and revise complaint; research

; add claim for
; revise damages allegations.

83122.001 10/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.50 1,600.00 18Revise complaint to conform to template.
83122.001 10/31/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.80 1,792.00 19Edit complaint to incorporate comments

from San Diego office; revise complaint to
incorporate Los Angeles specific
allegations.

83122.001 11/01/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 53Research ; research LA
County local rules.

83122.001 11/02/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.70 1,088.00 54Review filings and court information;
correspondence with co-counsel regarding
judges; research rules regarding striking
of judge; respond to media inquiries.

83122.001 11/03/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 55Email correspondence with co-counsel;
review Law360 article about cases;
respond to media inquiries.

83122.001 11/04/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.90 1,216.00 56Research cases decided by Superior
Court Judge; telephone conference with 

 
email correspondence from 
regarding PACE Loans.

83122.001 11/07/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.40 1,536.00 57Telephone conferences with 

83122.001 11/08/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.20 768.00 58Telephone conference with 
regarding PACE Loans; correspondence
with co-counsel regarding same;
discussion with J. Pollack.

83122.001 11/09/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 59Telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding peremptory
challenges; research regarding same;
review motion.

83122.001 11/10/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 2.10 1,344.00 60Telephone conference with 
; review

 research

review law review article about 
; research regarding

; review PACE
legislation in 

.
83122.001 11/11/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.10 704.00 61Telephone conference with SD attorney;

research regarding state PACE laws;
conference with J. Pollack regarding
status.

83122.001 11/14/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.30 832.00 62Research regarding case law on 
; conference call

with 
83122.001 11/15/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 63Correspondence with ; email

correspondence with CA counsel
regarding peremptory challenges;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same;
research regarding legal brief filed by
CFPB regarding 

; research CFPB position.
83122.001 11/16/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.90 576.00 64Telephone conference with potential class

member; review documents related to
PACE Loan; review 
agreement with Riverside; email
correspondence to CFPB regarding
amicus brief.

83122.001 11/17/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.80 512.00 65Correspondence with ;
correspondence to , research
regarding  HERO program;
research regarding 

83122.001 11/18/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.70 448.00 66Research defense counsel experience
and prior cases; review article in San
Diego Union Tribune.

83122.001 11/21/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.80 512.00 67Review revised 

83122.001 11/22/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.20 768.00 68Review LA Order; review email from RA's
counsel regarding scheduling of Motion to
Dismiss.
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83122.001 11/23/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.50 320.00 69Review email correspondence regarding

stipulations; conference with J. Pollack.
83122.001 11/28/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 1.60 1,024.00 70Review stipulation; review emails

regarding ; review emails from
potential class members; discussion with
J. Pollack.

83122.001 11/30/2016 RSN P 10 640.00 0.70 448.00 71Conference call with ; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; review
potential class member documents and
prepare calculations.

83122.001 12/05/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 98Correspondence regarding pro hac vice
motions; conference with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83122.001 12/06/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 99Review Ramos removal documents;
telephone conference with Shalov;
telephone conference with defendants
regarding consolidation; review Ramos
scheduling notice; review order striking
allegations in complaint; review 

; conference with J. Pollack
regarding order.

83122.001 12/08/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 100Email correspondence with San Diego
attorney, review notices of related cases;
review SD potential client documents;
conference with J. Pollack regarding
same.

83122.001 12/09/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 101Telephone conference with SD attorney
regarding potential clients; telephone
conference with potential Riverside client;
regarding pro hac vice motions.

83122.001 12/12/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 102Email correspondence regarding potential
plaintiffs; meeting with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83122.001 12/13/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 103Review ;
telephone conference with same; prepare
retainer letter; telephone conference with
potential Orange County plaintiff; research
regarding consolidation; research
regarding

; research regarding 
;

research regarding .
83122.001 12/14/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 104Email correspondence with 

regarding status of lawsuits; review
order relating cases; discussion with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83122.001 12/15/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 105Review ECF notice regarding order
vacating scheduling conference;
telephone conference with potential LA
plaintiff; review HERO Loan documents.

83122.001 12/16/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 106Email correspondence regarding briefing
schedules; conference calls with potential
plaintiffs (Riverside, etc).

83122.001 12/19/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 107Correspondence with 
retainer letter; review client documents.

83122.001 12/20/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 108Review ; correspondence
with ; call with
potential client.

83122.001 12/21/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.00 Review
 discussion with J. Pollack

regarding same; telephone conference
with  regarding ;
research regarding

;
research regarding L.R. 23-3 and
requirement for filing motion for class
certification.

83122.001 12/22/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 110Call with possible client; review stipulation;
emails, conference with J. Pollack; review
order to show cause regarding status of
removal; review HERO loan documents
for potential new client.

83122.001 12/23/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 111Review documents for Renew Clients;
telephone conference with  from SD
regarding same.

83122.001 12/26/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 112Conference call with M. Rifkin and J.
Pollack regarding motions for
consolidation and Interim Lead counsel;



KD Monday 05/18/2020  8:54 am

Date: 05/18/2020 Detail Transaction File List Page: 97
Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP

Trans H Check Tcode/ Hours
Client Date Tmkr P Number Task Code Rate to Bill Amount Ref #

Client ID 83122.001 Richardson/Michael
email correspondence regarding same.

83122.001 12/30/2016 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 113Conference call with M. Rifkin and J.
Pollack regarding motions for
consolidation and Interim Lead counsel;
email correspondence regarding same.

83122.001 01/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 138Discussion with J. Pollack regarding case
status and strategy; research regarding

83122.001 01/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 139Conference calls with potential class
members, board of realtors.

83122.001 01/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 140Research regarding conspiracy cause of
action; review HERO documents for 

; review documents provided by 

; review motion to consolidate
and for interim lead.

83122.001 01/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 141Emails regarding Stipulation on Motions to
Dismiss; research regarding 

, case law and legislative history of
statutory provision.

83122.001 01/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 152Conference with J. Pollack regarding
consolidation; review ECF Notice
regarding pro hac vice applications;
research 

83122.001 01/10/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 Conference with M. Rifkin regarding 

; research case law regarding
same; research 9th Cir. authority
regarding same; research 9th Cir. rules
regarding citation to unpublished decisions
(1.1); conference with J. Pollack regarding
consolidation and interim lead counsel;
research rule 23(g) and related case law;
telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding strategy for
consolidation and interim lead; participate
in meet and confer with defendants
regarding Motion to Dismiss; motion to
consolidate; motion for interim lead;
adjournment of motion for class
certification under local rule;
correspondence with 
regarding PACE article; telephone
conference with  regarding same.

83122.001 01/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 154Review HERO Financing Documents for
; prepare computations of

same; review and revise motion to
consolidate and motion for interim lead
counsel.

83122.001 01/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 155Review and revise Motion for Interim Lead
and Consolidation; research regarding

; discussions with J.
Pollack regarding same.

83122.001 01/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 156Review motion for interim lead counsel
and to consolidate; prepare list of past
TILA cases; conference with Defendants'
counsel regarding return date of motion.

83122.001 01/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 157Conference with J. Pollack regarding
potential new clients and motion to
dismiss; telephone conference with
potential HERO borrower; review
documents from HERO borrower and
prepare calculations regarding same.

83122.001 01/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 158Research regarding issues raised in
motion to dismiss.

83122.001 01/19/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 159Prepare amended complaint; research
regarding Renovate America 

; review 
; research definition of 

83122.001 01/23/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 160Review motion to dismiss filed by LA
County; review documents attached to
request for judicial notice; telephone
conference with client regarding same;
discussion with M. Rifkin.
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83122.001 01/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 161Discussion with J. Pollack regarding

strategy.
83122.001 01/25/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 162Research regarding .
83122.001 01/26/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 163Research regarding 

 and potential
claims.

83122.001 01/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 164Research legislative history of PACE

 research 
; research

legislative history of
; research CA

; research CA

.
83122.001 01/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 165Review and revise document requests to

Defendants; research regarding

discussions with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83122.001 01/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 166Review and revise discovery requests to
Defendants; review client documents;
discussions with J. Pollack regarding
discovery.

83122.001 02/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.40 1,560.00 180Finalize Request for Production;
discussion with potential plaintiff;
discussions with J. Pollack; research
regarding ; prepare
calculations for potential plaintiff; research

.
83122.001 02/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.70 1,755.00 181Prepare calculations for plaintiff and other

potential plaintiffs regarding

;
research regarding 

 research regarding
legislative history of , research
regarding ; review and
revise draft of Amended Complaint.

83122.001 02/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.30 1,495.00 182Conference with M. Rifkin regarding
Amended Complaint; review and revise
Amended Complaint; research regarding

; research
regarding .

83122.001 02/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 183Prepare  for clients and
other borrowers; prepare 

 review and revise
stipulations regarding extensions of time
to file Amended Complaints; research

;
discussions with J. Pollack

83122.001 02/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 184Review and Revise Amended Complaint
83122.001 02/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.00 1,300.00 185Review and revise amended complaint.
83122.001 02/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 186Review and Revise Amended Complaint
83122.001 02/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 187Review and revise Amended Complaint
83122.001 02/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.20 2,080.00 188Review and revise Amended Complaint
83122.001 02/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.80 1,820.00 189Review and revise Amended Complaint
83122.001 02/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 190Review and revise Amended Complaint
83122.001 02/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 191Review and revise Amended Complaint
83122.001 02/22/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 192Review and revise Amended Complaint

for Los Angeles; add allegations regarding
Shirley Petetan HERO Loan

83122.001 02/23/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 5.40 3,510.00 194Review and revise Los Angeles Amended
Complaint

83122.001 02/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 195Review and finalize Los Angeles Amended
Complaint.

83122.001 03/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 208Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83122.001 03/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 209Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83122.001 03/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 210Discussion with 

regarding cases; Opposition to Motion to
Dismiss.

83122.001 03/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 211Research regarding 
 research regarding

; prepare
opposition to motion to dismiss.

83122.001 03/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 212Prepare opposition to motion to dismiss;
telephone conference with counsel for
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amicus; review amicus brief; research
regarding ; research

; discussion with J. Pollack.
83122.001 03/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 213Review and revise Opposition to Motion to

Dismiss.
83122.001 03/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.50 975.00 214Review portion of opposition brief

prepared by J. Pollack; review Amicus;
research regarding amicus;
correspondence with co-counsel regarding
amicus; prepare opposition to motion to
dismiss.

83122.001 03/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 215Review amicus brief filed by Local
Government Commission; review sources
cited in brief; research regarding 

83122.001 03/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.80 1,170.00 216Review Local Gov Commission amicus
brief; research regarding 

 and Renovate America HERO
; review and

revise opposition to motion to dismiss;
meet with M. Rifkin to discuss opposition
brief.

83122.001 03/20/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.90 1,235.00 217Prepare Request for Judicial Notice and
exhibits.

83122.001 03/21/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 218Finalize request for judicial notice.
83122.001 03/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 219Prepare Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.
83122.001 03/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 6.20 4,030.00 220Review and revise Opposition to Motion to

Dismiss; exhibit A to brief; research
regarding amicus; prepare opposition to
amicus; meeting with M. Rifkin and J.
Pollack.

83122.001 03/28/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 221Telephone conference with potential
plaintiff; review ECF filings and organize
for hearing; discussion with J. Pollack.

83122.001 04/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 241Review Reply Briefs; Request for Judicial
Notice; Opposition to Plaintiffs' Request
for Judicial Notice; discussion with J.
Pollack regarding same.  Research

 Act introduced by 

83122.001 04/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 242Prepare Reply in Support of Plaintiffs'
Request for Judicial Notice; research
regarding .

83122.001 04/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.40 910.00 243Prepare Reply in Support of Plaintiffs'
Request for Judicial Notice; research
regarding .

83122.001 04/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 244Telephone conference with  from
 regarding

83122.001 04/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.20 780.00 245Correspondence with ;
prepare information to provide to r;
review draft of Joint 26 report.

83122.001 04/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 246Review and revise joint report.
83122.001 04/13/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 247Discuss joint report with J. Pollack; review

discovery requests to defendants.
83122.001 04/17/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.20 1,430.00 248Prepare Reply in Support of Request for

RJN; review and revise Joint Report;
research regarding  for

; discussions with J.
Pollack regarding Joint Report.

83122.001 04/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 249Conference with J. Pollack regarding
motions to dismiss and joint report;
telephone conference with HERO
borrowers.

83122.001 04/20/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.70 1,105.00 250Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83122.001 04/24/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.10 1,365.00 251Correspondence with counsel for 
; prepare Notice of

Supplemental Authority; telephone
conferences with HERO borrowers;
telephone conference with J. Pollack and
B. Manifold.

83122.001 04/25/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 252Correspondence with counsel for 
; review and revise notice of

supplemental authority; research
regarding same.
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83122.001 04/27/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 253Telephone conferences with HERO

borrowers; prepare for hearing on Motion
to Dismiss.

83122.001 04/28/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.10 715.00 254Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
correspondence regarding same.

83122.001 04/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 255Travel to Los Angeles and prepare for
hearing on Motion to Dismiss; meeting
with J. Pollack and L. Shalov regarding
same.

83122.001 05/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 4.60 2,990.00 262Prepare for hearing on Motion to Dismiss;
appear at hearing; travel from LA to NYC.

83122.001 05/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 263Correspondence with office of 
 regarding PACE Loans and

hearing on Motion to Dismiss; provide
documents regarding affected
homeowners.

83122.001 05/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 264Telephone conference with 
office regarding meeting with 

.
83122.001 05/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 265Correspondence with potential class

members; review documents.
83122.001 05/09/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 266Telephone conference with Wall Street

Journal regarding HERO program;
research regarding status of county
programs.

83122.001 05/11/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 267Review documents for PACE program;
correspondence with 
regarding .

83122.001 05/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 268Review new case filed in CA; research
regarding same.

83122.001 06/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 269Correspondence with PACE borrower
regarding HERO loans and status of
cases.

83122.001 06/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 270Telephone conference with HERO
borrower; review documents.

83122.001 06/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 271Review PACE loan documents provided
by potential client.

83122.001 06/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 272Correspondence regarding Order to Show
Cause; review PACE loan documents.

83122.001 07/06/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.50 325.00 285Review PACE loan documents from 
.

83122.001 07/18/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 1.60 1,040.00 286Review decisions granting County's
motion to dismiss and remanding state
claims back to Superior Court; research
regarding when appeal must be filed and
whether decision on motion to dismiss and
remand is appealable; correspondence to
CFPB regarding decision; discussions with
J. Pollak and M. Rifkin regarding same.

83122.001 07/19/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.50 325.00 287Meeting with J. Pollack and R. Rickert to
discuss decision in HERO cases.

83122.001 07/31/2017 RSN P 499 650.00 0.80 520.00 288Review Superior Court dockets;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding
strategy.

83122.001 08/01/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.00 1,950.00 315Review docket report; discuss status with
J. Pollack.

83122.001 08/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 316Research regarding "final judgment" for
purposes of appeal; telephone conference
with counsel for CFPB; discussions with J.
Pollack.

83122.001 08/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.70 455.00 317Call with counsel for counties; discussion
regarding judgments; review Superior
Court rules and dockets.

83122.001 08/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.80 520.00 318Telephone conference with counsel for
counties regarding judgment; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; research
re coordination; review notice of
conference.

83122.001 08/07/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 319Review court orders, discuss coordination.
83122.001 08/14/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 322Emails regarding appeal of District Court

decision and ;
review Superior Court dockets for activity.

83122.001 08/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 323Discussion with J. Pollack regarding
status; research regarding time to appeal;
consolidation and strike judges.

83122.001 08/16/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 324Telephone conference with J. Pollack and
R. Rickert regarding status; email
correspondence with counsel; review
Superior Court dockets.
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83122.001 08/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 325Review and revise coordination motion.
83122.001 08/30/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 326Review dockets and rules regarding status

reports; begin draft of report.
83122.001 08/31/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.90 585.00 327Review and revise case management

statement and rules; review coordination
motion; correspondence with co-counsel.

83122.001 09/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 330Telephone conference with 
; review court rules; review

documents from Defendants.
83122.001 09/15/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 331Review proposed Judgment and email

correspondence regarding same.
83122.001 09/18/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.30 195.00 332Telephone conference with Judicial

Council regarding status of coordination
motion.

83122.001 10/02/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.40 260.00 381Review status of coordination motion;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83122.001 10/03/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 382Correspondence with HERO borrower and
potential client regarding HERO loan;
research regarding same.

83122.001 10/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 383Review coordination order, discussion with
J. Pollack regarding same; email
correspondence regarding same.

83122.001 10/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.50 325.00 384Review 
; discussion with J. Pollack

regarding same.
83122.001 10/10/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 385Review  decision; review second

amended complaint; review motion to
dismiss second amended complaint;
research CA law for claims asserted
against .

83122.001 12/04/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 3.00 1,950.00 386Travel to CA for coordination hearing;
prepare for same; meet with counsel to
prepare.

83122.001 12/05/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.80 1,820.00 387Prepare for hearing and attend hearing;
travel to NYC.

83122.001 12/06/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 2.60 1,690.00 388Travel to NYC on red eye flight; call with J.
Pollack to discuss proposed settlement
terms.

83122.001 12/08/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 1.30 845.00 389Settlement Calculations and conference
with J. Pollack.

83122.001 12/12/2017 RSN P 10 650.00 0.60 390.00 390Review consolidation decision; discussion
with J. Pollack; research.

83122.001 01/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 450Review notice from Court; discussion with
J. Pollack regarding same; research
coordination rules.

83122.001 02/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 473Prepare draft of CMC Statement.
83122.001 02/05/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 474Review revisions to CMC statement; email

correspondence regarding same.
83122.001 02/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 475Email correspondence regarding CMC.
83122.001 02/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.70 462.00 476Email correspondence regarding

appearance at CMC; research regarding
; email regarding 

claims; research regarding  case.
83122.001 02/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 477Review transcript from CMC hearing;

discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.
83122.001 02/23/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 478Email correspondence regarding

; telephone conference
with plaintiffs.

83122.001 02/27/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 479Review and revise Second Amended
Complaint.

83122.001 02/28/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 480Research and discuss additional claims to
assert in SAC.

83122.001 03/01/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 513Review and revise amended complaint;
research regarding causes of action.

83122.001 03/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 514Review and revise amended complaint;
research regarding causes of action.

83122.001 03/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.60 1,056.00 515Review and revise amended complaint;
research updated factual allegations and
new disclosures; review memorandum
regarding cause of action for 

; review 
complaints.

83122.001 03/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 516Review and revise amended complaint;
research regarding factual allegations and
supporting documentation.

83122.001 03/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.80 1,188.00 517Review and revise amended complaint;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same;
research 
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83122.001 03/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 518Review and revise amended complaint;
emails regarding same.

83122.001 03/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 519Finalize amended complaint.
83122.001 04/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 520Review court's order regarding filing of

amended complaints; email
correspondence with Defendant regarding
same.

83122.001 04/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 521Meet and confer with Defendant regarding
demurrer to Amended Complaint; email
correspondence regarding same.

83122.001 04/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 522Review demurrer to Amended Complaint;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding same.

83122.001 05/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 523Review draft of opposition to demurrer.
Email correspondence regarding CMC
joint statement.

83122.001 05/07/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 524Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
research regarding same.

83122.001 05/08/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.10 1,386.00 525Review demurrer and draft of opposition;
research 

; factual research regarding

83122.001 05/09/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 526Prepare RJN; review and revise
opposition to demurrer.

83122.001 05/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 527Review and revise RJN; review and revise
opposition to demurrer; research
regarding same.

83122.001 05/11/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.90 594.00 528Research regarding  claims and
standard for 

83122.001 05/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.80 1,188.00 529Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
send to J. Pollack and M. Rifkin for review;
email correspondence regarding clerk's
rejection of Defendant's demurrer.

83122.001 05/15/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 530Email correspondence regarding rejection
of Defendant's demurrer; review docket;
email correspondence with Defendant
regarding same.

83122.001 05/22/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 531Review amended demurrer; review and
revise brief.

83122.001 05/23/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.40 924.00 532Research regarding Renovate America
versions of documents; research
regarding ;
review and revise opposition to demurrer.

83122.001 05/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.10 726.00 533Edit opposition to demurrer;
correspondence with M. Rifkin regarding
edits.

83122.001 05/25/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 534Email correspondence regarding service
of opposition to demurrer.

83122.001 05/29/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.60 1,056.00 535Edit opposition to demurrer; prepare RJN;
prepare Declaration of Randall S.
Newman in opposition to demurrer.

83122.001 05/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.10 1,386.00 536Review and revise opposition to demurrer;
RSN Declaration; RJN; research
regarding RA documents.

83122.001 05/31/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.20 792.00 537Finalize opposition to demurrer; RSN
Declaration; RJN.

83122.001 06/01/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 538Review documents filed in opposition;
research regarding 

83122.001 06/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 539Review and revise joint CMC statement.
83122.001 06/05/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 540Joint CMC statement; email

correspondence regarding same.
83122.001 06/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 541Review Defendant's reply brief in support

of demurrer.
83122.001 06/07/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 542Review Defendant's reply brief in support

of demurrer; meeting with J. Pollack
regarding hearing; review cases cited by
Defendant in Reply.

83122.001 06/08/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 1.30 858.00 543Review and revise CMC statement;
correspondence with Defendant's counsel
regarding same; review Court's 11/8/16
CMO order; discussions with J. Pollack.

83122.001 06/11/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 544Prepare documents for hearing in
Riverside County on demurrer.

83122.001 06/12/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.60 1,716.00 545Travel to CA for hearing on demurrer;
review motion and opposition; review
tentative ruling; telephone conference with
J. Pollack and M. Rifkin.
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83122.001 06/13/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 3.10 2,046.00 546Prepare for hearing on demurrer; attend

hearing; discussions with Defendant's
counsel; telephone conference with J.
Pollack and M. Rifkin; travel to NY.

83122.001 06/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 547Informal discovery research; meeting with
J. Pollack and M. Rifkin regarding
discovery requests; call Defendant's
counsel.

83122.001 06/20/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 548Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery and
settlement; email correspondence
regarding same.

83122.001 07/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.80 528.00 549Review cases filed by  against
Renovate America; research regarding
status of cases; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same; review and revise CMC
statement.

83122.001 07/03/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.40 264.00 550Conference call with counsel for 
 regarding cases against Renovate

America; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding Defendant's answer and
discovery.

83122.001 07/09/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.70 462.00 551Review and revise joint CMC statement;
meeting with J. Pollack and M. Rifkin to
review.

83122.001 07/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.50 330.00 552Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding joint CMC; review and revise for
filing.

83122.001 07/16/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.40 1,584.00 553Travel to CA for status conference.
83122.001 07/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 2.80 1,848.00 554Attend status conference; discussion with

M. Sheldon regarding settlement;
discussion with J. Pollack regarding
status; travel to NY.

83122.001 07/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 555Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery and
settlement; emails regarding same.

83122.001 08/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 556Correspondence with M. Sheldon
regarding production of documents
requested in informal discovery

83122.001 08/28/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 557Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery; discussion
with J. Pollack regarding same; emails.

83122.001 09/04/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 558Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding informal discovery.

83122.001 09/06/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 559Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding informal discovery.

83122.001 09/14/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.60 396.00 560Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding informal discovery; review letter
from Defendant regarding settlement;
review

 review county financial
statements; discussion with J. Pollack
regarding same.

83122.001 09/17/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.30 198.00 561Telephone conference with Defendant;
email correspondence regarding
settlement.

83122.001 09/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 562Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83122.001 09/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 563Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement; email
correspondence regarding same.

83122.001 09/25/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 564Email correspondence with co-counsel
regarding settlement.

83122.001 09/26/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 565Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83122.001 09/27/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 566Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement; email
correspondence regarding same.

83122.001 10/02/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 567Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83122.001 10/03/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 568Telephone conference with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83122.001 10/10/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 569Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83122.001 10/19/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 570Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement.

83122.001 10/22/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.20 132.00 571Email correspondence with Defendant
regarding settlement; review 
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; email correspondence

regarding same.
83122.001 10/24/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 572Email correspondence with Defendant

regarding mediation.
83122.001 10/29/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 573Email correspondence with Defendant

regarding mediation.
83122.001 10/30/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 574Email correspondence with Defendant

regarding mediation.
83122.001 10/31/2018 RSN P 10 660.00 0.10 66.00 575Email correspondence with Defendant

regarding mediation.

Subtotal for Timekeeper RSN Billable 273.00 177,402.00 Randall  S. Newman

83122.001 03/01/2018 KMM P 499 555.00 3.00 1,665.00 504Research and drafting re suing third party
administrator.

83122.001 03/02/2018 KMM P 499 555.00 2.70 1,498.50 505Research for amended complaint
83122.001 03/05/2018 KMM P 499 555.00 8.30 4,606.50 506Research re claims; drafting memo re

same.
83122.001 03/06/2018 KMM P 499 555.00 7.30 4,051.50 507Research re and writing re tortious

interference with contract; defendants;
construction program.

Subtotal for Timekeeper KMM Billable 21.30 11,821.50 Kate M. McGuire

83122.001 12/26/2016 BD P 499 440.00 1.20 528.00 86Review complaints, notice of related case,
notice of removal, prepare motion to
coordinate.

83122.001 12/29/2016 BD P 499 440.00 0.90 396.00 87Prepare motion to consolidate and appoint
WHAFH as interim lead counsel.

83122.001 01/05/2017 BD P 499 440.00 0.20 88.00 122Review email re status of meet and confer
re motion to appoint interim lead counsel
and motion to consolidate, prepare Rickert
declaration in support of motion for
appointment as interim lead counsel.

83122.001 04/16/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.90 400.50 423Prepare for hearing re amended
complaints by reviewing stipulation, MTDs,
order re MTD, complaints, amended
complaints, researching case law re

,
prepare and respond to emails with RN
and JP re amended complaints.

83122.001 04/17/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.40 1,068.00 424Prepare for and attend status conference
re amended complaints, confer with RRR,
RN and JP re same, prepare email with M.
Madden re same, review demurrer,
research case law re demurrer.

83122.001 04/19/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.30 133.50 425Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 04/20/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 426Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 04/24/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.50 1,112.50 427Prepare opposition to demurrer while

researching case law.
83122.001 04/25/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.40 1,068.00 428Prepare opposition to demurrer while

researching case law and legislative
history of ,
review new class action filed in LA County.

83122.001 04/27/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.60 712.00 429Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 04/30/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.90 845.50 430Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 05/01/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.30 1,023.50 463Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 05/02/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.80 1,246.00 464Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 05/03/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.90 1,290.50 465Prepare opposition to demurrer.
83122.001 05/15/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 466Review emails from RRR, JP, RN and KC

re demurrer being rejected by court, denial
of stip for additional pages and denial of
PHV application.

83122.001 05/29/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.30 578.50 467Confer with RRR and JP re CMC
statement, review judge's case
management order, local rules and prior
case management statement, prepare
case management statement, review
emails from RN and RRR re opposition to
demurrer.

83122.001 05/30/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.80 801.00 468Review emails from RRR, JP and RN re
opposition to demurrer, prepare CMC
statement.

83122.001 06/05/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.40 178.00 491Review email from RN re CMC statement,
review edits to statement, edit statement,
research local rules re remand.

83122.001 06/08/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.10 44.50 492Review numerous emails from defendant's
counsel, RRR and JP re CMC statement.

83122.001 06/25/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 493Review and respond to emails from JP
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and RN re case management statement.

83122.001 12/14/2018 BD P 499 445.00 0.20 89.00 591Confer with RRB re CMC, review emails
from KC re pro hac vice applications,
confer with KC re register of actions.

83122.001 12/17/2018 BD P 499 445.00 2.60 1,157.00 592Review CMC statement, P/C with RRB, JP
and RN re same, review complaints,
review emails from RRB and RN re status
conference, review prior CMC statement
and related minute order, review tentative
rulings, confer with KC re pro hac vice
applications, travel to Riverside for
hearing.

83122.001 12/18/2018 BD P 499 445.00 1.50 667.50 593Travel to and attend CMC, travel back to
SD.

83122.001 07/09/2019 BD P 499 450.00 1.60 720.00 632Review settlement agreement, prepare
motion for preliminary approval.

Subtotal for Timekeeper BD Billable 32.40 14,414.50 Brittany DeJong

83122.001 11/21/2016 JAC P 499 335.00 1.10 368.50 76Research
83122.001 12/02/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 125Review dockets; research
83122.001 12/07/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 1.50 472.50 126Prepare docs for e-filing
83122.001 12/23/2016 JAC P 499 315.00 0.30 94.50 135Emails to JLP; review PHV Apps
83122.001 01/04/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 1.30 409.50 136PHV motion docs; editing forms; call Mario

Jaramilo; conf with JLP
83122.001 01/06/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 137Review dockets; conf with JLP
83122.001 02/09/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.50 157.50 193doc organization
83122.001 03/20/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.70 220.50 230Research
83122.001 07/24/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.70 220.50 295Research
83122.001 08/03/2017 JAC P 499 315.00 0.40 126.00 306Review docket on Courtlink; docs for RSN
83122.001 11/02/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 0.80 256.00 586Plaintiffs' report; conf with DWK
83122.001 11/05/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 0.90 288.00 587Plaintiffs' reports
83122.001 11/06/2018 JAC P 499 320.00 1.00 320.00 588Review and edit PHV Apps for MCR and

GMN; email and call KC in Cali office; get
signature pages - scan to KC; review court
website re admissions

Subtotal for Timekeeper JAC Billable 10.00 3,185.50 James A.Cirigliano

83122.001 11/07/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.80 180.00 578Compiled, filed and served 4 PHV
Applications (time divided three ways for
HERO)

83122.001 12/10/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.20 45.00 594Prepared, gathered signatures, filed and
served Stip and PO for Advancing PHV
App Hearing

83122.001 12/14/2018 AML P 499 225.00 0.80 180.00 595Drafted Notice of Entry of Order, filed and
Served

Subtotal for Timekeeper AML Billable 1.80 405.00 Alexandra Loutsenhizer

83122.001 12/27/2016 WL P 499 205.00 2.10 430.50 95Fact-check Mtn for Lead Plaintiff (review
emails and counsel with BND re same)

83122.001 12/29/2016 WL P 499 205.00 0.60 123.00 96Draft MCR Decl ISO Mtn for lead counsel
83122.001 02/06/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 177File joint stip and PO with CD Cal,

download and save filed version to N drive
83122.001 02/13/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.60 328.00 178Paralegal reply brief, consult with RRR

and KC re same, prepare brief for filing
and file same, draft and send
correspondence to clerk and courtesy
copies to WOJ

83122.001 09/12/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 314D/L order from CourtLink and calendar
hearing dates/deadlines

83122.001 10/04/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.90 184.50 334Draft Ntc of Entry of Order (JCCP), file
and serve same upon defendants

83122.001 10/05/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.30 266.50 335Research rules re continuing hearing date
with JCCP/Superior Court (speak with
clerk at JCCP re procedures)
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83122.001 10/12/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.90 184.50 336Speak with WOJ and clerk re issues

surrounding stipulation/order; email
counsel re same; draft new caption page
per clerk's request, speak with WOJ re
attempting service again.

83122.001 10/13/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 337Speak with the clerk in dpt 309 addressing
specific issues surrounding caption page,
draft and submit new caption to WOJ for
filing

83122.001 10/16/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 338Calendar conference date
83122.001 10/20/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 339F/U with WOJ re hearing dates; F/U with

JCCP re same
83122.001 10/23/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 340F/U with WOJ re hearing date
83122.001 10/24/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 341Receive and respond to JCCP clerk re

conformed copies of Notice, save same to
N drive

83122.001 10/26/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.20 41.00 342F/U with WOJ re hearing date
continuation, emails with RRR re same

83122.001 10/30/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 343F/U with WOJ re hearing
83122.001 10/31/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.10 20.50 344F/U with WOJ re signed order (hearing

continuance)
83122.001 11/02/2017 WL P 499 205.00 0.30 61.50 350Circulate stip to counsel, respond to

inquiries re same
83122.001 11/03/2017 WL P 499 205.00 1.70 348.50 351Receive order from WOJ, circulate to

counsel; draft notice of entry of order, file
and serve same;

Subtotal for Timekeeper WL Billable 11.20 2,296.00 Windy Loritsch

83122.001 10/31/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 1.00 250.00 29Finalize complaint; draft summons and
civil cover sheet; check local rules re local
forms and correct location for filing, draft
local civil cover sheet addendum; send
same; corr. w/ WOJ re hold off on filing
per delay with other complaints

83122.001 11/01/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.30 75.00 39Receipt of all file stamped face pages;
save same to sys. and forward to NY

83122.001 11/02/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.40 100.00 41Research re correct addresses/entities for
service of process; phone calls re same;
arrange for service of process via WOJ
and First Legal

83122.001 11/07/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.20 50.00 42Phone call w/ 
; take message and circulate

same
83122.001 11/21/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.10 25.00 43Corr. re paying complex fees and service

of standing order
83122.001 11/22/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.20 50.00 44Corr. re service of county with additional

order from court
83122.001 11/28/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.80 200.00 45Print Initial Status Conference Order and

Court Order re Newly Field Class Action;
serve same via U.S. Mail; corr. re POS for
Renovate America, counsel for the
government entities

83122.001 11/29/2016 KMC P 499 250.00 0.70 175.00 46Corr. re POS for Renovate America;
calendar Initial CMC and related deadlines

83122.001 12/01/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.50 127.50 88Corr. re correct POS summons for County
of LA; arrange for filing of POS summons
and POS re initial case orders via WOJ

83122.001 12/02/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 89Check register of actions for removal from
federal court; corr. re same

83122.001 12/07/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 90Create federal caption
83122.001 12/09/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.80 204.00 91Draft status report re PHV applications;

e-file same; calendar deadline for defs to
respond to complaint per stip

83122.001 12/16/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 92Finalize PHV applications with local
counsel info

83122.001 12/20/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 93Corr. re requested extended deadline to
file PHV apps

83122.001 12/22/2016 KMC P 499 255.00 0.30 76.50 94Corrections to PHV application admission
dates

83122.001 01/03/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 127Update caption to reflect new judge
assignment

83122.001 01/04/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 128Corr. re status of PHV applications for JLP
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Client ID 83122.001 Richardson/Michael
and MCR

83122.001 01/06/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.40 102.00 129Calendar new deadline for def response to
complaint and subsequent briefing per
order; corr. re fixing error in PHV apps

83122.001 01/11/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.20 51.00 130Reformat PO re motion for consolidation
and interim lead counsel (.2)

83122.001 01/12/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.20 306.00 131Paralegal mtn for consolidation and for
interim class counsel

83122.001 01/13/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 1.80 459.00 132Finalize edits to mtn for consolidation and
for interim class counsel; update RRR
Decl re same and PO; corr. w/ L.Shalov re
firm resume and cited cases; finalize decl
and PO; e-file all docs; submit Word
version of PO to chambers

83122.001 01/17/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.10 25.50 133Save file stamped copies to sys.
83122.001 01/24/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.70 178.50 134Draft stip and PO re deadline to file mtn

for class cert; e-file same; send Word
version of PO to chambers (.6); calendar
briefing deadlines and hearing for mtn to
consolidate and appoint interim class
counsel (.1)

83122.001 03/27/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 4.50 1,147.50 201Paralegal Opp to MTD; finalize same and
e-file

83122.001 03/28/2017 KMC P 499 255.00 0.30 76.50 202Save file stamped docs to sys.; arrange
for chambers copies of Opp to MTD and
Opp to Mtn to File Amicus Briefs via WOJ

83122.001 08/30/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 1.50 397.50 297Begin to paralegal memorandum ISO
petition for coordination

83122.001 08/31/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 3.80 1,007.00 298Finalize memorandum, petition, and RRR
decl for filing; review rules re filing
Petitions for Coordination w/ Judicial
Council; email all docs to Judicial Council

83122.001 11/30/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 1.30 344.50 359Draft J. Pollack PHV papers; corr. re
same (1.2); recalendar CMC per corr. (.1)

83122.001 12/01/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 1.50 397.50 370Corr. re state bar check; finalize Pollack
PHV app; file same via WOJ; send state
bar check and PHV app copies via NY;
mail service copies via U.S Mail

83122.001 12/04/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.10 26.50 371Save file stamped face pages to Pollack
PHV to sys.; email same to Pollack

83122.001 12/12/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.10 26.50 372Draft notice of entry of order re
coordination

83122.001 12/13/2017 KMC P 499 265.00 0.50 132.50 373Finalize notice of entry of order re
coordination; file same via WOJ; serve via
U.S. Mail; email electronic copy to counsel

83122.001 01/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 393Draft notice of entry of order assigning
coordination trial judge

83122.001 01/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 394Finalize Notice of Entry of Order Assigning
Coordination Judge; arrange for filing of
same via WOJ; serve same via U.S. Mail

83122.001 03/15/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 406Finalize amended complaint; file via WOJ;
serve via email

83122.001 03/27/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 407Call clerk re possibility of getting PHV
order re JLP, inability to file notice of stay
because case file transferred to Riverside

83122.001 04/02/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 433Corr. re consolidated caption
83122.001 04/03/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 434Further corr. re consolidated caption
83122.001 04/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 435Edits to stipulation (.1); review JLP PHV

app (.1)
83122.001 04/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 436Send PHV in Word form to JLP; finalize

PHV app and letter to state bar
83122.001 04/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 437Final review of docs for filing; arrange for

filing of stip re evidence for amended
complaints and JLP PHV application

83122.001 04/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 438Check on status of stip re hearing off
calendar re amended complaints; save file
stamped face pages to sys.

83122.001 04/12/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 439Check on status of stipulation
83122.001 04/13/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 440Call clerk re status of stipulation to vacate

4/17 hearing, PHV application, issued w/
fees (.3); research re Renew Financial
lawsuits filed (.1)

83122.001 04/16/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.90 243.00 441Call clerk re status of stip and PO
removing hearing (.4); schedule CourtCall
for hearing a circulate notice of same (.2);
draft chart of complaint claims through all
amendments (.3)

83122.001 04/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 442Print chart for hearing; corr. re court
calendar
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Client ID 83122.001 Richardson/Michael
83122.001 04/19/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 443Pull minute order from 4/17 hearing; corr.

re court reporter
83122.001 04/24/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 444Research re legislative history of 

83122.001 04/25/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 445Research re  complaints;
download and circulate same

83122.001 04/30/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.50 135.00 446Lexis research re MTD cases in CA
federal courts involving 

83122.001 05/01/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 451Check register of actions for any order re
page limits on demurrer briefing

83122.001 05/02/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 452Check cites to RJN, def brief in opp to
demurrer

83122.001 05/03/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 453Format opp to demurrer
83122.001 05/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 454Corr. re CMC date moved; remove

calendar entry re same
83122.001 05/07/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 455Corr. re deadline to file joint statement;

coordinate calendaring of same
83122.001 05/15/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.60 162.00 456Corr. re rejected filings; whether or not

opp to demurrer due; call clerk re same;
recalendar demurrer briefing deadlines
per CCP

83122.001 05/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 457Corr. w/ WOJ re fees returned by court;
corr. w/ George at State Bar re whether
additional fee needs to be sent, copy of
revised PHV application; attempt to call
clerk re fees

83122.001 05/18/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.60 162.00 458Draft revised JLP PHV app; call w/ clerk re
fees and procedures for correctly filing;
draft notice of hearing

83122.001 05/21/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.80 216.00 459Finalize JLP amended PHV app, notice of
hearing, PO; arrange for filing of same via
WOJ; serve same via email; email copy of
revised docs to G. Bursiago at State Bar

83122.001 05/22/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 460Corr. re method of service for opp to
demurrer

83122.001 05/30/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 461Paralegal opp to demurrer
83122.001 05/31/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.90 513.00 462Paralegal remaining cites to opp to

demurrer; finalize all docs and prep for
filing; file all docs via WOJ; arrange for
personal service at Goodwin Procter LA
office via WOJ; serve all counsel via FTP
link

83122.001 06/06/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 488Check causes of action for all 3 filed
complaints in chart

83122.001 06/08/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 489Finalize CMC statement; fax file; serve via
email

83122.001 06/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 490Send chart of COAs to Randy; corr. re
appearance at hearing

83122.001 07/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 502Save demurrer opp file stamped face
pages to sys.

83122.001 07/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 503Finalize Joint CMC Statement; file same
via WOJ; serve same via email

83122.001 10/09/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 512Finalize JLP notice of attorney info
change; file same via WOJ; serve same
via email

83122.001 11/05/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.60 432.00 579Pull Order granting JLP PHV; corr. re
status of L. Shalov, MCR, GMN PHV
applications; draft same; corr. w/ W.
Wilkinson re L. Shalov PHV app

83122.001 11/06/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 1.20 324.00 580Draft L. Shalov, MCR, GMN notice of
hearing, PHV PO for MCR, GMN;
calendar hearing

83122.001 11/07/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.50 135.00 581Call clerk Rachel to get hearing date for
W. Wilkinson PHV app (.2); finalize
Wilkinson and Shalov PHV apps (.2); send
all docs to WOJ for filings (.1);

83122.001 11/08/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.30 81.00 582Corr. w/ W. Wilkinson re status of PHV
filings, docs to send to State Bar (.1); draft
RRB letter to State Bar encl. MCR, GMN
payment; send same to Y. Rodriguez with
accompanying docs to be sent to State
Bar (.2)

83122.001 11/26/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 583Calendar 12/18 CMC; corr. re deadlines;
check Courtlink for 7/17 CMC minutes

83122.001 12/04/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.10 27.00 603Acquire copy of 7/17/18 minutes from
CMC

83122.001 12/10/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 604Paralegal stip re advancing PHV hearings;
update service list
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83122.001 12/11/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 605Finalize joint CMC statement; file same

via WOJ; serve same via email
83122.001 12/13/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 606Check for court reporter availability for

CMC; check on status of stip to move
PHV hearings to 12/18; schedule RSN
CourtCall appearance; circulate service
copy re same

83122.001 12/14/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.20 54.00 607Corr. re status of PHV hearings; pull order
moving PHV hearings to 12/18; recalendar
tentative ruling reminder

83122.001 12/17/2018 KMC P 499 270.00 0.40 108.00 608Serve Pollack notice of CourtCall
appearance (.1); check for tentative ruling
re PHV hearings; call tentative clerk re
same; leave voicemail with Dept. 5 re
same (.3)

83122.001 01/16/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.50 137.50 614Paralegal, finalize and serve RFPs1 to
Defendant; calendar deadline to respond
to same

83122.001 01/17/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 615Send Word version of RFPs1 to defense
counsel per request

83122.001 01/23/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 616Download PHV orders to sys.
83122.001 02/06/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.40 110.00 626Draft notice of change of address and

letter to clerk; file same via U.S. Mail;
serve counsel via email

83122.001 02/08/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 627Recalendar deadline for Def to respond to
RFPs1 per email request for extension

83122.001 03/21/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 629Calculate deadline to file MTC re RFPs
83122.001 06/20/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 631Corr. re continued CMC; calendar

deadline to file CMC statement
83122.001 07/03/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 636Set up RSN CourtCall for 7/9 status

conference; serve notice of same
83122.001 07/08/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 637Corr. re status of stip to continue status

conference; cancel RSN CourtCall
appearance

83122.001 07/09/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 638Calendar rescheduled status conference
and deadline to file status conference
statement

83122.001 07/11/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 639Save M. Sheldon CourtCall service copy
to sys.

83122.001 08/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 647Pull 
complaint

83122.001 09/17/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 649Pull local rule re deadline to file case
management statement; corr. re CourtCall
for RSN

83122.001 10/25/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 651Serve RSN CourtCall notice via email;
double check status conference still on
calendar

83122.001 10/29/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 652Continue RSN CourtCall appearance per
Court's continuance of CMC

83122.001 11/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.80 220.00 653Finalize stip re page limits for mtn for
preliminary approval; file same via First
Legal; serve same via email; begin to
paralegal mtn for preliminary approval

83122.001 11/13/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 1.90 522.50 654Continue to paralegal mtn for preliminary
approval; reserve hearing date; calendar
same

83122.001 11/14/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 1.60 440.00 655Finalize edits to mtn for preliminary
approval; paralegal RSN Decl and finalize
all attachments; file mtn for preliminary
approval and all supporting docs via First
Legal; serve same via email

83122.001 12/03/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.20 55.00 660Draft notice of additional signature page to
settlement agreement

83122.001 12/04/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.20 55.00 661Finalize notice of additional signature
page; file same via First Legal; serve
same via email; make sure motion fees
were satisfied; calendar deadline to file
status conference statement

83122.001 12/12/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 662Corr. re coverage for hearing, no need for
CourtCall

83122.001 12/16/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 663Check for tentative ruling; review of same;
recalendar hearing re preliminary approval
per tentative ruling

83122.001 12/23/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.30 82.50 664Corr. w/ Y. Rodriguez re cc charges for
mtn for preliminary approval; call court
clerk re process for refund; recalendar
status conference per ROA

83122.001 12/30/2019 KMC P 499 275.00 0.10 27.50 665Corr. w/ Y. Rodriguez re credit received
for filing fee charges
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83122.001 01/02/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.80 224.00 666Corr. re location of operative Word

versions of settlement docs that need to
be revised per court's tentative order (.1);
pull complaint, docket, doe amendments,
and Hill dismissal for 

 case; calendar hearing
and briefing schedule for Hill mtn to file
complaint in intervention per register of
actions (.7)

83122.001 01/07/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 667Pull order continuing hearing re
preliminary approval

83122.001 01/14/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.40 112.00 668Paralegal stip re changes to settlement
agreement, supplemental submission

83122.001 01/15/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.90 252.00 669Finish paralegaling supplemental
submission re preliminary approval;
finalize all exhibits and decs re same; file
same via First Legal; serve same via
email

83122.001 01/16/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 670Check docket for any withdrawal of mtn to
intervene

83122.001 01/21/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 671Corr. w/ RSN re coverage of preliminary
approval hearing and checking for
tentative ruling; check docket for entry of
ntc of withdrawal of Hill mtn to intervene;
remove mtn to intervene deadlines from
calendar

83122.001 01/22/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 672Pull copy of tentative ruling
83122.001 01/28/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 673Check register of actions for any sign of

preliminary approval order entered
83122.001 01/31/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 674Check register of actions for any sign of

preliminary approval order entered;
calendar final approval hearing

83122.001 02/04/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.40 112.00 675Accept all changes to First Amended
Settlement Agreement, finalize all exhibits
and circulate same for signature

83122.001 02/06/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.60 168.00 676Finalize amended proposed order re
preliminary approval and all exhibits; file
same via First Legal; serve same via
email

83122.001 02/28/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 677Check on status of amended preliminary
approval order; try to pull via Courtlink

83122.001 03/03/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 678Calculate deadlines per preliminary
approval order

83122.001 03/04/2020 KMC P 499 280.00 0.10 28.00 679Calendar deadlines per settlement
agreement

Subtotal for Timekeeper KMC Billable 54.20 14,416.50 Kathryn M.Cabrera



Date Atty/Para Case Description Time
5/7/2020 RRB 83117.001 Emails to/from JP, defense counsel and Epiq re objections and opt outs; forward same 

to KW to save in file. 0.20
5/8/2020 RRB 83117.001 Continue drafting motion for final approval; draft class counsel declaration; send JP 

the change of attorney info. form; emails to/from JP re plaintiff declarations; locate and 
send model plaintiff decl. to JP; edit class counsel decls. And emails to/from JP re 
same. 1.60

5/11/2020 RRB 83117.001 Search for sample fee applications in Riverside Complex on CourtLink; create fee and 
expense brief from sample and send to JP to edit content; continue drafting motion for 
final approval (0.5); review JP’s change of address form and forward to AL for filing 
and service; edit class counsel declaration and email same to JP; locate Petetan’s 
signature to FASA and save to file; multiple emails to RSN re Richardson’s signature 
to FASA and plaintiff decl.; review JP’s edits to plaintiff declaration; t/c w/JP re 
exhibit  to class counsel decl.; create same; email to JP re class member contact; pull 
court docket and email same to JP. 3.60

5/11/2020 AL 83117.001 Finalized and filed Ntc of Change of Address for co-counsel Pollack, served. 1.00
5/12/2020 RRB 83117.001 Edit Ramos declaration; emails to/from JP re same; emails to/from MCR re including 

redacted time detail in fee application; edit exhibit to class counsel declarations for 
expense items; email to RSN w/plaintiff declarations; edit Petetan and Richardson 
declarations; emails to/from AL re searching CourtLink for fee petitions in Riverside 
Complex; emails to/from JP re what we could find; further edit class counsel 
declaration and send to JP. 2.20

5/12/2020 KW 83117.001 Returning call re settlement notice and updating spreadsheet 0.20
5/12/2020 AL 83117.001 CourtLink search for examples of Awards of Attorney Fees in Riverside County for 

complex case judges (Attorney Declarations) wrt Mtn Preliminary Approval, searched 
google as well for any publically available docs, checked CourtLink regularly to see if 
docs became available

3.00

5/13/2020 RRB 83117.001 Emails to/from JP re plaintiffs’ declarations; edit firm T&E declaration; t/c w/AL re 
compiling and organizing WHAFH T&E declaration lodestar and expense 
numbers/data and creating exhibits for same; emails to/from AL re same; edit final 
order and judgment and email same to JP. 0.50

5/13/2020 KW 83117.001 Cross checking Class Member excel chart with recent objection ltrs (.9); Returning 
calls re settlement, updating spreadsheet (.2) 1.10

5/13/2020 AL 83117.001 Discussed t&e reporting project with RRB re preliminary approval brief, requested 
T&E data from KD

0.50

5/14/2020 RRB 83117.001 Continue drafting final approval brief and joint declaration in support; emails to/from 
and t/c w/ JP; emails re class member calls; review and edit final order and judgment; 
emails to/from JP and AL re same. 4.80

5/14/2020 AL 83117.001 Started Reviewing T&E Reports – Time description redactions 2.00
5/14/2020 AL 83117.001 Research re: when necessary to file PO for Mtns in Riverside Superior 0.60
5/15/2020 RRB 83117.001 Emails to/from JP re settlement papers; emails from defense counsel and settlement 

administrator; continue drafting final approval brief and joint declaration in support; 
email same to JP; emails to/from JP w/fee briefs citing 33% cases and negative 
multiplier language; review AL’s redactions to detailed time records and email to AL 
re instructions and on  how I modified them. 5.40

5/15/2020 KW 83117.001 Updating spreadsheet 0.20
5/15/2020 AL 83117.001 Started Reviewing T&E Reports – Time description redactions & started calculation of 

time by timekeeper (attny/paralegal)
4.00

5/18/2020 RRB 83117.001 Emails to/from JP re fee brief; review and edit same; email draft to JP; review lodestar 
summary and emails to/from AL re same. 1.80

5/18/2020 AL 83117.001 Finished time calculations by Timekeeper, continued redactions 6.00
5/19/2020 RRB 83117.001

Review JP’s edits to joint decl. and final approval motion and make additional edits; 
emails to/from JP re final approval papers; emails to/from AJ re lodestar calculation. 0.60

5/19/2020 KW 83117.001 Finding cases on courtlink and pulling orders re mtn for final approval 2.80
5/19/2020 AL 83117.001 Worked on expense calculations by category 7.00

In re: Renovate America Finance Cases
May 2020 Time Detail

EXHIBIT A



5/20/2020 RRB 83117.001 Edit motion for final approval; emails to/from JP re same; emails to/from KW re 
pulling materials for fee brief from CourtLink. 0.80

5/20/2020 KW 83117.001 Updating spreadsheet; Pulling orders from cases for mtn for final approval 1.60
5/20/2020 AL 83117.001 Made adjustments to expense calculations based on feedback, updated RRB Fee decl 

to reflect time and expense calculations. Searched for LEXIS cites to cited cases in 
RRB decl., worked on time description redactions

7.00

5/21/2020 RRB 83117.001
Review and edit settlement brief, fee brief, joint declaration, Byrd Declaration, review 
and organize exhibits to the joint declaration and to the attorney declarations; emails 
to/from RSN re his clients’ declarations; emails to/from JP re all of the above and re 
other plaintiff declarations; conf. call w/KW and AL re cite checking and preparing 
exhibits for Byrd declaration; emails to/from partners re locating an updated firm 
resume; review and edit Azari declaration; emails to/from settlement administrator re 
same; emails to/from co-counsel re their declaration(s). 8.80

5/21/2020 KW 83117.001 T/C with RRB and AL re Hero filing; Paralegaling brief & inputting changes; 
Updating spreadsheet 2.70

5/21/2020 AL 83117.001 Telephone conf. with RRB and KW re: plan of action re final approval filing. 
Transferred expense details to excel spreadsheet to be filed as an exhibit to RRB Fee 
Decl.

7.00

5/22/2020 RRB 83117.001 Review expenses and backup and edit spreadsheet for exhibit to T&E decl.; emails 
to/from KD, JP, AL re same; emails to/from RSN re sending plaintiff declarations; 
email same to Richardson and Petetan; review and edit fee brief, settlement brief and 
joint declaration; emails to/from KW re checking citations in fee brief; update firm 
resume for T&E declaration; emails to/from KD and JC re pulling Lexis charges for 
May; review time detail and edit proposed redactions. 7.50

5/22/2020 KW 83117.001 Paralegaling fee brief & inputting changes; corr. with RRB and AL (3.3) 3.30
5/22/2020 AL 83117.001 Finished time description redactions for RRB Fee Decl. sent to RRB for review. 5.00
5/22/2020 AL 83117.001 Made additional adjustments to expense detail and confirmed totals; updated RRB Fee 

Decl. with time and expense totals. Created May Time Detail spreadsheet for RRB, 
KW & my time to supplement time detail pulled by KD.

3.00

TOTAL MAY TIME 95.80

EXHIBIT A
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Founded in 1888, Wolf Haldenstein Adler Freeman & Herz LLP is a full service law 
firm specializing in complex litigation in federal and state courts nationwide.  The 
firm’s practice includes litigation, both hourly and contingent, in securities, antitrust, 
wage & hour, consumer fraud, false marketing, ERISA, and general and commercial 
matters, whistleblower, false claim, trust & estate, corporate investigation, and white 
collar matters, and FINRA arbitration.  The Firm has a particular specialty in complex 
class action and other representative litigation – including investor, shareholder, 
antitrust, ERISA, consumer, employee, and biotechnology matters – under both federal 
and state law.     

Wolf Haldenstein’s total practice approach distinguishes it from other firms.  Our 
longstanding tradition of a close attorney/client relationship ensures that each one of 
our clients receives prompt, individual attention and does not become lost in an 
institutional bureaucracy.  Our team approach is at the very heart of Wolf Haldenstein’s 
practice.  All of our lawyers are readily available to all of our clients and to each other.  
The result of this approach is that we provide our clients with an efficient legal team 
having the broad perspective, expertise and experience required for any matter at hand.  
We are thus able to provide our clients with cost effective and thorough counsel focused 
on our clients’ overall goals. 
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THE FIRM  
Wolf Haldenstein has been recognized by state and federal courts throughout the 
country as being highly experienced in complex litigation, particularly with respect to 
securities, consumer, ERISA, FLSA and state overtime and expense deductions, and 
antitrust class actions and shareholder rights litigation.   

Among its colleagues in the plaintiffs’ bar, as well as among its adversaries in the 
defense bar, Wolf Haldenstein is known for the high ability of its attorneys, and the 
exceptionally high quality of its written and oral advocacy. 

The nature of the Firm’s activities in both individual and representative litigation is 
extremely broad.  In addition to a large case load of securities fraud and other investor 
class actions, Wolf Haldenstein has represented classes of corn and rice farmers in 
connection with the devaluation of their crops; contact lens purchasers for contact lens 
manufacturers’ violations of the antitrust laws; merchants compelled to accept certain 
types of debit cards; insurance policyholders for insurance companies’ deceptive sales 
practices; victims of unlawful strip searches under the civil rights laws; and various 
cases involving violations of Internet users’ on-line privacy rights. 

The Firm’s experience in class action securities litigation, in particular public 
shareholder rights under state law and securities fraud claims arising under the federal 
securities laws and regulations is particularly extensive.  The Firm was one of the lead 
or other primary counsel in securities class action cases that have recouped billions of 
dollars on behalf of investor classes, in stockholder rights class actions that have 
resulted in billions of dollars in increased merger consideration to shareholder classes, 
and in derivative litigation that has recovered billions of dollars for corporations. 

Its pioneering efforts in difficult or unusual areas of securities or investor protection 
laws include: groundbreaking claims that have been successfully brought under the 
Investment Company Act of 1940 regarding fiduciary responsibilities of investment 
companies and their advisors toward their shareholders; claims under ERISA involving 
fiduciary duties of ERISA trustees who are also insiders in possession of adverse 
information regarding their fund’s primary stockholdings; the fiduciary duties of the 
directors of Delaware corporations in connection with change of control transactions; 
the early application of the fraud-on-the-market theory to claims against public 
accounting firms in connection with their audits of publicly traded corporations; and 
the application of federal securities class certification standards to state law claims often 
thought to be beyond the reach of class action treatment. 
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Judicial Commendations 

Wolf Haldenstein has repeatedly received favorable judicial recognition.  The following 
representative judicial comments over the past decade indicate the high regard in which 
the Firm is held: 

• In re Empire State Realty Trust, Inc. Investor Litig., No. 650607/2012  (Sup. Ct. 
N.Y. Co.) – On May 2, 2013, Justice O. Peter Sherwood praised the Firm in its 
role as chair of the committee of co-lead counsel as follows: "It is apparent to 
me, having presided over this case, that class counsel has performed in an 
excellent manner, and you have represented your clients quite well.  You 
should be complimented for that."  In awarding attorneys' fees, the 
Court stated that the fee was "intended to reward class counsel handsomely 
for the very good result achieved for the Class, assumption of the high risk of 
Plaintiffs prevailing and the efficiency of effort that resulted in the settlement 
of the case at an early stage without protracted motion practice."  May 17, 2013 
slip. op. at 5 (citations omitted). 

• Roberts v. Tishman Speyer, 13 N.Y.3d 270 (N.Y. 2009) – On April 9, 2013, Justice 
Richard B. Lowe III praised the Firm’s efforts as follows: “[W]hen you have 
challenging cases, the one thing you like to ask for is that the legal 
representation on both sides rise to that level.  Because when you have lawyers 
who are professionals, who are confident, who are experienced, each of you 
know that each side has a job to do [. . . .]  I want to tell you that I am very 
satisfied with your performance and with your, quite frankly, tenacity on both 
sides.  And it took six years, but look at the history of the litigation. There were 
two appeals all of the way to the Court of Appeals [. . . .]  And then look at the 
results.  I mean, there are dissents in the Court of Appeals, so that shows you 
the complexity of the issues that were presented in this litigation [. . . .]  [I]t 
shows you effort that went into this and the professionalism that was 
exhibited [. . . .]  So let me just again express my appreciation to both sides.” 

• K.J. Egleston L.P. v. Heartland Industrial Partners, et al., 2:06-13555 (E.D. Mich.) – 
where the Firm was Lead Counsel, Judge Rosen, at the June 7, 2010 final 
approval hearing, praised the Firm for doing “an outstanding job of 
representing [its] clients,” and further commented that “the conduct of all 
counsel in this case and the result they have achieved for all of the parties 
confirms that they deserve the national recognition they enjoy.” 
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• Klein, et al. v. Ryan Beck Holdings, Inc., et al., 06-cv-3460 (DAB) (S.D.N.Y. 2010) – 
where the Firm was Lead Counsel, Judge Deborah A. Batts described the 
Firm’s successful establishment of a settlement fund as follows: “[a] miracle 
that there is a settlement fund at all.”  Judge Batts continued: "As I said earlier, 
there is no question that the litigation is complex and of a large and, if you 
will, pioneering magnitude ..." (Emphasis added). 

• Parker Friedland v. Iridium World Communications, Ltd., 99-1002 (D.D.C.) – where 
the Firm was co-lead counsel, Judge Laughrey said (on October 16, 2008), “[a]ll 
of the attorneys in this case have done an outstanding job, and I really 
appreciate the quality of work that we had in our chambers as a result of this 
case.” 

• In re Dynamic Random Access Memory Antitrust Litigation, MDL-02-1486 (N.D. 
Cal.) – where the Firm was co-lead counsel, Judge Hamilton said (on August 
15, 2007), “I think I can conclude on the basis with my five years with you all, 
watching this litigation progress and seeing it wind to a conclusion, that the 
results are exceptional.  The percentages, as you have outlined them, do put 
this [case] in one of the upper categories of results of this kind of [antitrust] 
class action.  I am aware of the complexity . . . I thought that you all did an 
exceptionally good job of bringing to me only those matters that really 
required the Court’s attention.  You did an exceptionally good job at 
organizing and managing the case, assisting me in management of the case.  
There was excellent coordination between all the various different plaintiffs’ 
counsel with your group and the other groups that are part of this litigation. . . 
. So my conclusion is the case was well litigated by both sides, well managed 
as well by both sides.” 

• In re Comdisco Sec. Litigation, 01 C 2110 (N.D. Ill. July 14, 2005) – Judge Milton 
Shadur observed: “It has to be said . . . that the efforts that have been extended 
[by Wolf Haldenstein] on behalf of the plaintiff class in the face of these 
obstacles have been exemplary.  And in my view [Wolf Haldenstein] reflected 
the kind of professionalism that the critics of class actions . . . are never willing 
to recognize. . . . I really cannot speak too highly of the services rendered by 
class counsel in an extraordinary difficult situation.” 
 

• Good Morning to You Productions Corp. v. Warner/Chappell Music, Inc., No. CV 
13-04460-GHK (MRWx) (C.D. Cal., Aug. 16, 2016) – Judge George H. King 
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stated: "Not all, or perhaps even most, plaintiffs' class counsel could have 
litigated this case as successfully as did class counsel against such a fierce and 
exceptionally accomplished opponent." 
 

• Bokelman et al. v. FCH Enterprises, Inc., (Case No. 1:18-cv-209, D. Haw., May 3, 
2019):  Judge Robert J. Bryan said, “I’ve been impressed by the quality of the 
work you’ve done throughout here, and that is reflected, I think, in the fact 
that no one has objected to the settlement.”  

 
Recent Noteworthy Results 

 
Wolf Haldenstein’s performance in representative litigation has repeatedly resulted in 
favorable results for its clients.  The Firm has helped recover billions of dollars on 
behalf of its clients in the cases listed below.  Recent examples include the following:   

• On May 13, 2019, in Apple Inc. v. Pepper, No. 17-204, the Supreme Court 
affirmed a decision by the Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals holding that iPhone 
purchasers have standing to sue Apple for monopolizing the market for iPhone 
apps in this longstanding antitrust class action.  Wolf Haldenstein has been 
Lead Counsel for the plaintiffs since 2007. The case was commenced in federal 
district court in Oakland.  The Supreme Court’s decision clears the way for the 
plaintiffs to proceed on the merits of their claim.   

• On June 11, 2018, the United States Supreme Court issued a highly anticipated 
decision in China Agritech, Inc. v. Michael H. Resh, et al. Wolf Haldenstein 
represented the plaintiffs/respondents, having commenced the action on behalf 
of aggrieved shareholders of China Agritech after two prior cases had failed at 
the class certification stage.  

• In re Genetically Modified Rice Litigation, MDL 1811 (E.D. Mo.) - Wolf 
Haldenstein represented U.S. rice farmers in this landmark action against Bayer 
A.G. and its global affiliates, achieving a global recovery of $750 million.  The 
case arose from the contamination of the nation's long grain rice crop by 
Bayer's experimental and unapproved genetically modified Liberty Link rice.     

• Roberts v. Tishman Speyer, 13 N.Y.3d 270 (N.Y. 2009) - a class action brought on 
behalf of over 27,500 current and former tenants of New York City's iconic 
Stuyvesant Town and Peter Cooper Village housing complexes.  On April 9, 
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2013, Justice Richard B. Lowe III of the New York Supreme Court finally 
approved settlement of the action, which totals over $173 million, sets aside 
$68.75 million in damages, re-regulates the apartments at issue, and sets 
preferential rents for the units that will save tenants significant monies in the 
future.  The settlement also enables the tenants to retain an estimated $105 
million in rent savings they enjoyed between 2009 and 2012.  The settlement is 
by many magnitudes the largest tenant settlement in United States history. 

• In re Empire State Realty Trust, Inc. Investor Litig., Index No. 650607/2012 – The 
firm served as Chair of the Executive Committee of Co-Lead Counsel for the 
Plaintiffs in a class action settlement finally approved on May 2, 2013 that 
provides for the establishment of a $55 million settlement fund for investors, in 
addition to substantial tax deferral benefits estimated to be in excess of $100 
million. 

• American International Group Consolidated Derivative Litigation, Civil Action No. 
769-VCS (Del. Ch.) The Firm acted as co-lead counsel and the settlement 
addressed claims alleging that the D&O Defendants breached their fiduciary 
duties to the Company and otherwise committed wrongdoing to the detriment 
of AIG in connection with various allegedly fraudulent schemes during the 
1999-2005 time period. 

• In re Bank of America Corp. Securities, Derivative, and Employee Retirement Income 
Security Act (ERISA) Litigation, Master File No. 09 MD 2058 (S.D.N.Y.) (firm was 
co-lead counsel in parallel derivative action pending in Delaware (In Re Bank of 
America Stockholder Derivative Litigation, C.A. No. 4307-CS (Del. Ch.)) (increase 
of settlement cash recovery from $20 million to $62.5 million). 

• The Investment Committee of the Manhattan and Bronx Service Transit Operating 
Authority Pension Plan v. JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A., 1:09-cv-04408-SAS 
(S.D.N.Y.) (class recovered $150 million). 

• In re Tremont Sec. Law, State Law and Insurance Litig., No. 08-civ-11117 (TPG) 
(SDNY) (class recovered $100 million).  The firm was court-appointed co-lead 
counsel in the Insurance Action, 08 Civ. 557, and represented a class of persons 
who purchased or otherwise acquired Variable Universal Life (“VUL”) 
insurance policies or Deferred Variable Annuity (“DVA”) policies issued by 
Tremont International Insurance Limited or Argus International Life Bermuda 
Limited from May 10, 1994 - December 11, 2008 to the extent the investment 



 
 

 
                                                          

Page 8 

accounts of those policies were exposed to the massive Ponzi scheme 
orchestrated by Bernard L. Madoff through one or more Rye funds. 

• In re Initial Public Offering Securities Litigation, 21 MC 92 (SAS) (S.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $586 million).  Wolf Haldenstein served as Co-Lead Counsel of one 
of the largest securities fraud cases in history.  Despite the United States Court 
of Appeals for the Second Circuit’s decision to vacate the district court’s class 
certification decision, on remand, counsel for plaintiffs were able to press on to 
a settlement on April 1, 2009, ultimately recovering in excess of a half-billion 
dollars.      

FIRM PRACTICE AREAS 
 

Class Action Litigation 
 

Wolf Haldenstein is a leader in class and derivative action litigation and is currently or 
has been the court-appointed lead counsel, co-lead counsel, or executive committee 
member in some of the largest and most significant class action and derivative action 
lawsuits in the United States.  For example, the class action Roberts v. Tishman Speyer, 13 
N.Y.3d 270 (N.Y. 2009) was recently described by a sitting member of the U.S. House of 
Representatives as the greatest legal victory for tenants in her lifetime.  In Roberts, the 
Firm obtained a victory in the New York Court of Appeals requiring the reregulation of 
thousands of apartment units in the Stuyvesant Town complex in Manhattan, New 
York.  Many of the firm’s other successful results are summarized within.       

Private Actions for Institutional Investors 
 

In addition to its vast class action practice, the Firm also regularly represents 
institutional clients such as public funds, investment funds, limited partnerships, and 
qualified institutional buyers in private actions.  The Firm has represented institutional 
clients in non-class federal and state actions concerning a variety of matters, including 
private placements, disputes with investment advisors, and disputes with corporate 
management.  

The Firm has also acted as special counsel to investors’ committees in efforts to assert 
and advance the investors’ interests without resorting to litigation.  For example, the 
Firm served as Counsel to the Courtyard by Marriott Limited Partners Committee for 
several years in its dealings with Host Marriott Corporation, and as Special Counsel to 
the Windsor Park Properties 7 and 8 limited partners to insure the fairness of their 
liquidation transactions. 
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Antitrust Litigation 
 

Wolf Haldenstein is a leader in antitrust and competition litigation.  The Firm actively 
seeks to enforce the federal and state antitrust laws to protect and strengthen the rights 
and claims of businesses, organizations, Taft-Hartley funds, and consumers throughout 
the United States.  To that end, Wolf Haldenstein commences large, often complex, 
antitrust and trade regulation class actions and other cases that target some of the most 
powerful and well-funded corporate interests in the world.  Many of these interests 
exert strong influence over enforcement policy that is in the hands of elected officials, so 
that private enforcement provides the only true assurance that unfair and 
anticompetitive conduct will be duly scrutinized for compliance with the law.  These 
cases frequently bring to light concealed, unlawful behavior such as price fixing, 
monopolization, market allocation, monopoly leveraging, essential facilities, tying 
arrangements, vertical restraints, exclusive dealing, and refusals to deal.  Wolf 
Haldenstein’s Antitrust Practice Group has successfully prosecuted numerous antitrust 
cases and aggressively advocates remedies and restitution for businesses and investors 
wronged by violations of the antitrust laws.  For example, in In re DRAM Antitrust 
Litigation, No. 02-cv-1486 (PJH) (N.D. Cal.) the firm successfully prosecuted an antitrust 
case resulting in a $315 million recovery.  Many of the firm’s successful results are 
summarized within.       

Wolf Haldenstein attorneys currently serve as lead counsel, co-lead counsel, or as 
executive committee members in some of the largest and most significant antitrust class 
action lawsuits.  The firm was most recently appointed lead counsel in the Salmon 
Antitrust Indirect Litigation pending in the U.S. District Court for the Southern District 
of Florida. 

Biotechnology and Agricultural Litigation 
 

Wolf Haldenstein is a leader in biotechnology and agricultural litigation.  The firm has 
represented U.S. row crop farmers and others harmed by crop supply contamination, 
price fixing of genetically-modified crop seeds, and false claims and representations 
relating to purportedly “organic” products.  The firm has prosecuted actions in these 
fields against domestic and international biotechnology and crop science companies 
under the federal and state antitrust laws, consumer protection and deceptive trade 
practice statues, and the common law.  As a leader in this field, Wolf Haldenstein 
pioneered approaches now commonly used in these types of cases, including the use of 
futures-based efficient market analyses to fashion damages models relating to the 
underlying commodity crops.  The firm has served or is currently serving as lead or co-
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lead counsel in some of the most significant biotechnology and agricultural class actions 
pending or litigated in the United States.  For example, in In re Genetically Modified Rice 
Litigation, MDL 1811 (E.D. Mo.) the firm prosecuted a multidistrict product liability 
litigation brought on behalf of United States long-grain rice farmers that ultimately 
settled in July 2011 for $750 million.  Many of the firm’s other successful results are 
summarized within.           
 

Overtime and Compensation Class Actions 
 

Wolf Haldenstein is a leader class action litigation on behalf of employees who have not 
been paid overtime or other compensation they are entitled to receive, or have had 
improper deductions taken from their compensation.  These claims under the federal 
Fair Labor Standards Act and state labor laws allege improper failure to pay overtime 
and other wages, and improper deductions from compensation for various company 
expenses.  Wolf Haldenstein has served as lead or co-lead counsel, or other similar lead 
role, in some of the most significant overtime class actions pending in the United States, 
and has recovered hundreds of millions of dollars in recovered wages for its clients.  For 
example, in LaVoice v. Citigroup Global Markets, Inc., Case No. C 07-801 (CW) (N.D. Cal.)) 
a $108 million settlement was secured for the class.  Many of the firm’s other successful 
wage and hour results are summarized within.       

Other Substantial Recoveries In Class Action And Derivative Cases in 
Which Wolf Haldenstein Was Lead Counsel or Had Another 

Significant Role 
 

• In re Beacon Associates Litigation, Master File No. 09 Civ. 0777 (LBS) (S.D.N.Y.) 
($219 million settlement in this and related action). 

• Roberts v. Tishman Speyer, No. 100956/2007 (Sup. Ct. N.Y. Cty.) ($173 Million 
settlement). 

• In re Mutual Fund Investment Litigation, MDL No. 1586 (D. Md.) (derivative 
counsel in consolidated cases against numerous mutual fund companies 
involved in market timing resulting in class/derivative settlements totaling 
more than $300 million). 

• Inland Western Securities Litigation, Case No. 07 C 6174 (N.D. Ill.) (settlement 
value of shares valued between $61.5 million and $90 million). 
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• In re Direxion Shares ETF Trust, No. 09-Civ-8011 (KBF) (S.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $8 million). 

• In re BankAmerica Corp. Securities Litigation, MDL Docket No. 1264 (JFN) (E.D. 
Mo.) (class recovered $490 million). 

• In re Dynamic Random Access Memory Antitrust Litigation, (MD-02 1486 (N.D. 
Cal.) (class recovered $325 million). 

• In re MicroStrategy, Inc. Securities Litigation, Civ. No. 00-473-A (E.D. Va.) (class 
recovered $160 million in cash and securities). 

• Kurzweil v. Philip Morris Cos., 94 Civ. 2373, 94 Civ. 2546 (S.D.N.Y.) (securities 
fraud) (class recovered $116.5 million in cash). 

• In re Starlink Corn Products Liability Litigation, (N.D. Ill.) (class recovered $110 
million). 

• In Computer Associates 2002 Class Action Sec. Litigation, 2:02-CV-1226 (E.D.N.Y.) 
($130 million settlement in this and two related actions). 

• In re Sepracor Inc. Securities Litigation, Civ. No. 02-12338 (MEL) (D. Mass.) 
(classes recovered $52.5 million). 

• In re Transkaryotic Therapies, Inc., Securities Litigation, C.A. No. 03-10165-RWZ 
(D. Mass) (class recovered $50 million). 

• In re Iridium Securities Litigation, C.A. No. 99-1002 (D.D.C.) (class recovered $43 
million). 

• In re J.P. Morgan Chase Securities Litigation, MDL No. 1783 (N.D. Ill.) (settlement 
providing for adoption of corporate governance principles relating to potential 
corporate transactions requiring shareholder approval).  

• LaVoice v. Citigroup Global Markets, Inc., Case No. C 07-801 (CW) (N.D. Cal.)) 
($108 million settlement). 

• Steinberg v. Morgan Stanley & Co., Inc., Case No. 06-cv-2628 (BEN) (S.D. Cal.) 
($50 million settlement). 
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• Poole v. Merrill Lynch, Pierce, Fenner & Smith Inc., Case No. CV-06-1657 (D. Or.) 
($43.5 million settlement). 

• In re Wachovia Securities, LLC Wage and Hour Litigation, MDL No. 07-1807 DOC 
(C.D. Cal.) ($39 million settlement). 

• In re Wachovia Securities, LLC Wage and Hour Litigation (Prudential), MDL No. 
07-1807 DOC (C.D. Cal.) ($11 million settlement). 

• Basile v. A.G. Edwards, Inc., 08-CV-00338-JAH-RBB (S.D. Cal.) ($12 million 
settlement). 

• Miguel Garcia, et al. v. Lowe’s Home Center, Inc. et al. – Case No. GIC 841120 
(Barton) (Cal. Sup. Ct, San Diego) (co-lead, $1.65 million settlement w/ 
average class member recovery of $5,500, attorney fees and cost awarded 
separately). 

• Neil Weinstein, et al. v. MetLife, Inc., et al. – Case No. 3:06-cv-04444-SI (N.D.Cal) 
(co-lead, $7.4 million settlement).  

• Creighton v. Oppenheimer, Index No. 1:06 - cv - 04607 - BSJ - DCF (S.D.N.Y.) 
($2.3 million settlement). 

• Klein v. Ryan Beck, 06-CV-3460 (DAB)(S.D.N.Y.) ($1.3 million settlement).   

• In re American Pharmaceutical Partners, Inc. Shareholder Litigation, Consolidated 
C.A. No. 1823-N (Del. Ch. Ct.) ($14.3 million settlement). 

• Egleston v. Collins and Aikman Corp., 06-cv-13555 (E.D. Mich.) (class recovered 
$12 million).   

• In re Merrill Lynch & Co., Inc. Global Technology Fund Securities Litigation, 02 CV 
7854 (JFK) (SDNY); and In re Merrill Lynch & Co., Inc. Focus Twenty Fund 
Securities Litigation, 02 CV 10221 (JFK) (SDNY) (class recovered $39 million in 
combined cases). 

• In re CNL Hotels & Resorts, Inc. Securities Litigation, No. 6:04-cv-1231 (Orl-31) 
(class recovered $35 million, and lawsuit also instrumental in $225 million 
benefit to corporation). 
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• In re Cablevision Systems Corp. Shareholder Derivative Litigation, Master File No. 
06-CV-4130-DGT-AKT ($34.4 million recovery). 

• In re Monster Worldwide, Inc. Stock Option Derivative Litigation, Master File No. 
06cv4622 (S.D.N.Y.) ($32 million recovery and corporate governance reforms). 

• Berger v. Compaq Computer Corp., Docket No. 98-1148 (S.D. Tex.) (class 
recovered $29 million). 

• In re Arakis Energy Corporation Securities Litigation, 95 CV 3431 (E.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $24 million). 

• In re E.W. Blanche Holdings, Inc. Securities Litigation, Civ. No. 01-258 (D. Minn.) 
(class recovered $20 million). 

• In re Globalstar Securities Litigation, Case No. 01-CV-1748 (SHS) (S.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $20 million). 

• In re Luxottica Group S.p.A. Securities Litigation, No. CV 01-3285 (E.D.N.Y) (class 
recovered $18.25 million).  

• In re Musicmaker.com Securities Litigation, CV-00-2018 (C.D. Cal.) (class 
recovered $13.75 million). 

• In re Comdisco Securities Litigation, No. 01 C 2110 (MIS) (N.D. Ill.) (class 
recovered $13.75 million). 

• In re Acclaim Entertainment, Inc., Securities Litigation, C.A. No. 03-CV-1270 
(E.D.N.Y.) (class recovered $13.65 million). 

• In re Concord EFS, Inc. Securities Litigation, No. 02-2097 (MA) (W.D. Tenn) (class 
recovered $13.25 million).   

• In re Bausch & Lomb, Inc. Securities Litigation, 01 Civ. 6190 (CJS) (W.D.N.Y.) 
(class recovered $12.5 million). 

• In re Allaire Corp. Securities Litigation, 00-11972 (D. Mass.) (class recovered $12 
million). 

• Bamboo Partners LLC v. Robert Mondavi Corp., No. 26-27170 (Cal. Sup. Ct.) (class 
recovered $10.8 million). 
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• Curative Health Services Securities Litigation, 99-2074 (E.D.N.Y.) (class recovered 
$10.5 million). 

• City Partnership Co. v. Jones Intercable, 99 WM-1051 (D. Colo.) (class recovered 
$10.5 million). 

• In re Aquila, Inc., (ERISA Litigation), 04-865 (W.D. Mo.) ($10.5 million recovery 
for the class). 

• In re Tenfold Corporation Securities Litigation, 2:00-CV-652 (D. Utah) (class 
recovered $5.9 million). 

• In re Industrial Gas Antitrust Litigation, 80 C 3479 and related cases (N.D. Ill.) 
(class recovered $50 million). 

• In re Chor-Alkalai and Caustic Soda Antitrust Litigation, 86-5428 and related cases 
(E.D. Pa.) (class recovered $55 million). 

• In re Infant Formula Antitrust Litigation, MDL No. 878 (N.D. Fla.) (class 
recovered $126 million). 

• In re Brand Name Prescription Drugs Antitrust Litigation, No. 1:94-cv-00897, 
M.D.L. 997 (N.D. Ill.) (class recovered $715 million). 

• Landon v. Freel, M.D.L. No. 592 (S.D. Tex.) (class recovered $12 million). 

• Holloway v. Peat, Marwick, Mitchell & Co., No. 84 C 814 EU (N.D. Okla.) (class 
recovered $38 million). 

• In re The Chubb Corp. Drought Insurance Litigation, C-1-88-644 (S.D. Ohio) 
(class recovered $100 million). 

• Wong v. Megafoods, Civ-94-1702 (D. Ariz.) (securities fraud) (class recovered 
$12.25 million). 

• In re Del Val Financial Corp. Securities Litigation, 92 Civ 4854 (S.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $11.5 million). 

• In re Home Shopping Network Shareholders Litigation, Consolidated Civil Action 
No. 12868, (Del. Ch. 1995) (class recovered $13 million). 
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• In re Paine Webber Limited Partnerships Litigation, 94 Civ 8547 (S.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $200 million). 

• In re Bristol-Meyers Squibb Co. Securities Litigation, 92 Civ 4007 (S.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $19 million). 

• In re Spectrum Information Technologies Securities Litigation, CV 93-2245 
(E.D.N.Y.) (class recovered $13 million). 

• In re Chase Manhattan Securities Litigation, 90 Civ. 6092 (LJF) (S.D.N.Y.) (class 
recovered $17.5 million). 

• Prostic v. Xerox Corp., No. B-90-113 (EBB) (D. Conn.) (class recovered $9 
million). 

• Steiner v. Hercules, Civil Action No. 90-442-RRM (D. Del.) (class recovered $18 
million). 

• In re Ambase Securities Litigation, 90 Civ 2011 (S.D.N.Y.) (class recovered $14.6 
million). 

• In re Southmark Securities Litigation, CA No. 3-89-1402-D (N.D. Tex.) (class 
recovered $70 million). 

• Steiner v. Ideal Basic Industries, Inc., No. 86-M 456 (D. Colo. 1989) (securities 
fraud) (class recovered $18 million). 

• Tucson Electric Power Derivative Litigation, 2:89 Civ. 01274 TUC. ACM 
(corporation recovered $30 million). 

• Alleco Stockholders Litigation, (Md. Cir. Ct. Pr. Georges County) (class recovered 
$16 million). 

• In re Revlon Group, Inc. Shareholders Litigation, No. 8362 (Del. Ch.) (class 
recovered $30 million). 

• In re Taft Broadcasting Company Shareholders Litigation, No. 8897 (Del. Ch.) (class 
recovered $20 million). 

• In re Southland Corp. Securities Litigation, No. 87-8834-K (N.D.Tex.) (class 
recovered $20 million). 
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• In re Crocker Bank Securities Litigation, CA No. 7405 (Del. Ch.) (class recovered 
$30 million). 

• In re Warner Communications Securities Litigation, No. 82 Civ. 8288 (JFK) 
(S.D.N.Y.) (class recovered $17.5 million). 

• Joseph v. Shell Oil, CA No. 7450 (Del. Ch.) (securities fraud) (class recovered 
$200 million). 

• In re Flight Transportation Corp. Securities Litigation, Master Docket No. 4-82-874, 
MDL No. 517 (D. Minn.) (recovery of over $50 million). 

• In re Whittaker Corporation Securities Litigation, CA000817 (Cal. Super. Ct., Los 
Angeles County) (class recovered $18 million). 

• Naevus International, Inc. v. AT&T Corp., C.A. No. 602191/99 (N.Y. Sup. Ct.) 
(consumer fraud) (class recovered $40 million). 

• Sewell v. Sprint PCS Limited Partnership, C.A. No. 97-188027/CC 3879 (Cir. Ct. 
for Baltimore City) (consumer fraud) (class recovered $45.2 million). 

• In re Vytorin/Zetia Marketing, Sales Practices and Products Liability Litigation, 2:08-
cv-285 (D.N.J.) (class recovered $41.5 million). 

• Egleston v. Verizon, No. 104784/2011 (N.Y. Sup. Ct.) – Wolf Haldenstein 
represented a class of New York Verizon Centrex customers in an action 
against Verizon stemming from overbilling of certain charges.  The Firm 
secured a settlement with a total value to the Class of over $5 million, which 
provided, among other things, each class member with full refunds of certain 
disputed charges, plus interest. 

• Zelouf Int’l Corp. v. Nahal Zelouf, Index No. 653652/2014 (Sup. Ct. N.Y. Co. 
2015).  In an important trial decision following an appraisal proceeding 
triggered by the freeze-out merger of a closely-held corporation, which also 
included shareholder derivative claims, Justice Kornreich of the New York 
Supreme Court refused to apply a discount for lack of marketability to the 
minority interest in the former corporation and found that the insiders stole 
more than $14 million dollars; the minority shareholder recovered over $9 
million.   
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• Zelouf Int’l Corp. v. Zelouf, 45 Misc.3d 1205(A) (Sup. Ct. N.Y. Co., 2014).   The 
Court rejected application of a discount for lack of marketability and awarded 
a $10,031,438.28 judgment following an eleven day bench trial in the 
Commercial Division of the Supreme Court of the State of New York (New 
York County) on the value of a minority interest in a closely held corporation.   

• Thompson et al. v. Bethpage Federal Credit Union et al., No. 2:17-cv-00921-GRB 
(E.D.N.Y.) ($3.6 million settlement) 

Representative Reported Opinions Since 1990 in Which Wolf 
Haldenstein Was Lead Counsel or Had Another Significant Role 

 
Federal Appellate and District Court Opinions 

 
• DeFrees v. Kirkland, 2012 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 52780 (C.D. Cal. Apr. 11, 2012). 

• In re Beacon Associates Litigation., 745 F. Supp. 2d 386 (S.D.N.Y. 2010); In re 
Beacon Associates Litig., 282 F.R.D. 315 (S.D.N.Y. 2012) 

• Messner v. Northshore University HealthSystem, 669 F.3d 802, No. 10-2514 (7th 
Cir. Jan. 13, 2012). 

• In re Text Message Antitrust Litigation, 630 F.3d, 622 (7th Cir. 2010). 

• In re Apple & ATTM Antitrust Litig., 2010 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 98270 (N.D. Cal. July 
8, 2010). 

• Freeland v. Iridium World Communications Ltd., 545 F.Supp.2d 59 (D.D.C. 2008). 

• In re Apple & AT&TM Antitrust Litig., 596 F. Supp. 2d 1288 (N.D. Cal. 2008). 

• Harzewski v. Guidant Corp., 489 F.3d 799 (7th Cir. 2007). 

• In re JP Morgan Chase & Co. Securities Litigation, No. 06 C 4674, 2007 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 93877 (N.D. Ill. Dec. 18, 2007). 

• Schoenbaum v. E.I. Dupont De Nemours and Co., 2007 WL 2768383 (E.D. Mo. 
Sept. 20, 2007). 

• Jeffries v. Pension Trust Fund, 99 Civ. 4174 (LMM), 2007 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 61454 
(S.D.N.Y. Aug. 20, 2007). 
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• Klein v. Ryan Beck, 06-Civ. 3460 (WCC), 2007 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 51465 (S.D.N.Y. 
July 13, 2007). 

• Cannon v. MBNA Corp. No. 05-429 GMS, 2007 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 48901 (D. Del. 
2007). 

• In re Aquila ERISA Litig., 237 F.R.D. 202 (W.D. Mo. 2006).  

• Smith v. Aon Corp., 238 F.R.D. 609 (N.D. Ill. 2006). 

• In re Sepracor Inc. Securities Litigation, 233 F.R.D. 52 (D. Mass. 2005). 

• In re Transkaryotic Therapies, Inc. Securities Litigation, No. 03-10165, 2005 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 29656 (D. Mass. Nov. 28, 2005). 

• In re Luxottica Group, S.p.A. Securities Litigation, 2005 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 9071 
(E.D.N.Y. May 12, 2005). 

• In re CNL Hotels & Resorts, Inc. Securities Litigation, 2005 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 38876, 
No. 6:04-cv-1231-Orl-31KRS (M.D. Fla. May 9, 2005). 

• Johnson v. Aegon USA, Inc., 1:01-CV-2617 (N.D. Ga. Sept. 20, 2004). 

• Freeland v. Iridium World Communications, Ltd., 99-1002 (D.D.C. Aug. 31, 2004). 

• In re Acclaim Entertainment, Inc. Securities Litigation, 03-CV-1270 (E.D.N.Y. June 
22, 2004). 

• In re Sepracor Inc. Securities Litigation, 308 F. Supp. 2d 20 (D. Mass. 2004). 

• In re Concord EFS, Inc. Securities Litigation, No. 02-2697 (W.D. Tenn. Jan. 7, 
2004). 

• In re Pharmatrak, Inc. Privacy Litig., 2003 U.S. App. LEXIS 8758 (1st Cir. May 9, 
2003). 

• In re Enterprise Mortgage Acceptance Co., LLC, Sec. Litig., 02-Civ. 10288 (SWK) 
(S.D.N.Y. Nov. 5, 2003). 

• In re PerkinElmer, Inc. Securities Litigation, 286 F. Supp. 2d 46 (D. Mass. 2003). 
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• In re Initial Public Offering Securities Litigation, 241 F. Supp. 2d 281 (S.D.N.Y. 
2003). 

• In re Comdisco Securities Litigation, No. 01 C 2110, 2003 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 5047 
(N.D. Ill. Mar. 31, 2003). 

• Berger v. Compaq Computer Corp., 257 F.3d 475 (2001), clarified, 279 F.3d 313 (5th 
Cir. 2002). 

• City Partnership Co. v. Cable TV Fund 14-B, 213 F.R.D. 576 (D. Colo. 2002). 

• In re Allaire Corporation Securities Litigation, Docket No. 00-11972 - WGY, 2002 
U.S. Dist. LEXIS 18143 (D. Mass., Sept. 27, 2002). 

• In re StarLink Corn Products Liability Litigation, 212 F.Supp.2d 828 (N.D. Ill. 
2002). 

• In re Bankamerica Corp. Securities Litigation, 263 F.3d 795 (8th Cir. 2001). 

• In re Comdisco Securities Litigation, 166 F.Supp.2d 1260 (N.D. Ill. 2001).   

• In re Crossroads Systems, Inc. Securities Litigation, Master File No. A-00-CA-457 
JN, 2001 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 14780 (W.D. Tx. Aug. 15, 2001). 

• In re MicroStrategy, Inc. Securities Litigation, 150 F. Supp. 2d 896 (E.D. Va. 2001). 

• Lindelow v. Hill, No. 00 C 3727, 2001 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 10301 (N.D. Ill. July 19, 
2001). 

• In re MicroStrategy, Inc. Securities Litigation, 148 F. Supp. 2d 654 (E.D. Va. 2001). 

• Jeffries v. Pension Trust Fund of the Pension, Hospitalization & Benefit Plan of the 
Electrical Industry, 172 F. Supp. 2d 389 (S.D.N.Y. 2001). 

• Carney v. Cambridge Technology Partners, Inc., 135 F. Supp. 2d 235 (D. Mass. 
2001). 

• Weltz v. Lee, 199 F.R.D. 129 (S.D.N.Y. 2001). 

• Schoers v. Pfizer, Inc., 00 Civ. 6121, 2001 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 511 (S.D.N.Y. Jan. 23, 
2001). 
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• Kurzweil v. Philip Morris Cos., 94 Civ. 2373 (MBM), 2001 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 83 
(S.D.N.Y. Jan. 9, 2001). 

• Goldberger v. Bear, Stearns & Co., 98 Civ. 8677 (JSM), 2000 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 18714 
(S.D.N.Y. Dec. 28, 2000). 

• In re Newell Rubbermaid, Inc., Securities Litigation, Case No. 99 C 6853, 2000 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 15190 (N.D. Ill. Oct. 2, 2000). 

• Stanley v. Safeskin Corp., Case No. 99 CV 454 BTM (LSP), 2000 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 
14100, Fed. Sec. L. Rep. (CCH) P91, 221 (S.D. Cal. Sept. 18, 2000). 

• In re MicroStrategy, Inc. Securities Litigation, 115 F. Supp. 2d 620 (E.D. Va. 2000). 

• In re USA Talks.com, Inc. Securities Litigation, 2000 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 14823, Fed. 
Sec. L. Rep. (CCH) P91, 231 (S.D. Cal. Sept. 14, 2000). 

• In re Sotheby’s Holdings, Inc. Securities Litigation, 00 CIV. 1041 (DLC), 2000 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 12504, Fed. Sec. L. Rep. (CCH) P91, 059 (S.D.N.Y. Aug. 31, 2000). 

• Dumont v. Charles Schwab & Co., Inc., Civil Action No. 99-2840 2000 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 10906 (E.D. La. July 21, 2000). 

• Berger v. Compaq Computer Corp., Civil Action No. H-98-1148, 2000 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 21424 (S.D. Tex. July 17, 2000). 

• In re BankAmerica Corp. Securities Litigation, 95 F. Supp. 2d 1044 (E.D. Mo. 2000). 

• In re Carnegie International Corp. Securities Litigation, 107 F. Supp. 2d 676 (D. 
Md. 2000). 

• Berger v. Compaq Computer Corp., Civil Action No. H-98-1148, 2000 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 21423 (S.D. Tex. Mar. 13, 2000). 

• In re Imperial Credit Industries Securities Litigation, CV 98-8842 SVW, 2000 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 2340 (C.D. Cal. Feb. 23, 2000). 

• Sturm v. Marriott Marquis Corp., 85 F. Supp. 2d 1356 (N.D. Ga. 2000). 

• In re Health Management Systems Securities Litigation, 82 F. Supp. 2d 227 
(S.D.N.Y. 2000). 
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• Dumont v. Charles Schwab & Co., Inc., Civil Action No. 99-2840, 2000 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 619 (E.D. La. Jan. 19, 2000). 

• In re MicroStrategy, Inc. Securities Litigation, 110 F. Supp. 2d 427 (E.D. Va. 2000). 

• In re BankAmerica Corp. Securities Litigation, 78 F. Supp. 2d 976 (E.D. Mo. 1999). 

• Kurzweil v. Philip Morris Cos., 94 Civ. 2373 (MBM), 1999 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 18378 
(S.D.N.Y. Nov. 24, 1999). 

• In re Nanophase Technologies Corp. Litigation, 98 C 3450, 1999 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 
16171 (N.D. Ill. Sept. 27, 1999). 

• In re Clearly Canadian Securities Litigation, File No. C-93-1037-VRW, 1999 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 14273 Cal. Sept. 7, 1999). 

• Yuan v. Bayard Drilling Technologies, Inc., 96 F. Supp. 2d 1259 (W.D. Okla. 1999). 

• In re Spyglass, Inc. Securities Litigation, No. 99 C 512, 1999 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 11382 
(N.D. Ill. July 20, 1999). 

• Carley Capital Group v. Deloitte & Touche, L.L.P., 1:97-CV-3183-TWT, 1999 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 11595 (N.D. Ga. June 30, 1999). 

• Blue Cross & Blue Shield of N.J., Inc. v. Philip Morris, Inc., 98 CV 3287, 1999 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 11363 (E.D.N.Y. June 1, 1999). 

• Carley Capital Group v. Deloitte & Touche, L.L.P., 1:97-CV-3183-TWT, 1999 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 1368, Fed. Sec. L. Rep. (CCH) P90, 429 (N.D. Ga. Jan. 19, 1999). 

• Longman v. Food Lion, Inc., 186 F.R.D. 331 (M.D.N.C. 1999). 

• Wright v. Ernst & Young LLP, 152 F.3d 169 (2d Cir. 1998). 

• Romine v. Compuserve Corp., 160 F.3d 337 (6th Cir. 1998). 

• Felzen v. Andreas, 134 F.3d 873 (7th Cir. 1998). 

• Walsingham v. Biocontrol Technology, Inc., 66 F. Supp. 2d 669 (W.D. Pa. 1998). 

• Sturm v. Marriott Marquis Corp., 26 F. Supp. 2d 1358 (N.D. Ga. 1998). 
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• Carley Capital Group v. Deloitte & Touche, L.L.P., 27 F. Supp. 2d 1324 (N.D. Ga. 
1998). 

• In re MobileMedia Securities Litigation, 28 F.Supp.2d 901 (D.N.J. 1998). 

• Weikel v. Tower Semiconductor, Ltd., 183 F.R.D. 377 (D.N.J. 1998). 

• In re Health Management Systems Securities Litigation, 97 Civ. 1865 (HB), 1998 
U.S. Dist. LEXIS 8061 (S.D.N.Y. May 27, 1998). 

• In re Painewebber Ltd. Partnership Litigation, 999 F. Supp. 719 (S.D.N.Y. 1998). 

• Carley Capital Group v. Deloitte & Touche, L.L.P., 1:97-cv-3183-TWT, 1998 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 23222 (N.D. Ga. Feb. 10, 1998). 

• Brown v. Radica Games (In re Radica Games Securities Litigation), No. 96-17274, 
1997 U.S. App. LEXIS 32775 (9th Cir. Nov. 14, 1997). 

• Robbins v. Koger Properties, 116 F.3d 1441 (11th Cir. 1997). 

• In re TCW/DW North American Government Income Trust Securities Litigation, 95 
Civ. 0167 (PKL), 1997 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 18485 (S.D.N.Y. Nov. 20, 1997). 

• Wright v. Ernst & Young, LLP, 97 Civ. 2189 (SAS), 1997 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 13630 
(S.D.N.Y. Sept. 9, 1997). 

• Felzen v. Andreas, No. 95-2279, 1997 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 23646 (C.D. Ill. July 7, 
1997). 

• Felzen v. Andreas, No. 95-2279, 1997 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 23647 (C.D. Ill. July 7, 
1997). 

• A. Ronald Sirna, Jr., P.C. Profit Sharing Plan v. Prudential Securities, Inc., 964 F. 
Supp. 147 (S.D.N.Y. 1997). 

• Kurzweil v. Philip Morris Companies, 94 Civ. 2373 (MBM), 1997 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 
4451 (S.D.N.Y. April 8, 1997). 

• Bobrow v. Mobilmedia, Inc., Civil Action No. 96-4715, 1997 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 
23806 (D.N.J. March 31, 1997). 
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• Kalodner v. Michaels Stores, Inc., 172 F.R.D. 200 (N.D.Tex. 1997). 

• In re Painewebber Ltd. Partnerships Litigation, 171 F.R.D. 104 (S.D.N.Y. 1997). 

• A. Ronald Sirna, Jr., P.C. Profit Sharing Plan v. Prudential Securities, Inc., 95 Civ. 
8422 (LAK), 1997 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 1226 (S.D.N.Y. Feb. 7, 1997). 

• In re Painewebber Inc. Limited Partnerships Litigation, 94 F.3d 49 (2d Cir. 1996). 

• Glassman v. Computervision Corp., 90 F.3d 617 (1st Cir. 1996). 

• Alpern v. Utilicorp United, Inc., 84 F.3d 1525 (8th Cir. 1996). 

• Shaw v. Digital Equipment Corp., 82 F.3d 1194 (1st Cir. 1996). 

• Dresner Co. Profit Sharing Plan v. First Fidelity Bank, N.A., 95 Civ. 1924 (MBM), 
1996 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 17913 (S.D.N.Y. Dec. 3, 1996). 

• Simon v. American Power Conversion Corp., 945 F. Supp. 416 (D.R.I. 1996). 

• TII Industries, Inc., 96 Civ. 4412 (SAS), 1996 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 14466 (S.D.N.Y. 
Oct. 1, 1996). 

• In re TCW/DW North American Government Income Trust Securities Litigation, 941 
F. Supp. 326 (S.D.N.Y. Oct. 1, 1996). 

• In re Painewebber Ltd. Partnership Litigation, 94 Civ. 8547 (SHS), 1996 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 9195 (S.D.N.Y. June 28, 1996). 

• In re Tricord Systems, Inc., Securities Litigation, Civil No. 3-94-746, 1996 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 20943 (D. Minn. April 5, 1996). 

• In re Painewebber Limited Partnership Litigation, 94 Civ. 8547 (SHS), 1996 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 1265 (S.D.N.Y. Feb. 6, 1996). 

• Riley v. Simmons, 45 F.3d 764 (3d Cir. 1995). 

• Stepak v. Addison, 20 F.3d 398 (11th Cir. 1994). 

• Zitin v. Turley, [1991 Transfer Binder] Fed. Sec. L. Rep. (CCH) ¶ 96,123 (D. 
Ariz. June 20, 1994). 
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• In re Southeast Hotel Properties Limited Partnership Investor Litigation, 151 F.R.D. 
597 (W.D.N.C. 1993). 

• County of Suffolk v. Long Island Lighting Co., 907 F.2d 1295 (2d Cir. 1990). 

Notable State Court Opinions 
 

• McWilliams v. City of Long Beach, 56 Cal. 4th 613 (2013). 

• Roberts v. Tishman Speyer, 89 A.D.3d 444 (N.Y. App. Div. 1st Dep't 2011). 

• Roberts v. Tishman Speyer, 13 N.Y.3d 270 (N.Y. 2009). 

• Ardon v. City of Los Angeles, 52 Cal.4th 241 (2011). 

• In re Tyson Foods, Inc., Consolidated Shareholder Litigation, 919 A. 2d 563 (Del. Ch. 
2007). 

• Naevus Int’l v. AT&T Corp., 283 A.D.2d 171, 724 N.Y.S.2d 721 (2001). 

• Paramount Communications, Inc. v. QVC Network, Inc., 637 A.2d 34 (Del. Super. 
Ct. 1994). 

• In re Western National Corp. Shareholders Litigation, Consolidated C.A. No. 
15927, 2000 Del. Ch. LEXIS 82 (May 22, 2000). 

• In re Cencom Cable Income Partners, L.P. Litigation, C.A. No. 14634, 2000 Del. Ch. 
LEXIS 90 (May 5, 2000). 

• In re Cencom Cable Income Partners, L.P. Litigation, Consolidated C.A. No. 14634, 
2000 Del. Ch. LEXIS 10 (Jan. 27, 2000). 

• In re Marriott Hotels Properties II Limited Partnership Unitholders Litigation, 
Consolidated C.A. No. 14961, 2000 Del. Ch. LEXIS 17 (Jan. 24, 2000). 

• Romig v. Jefferson-Pilot Life Insurance Company, 132 N.C. App. 682, 513 S.E.2d 
598 (Ct. App. 1999), aff’d, 351 N.C. 349, 524 S.E.2d 804 (N.C. 2000). 

• Wallace v. Wood, 752 A.2d 1175 (Del. Ch. 1999). 

• Greenwald v. Batterson, C.A. No. 16475, 1999 Del. Ch. LEXIS 158 (July 26, 1999). 
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• Brown v. Perrette, Civil Action No. 13531, 1999 Del. Ch. LEXIS 92 (May 18, 
1999). 

• In re Cencom Cable Income Partners, L.P. Litigation, C.A. No. 14634, 1997 Del. Ch. 
LEXIS 146 (Oct. 15, 1997). 

• In re Marriott Hotel Properties II Limited Partnership Unitholders Litigation, 
Consolidated C.A. No. 14961, 1997 Del. Ch. LEXIS 128 (Sept. 17, 1997). 

• In re Cheyenne Software Shareholders Litigation, Consolidated C.A. No. 14941, 
1996 Del. Ch. LEXIS 142 (Nov. 7, 1996). 

• Seinfeld v. Robinson, 246 A.D.2d 291, 676 N.Y.S.2d 579 (N.Y. 1998). 

• Werner v. Alexander, 130 N.C. App. 435, 502 S.E.2d 897 (N.C. Ct. App. 1998). 

 

ATTORNEY BIOGRAPHIES 
 

The qualifications of the attorneys in the Wolf Haldenstein Litigation Group are set 
forth below and are followed by descriptions of some of the Firm’s attorneys who 
normally practice outside the Litigation Group who contribute significantly to the class 
action practice from time to time. 

Partners 
 

DANIEL W. KRASNER:  admitted:  New York; Supreme Court of the United States; U.S. 
Courts of Appeals for the Second, Third, Fourth, Sixth, Eighth, Ninth, Tenth, and 
Eleventh Circuits; U.S. District Courts for the Southern and Eastern Districts of New 
York, Central District of Illinois, and Northern District of Michigan.  Education: Yale 
Law School (LL.B., 1965); Yeshiva College (B.A., 1962).  Mr. Krasner, a partner in the 
Firm’s New York office, is the senior partner of Wolf Haldenstein’s Class Action 
Litigation Group.  He began practicing law with Abraham L. Pomerantz, generally 
credited as the "Dean of the Class Action Bar."  He founded the Class Litigation Group 
at Wolf Haldenstein in 1976. 

Mr. Krasner received judicial praise for his class action acumen as early as 1978.  See, 
e.g., Shapiro v. Consolidated Edison Co., [1978 Transfer Binder] Fed. Sec. L. Rep. (CCH) & 
96,364 at 93,252 (S.D.N.Y. 1978) (“in the Court’s opinion the reputation, skill and 
expertise of . . .  [Mr.] Krasner, considerably enhanced the probability of obtaining as 
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large a cash settlement as was obtained”); Steiner v. BOC Financial Corp., [1980 Transfer 
Binder] Fed. Sec. L. Rep. (CCH) & 97,656, at 98,491.4, (S.D.N.Y. 1980) (“This Court has 
previously recognized the high quality of work of plaintiffs’ lead counsel, Mr. 
Krasner”).  The New York Law Journal referred to Mr. Krasner as one of the “top rank 
plaintiffs’ counsel” in the securities and class action fields.  In connection with a failed 
1989 management buyout of United Airlines, Mr. Krasner testified before Congress. 

More recently, Mr. Krasner has been one of the lead attorneys for plaintiffs in some of 
the leading Federal multidistrict cases in the United States, including the IPO Litigation 
in the Southern District of New York, the Mutual Fund Market Timing Litigation in the 
District of Maryland, and several Madoff-related litigations pending in the Southern 
District of New York.  Mr. Krasner has also been lead attorney in several precedent-
setting shareholder actions in Delaware Chancery Court and the New York Court of 
Appeals, including American International Group, Inc. v. Greenberg, 965 A.2d 763 (Del. Ch. 
2009) and the companion certified appeal, Kirschner v. KPMG LLP, Nos. 151, 152, 2010 
N.Y. LEXIS 2959 (N.Y. Oct. 21, 2010); Teachers' Retirement System of Louisiana and City of 
New Orleans Employees' Retirement System, derivatively on behalf of nominal defendant 
American International Group, Inc., v. PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP, No. 152 (New York, 
October 21, 2010); In re CNX Gas Corp. S'holders Litig., C.A. No. 5377-VCL, 2010 Del. Ch. 
LEXIS 119 (Del. Ch., May 25, 2010); In re CNX Gas Corp. S'holders Litig., C.A. No. 5377-
VCL, 2010 Del. Ch. LEXIS 139, (Del. Ch. July 5, 2010), appeal refused, 2010 Del. LEXIS 
324, 2010 WL 2690402 (Del. 2010). 

Mr. Krasner has lectured at the Practicing Law Institute; Rutgers Graduate School of 
Business; Federal Bar Council; Association of the Bar of the City of New York; Rockland 
County, New York State, and American Bar Associations; Federal Bar Council, and 
before numerous other bar, industry, and investor groups. 

FRED TAYLOR ISQUITH:  admitted: New York; Supreme Court of the United States; 
U.S. Courts of Appeals for the First, Second, Third, Fourth and Eighth Circuits; U.S. 
District Courts for the Southern, Eastern and Northern Districts of New York; District of 
Columbia; District of Arizona; District of Colorado; Northern and Central District of 
Illinois; Western District of Michigan and District of Nebraska.  Education: Columbia 
University Law School (J.D. 1971), City University of New York (Brooklyn) (B.A., 1968). 

Mr. Isquith is a senior partner in the litigation department. He has been lead counsel in 
numerous class actions in the fields of securities law and antitrust law (as well as 
others) in his more than forty years of experience. Most recently, Mr. Isquith and the 
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firm were appointed lead counsel in the Salmon Antitrust Indirect Litigation pending in 
the United States District Court for the Southern District of Florida. 

Courts have commented about Mr. Isquith as follows: 

· Parker Friedland v. Iridium World Communications, Ltd., 99-1002 (D.D.C.) – where the 
Firm was co-lead counsel, Judge Laughrey said (on October 16, 2008), “[a]ll of the 
attorneys in this case have done an outstanding job, and I really appreciate the quality 
of work that we had in our chambers as a result of this case.” 

· In re Dynamic Random Access Memory Antitrust Litigation, MDL-02-1486 (N.D. Cal.) – 
where the Firm was co-lead counsel, Judge Hamilton said (on August 15, 2007), “I think 
I can conclude on the basis with my five years with you all, watching this litigation 
progress and seeing it wind to a conclusion, that the results are exceptional. The 
percentages, as you have outlined them, do put this [case] in one of the upper categories 
of results of this kind of [antitrust] class action. I am aware of the complexity . . . I 
thought that you all did an exceptionally good job of bringing to me only those matters 
that really required the Court’s attention. You did an exceptionally good job at 
organizing and managing the case, assisting me in management of the case. There was 
excellent coordination between all the various different plaintiffs’ counsel with your 
group and the other groups that are part of this litigation. . . So my conclusion is the 
case was well litigated by both sides, well managed as well by both sides.” 

· In re MicroStrategy Securities Litigation, 150 F. Supp. 2d 896, 903 (E.D. Va. 2001) – where 
the Firm was co-lead counsel, Judge Ellis commented: “Clearly, the conduct of all 
counsel in this case and the result they have achieved for all of the parties confirms that 
they deserve the national recognition they enjoy.” 

· In re Public Service Co. of New Hampshire Derivative Litigation, 84-220-D (D.N.H. 1986) – 
involving the construction of the Seabrook Nuclear Power Plant, where the Firm was 
lead counsel, the court said of plaintiffs’ counsel that “the skill required and employed 
was of the highest caliber.” 

· In re Warner Communications Securities Litigation, 618 F. Supp. 735, 749 (S.D.N.Y 1985) – 
where the Firm served as co-lead counsel, the court noted the defendants’ concession 
that “’plaintiffs’ counsel constitute the cream of the plaintiffs’ bar.’ The Court cannot 
find fault with that characterization.” 
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· Steiner v. Equimark Corp., No. 81-1988 (W.D. Pa. 1983) – a case involving complex issues 
concerning banking practices in which the Firm was lead counsel, then District Judge 
Mannsman described, in part, the work the Firm performed: “We look at the complexity 
of the issue, the novelty of it, the quality of work that, as the trial judge, I am able to 
perceive, and then, finally, the amount of recovery obtained: I think I have certainly 
said a lot in that regard. I think it’s been an extraordinary case. I think it’s an 
extraordinary settlement. Certainly defense counsel and plaintiffs’ counsel as well are 
all experienced counsel with tremendous amount of experience in these particular kinds 
of cases. And under those circumstances. . . I think it was, really, the strategy and 
ingenuity of counsel in dividing up the workload and strategizing the cases as to who 
was to do what and what ultimately should be done to bring about the settlement that 
was achieved.” 

A frequent author, lecturer, and participant in bar committees and other activities, Mr. 
Isquith has devoted his career to complex financial litigation and business matters.  

Mr. Isquith currently writes a weekly column of class action for The Class Act, a 
publication of the National Association of Shareholders and Consumer Attorneys and 
appears monthly as a columnist for Law 360.  Among his articles and writings are: 
Further Thinking On Halliburton (December, 2013); State Mandated Student Pro Bono 
Programs Are Inefficient (November, 2013); Let’s Really Consider The Idea Of A 2 Year Law 
Degree (October, 2013); Spotlight on Spoliation (September, 2013); More Restrictions for 
ERISA Fiduciaries (August, 2013); Questionable Constitutionality: Supreme Court’s Amex 
Ruling (co-authored with Alexander Schmidt of Wolf Haldenstein) (July, 2013); How 
Facebook Informs Exclusive Jurisdiction Provisions (May, 2013); Sui Generis At Supreme 
Court (May, 2013); Another Look at Amgen (April, 2013); How Not To Plead A Multistate 
Class Action (March, 2013); Supreme Court Spotlight: Sex, Race And ... Commerce (January, 
2013); Rule 23 'Preliminary' Requirement As Seen By 7th Circ. (December, 2012); Exhaustion 
- Patent And Copyright And The Supreme Court (November, 2012); Case Study: In Re AIG 
Securities Litigation (October, 2012); Case Study: Rosado V. China North East Petroleum 
(September, 2012); A Dissection Of Rule 23 (August, 2012); A 2nd Look At Class Action 
Requirements (July, 2012); The Continued Robustness Of Rule 23(b)(2) (June, 2012); The 
Simmonds Case (§16 Ruling) In The Litigation Context (May, 2012); A Look At Litigated And 
Settled Class Certification (April, 2012); Concepcion Commands a Case-by-Case Analysis 
(March, 2012); Dec. 20, 2011 - 3 Big Decisions (February, 2012); Case Study: Damasco v. 
Clearwire (January, 2012). 

Further he is a lecturer called upon by the Academy and Bar.  For example, Class Actions 
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with Caution, (Touro School, 2011); The Federal Pleading Standards after Twombly; 
Touro Law School (2010). Panelist with the Antitrust Committee of the New York City 
Bar Association Regarding Private Equity Transactions and the Implications of the 
Supreme Court’s Recent Decisions (2008); Developments in Class Actions; (NYSBA, 
2007); IPO Tie In/Claims Seminar, Professional Liability Underwriter Society; Securities 
Arbitration New York State Bar Association; Real Estate Exit Strategies, American 
Conference Institute; Fundamental Strategies in Securities Litigation (NYSBA, CLE 
Program).  He has been active in the Bar Association’s activities: President’s Committee 
on Access to Justice (2010); Committee on Evidence (2007 ‐ ); Committees on Legislation 
and Federal Courts, 1984‐1988), Committee on Securities, The Association of the Bar of 
the City of New York (Committee on Federal Courts; Committee on Antitrust); New 
York County Lawyers’ Association (Former Chair: Business Tort/Consumer Fraud‐Tort 
Law Section); Brooklyn (Member: Committee on Civil Practice Law and Rules, 
1983‐1987; New York State (Member: Committee on Legislation, Trial Lawyers Section, 
1981‐ ); the District of Columbia Bar; and Legislation and Civil Practice Law and Rules 
Committee of the Brooklyn Bar Association; Vice President if the Institute for Law and 
Economic Policy. Mr. Isquith has been Chairman of the Business Tort/Consumer Fraud 
Committee of the Tort Law Section of the New York State Bar Association and is a 
member of that Association’s Committees on Securities Law and Legislation. He also 
serves as a judge for the Moot Court Competition of Columbia University Law School. 
Mr. Isquith served as President of the National Association of Securities and 
Commercial Law Attorneys in 2003 and 2004.  He is also a Fellow of the American Bar 
Foundation. 

Mr. Isquith is frequently quoted in the Wall Street Journal, the New York Times, and 
other national publications.  

The April 1987 issue of Venture magazine listed Mr. Isquith as among the nation’s top 
securities class action attorneys. Since 2006 Mr. Isquith has been elected as among the 
top 5% of attorneys in the New York City metropolitan area chosen to be included in 
the Super Lawyers Magazine. Martindale Hubbell registers Mr. Isquith as one of the 
Preeminent Lawyers (2010), Avenue Magazine, Legal Elite (2010). 

JEFFREY G. SMITH:  admitted:  New York; California; Supreme Court of the United 
States; U.S. Courts of Appeals for the Second, Third, Fourth, Fifth, Sixth, Seventh, 
Eighth and Ninth Circuits; U.S. Tax Court; U.S. District Courts for the Southern and 
Eastern Districts of New York, Southern,  Central and Northern Districts of California 
and the Districts of Colorado and Nebraska.  Education: Woodrow Wilson School of 
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Public and International Affairs, Princeton University (M.P.A., 1977); Yale Law School 
(J.D., 1978); Vassar College (A.B., cum laude generali, 1974).  At Yale Law School, Mr. 
Smith was a teaching assistant for the Trial Practice course and a student supervisor in 
the Legal Services Organization, a clinical program.  Member: The Association of the 
Bar of the City of New York; New York State and American (Section on Litigation) Bar 
Associations; State Bar of California (Member: Litigation Section); American Association 
for Justice.  Mr. Smith has frequently lectured on corporate governance issues to 
professional groups of Fund trustees and investment advisors as well as to graduate 
and undergraduate business student groups, and has regularly served as a moot court 
judge for the A.B.A. and at New York University Law School.  Mr. Smith has substantial 
experience in complex civil litigation, including class and derivative actions, tender 
offer, merger, and takeover litigation.  Mr. Smith is rated “AV” by Martindale Hubble 
and, since its inception in 2006, has been selected as among the top 5% of attorneys in 
the New York City metropolitan area chosen to be included in the Super Lawyers 
Magazine. 

PETER C. HARRAR:  admitted; New York; United States Court of Appeals for the 
Fourth Circuit and the United States District Courts for the Southern and Eastern 
Districts of New York.  Education: Columbia Law School (J.D. 1984); Princeton 
University, Phi Beta Kappa, magna cum laude.  Mr. Harrar is a partner in the firm and 
has extensive experience in complex securities and commercial litigation on behalf of 
individual and institutional clients. 

He has represented investment funds, hedge funds, insurance companies and other 
institutional investors in a variety of individual actions, class actions and disputes 
involving mortgage-backed securities and derivative instruments. Examples include In 
re EMAC Securities Litigation, a fraud case concerning private placements of securitized 
loan pools, and Steed Finance LDC v. LASER Advisors, Inc., a hybrid individual and class 
action concerning the mispricing of swaptions. 

Over the years, Mr. Harrar has also served as lead or co-lead counsel in numerous 
securities class and derivative actions throughout the country, recovering hundreds of 
millions of dollars on behalf of aggrieved investors and corporations. Recent examples 
are some of the largest recoveries achieved in resolution of derivative actions, including 
American International Group Consolidated Derivative Litigation) ($90 million), and Bank of 
America/Merrill Derivative Litigation ($62.5 million). 
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MARK C. RIFKIN: admitted: New York; Pennsylvania; New Jersey; U.S. Supreme 
Court; U.S. Courts of Appeals for the Second, Third, Fifth, and D.C. Circuits; U.S. 
District Courts for the Southern and Eastern Districts of New York, the Eastern and 
Western Districts of Pennsylvania, the District of New Jersey, the Eastern District of 
Wisconsin and the Western District of Michigan. Education: Princeton University (A.B., 
1982); Villanova University School of Law (J.D. 1985). Contributor, Packel & Poulin, 
Pennsylvania Evidence (1987). 
 
A highly experienced securities class action and shareholder rights litigator, Mr. Rifkin 
has recovered hundreds of millions of dollars for victims of corporate fraud and abuse 
in federal and state litigation across the country. Since 1990, Mr. Rifkin has served as 
lead counsel, co-lead counsel, or trial counsel in many class and derivative actions in 
securities, intellectual property, ERISA, antitrust, insurance, consumer and mass tort 
litigation throughout the country.  
 
Unique among his peers in the class action practice, Mr. Rifkin has extensive trial 
experience. Over the past thirty years, Mr. Rifkin has tried many complex commercial 
actions in federal and state courts across the country in class and derivative actions, 
including In re National Media Corp. Derivative Litig., C.A. 90-7574 (E.D. Pa.), Upp v. 
Mellon Bank, N.A., C.A. No. 91-5229 (E.D. Pa.), where the verdict awarded more than 
$60 million in damages to the Class (later reversed on appeal, 997 F.2d 1039 (3d Cir. 
1993)), and In re AST Research Securities Litigation, No. 94-1370 SVW (C.D. Cal.), as well 
as a number of commercial matters for individual clients, including Zelouf Int’l Corp. v. 
Zelouf, Index No. 653652/2013 (N.Y. Sup. Ct. 2015), in which he obtained a $10 million 
judgment for for his client. 
 
Mr. Rifkin also has extensive appellate experience. Over thirty years, Mr. Rifkin has 
argued dozens of appeals on behalf of appellants and appellees in several federal 
appellate courts, and in the highest appellate courts in New York, Pennsylvania, New 
Jersey, and Delaware. 
 
Mr. Rifkin has earned the AV®-Preeminent rating by Martindale-Hubbell® for more 
than 20 years, and has been selected for inclusion in the New York Metro 
SuperLawyers® listing since 2010. In 2014, Mr. Rifkin was named a “Titan of the 
Plaintiff’s Bar” by Law360®.   
 



 
 

 
                                                          

Page 32 

In 2015, Mr. Rifkin received worldwide acclaim for his role as lead counsel for the class 
in Good Morning To You Productions Corp. v. Warner/Chappell Music, Inc., No. CV 13-
04460-GHK (MRWx), in federal court in Los Angeles, successfully challenging the 
copyright to “Happy Birthday to You,” the world’s most famous song.  In recognition of 
his historic victory, Mr. Rifkin was named a Trailblazer in Intellectual Property by the 
National Law Journal in 2016.  In 2018, Mr. Rifkin led a team of lawyers from Wolf 
Haldenstein who represented the plaintiffs in We Shall Overcome Foundation, et al. v. The 
Richmond Organization, Inc., et al., No. 16-cv-02725-DLC (S.D.N.Y.), which successfully 
challenged the copyright to “We Shall Overcome,” called the “most powerful song of 
the 20th century” by the Librarian of Congress. 
 
Mr. Rifkin lectures frequently to business and professional organizations on a variety of 
securities, shareholder, intellectual property, and corporate governance matters. Mr. 
Rifkin is a guest lecturer to graduate and undergraduate economics and finance 
students on corporate governance and financial disclosure topics. He also serves as a 
moot court judge for the A.B.A. and New York University Law School.  Mr. Rifkin 
appears frequently in print and broadcast media on diverse law-related topics in 
corporate, securities, intellectual property, antitrust, regulatory, and enforcement 
matters. 
 
BETSY C. MANIFOLD:  admitted:  Wisconsin; New York; California; U.S. District Courts 
for the Western District of Wisconsin, Eastern and Southern Districts of New York, and 
Northern, Central and Southern Districts of California.  Education:  Elmira College; 
Middlebury College (B.A., cum laude, 1980); Marquette University (J.D., 1986); New 
York University. Thomas More Scholar. Recipient, American Jurisprudence Award in 
Agency. Member: The Association of the Bar of the City of New York.  Languages: 
French.  

Ms. Manifold served as co-lead counsel in the following cases to recovery on behalf of 
employees: Miguel Garcia, et al. v. Lowe’s Home Center, Inc. et al. – Case No. GIC 841120 
(Barton) (Cal. Sup. Ct, San Diego) ($1.65 million settlement w/ average class member 
recovery of $5,500, attorney fees and cost awarded separately) and Neil Weinstein, et al. 
v. MetLife, Inc., et al. – Case No. 3:06-cv-04444-SI (N.D. Cal) ($7.4 million settlement).   
Ms. Manifold also served as co-lead counsel in the following derivative actions: In re 
Atmel Corporation Derivative Litigation, Master File No. CV 06-4592-JF (N.D. Cal.) ($9.65 
million payment to Atmel) and In re Silicon Storage Technology Inc. Derivative Litig., Case 
No. C 06-04310 JF (N.D. Cal.) (cash payment and re-pricing of options with a total value 
of $5.45 million).  Ms. Manifold also worked as lead counsel on the following class 
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action:  Lewis v. American Spectrum Realty, Case No. 01 CC 00394, Cal. Sup. Ct (Orange 
County) ($6.5 million settlement).  

BENJAMIN Y. KAUFMAN: admitted: New York.  Education: Yeshiva University, B.A.; 
Benjamin N. Cardozo School of Law, Yeshiva University, J.D.  Mr. Kaufman focuses on 
class actions on behalf of defrauded investors and consumers.  Mr. Kaufman’s 
successful securities litigations include In re Deutsche Telekom AG Securities Litigation, 
No. 00-9475 (S.D.N.Y.), a complex international securities litigation requiring 
evidentiary discovery in both the United States and Europe, which settled for $120 
million.  Mr. Kaufman was also part of the team that recovered $46 million for investors 
in In re Asia Pulp & Paper Securities Litigation, No. 01-7351 (S.D.N.Y.); and $43.1 million, 
with contributions of $20 million, $14.85 million and $8.25 million from Motorola, the 
individual defendants, and defendant underwriters respectively, in Freeland v. Iridium 
World Communications, Ltd. 

Mr. Kaufman’s outstanding representative results in derivative and transactional 
litigations include: In re Trump Hotels Shareholder Derivative Litigation (Trump personally 
contributed some of his holdings; the company increased the number of directors on its 
board, and certain future transactions had to be reviewed by a special committee); 
Southwest Airlines Derivative Litigation (Carbon County Employee Retirement System v. Kelly 
(Dist. Ct. Dallas Cnty., Tex.)) (a derivative matter that resulted in significant reforms to 
the air carrier’s corporate governance and safety and maintenance practices and 
procedures for the benefit of Southwest and its shareholders). 

He argued the appeal in In re Comverse Technology, Inc. Derivative Litig., 56 A.D.3d 49 (1st 
Dep’t 2008) which led to the seminal New York Appellate Division opinion which 
clarified the standards of demand futility, and held that a board of directors loses the 
protection of the business judgment rule where there is evidence of self-dealing and 
poor judgment by the directors; and In re Topps Company, Inc. Shareholders Litigation 
which resulted in a 2007 decision which vindicated the rights of shareholders under the 
rules of comity and doctrine of forum non conveniens and to pursue claims in the most 
relevant forum notwithstanding the fact that jurisdiction might exist as well in the state 
of incorporation.  Mr. Kaufman has also lectured and taught in the subjects of corporate 
governance as well as transactional and derivative litigation. 

In addition, Mr. Kaufman represents many corporate clients in complex commercial 
matters, including Puckett v. Sony Music Entertainment, No. 108802/98 (Sup. Ct. N.Y. 
Cnty. 2002) (a complex copyright royalty class action); Shropshire v. Sony Music 
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Entertainment, No. 06-3252 (S.D.N.Y.), and The Youngbloods v. BMG Music, No. 07-2394 
(S.D.N.Y.); and Mich II Holdings LLC v. Schron, No. 600736/10 (Sup. Ct. N.Y. Cnty.) 
(represented certain defendants in connection with real estate dispute and successfully 
litigated motion to dismiss all claims against those defendants; he continues to 
represent those clients’ interests in several related litigations in New York and 
Delaware).  Mr. Kaufman has also represented clients in arbitrations and litigation 
involving oppressed minority shareholders in closely held corporations. 

Prior to joining Wolf Haldenstein, and prior to joining Milberg in August of 1998, Mr. 
Kaufman was a Court Attorney for the New York State Supreme Court, New York 
County (1988-1990) and Principal Law Clerk to Justice Herman Cahn of the Commercial 
Division of the New York State Supreme Court, New York County (1990-1998). 

Mr. Kaufman is an active member of the Commercial and Federal Litigation Section of 
the New York State Bar Association, the International Association of Jewish Lawyers 
and Jurists and the Jewish Lawyers Guild.  He has also lectured on corporate 
governance issues to institutional investor conferences across the United States and 
abroad.  Mr. Kaufman is a member of the Board of Trustees of the Hebrew Academy of 
the Five Towns and Rockaways. 

THOMAS H. BURT: admitted: New York; U.S. District Courts for the Southern and 
Eastern Districts of New York, Eastern District of Michigan.  Education: American 
University (B.A., 1993); New York University (J.D., 1997).  Articles Editor with New 
York University Review of Law and Social Change.  Mr. Burt is a litigator with a 
practice concentrated in securities class actions and complex commercial litigation. 
After practicing criminal defense with noted defense lawyer Jack T. Litman for three 
years, he joined Wolf Haldenstein, where he has worked on such notable cases as In re 
Initial Public Offering Securities Litigation, No. 21 MC 92 (SAS) (S.D.N.Y.)(a novel and 
sweeping amalgamation of over 300 class actions  which resulted in a recovery of $586 
million); In re MicroStrategy Securities Litigation, No. 00-473-A (E.D. Va.) (recovery of 
$192 million); In re DRAM Antitrust Litigation, No. 02-cv-1486 (PJH) (N.D. Cal.) 
(antitrust case resulting in $315 million recovery); In re Computer Associates 2002 Class 
Action Securities Litigation, No. 02-cv-1226 (TCP) (E.D.N.Y.)(settled, together with a 
related fraud case, for over $133 million); K.J. Egleston L.P. v. Heartland Industrial 
Partners, et al., 2:06-13555 (E.D. Mich.) (recovery included personal assets from former 
Reagan Administration budget director David A. Stockman); and Parker Friedland v. 
Iridium World Communications, Ltd., 99-1002 (D.D.C.)(recovery of $43.1 million).  Mr. 
Burt has spoken on several occasions to investor and activist groups regarding the 
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intersection of litigation and corporate social responsibility.  Mr. Burt writes and speaks 
on both securities and antitrust litigation topics.  He has served as a board member and 
officer of the St. Andrew’s Society of the State of New York, New York’s oldest charity.   
 
RACHELE R. BYRD: admitted: California; U.S. District Courts for the Southern, 
Northern, Central and Eastern Districts of California; U.S. Court of Appeals for the 
Ninth Circuit.  Education:  Point Loma Nazarene College (B.A., 1994); University of 
California, Hastings College of the Law (J.D., 1997).  Member: State Bar of California.  
Former Deputy Alternate Public Defender for the County of San Diego.  Ms. Byrd is 
located in the firm’s San Diego office. She practices corporate derivative and class action 
litigation including securities, consumer, antitrust, employment and general corporate 
and business litigation.  Ms. Byrd has played a significant role in litigating numerous 
class and derivative actions, including In re Apple & AT&TM Antitrust Litigation, Master 
File No. C 07-05152 JW (N.D. Cal.) (antitrust class action against Apple Inc. and AT&T 
Mobility LLC regarding aftermarkets for iPhone wireless service and applications); 
Ardon v. City of Los Angeles (2011) 52 Cal.4th 241 (challenging the City of Los Angeles’ 
telephone users tax on behalf of the City’s taxpayers); McWilliams v. City of Long Beach, 
2013 Cal. LEXIS 3510, Cal. Supreme Ct. No. S202037 (April 25, 2013) (challenging the 
City of Long Beach’s telephone users tax on behalf of the City’s taxpayers); DeFrees, et al. 
v. Kirkland, et al., No. CV 11-04272 GAF(SPx) (C.D. Cal.) (shareholder derivative action); 
Bamboo Partners LLC, et al. v. Robert Mondavi Corp., et al. (shareholder class action that 
settled for $10.8 million in 2007);  and Lewis, et al. v. American Spectrum Realty, Inc., et al., 
(shareholder class action that settled for $6.5 million in 2004). 

MATTHEW M. GUINEY:  admitted: New York; U.S. District Courts for the Southern and 
Eastern District of New York.  Education: The College of William & Mary (B.A. in 
Government and Economics 1998); Georgetown University Law Center (J.D. 2002).  Mr. 
Guiney’s primary areas of practice are securities class actions under the Securities Act of 
1933 and the Exchange Act of 1934, complex commercial litigation, Employee Retirement 
Income Security Act (ERISA) actions on behalf of plan participants, Fair Labor Standards 
Act of 1938 actions concerning overtime payment, and fiduciary duty actions under 
various state laws. Mr. Guiney has helped recover hundreds of millions of dollars for 
victims of corporate fraud and abuse in federal and state litigation across the country.  
Some of Mr. Guiney’s notable results on behalf of investors include: Mallozzi v. 
Industrial Enterprises of America, Inc. et al., 1:07-cv-10321-DLC (S.D.N.Y.) ($3.4 million 
settlement on behalf of shareholders); In re Luxottica Group S.p.A. Securities Litigation, 
No. CV 01-3285 (JBW) (MDG) (E.D.N.Y.) ($18.5 million settlement on behalf of 
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shareholders); In re MBNA Corp. ERISA Litigation, Master Docket No. 05-429 (GMS), (D. 
Del) ($4.5 million settlement on behalf of plan participants).  Recent publications 
include: Citigroup and Judicial Immunity in ERISA: An Emerging Trend?, Compensation 
and Benefits Review, Vol. 42, No. 3, 172-78 (May/June 2010) (with Mark C. Rifkin); Case 
of the Moenchies: Moench Provision Expansion, Employment Law360/Securities Law360 
Newswires, Guest Column (June 2, 2010) (with Mark C. Rifkin). 

MALCOLM T. BROWN: admitted: United States District Courts for the Southern and 
Eastern Districts of New York, District of New Jersey and Eastern District of 
Pennsylvania; United States Court of Appeals for the Second Circuit. Education: 
University of Pennsylvania (B.A., Political Science 1988) and Rutgers University School 
of Law (J.D. 1994).  Mr. Brown’s primary areas of practice are securities, derivative, 
M&A litigation and consumer class actions.  Recent notable decisions include: Johnson v. 
Ford Motor Co., 309 F.R.D. 226 (S.D. W. Va. 2015); Thomas v. Ford Motor Co., 2014 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 43268 (D.S.C. Mar. 31, 2014); In re Merkin Sec. Litig., 2015 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 
178084 (S.D.N.Y. Aug. 24, 2015).  Prior to joining Wolf Haldenstein, Mr. Brown was a 
business litigation attorney who represented financial institutions, corporations and 
partnerships and advised clients on business disputes, reorganizations, dissolutions and 
insurance coverage matters.  Notable decisions include: Garment v. Zoeller, 2001 U.S. 
Dist. LEXIS 20736 (S.D.N.Y. June 19, 2001), aff’d 2002 U.S. App. LEXIS 9966 (2d Cir. May 
24, 2002); Bainton v. Baran, 731 N.Y.S.2d 161 (1st Dep’t 2001). 
 

Of Counsel 

KATE MCGUIRE: admitted: New York; U.S. District Courts for the Southern and 
Eastern Districts of New York.  Education: University of California at Santa Cruz (B.A. 
1995), Georgetown University Law Center (J.D., 1998); Member: Georgetown Immigration 
Law Journal. 

GLORIA KUI MELWANI: admitted: New York (2006), New Jersey (2005), United States 
District Courts for the Southern and Eastern Districts of New York, District of New 
Jersey. Education: New York University (B.M., Piano Performance, 2000); Benjamin N. 
Cardozo School of Law (J.D., 2005), where she served as a Notes Editor on the Cardozo 
Public Law, Policy and Ethics Journal. Ms. Melwani’s primary areas of focus are 
securities, stockholder derivative litigation, M&A litigation, and consumer litigation. 

In 2018, Ms. Melwani represented the plaintiffs in We Shall Overcome Foundation, et al. v. 
The Richmond Organization, Inc., et al., No. 16-cv-02725-DLC (S.D.N.Y.), which 
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successfully challenged the copyright to “We Shall Overcome,” called the “most 
powerful song of the 20th century” by the Librarian of Congress. 
 
LYDIA KEANEY REYNOLDS: admitted: New York, U.S. District Courts for the Southern 
and Eastern Districts of New York and the Northern and Central Districts of Illinois.  
Education:  Temple University (B.A. magna cum laude, Phi Beta Kappa, English, 2004); 
University of Pennsylvania Law School (J.D. 2007), where she was a Production Editor 
of the University of Pennsylvania Journal of Constitutional Law.  Prior to joining Wolf 
Haldenstein, Ms. Reynolds was an associate at SNR Denton US LLP, n/k/a Dentons. 

Ms. Reynolds has substantial experience litigating complex class actions in a variety of 
practice areas, including consumer fraud and securities litigation. 

Ms. Reynolds joined Wolf Haldenstein as an associate in 2011.  In 2015, she left Wolf 
Haldenstein to serve as an Assistant Attorney General in the Consumer Frauds and 
Protection Bureau of the Office of the New York Attorney General, and returned to the 
Firm in 2017.  As an Assistant Attorney General, Ms. Reynolds investigated and 
litigated actions against financial services corporations and manufacturers and retailers 
who engaged in unfair or deceptive practices.   

As an attorney at Wolf Haldenstein, Ms. Reynolds represented the plaintiffs in In re 
Empire State Realty Trust, Inc. Investor Litig., No. 650607/2012 (N.Y. Sup. Ct.), arising out 
of the historic IPO of the Empire State Building and other properties and resulting in a 
$55 million recovery for the original investors.  Ms. Reynolds also has significant 
experience litigating consumer fraud actions, including Milman v. Thermos LLC, No. 
1:13-cv-7750 (N.D. Ill.), a consumer fraud action alleging that Thermos bottles 
advertised as leak-proof were not, resulting in a settlement of over $1 million in cash 
and products for consumers.  

Associates 
 

KEVIN COOPER: admitted: New York; New Jersey; U.S. District Courts for the Southern 
District of New York and the District of New Jersey. Education: Fordham University 
(B.A., Legal and Policy Studies, 2011); Brooklyn Law School (J.D., 2014), where he 
served as an Associate Managing Editor on the Brooklyn Journal of Corporate, Financial 
& Commercial Law and as a Barry L. Zaretsky Fellow in Commercial and Bankruptcy 
Law.  Mr. Cooper’s primary areas of focus are securities, derivative and M&A litigation. 
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BRITTANY N. DEJONG: admitted: California; U.S. District Courts for the Southern, 
Northern, Central and Eastern Districts of California.  Education: University of Phoenix 
(B.S. 2005); Golden Gate University, School of Law (J.D. 2008), Graduated with Highest 
Honors, Editor – Law Review, Merit Scholarship Recipient, Member: State Bar of 
California. Prior to joining Wolf Haldenstein, Ms. DeJong was an associate at a boutique 
trial firm in San Francisco where her practice focused on multiparty litigation involving 
catastrophic property damage.  Prior to entering private practice, Ms. DeJong worked as 
a Research Attorney for the Honorable Peter Busch in the Law & Motion Department at 
the San Francisco Superior Court.  Additionally, while in law school, Ms. DeJong 
externed for the Honorable Susan Illston of the Northern District of California and the 
U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission.  

PATRICK DONOVAN: admitted: New York (2012).  Education: Iona College (B.A., 
Business Management, 2007); St. John's University School of Law (J.D., 2011).  Mr. 
Donovan’s primary areas of focus are securities, derivative and M&A litigation.   

MARISA LIVESAY: admitted: California; United States District Courts for the Southern, 
Central and Northern District of California; Ninth Circuit.  Education: University of 
Arizona (B.A., History & Spanish, 1999); University California Los Angeles Law School 
(J.D. 2002). 

CARL MALMSTROM: admitted: Illinois; Minnesota; United States Court of Appeals for 
the Seventh Circuit; Northern and Southern Districts of Illinois; Northern District of 
Indiana; District of Minnesota; Eastern District of Missouri; Western District of New 
York. Education: University of Chicago (A.B., Biological Sciences, 1999; A.M., Social 
Sciences, 2001); The University of Hawai’i at Manoa (M.A., Anthropology, 2004); Loyola 
University Chicago School of Law (J.D., 2007).  Prior to joining the firm, Mr. Malmstrom 
worked for the City of Chicago Department of Law in the Municipal Prosecutions 
Division; he is a member of the Chicago Bar Association.  Mr. Malmstrom has 
substantial experience litigating complex class actions in several practice areas, 
including antitrust, consumer fraud, and data security.  Representative cases in which 
he has represented plaintiffs include Bokelman et al. v. FCH Enterprises, Inc., Case No. 
1:18-cv-209 (D. Haw.), involving customers of Zippy’s Restaurants in Hawaii whose 
personal data was stolen by hackers, In re: Experian Data Breach Litigation, Case No. 8:15-
cv-1592 (C.D. Cal.); Freeman-Hargis v. Taxi Affiliation Services, LLC, Case No. 2016-CH-
02519 (Cir. Ct. Cook Cty.), involving customers of several taxi services in Chicago who 
were unlawfully charged fees for using credit cards in taxis. 
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GREGORY STONE:  Education: University of Pennsylvania (B.S., Economics, 1979); 
University of California, Los Angeles (MBA, 1983). Mr. Stone is the Firm’s Director of 
Case and Financial Analysis. He has been associated with leading securities class action 
law firms since 1999, and has been involved in a supporting role in major securities 
class action litigation. Prior to that time, he worked in various capacities in the financial 
services and investment industry.  

Non-Discrimination Policies 
 

Wolf Haldenstein does not discriminate or tolerate harassment against any employee or 
applicant because of race, creed, color, national origin, sex, age, disability, marital 
status, sexual orientation, or alienage or citizenship status and designs its hiring 
practices to ensure that minority group members and women are afforded equal 
employment opportunities without discrimination.  The Firm is in compliance with all 
applicable Federal, State, County, and City equal employment opportunity laws. 

Wolf Haldenstein is proud of its long history of support for the rights of, and 
employment opportunities for, women, the disadvantaged, and minority group 
persons, including the participation in civil rights and voter registration activities in the 
South in the early 1960s by partners of the Firm; the part-time employment of 
disadvantaged youth through various public school programs; the varied pro bono 
activities performed by many of the Firm’s lawyers; the employment of many women 
and minority group persons in various capacities at the Firm, including at the partner 
level; the hiring of ex-offenders in supported job training programs; and the use of 
minority and women-owned businesses to provide services and supplies to the Firm. 

 
270 MADISON AVENUE 
NEW YORK, NY 10016 

Telephone: 212-545-4600 
Telecopier: 212-545-4653 

www.whafh.com 
 

SYMPHONY TOWERS 
750 B STREET, SUITE 1820 

SAN DIEGO, CA 92101 
Telephone:  619-239-4599 
Telecopier: 619-234-4599 

 

111 West Jackson 
SUITE 1700 

CHICAGO, IL 60604 
Telephone: 312-984-0000 
Telecopier: 312-214-3110 

 
 

http://www.whafh.com/


EXHIBIT C 



In re: Renovate America Finance Cases
Expenses Detail

DATE CASE CATEGORY NATURE

If travel, state mode (car, taxi, plane, 
etc.), starting point, destination, # of 

people on trip
If overnight, state necessity for and # 

of people staying overnight AMOUNT

11/15/2016 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice #Inv.# W2669903 DT 10/31/16 
(Serve: Court Service) 1,700.00$          

11/15/2016 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice Inv.# W2669902 DT 10/31/16 ( 
Serve: Court Service-Riverside) 1,716.50$          

11/15/2016 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2669904 DT 10/31/16 
(Serve: Court Service LA Superior Court) 1,698.50$          

11/15/2016 Richardson Attorney Services

Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2670007 DT 11/02/16 
(Serve: Executive Office of the Board of 
Supervisors, LA) 122.50$             

11/21/2016 Ramos Attorney Services Wheels of Justice -Inv.# CIVDS 1618459 124.25$             

11/21/2016 Loya Attorney Services

Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2670003 11/2/16 
(Serve; Western Riverside Council of 
Governments) 136.25$             

12/5/2016 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2670510 DT 11/15/16 
(Serve: Court Service) 110.00$             

12/6/2016 Ramos Attorney Services
Service of Process -First Legal Network LLC-
Inv.# 50016945 DT 11/15/16 54.26$               

12/6/2016 Loya Attorney Services
Service of Process -First Legal Network LLC-
Inv.# 50016945 DT 11/15/16 158.69$             

12/6/2016 Richardson Attorney Services
Service of Process -First Legal Network LLC-
Inv.# 50016945 DT 11/15/16 50.55$               

12/13/2016 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv#W267106 DT 12/01/16 ( 
Serve: Court Service, LA Superior Court) 110.00$             

12/19/2016 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2671463 DT 12/08/16 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr.) 110.00$             

1/20/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2672910 DT 01/17/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr./LA District) 136.00$             

2/22/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -W2674217 DT02/13/17 (Serve: 
Honorable Andre Birotte Jr.- LA District) 110.00$             

2/24/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2674798 DT 02/24/17 
(Serve: Hon. Andre Birotter Jr.,LA District) 110.00$             

2/27/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2674677 DT 02/22/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr. LA District) 122.50$             

2/27/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv# W2674442 DT 02/16/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr LA District.) 123.75$             

4/13/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2676149 DT 03/28/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr.-LA District) 132.75$             

4/13/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2675852 DT 03/22/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr.-LA District) 162.25$             

5/3/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2676989 DT 04/17/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr. -LA District) 110.00$             

5/3/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2677036 DT 04/18/17 ( 
Serve: Hororable Andred Birotte Jr. -LA District) 117.00$             

5/15/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2675981 DT 03/24/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr.-LA District) 162.25$             

7/31/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2677391 DT 04/25/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr..) 118.50$             

7/31/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.3 W2675997 DT 03/24/17 
(Serve: Honorable Andre Birotte Jr.-LA District) 110.00$             

8/11/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2682178 DT 08/07/17 
(Serve: Court Service) 110.00$             

8/28/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2682390 DT 8/10/17 
(Serve: Court Ser.) 110.00$             

8/28/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2682391 DT 08/10/17 
(Serve: Court Service .Riverside) 110.00$             

8/28/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2682635 DT 08/16/17 
(Serve Court Service.Riverside) 110.00$             

9/20/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2683433 DT 09/05/17 
(Serve: Court Service) 185.00$             

9/20/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2683345 DT 09/01/17 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside) 759.75$             

10/23/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv#W2685108 DT 10/11/17 
(Serve; Court Service) 110.00$             

10/23/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2684871 DT 10/05/17 
(Serve: Court Service) 110.00$             

10/23/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W 2685110 DT 10/11/17 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside) 110.00$             

10/23/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2684870 DT 10/05/17 
(Serve:Court Service-Riverside) 110.00$             

11/15/2017 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2685098 DT 10/11/17 
(Serve: Court Service LA Superior Court) 318.00$             

EXHIBIT C



11/27/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2686110 DT 11/03/17 
(Serve: Court Sevice) 110.00$             

11/27/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2684872 DT 10/05/17 
(Serve: Court Service-LA Superior Court) 110.00$             

11/27/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2686108 DT 11/03/17 
(Serve: Court Service-LA Superior Court) 110.00$             

11/27/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2683410 DT 09/5/17 
(Serve: Court Service Riverside) 110.00$             

11/27/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2683976 DT 9/18/17 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside) 275.00$             

11/27/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2686109 DT 11/3/17 
(Serve: Court Service -Riverside) 110.00$             

12/20/2017 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2687866 DT 12/13/17 ( 
Serve: Court Service-SB,CA) 110.00$             

12/20/2017 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2687865 DT 
54312/1317 110.00$             

12/20/2017 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2687865 DT 12/13/17 
(Serve: Court Service -Riverside) 660.00$             

2/26/2018 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2689080 DT 01/11/18 
(Serve: Court Service-San Bernardino) 110.00$             

2/26/2018 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice-Inv.#W2689081 DT 01/11/18 
(Serve Court Service -Riverside) 110.00$             

2/27/2018 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -W2689077 DT 01/11/18 
(Serve: Court Service.LA Superior Court) 110.00$             

3/9/2018 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -iNV.#w2691702 Dt 03/07/18 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside Superior) 110.00$             

3/27/2018 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2692066 DT 03/15/18 
(Serve: Corut Service-Riverside Superior) 131.75$             

4/9/2018 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2692587 DT 03/27/18 
(Serve: Court Ser. San Bernardino) 110.00$             

4/12/2018 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2693185 DT 04/10/18 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside Superior) 660.00$             

6/18/2018 Richardson Attorney Services

Wheels of Justice -Inv.@W2695461 DT 05/31/18 
(Serve: Todd A. Boock, Steven A. Ellis -Goodwin 
Procter LLP) 203.25$             

7/6/2018 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2695460 DT 05/31/18 
(Serve: Court Service Riverside Superior ) 186.00$             

7/6/2018 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2695460 DT 05/31/18 
(Serve: Court Service Riverside Superior ) 186.00$             

7/6/2018 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2695460 DT 05/31/18 
(Serve: Court Service Riverside Superior ) 186.00$             

7/18/2018 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2697116 DT 07/10/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 110.00$             

7/26/2018 Ramos Attorney Services

Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2693398 DT 04/13/18 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside Superior -Pro Hac 
Vice-JLP) 53.33$               

7/26/2018 Loya Attorney Services

Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2693398 DT 04/13/18 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside Superior -Pro Hac 
Vice-JLP) 53.33$               

7/26/2018 Richardson Attorney Services

Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2693398 DT 04/13/18 
(Serve: Court Service-Riverside Superior -Pro Hac 
Vice-JLP) 53.34$               

11/19/2018 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Jusitce -Inv.#2702273 DT 11/7/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 119.34$             

11/19/2018 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#2702273 DT 11/7/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 119.33$             

11/19/2018 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#2702273 DT 11/7/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 119.33$             

12/13/2018 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2703471 DT 12/10/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 37.67$               

12/13/2018 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2703471 DT 12/10/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 37.66$               

12/13/2018 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2703471 DT 12/10/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 37.67$               

1/8/2019 Ramos Attorney Services Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2695064 DT 5/21/2018 45.00$               

1/8/2019 Loya Attorney Services Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2695064 DT 5/21/2018 45.00$               

1/8/2019 Richardson Attorney Services Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2695064 DT 5/21/2018 45.00$               

3/7/2019 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2703518 DT 12/11/18 
(Serve; Court Service) 36.66$               

3/7/2019 Ramos Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2701037 DT 10/09/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 36.66$               

3/7/2019 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2703518 DT 12/11/18 
(Serve; Court Service) 36.67$               

3/7/2019 Loya Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2701037 DT 10/09/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 36.67$               

3/7/2019 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.# W2703518 DT 12/11/18 
(Serve; Court Service) 36.67$               

3/7/2019 Richardson Attorney Services
Wheels of Justice -Inv.#W2701037 DT 10/9/18 
(Serve: Court Service) 36.67$               
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12/5/2019 Ramos Attorney Services
Service of Process -First Legal Network, LLC- 
Inv.# 50057355 DT 11/15/19 90.87$               

12/5/2019 Loya Attorney Services
Service of Process -First Legal Network, LLC- 
Inv.# 50057355 DT 11/15/19 90.87$               

12/5/2019 Richardson Attorney Services
Service of Process -First Legal Network, LLC- 
Inv.# 50057355 DT 11/15/19 90.86$               

10/20/2016 - 
1/17/2020 Loya Document Reproduction Reproduction/Duplication/Scanning/Fax 1,460.00$          
11/02/2016 - 
3/11/2020 Richardson Document Reproduction Reproduction/Duplication/Scanning/Fax 369.70$             
7/14/2016 - 
1/13/2020 Ramos Document Reproduction Reproduction/Duplication/Scanning/Fax 910.35$             
3/28/2017 Loya Employee Overtime Extra Steno 241 107.39$             

12/7/2016 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Filing Fees -Appellate Divison First Department-
Inv.# 12072016 DT 12/07/16 (Cert. of Good 
Standing for JLP) 5.00$                 

12/7/2016 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Filing Fees-Appellate DivisonFirst Department-
Inv.# 12072016 DT 12/07/16 (Cert. of Good 
Standing for MCR) 5.00$                 

12/7/2016 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Attorney Registration - Inv.# 
12072016 DT 12/07/16 ( COS In PA for MCR) 25.00$               

12/7/2016 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Secretary, New Jersey Boad of Bar -
Inv.# 12072016 DT 12/07/16 (CGS-MCR) 10.00$               

12/7/2016 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Secretary, New jersey Board of Bar-
Inv.# 12072016 DT 12/07/16 (COGS-JLP) 10.00$               

1/10/2017 Ramos Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Access Lawyers Group- Inv.# 
01092017 DT 01/09/17 (PHV/MCR& JLP) 650.00$             

1/10/2017 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Access Lawyers Group-Inv.# 
01092017 DT 01/09/17 (PHV/MCR&JLP) 650.00$             

1/10/2017 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Access Lawyers Group-Inv.# 
01092017 DT 01/09/17 (PHV/MCR & JLP) 650.00$             

3/28/2017 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -CardMember 
Service-Inv.# 01172017 DT Client ID 83117.001 
Loya/George 01/17/17 (Copy of Documents-
Riverside Court Web IM/CA) 5.00$                 

9/27/2017 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -CardMember 
Services-Inv.# 09182017 DT 09/18/17 (Copy of 
an Order-Riverside Court Web IM CA) 2.00$                 

10/24/2017 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Telephone -CardMember Service -Inv.# 10/20/17 
DT 10/20/17 (CourtCall-Case Management 
Conference) 86.00$               

12/1/2017 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -State Bar of California -Inv.# 
12012017 DT 12/01/17 (pro hac vic-JPL) 50.00$               

3/1/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Transcript Costs Cardmember Service-Inv.# 
03012018 DT 03/01/2018 (Oral Proceedings/Sq 
Sheila A Detwiler San Bernardino CA) 65.00$               

4/4/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -State Bar of California-Inv.#04042018
DT 04/04/18 50.00$               

5/7/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing CardMember 
Service-Inv.#05072018 DT 05/07/ 1(LA Superior 
Court =-copies/class action complain/financial 
Elder Abuse) 40.00$               

5/7/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing CardMember 
Service-Inv.#05072018 DT 05/07/ 1(LA Superior 
Court=-copies/class action complain/financial 40.00$               

5/7/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing CardMember 
Service-Inv.#05072018 DT 05/07/18 (Riverside 
Court Web-copy of a minute order) 1.00$                 

5/9/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Telephone CardMember Service-Inv.#05072018 
DT 05/07/18 (CourtCall-Status Conference) 116.00$             

11/8/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Filing Fees -State Bar of California -Inv.# 
11082018 DT 11/08/18 (pro hac vice- for 
MCR,GMN) 100.00$             

11/19/2018 Ramos Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Wheels of Jusitce, Inc.-Inv.#2702273 
DT 11/7/18 676.66$             

11/19/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Wheels of Jusitce, Inc.-Inv.#2702273 
DT 11/7/18 676.67$             

11/19/2018 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -Wheels of Jusitce, Inc.-Inv.#2702273 
DT 11/7/18 676.67$             

12/13/2018 Ramos Filing/Court Fees
Court Fee Expense -Inv.#W2703471 DT 
12/10/2018 6.67$                 

12/13/2018 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Court Fee Expense -Inv.#W2703471 DT 
12/10/2018 6.66$                 

12/13/2018 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Court Fee Expense -Inv.#W2703471 DT 
12/10/2018 6.67$                 

5/14/2019 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember 
Ser.-Inv.# 12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a 
Minute Order -Riverside Court Web) 0.33$                 

5/14/2019 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember 
Ser.-Inv.# 12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a 
Minute Order-Riverside Court Web) 1.67$                 

5/14/2019 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember 
Ser.-Inv.#12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Riverside Court 
Web-copy of Doc) 0.33$                 
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5/14/2019 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Transcript Costs -Cardmember Ser.-Inv.# 12/27/18 
DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a Minute Order -Riverside 
Court Web) 0.67$                 

5/14/2019 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember 
Ser.-Inv.# 12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a 
Minute Order-Riverside Court Web) 1.67$                 

5/14/2019 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember 
Ser.-Inv.#12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Riverside Court 
Web-copy of Doc) 0.34$                 

5/14/2019 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing-Cardmember Ser.-
Inv.# 12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a Minute 
Order -Riverside Court Web) 0.33$                 

5/14/2019 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Telephone CA -Cardmember Ser.-Inv.#12/27/18 
DT 12/27/18 (CourtCall CA-Case Management 
Conf.-RSN) 86.00$               

5/14/2019 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Transcript Costs -Cardmember Ser.-Inv.# 12/27/18 
DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a Minute Order -Riverside 
Court Web) 0.67$                 

5/14/2019 Richardson Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember 
Ser.-Inv.# 12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a 
Minute Order-Riverside Court Web) 0.34$                 

5/14/2019 Richardson Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember 
Ser.-Inv.#12/27/18 DT 12/27/18 (Riverside Court 
Web-copy of Doc) 0.33$                 

5/14/2019 Richardson Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing-Cardmember Ser.-
Inv.# 12/27/18 DT 12/27/18(Copy of Minute 
Order-Riverside Court Web) 1.66$                 

5/14/2019 Richardson Filing/Court Fees

Transcript Costs -Cardmember Ser.-Inv.# 12/27/18 
DT 12/27/18 (Copy of a Minute Order -Riverside 
Court Web) 0.66$                 

6/18/2019 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Telephone -Cardmember Service-Inv.# 032820190 
DT 03/28/19 (Courtcall CA-RSN-Court Hearing 
Telephonically) 94.00$               

8/27/2019 Ramos Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember Ser-
Inv.# 08272019 DT 08/27/2019 (Riverside Court 
Web CA-copy of document) 2.17$                 

8/27/2019 Loya Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember Ser-
Inv.# 08272019 DT 08/27/2019 (Riverside Court 
Web CA-copy of document) 2.17$                 

8/27/2019 Richardson Filing/Court Fees

Photocopying/Outside Xeroxing -Cardmember Ser-
Inv.# 08272019 DT 08/27/2019 (Riverside Court 
Web CA-copy of document) 2.16$                 

12/5/2019 Ramos Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC- Inv.# 
50057355 DT 11/15/19 8.33$                 

12/5/2019 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC- Inv.# 
50057355 DT 11/15/19 8.34$                 

12/5/2019 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC- Inv.# 
50057355 DT 11/15/19 8.33$                 

1/6/2020 Ramos Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC-Inv.# 
50058398 DT12/158/19 13.34$               

1/6/2020 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC-Inv.# 
50058398 DT12/158/19 13.33$               

1/6/2020 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC-Inv.# 
50058398 DT12/158/19 13.33$               

1/28/2020 Ramos Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC- Inv. # 
50059738 DT 1/15/20 38.15$               

1/28/2020 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC- Inv. # 
50059738 DT 1/15/20 38.15$               

1/28/2020 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network, LLC- Inv. # 
50059738 DT 1/15/20 38.15$               

3/11/2020 Ramos Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network,LLC-
Inv.#50061320 DT 2/15/20 27.32$               

3/11/2020 Loya Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network,LLC-
Inv.#50061320 DT 2/15/20 27.32$               

3/11/2020 Richardson Filing/Court Fees
Filing Fees -First Legal Network,LLC-
Inv.#50061320 DT 2/15/20 27.32$               

11/16/2018 Ramos Mediation Fees
Professional Services -Jams Inc.-Inv.# 
0004617038-220 DT 11/13/18 1,350.00$          

11/16/2018 Loya Mediation Fees
Professional Services -Jams Inc.-Inv.# 
0004617038-220 DT 11/13/18 1,350.00$          

11/16/2018 Richardson Mediation Fees
Professional Services -Jams Inc.-Inv.# 
0004617038-220 DT 11/13/18 1,350.00$          

3/15/2017 Ramos Non-Travel Meals
Meals -Mark C. Rifkin - Inv.# 11072016 DT 
11/07/16 ( Meeting wieh RSN/RMC) 134.21$             

11/20/2017 Ramos Non-Travel Meals Meals -PCV- Ainsley Hegener (10/02-Work Late) 20.00$               
11/30/2016 Richardson Postage CA Postage 1.36$                 
12/19/2016 Loya Postage Federal Express -Inv.# 564676151 12/19/2016 37.68$               
9/7/2017 Ramos Postage CA Postage 2.74$                 
9/7/2017 Loya Postage CA Postage 3.78$                 
11/15/2017 Loya Postage CA Postage 4.98$                 
11/30/2017 Loya Postage CA Postage 3.22$                 

12/21/2017 Loya Postage Federal Express -Inv.#602783718 Dec.18, 2017 25.13$               
12/31/2017 Ramos Postage CA Postage 4.06$                 
12/31/2017 Richardson Postage CA Postage 3.26$                 
1/30/2018 Ramos Postage CA Postage 3.64$                 
4/10/2018 Loya Postage Federal Express -Inv.#614358877 DT 4/9/2018 38.17$               
4/30/2018 Loya Postage CA Postage 1.42$                 

12/26/2018 Loya Postage Federal Express -Inv.# 640891844 DT 12/24/2018 20.25$               
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12/31/2018 Loya Postage CA Postage 0.47$                 
2/28/2019 Richardson Postage CA Postage 1.65$                 
9/30/2019 Loya Postage CA Postage 1.65$                 

9/26/2016 Ramos Research
Lexis Nexis-Aug.-Inv.# 16808001036 DT 
8/31/2016 513.35$             

12/16/2016 Loya Research Lexis-Oct.2016-Inv.# 3090713926 DT 10/31/2016 233.69$             

12/16/2016 Ramos Research
Lexis -Oct.2016-Inv.# 3090713926 DT 
10/31/2016 1,002.57$          

12/16/2016 Richardson Research Lexis-Oct.2016-Inv.# 3090713926 DT 10/31/2016 75.23$               

12/19/2016 Ramos Research
Lexis -Nov.2016-Inv.# 3090745160 DT 
11/30/2016 453.06$             

12/19/2016 Richardson Research
Lexis -Nov.2016-Inv.# 3090745160 DT 
11/30/2016 74.95$               

1/20/2017 Loya Research Pacer -Inv.#4310473Q442016 DT 1/9/2017 9.75$                 
1/20/2017 Ramos Research Pacer -Inv.#4310473Q442016 DT 1/9/2017 3.63$                 
1/20/2017 Richardson Research Pacer -Inv.#4310473Q442016 DT 1/9/2017 9.50$                 
1/23/2017 Loya Research CourtLink -Inv.#EA-698422 DT 01/01/17 109 7.62$                 

2/9/2017 Loya Research
Lexis -Relx Inc. DBA Lexis Nexis -Inv.# 
3090817435 DT 01/31/17 749.99$             

2/9/2017 Ramos Research
Lexis -Relx Inc. DBA Lexis Nexis -Inv.# 
3090817435 DT 01/31/17 219.10$             

2/10/2017 Ramos Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA LexisNexis -Inv.# 
3090781191 DT 12/31/16 63.50$               

2/10/2017 Richardson Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA LexisNexis -Inv.# 
3090781191 DT 12/31/16 272.63$             

2/14/2017 Loya Research

Miscellaneous -Rachele R. Rickert -Inv.# 
02032017 DT02/03/17 (Document Search-Ernest 
J. Dronenburg, Jr. San Diego Cnty) 12.00$               

3/16/2017 Loya Research Lexis -Inv.# 3090851746 DT 02/28/17 207 1,591.71$          
4/14/2017 Loya Research Pacer -Inv.#4310473-Q12017 DT 4/15/2017 45.00$               
4/14/2017 Ramos Research Pacer -Inv.#4310473-Q12017 DT 4/15/2017 1.88$                 
4/14/2017 Richardson Research Pacer -Inv.#4310473-Q12017 DT 4/15/2017 1.38$                 

4/17/2017 Loya Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA Lexis Nexis-Inv.# 
3090888691 DT 03/31/17 2,817.31$          

4/17/2017 Ramos Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA Lexis Nexis-Inv.# 
3090888691 DT 03/31/17 4.15$                 

4/17/2017 Richardson Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA Lexis Nexis-Inv.# 
3090888691 DT 03/31/17 69.67$               

5/12/2017 Loya Research Lexis -Relx Inc.-Inv.# 3090929635 DT 4/30/2017 113.15$             

5/12/2017 Richardson Research Lexis -Relx Inc.-Inv.# 3090929635 DT 4/30/2017 29.35$               
7/24/2017 Loya Research Pacer--Inv.# 4310473-Q2-2017 DT 7/6/2017 16.25$               
9/26/2017 Loya Research CourtLink -Inv.#EA-729911 DT 09/01/17 467 13.04$               

9/27/2017 Ramos Research
Lexis-RELX Inc. DBA LexisNexus -
Inv.#3091085470 DT 08/31/17 40.65$               

9/27/2017 Richardson Research
Lexis-RELX Inc. DBA LexisNexus -
Inv.#3091085470 DT 08/31/17 15.96$               

10/17/2017 Loya Research Pacer-Inv.#4310473-32017 DT 10/6/17 507 17.25$               

11/13/2017 Ramos Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA LexisNexis -Inv.# 
3091170365 DT 10/31/17 33.93$               

1/17/2018 Loya Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA LexisNexis -Dec.2017 
Inv.#3091255686 17.49$               

3/7/2018 Loya Research
Lexis -Relx Inc. DBA Lexis Nexis -
Inv.#3091345291 DT 02/28/18 423.22$             

3/26/2018 Loya Research
CourtLink -Lexis Nexis-Inv.#EA-753763 DT 
03/01/18 41.42$               

4/11/2018 Loya Research
Lexis -RelX Inc.DBA LexisNexis -
Inv.#3091392679 DT 03/31/18 1,023.25$          

4/19/2018 Loya Research CourtLink -Inv.#EA-757790 DT 04/01/18 607 135.30$             
4/19/2018 Richardson Research Pacer -Inv.# 4310473-Q12018 DT 4/5/2018 6.00$                 

5/25/2018 Loya Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis -Inv.#EA-761840 DT 
05/01/18 138.10$             

6/1/2018 Loya Research
Lexis -ReLx Inc.DBA LexisNexis - Inv.# 
3091439350 DT 04/30/18 706.71$             

6/21/2018 Loya Research
CourtLink -Lexis Nexis-Inv.# EA761840 DT 
06/01/18 35.71$               

6/26/2018 Loya Research Lexis -Inv.#3091483215 DT 05/31/18 678 890.06$             
6/26/2018 Ramos Research Lexis -Inv.#3091483215 DT 05/31/18 616.36$             

7/20/2018 Loya Research
CourtLink -Lexis Nexis - Iv.#RS-770233 DT 
07/01/18 46.07$               

8/9/2018 Richardson Research Pacer -Inv.#4310473-Q22018 DT 7/6/2018 1.75$                 
8/20/2018 Loya Research CourtLink -Inv.#EA9774431 DT08/01/18 704 9.88$                 

10/8/2018 Loya Research
CourtLink -Lexis-Nexis-Aug.Inv.# EA-779765 DT
9/01/18 65.74$               

10/24/2018 Loya Research
CourtLink -Lexis Nexis -Inv.# EA-783970 DT 
10/1/18 105.12$             

11/14/2018 Loya Research CourtLink -Inv.#EA-788239 DT 11/01/18 741 125.74$             

12/18/2018 Loya Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis -Inv.# EA792521 DT 
12/1/18 73.97$               

12/18/2018 Ramos Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis -Inv.# EA792521 DT 
12/1/18 12.20$               

12/18/2018 Richardson Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis -Inv.# EA792521 DT 
12/1/18 15.68$               

1/25/2019 Richardson Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis -Inv/# EA796814 DT 
01/01/19 83.76$               

2/25/2019 Loya Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis-Inv.#AE801144 DT 
2/1/2019 58.59$               
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7/24/2019 Loya Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis-Inv.# EA-823063 DT 
07/01/19 4.01$                 

8/7/2019 Loya Research
Lexis -RELX Inc.DBA LexisNexis-Inv.# 
3092127318 DT 07/31/19 117.20$             

9/17/2019 Richardson Research
CourtLink -LexisNexis-Inv.# EA-831041 DT 
09/01/19 1.12$                 

12/2/2019 Richardson Research
Lexis -RELX,Inc.DBA LexiswNexis-Inv.# 
1900001392 DT 11/20/19 45.90$               

12/16/2019 Loya Research Lexis -Relx Inc. DBA LexisNexis -Inv.# 902 337.35$             

12/16/2019 Richardson Research
Lexis -Relx Inc. DBA LexisNexis -Inv.# 
3092331938 DT 11/30/19 116.10$             

1/13/2020 Ramos Research
Lexis -Relx Inc.DBA LexisNexis Inv.# 
3092421272 DT 12/31/19 18.99$               

1/28/2020 Richardson Research
Lexis Relx Inc.DBA Lexisnexis-Inv.# 1900001392 
DT 01/28/2020 5.55$                 

2/10/2020 Loya Research
Lexis -ReLx Inc. dba LexisNexis-
Inv.#3092475171 DT 01/31/20 19.69$               

2/10/2020 Ramos Research
Lexis -ReLx Inc. dba LexisNexis-
Inv.#3092475171 DT 01/31/20 19.69$               

2/10/2020 Richardson Research
Lexis -ReLx Inc. dba LexisNexis-
Inv.#3092475171 DT 01/31/20 19.69$               

5/22/2020 Loya Research Lexis-May.2020 to date charges 1,533.96$          

8/12/2016 Ramos Telephone
Telephone -SoundPath Legal-Inv.#2125454600-
071216 DT 7/12/2016 5.99$                 

9/14/2016 Ramos Telephone
Telephone-SoundPath Legal-Inv.# 2125454600-
081216 DT 8/12/16 2.40$                 

10/6/2016 Ramos Telephone
Telephone -SoundPath Legal Inv.#2125454600-
091216 DT 9/12/16 2.03$                 

11/2/2016 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
11/2/2016 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
12/5/2016 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.43$                 
12/7/2016 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.97$                 
1/4/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.75$                 
1/6/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.43$                 

1/13/2017 Loya Telephone
Telephone -SoundPath Legal -Inv.# 2125454600-
121216 DT 12/12/16 4.79$                 

2/15/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.43$                 

2/16/2017 Loya Telephone
Telephone -Soundpath Legal-Inv.# 2125454600-
011217 DT 01/12/17 5.98$                 

2/22/2017 Ramos Telephone Telephone 2.45$                 
2/22/2017 Ramos Telephone Telephone 3.43$                 
2/22/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.43$                 
3/10/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 3.87$                 
3/23/2017 Ramos Telephone Telephone 3.44$                 
3/28/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 11.18$               
4/14/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
4/17/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.56$                 
5/2/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 8.17$                 
6/20/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.20$                 
9/1/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
9/1/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.43$                 
9/1/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.43$                 
9/1/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.29$                 
9/5/2017 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.43$                 
9/5/2017 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.86$                 
9/5/2017 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.86$                 
9/5/2017 Ramos Telephone Telephone 3.87$                 
9/18/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 

9/19/2017 Ramos Telephone
Telephone -SoundPath Legal-Inv.# 2125454600-
081217 DT 08/17/17 0.81$                 

10/4/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.86$                 
10/4/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
10/4/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
10/5/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
10/5/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.47$                 
10/5/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
10/5/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
10/5/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.96$                 
10/10/2017 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.96$                 
10/11/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
10/13/2017 Richardson Telephone Telephone 4.90$                 
2/13/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
2/13/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
3/1/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.47$                 
3/27/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 5.39$                 
3/27/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 5.39$                 
4/13/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 2.45$                 
4/13/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 5.39$                 
4/13/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.47$                 
4/16/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
4/16/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 6.86$                 
4/16/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
4/16/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
4/17/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
5/17/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
5/17/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.98$                 
5/17/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
5/18/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
5/18/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 1.47$                 
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5/18/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 9.31$                 
7/3/2018 Richardson Telephone Telephone 3.87$                 
7/3/2018 Richardson Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 

8/6/2018 Loya Telephone
Telephone -Soundpath Legal -Inv.# 2125454600-
071218 DT 07/12/18 1.68$                 

9/20/2018 Loya Telephone
Telephone -Soundpath Legal-Inv.# 21254654600-
081218 DT 08/12/18 1.12$                 

11/5/2018 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.20$                 
11/6/2018 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.20$                 
11/6/2018 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.20$                 
11/6/2018 Ramos Telephone Telephone 0.58$                 
11/7/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
11/7/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 13.72$               
11/7/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 0.49$                 
11/7/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 3.92$                 
11/9/2018 Loya Telephone Telephone 3.87$                 

11/13/2018 Loya Telephone
Telephone -SoundPath Legal-Inv.#2125454600-
101218 DT 10/12/2018 11.64$               

2/20/2019 Loya Telephone
Telephone -American Teleconferencing Inv.# 
2125454600-011219 DT 01/12/19 3.34$                 

3/21/2019 Ramos Telephone Telephone 1.47$                 

11/15/2019 Loya Telephone
Telephone -American Teleconferencing-
Inv.#2125454600-101219 DT 10/12/19 1.92$                 

12/23/2019 Loya Telephone Telephone 4.41$                 

2/10/2020 Loya Telephone
Telephone -American Teleconferencing Services 
Ltd-Inv.#4600-011220 DT 1/12/2020 3.87$                 

12/8/2016 Ramos Travel Carfare -PCV-12/31/16 -Ryan Dill

Subway travel from NY office to NY court 
to obtain Certificates of Good Standing, 
one person 5.50$                 

2/28/2017 Ramos Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman - 
Inv.#02272017 DT 02/27/17 (Trip to LA-Court 
for Hero)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 182.47$             

2/28/2017 Loya Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman - 
Inv.#02272017 DT 02/27/17 (Trip to LA-Court 
for Hero)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 182.46$             

2/28/2017 Richardson Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman - 
Inv.#02272017 DT 02/27/17 (Trip to LA-Court 
for Hero)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 182.47$             

4/19/2017 Ramos Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.#04142017
DT 04/14/17 (Trip to LA)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 172.00$             

4/19/2017 Loya Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.#04142017
DT 04/14/17 (Trip to LA)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 172.00$             

4/19/2017 Richardson Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.#04142017
DT 04/14/17 (Trip to LA)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 172.00$             

5/4/2017 Ramos Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.# 
05012017 DT 05/01/17 (Trip to LA + Various Car 
Ser-to Attend Court)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 165.67$             

5/4/2017 Loya Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.# 
05012017 DT 05/01/17 (Trip to LA + Various Car 
Ser-to Attend Court)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 165.67$             

5/4/2017 Richardson Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.# 
05012017 DT 05/01/17 (Trip to LA +  Various 
Car Ser-to Attend Court

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 165.67$             

6/1/2017 Ramos Travel
Trip expenses -Janine L Pollack- Inv.# 05012017 
DT 05/01/17 (Trip to LA)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 477.87$             

6/1/2017 Loya Travel
Trip expenses -Janine L Pollack- Inv.# 05012017 
DT 05/01/17 (Trip to LA)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 477.88$             

6/1/2017 Richardson Travel
Trip expenses -Janine L Pollack- Inv.# 05012017 
DT 05/01/17 (Trip to LA)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 341.28$             

12/11/2017 Ramos Travel
Trip expenses -Janine L Pollack -OInv.# 12052017 
DT 12/05/17 (Trip to LA-Dec.4-5)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 341.51$             

12/11/2017 Loya Travel
Trip expenses -Janine L Pollack -OInv.# 12052017 
DT 12/05/17 (Trip to LA-Dec.4-5)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 341.50$             

12/11/2017 Richardson Travel
Trip expenses -Janine L Pollack -OInv.# 12052017 
DT 12/05/17 (Trip to LA-Dec.4-5)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 341.50$             

12/22/2017 Ramos Travel
Trip expenses -Randy Newman-Inv.# 12052017 
DT 12/5/17(to LA -Hearing)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 253.38$             

12/22/2017 Loya Travel
Trip expenses -Randy Newman-Inv.# 12052017 
DT 12/5/17(to LA -Hearing)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 253.38$             

12/22/2017 Richardson Travel
Trip expenses -Randy Newman-Inv.# 12052017 
DT 12/5/17(to LA -Hearing)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
Los Angeles 253.37$             

2/22/2018 Loya Travel

Trip expenses -Rachele R Rickert (Byrd)-Inv.# 
02142018 DT 02/14/18 (RT to Riverside to attend 
CMC)

Car travel from San Diego to Riverside, 
one person 114.64$             

7/6/2018 Ramos Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman - Inv.# 
06182018 DT 06/18/18 (Trip to LA/Riverside for 
hearing on Motion to Dismiss)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person 470.42$             

7/6/2018 Loya Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman - Inv.# 
06182018 DT 06/18/18 (Trip to LA/Riverside for 
hearing on Motion to Dismiss)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person 470.42$             

7/6/2018 Richardson Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman - Inv.# 
06182018 DT 06/18/18 (Trip to LA/Riverside for 
hearing on Motion to Dismiss)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person 470.42$             

7/26/2018 Ramos Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.#07172018
DT 07/17/18 (to Attend Court)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person 329.40$             

7/26/2018 Richardson Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.#07172018
DT 07/17/18 (to Attend Court)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person 329.40$             

7/26/2018 Richardson Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S. Newman-Inv.#07172018
DT 07/17/18 (to Attend Court)

Plane travel from New York to Los 
Angeles, one person 329.40$             
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11/8/2018 Ramos Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S Newman-Inv.# 11082018
DT 11/08/18 (Mediation-11/19-11/21,2018)

Plane travel from New York to San Diego, 
one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
San Diego 164.26$             

11/8/2018 Loya Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S Newman-Inv.# 11082018
DT 11/08/18 (Mediation-11/19-11/21,2018)

Plane travel from New York to San Diego, 
one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
San Diego 164.26$             

11/8/2018 Richardson Travel
Trip expenses -Randall S Newman-Inv.# 11082018
DT 11/08/18 (Mediation-11/19-11/21,2018)

Plane travel from New York to San Diego, 
one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
San Diego 164.27$             

11/19/2018 Richardson Travel

Trip expenses -Gregory M. Nespole-Inv# 
11192018 DT 11/19/18 (trip to SD-Mediation-
11/19-11/20,20018)

Plane travel from New York to San Diego, 
one person

Overnight due to travel from New York to 
San Diego 920.47$             

12/4/2018 Ramos Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S Newman -Inv.# 
11212018 DT 11/21/18 (Lyft, Uber, Hotel for 
Mediation- San Diego) 199.45$             

12/4/2018 Loya Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S Newman -Inv.# 
11212018 DT 11/21/18 (Lyft, Uber, Hotel for 
Mediation- San Diego) 199.45$             

12/4/2018 Richardson Travel

Trip expenses -Randall S Newman -Inv.# 
11212018 DT 11/21/18 (Lyft, Uber, Hotel for 
Mediation- San Diego) 199.45$             

12/17/2018 Richardson Travel
Carfare -Minutemen Service Corp.-Inv.# 5442049 
DT 11/30/18

Car travel from NY office to NY airport 
and from NY airport to NY office, one 
person 309.90$             

12/20/2018 Loya Travel

Trip expenses -Brittany DeJong-Inv.# 12182018 
DT 12/18/2018 (Trip to Riverside,to attend CMC 
on 12/18/18)

Car travel from San Diego to Riverside, 
one person 346.99$             

TOTAL 52,602.60$      
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